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Federation Presents “The Main Event” of the 2004 Annual Campaign: 
“Being Jewish in America: An Evening with Joel Siegel”
Saturday, February 7,2004, 7:45 PM - Temple Israel

On Saturday, February 7,2004, 
the Jewish Federation of Greater 
Charlotte presents “Being Jewish 
in America: An Evening with Joel 
Siegel” as The Main Event of the 
2004 Annual Campaign. Followed 
by “A Taste of Jewish New York” 
dessert reception, tickets for this 
entertaining and engaging pro­
gram are just $36 per person. For 
more information, including 
advance ticket sales, please call us 
at 704-944-6757. Adrienne Gosset 
is the Event Chair and Donald 
Jacobs and Jerry Levin are the 
Annual Campaign Co-Chairs.

At age 57, New York film critic 
Joel Siegel became a father for the 
first time and learned that he had 
cancer. EXiring this emotional 
time, he was very open about his 
illness, publicly discussing his 
fight against cancer and what it 
meant to him as a new father. In 
his latest book. Lessons for Dylan, 
Siegel shares all the things he 
wants his son to know, including 
his Jewish heritage. “If you fight 
bagk and get hit, it hurts a little 
while: if you don’t fight back it 
hurts forever,” says Siegel in one 
of his many pieces of fatherly 
advice to his son.

Please join us on Saturday, 
February 7, at The Main Event of 
the 2004 Annual Campaign, as 
Siegel delivers a powerful account 
of a life well lived and recounts 
the many chapters of his life from 
the inspirational (his path from an 
immigrant neighborhood to 
national television and his work in 
the civil rights movement), to the 
difficult (the death of his first 
wife, his experiences with cancer) 
and the lighthearted (rubbing 
elbows with Hollywood stars; a 
glossary of Yiddish words).

He is also President and Co­
founder of the “Gilda’s Club,” a 
non-profit facility providing emo-

Joel Siegel

An engaging speaker and mas­
terful storyteller, Siegel’s sense of 
humor and insight into the world 
of films and filmmaking has made 
him a six-time Emmy Award-win­
ner. Besides his film reviews, 
Siegel is the entertainment editor 
for Good Morning America, 
where he has been a family mem­
ber since 1981. His annual prime­
time special, Joel Siegel's Road to 
the Academy Awards, has been 
broadcast for over 15 years on' 
WABC-TV and is syndicated to 
more than 150 markets world­
wide.

A native of Los Angeles, Siegel 
graduated cum laude from UCLA. 
Before his career in television, he 
worked as a radio newscaster, 
book reviewer for the Los Angeles 
Times, freelance writer for Robert 
Kennedy and advertising copy 
writer/producer, where he invent­
ed ice cream flavors for Baskin- 
Robbins.

Among his many accolades, 
Siegel is a recipient of Public 
Service Award from the Anti- 
Defamation League of B’nai 
B’rith for “distinguished news 
reporting and commitment to free­
dom of the press.”

“Being Jewish In 
America” Raffle

Only 200 tickets 
win be sold

Raffle ticket cost: $100 each
Drawing will take place at 

The Main Event 
You do not have to be 

present to win

First Prize:
One Fully Paid Mission to Israel 

You will join the Jewish
Federation of Greater Charlotte
Community Mission to Isr^i 

October 21 - 30,2004 
Value: $2800 

Second Priz«:
Framed Charles Fazzino Pop Up 

Art Serigraph 
“A Celebration of Spirit” 

Value: $1800 
Third Prize:

Weekend Getaway for Two to 
New York City 

Includes airfare, hotel and 
Broadway tickets 

Value: $1200 
Fourth Prize:

Earthenware menorah created by 
artist Marsha McCarthy 

Value: $375 
Fifth Prize:

Manhattan Bagels for one year 
Value: $175

All proceeds go to the 2004 
Annual Campaign.

Nation^ Young Leadership 
Washington Confersn«. 
fteh 21-23, 2004 j

Federation Office for further 
details. It promises to be an expe­
rience you will never forget.

To register and for more infor­
mation, log on to www.jew- 
ishcharlotte.org. 0

“Make a Difference” at Washington 14
March 21 - 23,2004

There’s simply no better place 
to start shaking things up in your 
community or on Capitol Hill.

There’s no better way to con­
front social injustices like poverty 
and hunger.

There’s no better time to make 
a difference.

Descend on oUr nation’s capital 
with other young leaders, age 25- 
45, for two days of constant stim­
ulation. It’s your immediate 
access to today’s most prominent 
policy makers and opinion 
shapers. It’s your connection to 
members of Congress, renowned 
Jewish thinkers, and global com­
mentators. It’s your chance to 
make a difference through politi­
cal, social, and Jewish activism.

We are currently in the recruit­
ment process for the conference.
This year we arc encouraging par­
ticipants to register online at 
www.jewishcharIotte.org. ($500 
subsidy available for first time 
participants, $250 subsidy for 
returning participants). If you 
would like more information, 
please contact Mamie Moskowitz,
Director of Program Development 
at 704-944-6764 or mmoskowitz 
@shalomcharlottc.org in the

K'GREENSPON
& ASSOCIATES

Independent Agents Specializing In:

• Individual Life and Health Insurance

• Group Medical, Life, Dental, and Disability Plans

• Long Term Care and Disability Insurance

• Retirement Programs and 401 (k) Plans

• Estate and Financial Planning

Visit Us At: www.greenspon.com

KEITH GREENSPON • STANLEY GREENSPON 
125 Cottage Place Charlotte, NC 28207

Ph: (704)376-7434 Fx: (704)342-3855

tional and social support for can­
cer patients and their family and 
friends.

The Jewish federation and its 
network of domestic and overseas 
agencies and partners - all sup­
ported by your gift to the Jewish 
Federation Annual Campaign - are 
stretching their resources to the 
limit to provide a critical safety 
net of services for all Jews, wher­
ever they live. Each person attend­
ing The Main Event will be asked 
to make his/her financial commit­
ment to the 2004 Annual 
Campaign. Because iQ serious 
times, the Jewish people turn to 
the federation community, and the 
federation community turns to 
you. 4*
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ANN LANGMAN
“Serving your real estate needs 

since 1972”
Multi Million Dollar Producer 

6700 Fairview Rd. 
Charlotte, NC 28210
704-364-6400 (0) 
704-841-7273 (H)

Toll Free 1-888-364-6401 ext. 240

MUin iVllllE

'

Largest Selection of 
Elegant Jewelry

At True Wholesale Prices!
^ Certified Loose Diamonds (GIA, EGL, IGI, UGL) 

(Up to 50% Below Wholesale Rapaport Diamond Report)

,-v- Fine Jewelry (Platinum, 14K & 18K Gold)
(Up to 50% Off)

^ Sterling Silver (50 to 70% Off)

■v" Watches (Sell, Repair & Battery Replacement)

^ Custom Designs &
Appraisals

^ Corporate, Bridal &
Baby Gifts

^ Layaway Now for the 
Holidays
Free Gift - Present this 
advertisement

■V- Free Quick Jewelry 
Cleaning and 
Inspection

We Buy, Sell, Trade, Repair, <& Engrave

At the Arboretum

Integrity with 25 Years Experience

We Offer 100 Day Price Protection and 
100% Satisfaction Guaranteed

704-341-1188
8042-800 Providence Rd., Charlotte 

w w w.malakjewelers .com
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