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Good  

Evening
Dorm Closing

Dormitories will close on 
Wednesday, November 24, a t 
9:00 p.m. All dorm residents 
must be out of the dorms by 
this time. A student is not 
permitted to stay in the dorm 
over the break, with the ex­
ception of the basketball 
team. Dorms will re-open on 
Sunday night.

Poster  
Regulations

Students are reminded that 
posters may be placed only on 
the campus bulletin boards. 
They may not be placed on 
windows, doors, or the ex­
teriors of any cam pus 
buildings unless specia l 
permission is granted. P er ­
sons wishing to erect banners 
must receive the approval of 
the Dean of Students. F u r ­
thermore, no poster may be 
placed on campus more than 
two weeks before the event it 
announces. They must be 
taken down within twenty-four 
hours after the event has 
taken place. The group which 
has placed the poster is 
responsible for taking it down. 
We would appreciate your 
cooperation.

Thanksgiving  

Worship
There will be a 

Thanksgiving worship service 
in Howard Chapel on Tuesday, 
November 23, at 11:00 a.m. 
The service will last until 
noon. Come to the chapel 
during this hour for quiet 
reflection, p rayers , and 
communion. Remain as long 
as you wish.

P sychology  

Majors
All Psychology majors are 

asked to go by the Psychology 
office and pick up a 
questionnaire if they have not 
received one. This 
questionnaire dea ls  with 
Jim my W ebste rs’ Senior 
Thesis. Please go by and get 
one, fill it out and return it to 
the Psychology office.

Gospel Choir
The ACC Grospel Choir will 

rehearse tonight at 6:30 p.m. 
in Hardy Alumni Hall. The 
rally is due tonight.

Gamma  

Delta Iota

Gamma Delta Iota will meet 
tonight at 6:30 p.m. in Hines 
Hall, room 208. All members 
are urged to attend.

Coffee H ouse
Friday night, November 19, 

there will be a coffee house in 
Hardy Alumbi Hall from 9 to 
11 p.m. It will be sponsored by 
the CCA. For an .evening of 
good entertainment, go to A 
Thurber Carnival at 8:00, and 
then go to the coffee house at 
9:00.

V______ y

A solitary student looks out of a wet window in Move Science 
Hall, and quietly ponders the rain and the cold. (Photo by Peter 
Chamness)

Landlords And The Law
By KEN STERN

(CPS) — It was not a pleasant 
ending to Mary Capito’s 
vacation.

Mary was returning home, 
feeling relaxed and happy. As 
she loped up the stairs to her 
apartment, Mary made a mental 
note to pay her rent since it was 
already three days overdue. But 
approaching her front door, she 
quickly found out that wouldn’t 
be necessary; she was greeted 
by a padlock and note which 
read, “Due to your failure to pay 
the rent on time, we have evicted 
you and have taken custody of 
your possessions.”

Strange but ture. It happens 
everyday in countless cities even 
though most states have banned 
the practice, whose legal 
moniker is “ forcible entry and 
d e ta in e r .” It m ay be a 
throwback to the days of 
powedered wigs and “ six gun 
justice,” but landlord hassles 
are still as common these days 
as acne, especially in student 
communities where the tran­
sient population causes a high 
rental turnover.

But relief from unscupulous 
landlords is not hard to come by, 
if students would always keep in 
mind a few simple principles. 
The first commandment of 
landlord-tenant relations is, 
“Thou shalt always carefully 
read thy lease, especially the 
fine print.” Landlords will often 
try and slip in outrageous 
responsibilities or disclaimers 
including provisions which allow 
a landlord to take all your 
possessions if your rent is just 
five days late.

One other problem area for 
tenants — students especially — 
is the gloomy region of security 
deposits. The biggest racket in 
town isn’t numbers running or 
interstate car theft, but rather 
the Great American Security 
Deposit Swindle. In most cases, 
when an apartment is rented the 
tenant is required to place a

security deposit with the land­
lord which is supposedly 
designed to cover any damage 
caused by the renter during the 
period of tenancy. The rules say 
this deposit will be refunded 
when the tenant moves on. But 
that’s not what always happens, 
even if the tenant leaves the 
place spotless. In reality, getting 
your money back is about as 
easy as saying “ no” to an in­
surance salesman.

Landlords realize that most 
people, not to mention busy, 
transient students, won’t take 
legal action even if they’re 
“ stiffed” on their hard-earned 
cash. The landlord’s modus 
operandi is to refund the money 
only a fte r  the tenant has 
initiated a lawsuit and seems 
determined to follow it through, 
which is one reason why legal 
action is so effective in this area.

Is This Ethical?
(CPS) — Patricia Wilson is 

dead, but her brain lies deep 
frozen in Oakland, California 
awaiting the day it might be 
plopped into another head in 
order to create another Patricia.

That, at least, was the bizarre 
request of Patricia’s parents 
following the 15-year-old’s 
violent murder in early October. 
They asked the Oakland coroner 
turn the girl’s brain over to a 
cyronic (body preserving) 
organization in the hope that it 
can someday be “cloned” into a 
person exactly like their late 
daughter.

Cloning is the process in which 
scientists reconstruct an entire 
body through the duplication of 
a single cell. Since scientists 
have not yet perfected this 
technique, Patricia’s brain is 
kept at a temperature of minus 
310 degrees Farenheit until that 
scientific milestone is reached.

The girl was found on the first 
Sunday in October bound and 
beaten in a Berkeley apartment.

Movie
W orld’s Greatest 

Athlete

Saturday, 

November 20, 

8 p.m., 

Hardy Alumni Hall

News Briefs
\  oral Ensem ble  

Concert Set

The Atlantic Christian 
College Vocal Ensemble will 
present its fall concert, 
Monday, Nov, 22, at 8 p.m., at 
St. T im othy 's Episcopal 
Church in Wilson. The en­
semble will be directed by 
Jam es  Powers, a new 
member of the ACC music 
faculty.

Highlighting the concert will 
be “Te Deum in C Major.” by 
Benjamin Britten, considered 
to be a glorious adaptation of 
the Anglical liturgy. Charles 
Rakow of the college music 
faculty and organist at St. 
Timothy's, will tie a guest 
artist for the Britten anthem.

The ACC Vocal Ensemble, 
consisting of 16 young singers, 
many of which are new 
members, will use a different 
approach and present a varied 
program with music from 
eight composers, covering a 
wide range of musical styles.

Piano Concert

Tonight

William and Thelma Sasser 
of Rocky Mount, duo-pianists, 
will be presented in concert at 
Atlantic Christian College 
tonight at 8 p.m. in the choral 
room of Hackney Music 
Building. Their appearance is 
being sponsored by the ACC 
Keyboard Festival.

The concert will feature 
orchestral transcriptions and 
works written for two pianos. 
Works to be featured on the 
program will include the 
Brahm’s “Variations on a 
Them e by H aydn,” the 
Poulenc “Sonata for Two 
P ian o s ,” and B rubeck’s 
“Points on Jazz.”

Profs' Works  

Performed
Marvin Lamb, assistant 

professor of music at Atlantic 
Christian College, had two 
compositions performed at a 
“Symposium of New Chamber 
Music” in Chapel Hill, on Oct. 
30.

The symposium was an 
invitational series of concerts 
sponsored jointly by the

University of North Carolina 
at Chapel Hill School of Music, 
and the Southeastern Com­
posers I>eague. Composers 
from Virginia, F"lorida and 
.North Carolina, were featured 
on the programs.

Works by I>amb performed 
were ‘ Tntonazione” for 
prepared tape, and three 
movement song cycle, "Life 
Cycle,” for tenor voice, flute, 
muted trumpet and bassoon. 
Jam es Powers, instructor in 
music at Atlantic Christian, 
was featured as a guest artist 
with the UNC New Music 
Ensem ble  on the "L ife  
Cycle" fx'rformance

Lamb has recently been 
notified that music editors of 
Manuscript Publications have 
elected to include three of his 
compositions in their catalog.

Faculty-Student  

Social Set
On Monday, November 22, 

at 9:00 p.m., the SGA will 
revive an old tradition, with a 
new twist. A Faculty-Student 
Social will be held in the 
Dining Hall in Hamlin Student 
Center.

Students are responsible for 
seeing that faculty members 
meet each other as well as 
students. Entertainment will 
be provided, and time will be 
set aside for conversation.

The Social, a discarded 
tradition, is being revived by 
the SGA to promote en- 
thasiasm and a sense of 
togetherness in the college 
community.

P sych o logy  Club 
Cleans Park

The Psychology Club, 
striving for a more congenial 
rela tionsh ip  between the 
college and the city of Wilson, 
completed its’ first service 
project of the year ,  by 
cleaning up the Wilson City 
Recreation Park. Members of 
the club who participated 
w ere: Howard F lem ing,
president of the club. Candy 
Sambrook, secretrary of the 
club, Karen Allen, the clubs’ 
treasurer. Alma Weathersby, 
Mary Tilman, Carol Calloway, 
Terry  Kornegay, Cindy 
Lindsey, Doc Tostoe, and 
Dana Stubbs.

Stage and S crip t—

Presents

A Thurber Carnival
Tonight 

and

Tomorrow night 

at

8:00P.M.  

in

Howard Chapel


