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BC Welcomes New Faculty

irts

Several new faculty m em bers 
have been added to the staff of 
Brevard College.

Joining the Division of Math 
and Science as associate pro­
fessor of biology is Dr. William C. 
A lexander. A native of Wilm­
ington, Alexander received his 
bachelor degree in biology from 
the University of North Carolina 
at Wilmington and his m as te r’s 
degree in biology from  Ap­
palachian State University. He 
received his doctorate in zoology 
from Clemson University. Alex­
ander has been assistant pro­
fessor of biology a t Georgia 
Southern and was also assistant 
professor of biology a t  the 
University of South Carolina. He 
has been a recipient of several 
National Wildlife F ed era tio n  
fellowships a n d  g r a n t s ,  a 
fellowship fro m  th e  South  
Carolina Wildlife and Marine 
Resource D e p a r tm e n t ,  a 
fellowship from the United States 
Fish and Wildlife Service and a 
faculty research  g ran t from 
Georgia Southern College. His 
teaching i n t e r e s t s  in c lu d e  
behaviorial ecology, an im al 
behavior, and ornithology.

Dr. Alexander is m arried to the 
former Christine M. Deasy. They 
are  the parents of Deborah, 7, 
Troy, 4, and Richard, 1.

The media specialist and in­
structor in percussion for the 
Division of Fine Arts will be 
Joseph W. Jackson. Jackson 
received his bachelor of arts in 
music education from the Univer­
sity of Georgia where he studied 
percussion under Dr. Thomas W. 
McCutchen. Recognitions during 
his undergraduate work included 
performing as a winner in the 
UGA Concerto Competition of 
1982 and winning the state and 
region MTNA Percussion Divi­
sion Competition as well as plac­
ing second runner-up in the na­
t iona l com p e titio n  in 1983. 
Jackson also received his Master 
of Music degree in percussion 

performance from the University 
of Georgia. He has done exten­
s ive  reco rd in g  w ork u nder 
Douglas Moore for the School of 
Music of UGA and for Southmark 
Recordings of Atlanta.

Jackson and his wife, Christy, 
have an 18-month-old daughter, 
Lorinda.

Steve Kelly joins the Brevard

music faculty as Instructor in 
Music. He will conduct the Con­
cert Band and the Stage Band. 
M r. K e lly , a n a t iv e  of 
Greensboro, NC, received his 
Bachelor of Music and Master of 
Music degrees from the Universi­
ty  of N o rth  C a ro lin a  a t  
Greensboro. Before coming to 
Brevard he was Director of 
Bands at Northside Junior and 
Senior High Schools in Roanoke, 
Va. An accomplished low brass 
performer, Mr. Kelly has per­
formed with the Greensboro and 
Charlotte Symphony Orchestras, 
and as a soloist with high school 
bands and recitals. He is the 
former conductor of the North 
S tate  Silver Cornets British 
Brass Band and was graduate 
assistant to the Director of Bands 
at UNC-G. In addition to his 
teaching, judging, and clinician 
activities, Mr. Kelly will present 
a research paper to the North 
Carolina Music Educators Con­
ference in November 1984.

Mr. Kelly is m arried to the 
former Kristin Olsen. A sports 
enthusiast, he enjoys football, 
basketball, swimming, and ten­
nis.

Emphasis On Guidance/Counselinjg

New Tutors Join Staff
Four new Resident Tutors join 

the Brevard College community 
with the commencement of the 
1984-85 academic year, and their 
combined skills represent an ex­
panded emphasis upon guidance 
and counseling. The new Resi­
dent Tutor for West Beam is Nan­
cy C. Williams, a graduate of 
Mars Hill College where she 
earned the B.S. d eg ree  in 
psychology; she  is a lso  a 
graduate of Western Carolina 
University where she earned the 
M.A. degree in guidance and 
counseling. In response to a 
recommendation from the Stu­
dent Development Committee in 
the spring of 1984, Nancy has 
been appointed career counselor. 
As such, she will adm inister 
career inventories, administer 
SIGI, the college’s computer- 
based career guidance program, 
and teach courses in psychology 
and career counseling. Nancy’s 
office will be in the newly-created 
counseling center on the second 
floor of the Sims Student Union.

At Mars Hill Nancy was the 
recipient of M ars Hill’s most 
prestigious scholarship; she was 
vice-president of the Student 
Government Association (her 
husband, D e rw in ,  w as  
president); she was the director 

“Gateway,” the freshm an 
orientation program ; she served 
on the Student Activities Commit­
tee; and she was Chief Justice of 
the Student Government Associa- 
*̂ 'on. At the sam e time, she 
organized an outreach program  
*̂ sing students to tutor students in 
*he secondary schools, which

resulted in her being recognized 
for service to the people of 
Madison County. As an expres­
sion of her interest in civic 
responsibility, Nancy has agreed 
to serve as sponsor of Circle K at 
Brevard.

Robert R. Hutchinson (Bob) 
joins the Brevard College com­
munity as Resident Tutor for 
E ast Beam. Bob graduated from 
the University of North Carolina 
in Asheville, and he earned the 
M.A. in guidance and counseling 
from Western Carolina Universi­
ty. Bob is an honor student of the 
Medical Field Service School; 
prior to returning to school to 
complete his m aste r’s degree, he 
was a psychiatric social worker 
with the U.S. Army. Bob is not 
new to Brevard; during the sum­
m er of 1984, he completed his in­
ternship requirem ent in student 
development here.

Bob’s office is located on the se­
cond floor of the Sims Student 
Union. In addition to his respon­
sibilities as Resident Tutor, Bob 
will serve as Director of Student 
Activities and Intram urals.

The new Resident Tutor for Up­
per Jones is Elizabeth M. Hauk 
(Betty). Betty earned the B.S. 
degree in psychology from the 
University of Montevallo; she 
received the M.S. degree in 
guidance and counseling from 
E ast Texas State College where 
she served simultaneously as 
H ead R esiden t of a m a jo r  
r e s id e n c e  h a l l .  As an  
undergraduate , Betty was a 
m em ber of Psi Chi Mu, the 
psychology honorary society, and

Academic regalia makes Convocation at the Methodist 
Church an impressive and inspirational ceremony for 
both student and faculty.

Dr. Charles Teague 
Named Chaplain

of Circle K.
In addition to her respon­

sibilities as Resident Tutor, Betty 
will serve as Assistant to the 
Dean of Student Affairs, with 
prim ary responsibility for hous­
ing and for programs of student 
development within the residence 
halls. Her office is located in 
Beam Administration Building.

David Rinker joins the Brevard 
College community as Resident 
Tutor for Green Hall. He received 
the B.S. degree in Business Ad­
m in i s t r a t io n  f ro m  J a m e s  
Madison University. For the last 
seven years, David has been 
teaching business and computer 
science and coaching champion­
ship teams in cross-country and 
track a t Blacksburg High School 
in Blacksburg, Va., where he 
coached two Brevard College 
s tu d en ts , J e ff  J e n re t te  and 
Charles Hinkle. Besides serving 
as Resident Tutor for Green, 
David will coach the women’s 
cross-country and track teams, 
and he will serve as an assistant 
to Coach Witek for the m en’s 
cross-country and track pro­
grams.

These new Resident Tutors join 
returning staff members Laura 
Campbell and Steve Wilson. 
Laura, Resident Tutor in Jones 
Dorm, will also be teaching 
psychology courses, directing the 
newly created counseling center, 
and supervising the Resident 
Assistants. Though he already 
serves as Resident Tutor for 
Taylor Hall, Steve’s additional 
responsibility will be directing 
the College’s outdoor education

K d i lo r s  Dr. T eacup  jo i n e d  ihp

lirei ard  co n im i in i ly  th is  s u m m e r  as p ar i  iij 

ihe s u m m e r  scluKtl fa ru l lv .

“ It seems that I ’m now re ­
living my student years  in 
reverse - my next move, I guess, 
will be to Asheville High.”

But Brevard College’s new 
C hap la in  and P ro fe sso r  of 
Religion, the Rev. Dr. Charles 
Teague, smiled when he spoke. 
Glad to be back a t Brevard eigh­
teen years after graduating in 
1966, he looks forward to staying 
a long while.

Dr. Teague attended High 
Point College after Brevard, 
graduating in 1968 with a B.A. in 
Religion and Philosophy. He 
earned a Master of Divinity 
degree a t Emory University in 
1971.

After serving as minister at 
Avery’s Creek United Methodist 
Church in Asheville for one year, 
Dr. Teague was invited to return 
to High Point as Chaplain of that 
United Methodist college.

“ I realized that year how much 
I enjoyed academic life, par­
ticularly in small, close-knit col­
leges like  High P o in t and 
Brevard,” he said. “ Classroom 
teaching is very satisfying to 
m e.”

After several years a t High 
Point, Dr. Teague began to juggle 
a full teaching load and further 
graduate work at Emory. In 1982 
the University awarded him the

Doctor of Ministry degree.
A year later, Brevard College’s 

C hap la in  and  P ro fe s so r  of 
Religion, Dr. C. Edward Roy, 
decided to take an early re tire ­
m ent, and  he im m e d ia te ly  
thought of his long-time friend 
and former student.

“ I t’s an honor for me to be 
following Dr. Roy; his influence 
on me has extended from my stu­
dent days to the present,” Dr. 
Teague said. “He has a concern 
for everyone, and he has strong 
academic integrity. It is hard  to 
imagine Brevard College without 
him.”

Dr. Teague, his wife Daune, 
and his nine-year-old daughter 
Julie, a re  living on campus this 
year while plans are being drawn 
for a new home in Glen Cannon.

While a student a t Brevard, Dr. 
Teague was president of Green 
Dorm and captain of the Brevard 
College golf team. He was elected 
“ M r. S o p h o m o re ”  by h is  
graduating class.

“Brevard College m eant a lot 
to me when I was a student 
here,” Dr. Teague continued, 
“and it is still very attractive to 
me now as a place to live and- 
work. I love the personal atten­
tion students can rightfully ex­
pect here, the community spirit, 
and “  like all Western Caroli­
nians who move away to the 
flatlands for awhile -  the moun­
tains. I t’s great to be back.”

program.

Two Resident Directors have 
also been appointed. Steve Kelly

is Resident Director for the New 
Complex. At Brevard he will be 
director of bands, including both 
the concert band and the stage 
band.

Returning to Brevard, where 
he was previously a student, is

Santiago Moya. Santiago and his 
wife, Wendy, will serve as Resi­
dent Directors of Ross Hall. For 
the last year Santiago and Wendy 
have served as house parents at 
the Florida Sheriffs’ Associa­
tions’ Boys’ Ranch. Santiago will 
be assisting Coach Scarborough 
with the soccer team. Both San­
t ia g o  a n d  W endy w ill be 
registered students.


