
Food
Committee

Meeting
by Forrest Hughes

The Senate Food Committee
met on Wednesday, Oct. 1, to

organize and to discuss the
needs of the Guilford
cafeteria. Present were eight
students, Ron Short, and Jin
King from Epicure and Ken
Schwab, director of student
personnel and John Marge-
not, one of the vegetarian
cooks.

The first order of businesi
was to select leaders. Jell
Martin is the new chairperson
of the committee and Barbara
Ropp and Forrest Hughes are
co-vice-chairpeople.

The Committee members
will ask questions of cafeteris
eaters about particular meals
and the food in general during
three different mealtimes each
week throughout the year. The
responses to these questions
will be correlated and turnec

over to Ron and Jim for then
to work with. Hopefully, the
food service can thus be
improved in the directions thai
students desire.

Several suggestions were
made during the meeting
itself as to possible improve
ments in Epicure's service
Among these were the
chances of having working
toasters, moving the gril
room hours from Saturday
nights to Sunday nights
putting up a daily meni

outside the cafeteria doors anc
the setting up of suggestior
boxes.

The point was brought out

that is a relatively simple
procedure to get a meal for a

sick friend who is unable to

get to the cafeteria. All you
have to do is get a filled-out
green card from your intern or

resident co-ordinator and
present it, at the cafeteria.
Then you can get a hot plate to

take back to the dormitory.
The Food Committee meet-

ings are open to anyone who
has complaints or suggestion
they would like to voice. The
next meeting will be held
during lunch on Tuesday in
the back dining room.
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Photo by Catee
OPENING OF STUDENT DARKROOM IN FOUNDERS willbe
one of several concerns under discussion Wednesday October 8,
at 10:00 a.m., when the Campus Association of Photographers
will meet for ratification of a constitution and election of

officers. All student and faculty interested in photography are

urged to attend. The meeting willbe held in the darkroom, in
the basement of Founders, next to student mail boxes.

Student Health Care Center
Continued from Page 5

The individual student will
be responsible for the expense
of additional services such as
lab tests, prescription medi-
cation, x-rays, etc. These
charges will be in compliance
with the fees set by Friends
Homes. Students will receive
bills for such services from the
college and the college will in
turn pay Friends Homes. The
college insurance program will
cover any charges that exeed
$25.00 for participating stu-

dents.

Student Health Records - All
students can expect the same
professional ethical code from
the Student Health Center as
that extended to them by their
family physician. The confi-
dentiality of any discussion
with the staff is guaranteed.
Medical records are kept on
file in the infirmary and will
not be shared with anyone
without the student's written
consent except authorized
college officials. These rec-
ords are discarded when the
student graduates and held for
a period of four years if a
student leaves the college
before graduation

Policy Covering Excuses from
Classes - Responsibility for
class attendance and for
completion of assignments
rests primarily with the
student, who should assume

this responsibility of granting
"excuses" rests with the
college nurse. She will send a
letter to the instructor to
inform him/her of the
student's excuse. The indivi-
dual diagnosis and other
specific details will not be
released without the written
consent of the student.

Health Education and Preven-
tive Medicine - An attempt
will be made by the medical
personnel of the Student
Health Care Center to educate
individuals and to instruct
students concerning their
particular health problems
and needs. Students who have
particular health care needs
should inform their resident
coordinator and the college
nurse.

Unruly or Uncooperative
Patients - Any student visiting
the Student Health Care
Center who becomes unruly or
uncooperative will be imme-
diately reported to the
Campus Security and to the
Student Services office.
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"Hands On"
Education Seminar

to Philadelphia
by Annette Zltver Green

The Education Department,
under the leadership of David
Kingsley, is now preparing for
the annual Education Seminar
to Philadelphia. The group
will leave Guilford in cars on
October 25 and return on
October 31.

Some basic changes in the
seminar's format are being
made this year. The emphasis
will no longer be on seeing a
little bit of alot of different
educational situations. In-

stead, participants will be
given the opportunity to

become more involved in the
programs they choose to visit.
David Kingsley describes it as
"very much a hands-on kind
of experience." Two full days
will be set aside for this sort of
personal involvement. An
inner city class building its
own sailing boat, the
innovative Parkway Program
and various social services are

Continued on Page 7

Photo Lab Awa
by Caryl Kuser

In the basement of
Founders waits a Photography
Lab with room enough for six
student photographers to print
at once in addition to three
separate film development
rooms. However, no equip-
ment will be provided until an

organization shows itself.
In order to be acknowledged

by those who will allot the
equipment, this organization
must have a statement of
purpose and a constitution,
accompanied by four expe-
dient officers; president, vice
president, secretary and
treasurer.

Across the span of three
meetings, fourteen people
have showed interest. More

Please, ifyou are interested
in facilities open to the use of
the student body, come to

Wednesday's meeting.
To be eligible for use of the

darkroom one must show
some competence and know-
ledge about the procedures ol
developing and printing, and
ability to keep the lab clean.
Beginners are welcome under
supervision and will be gladly
shown the basics and
observed until they feel more

confident.
would-be photographers are
needed to expand the ranks so
that the criterion for an
organization will be fulfilled
and the group will be able to
benefit from the needed
equipment.

"BECAUSE YOU'VE

The experiences that have "carvel" your real achievements
are the personal ones. Wear a class ring and remember.

Order on Ring Day and save 5%.
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