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On The Lighter Side
by Jenny Savage

Here I am again "On the Lighter 
Side." But this time there is a 
slight twist to my article. It's not 
really going to be a satire, but more 
like a lesson on life! In my years at 
Salem my life has changed a lot, in 
some ways for the better, in some 
ways for the worse. But I have 
learned a very important aspect of 
life that can't be overlooked: LIVE 
LIFE TO THE FULLEST!!! It is my 
own personal philosophy on how to 
get the most out of your life so, here 
goes.

The first stage of my philosophy 
is to not let the little itty bitty 
things get you down. So, your 
boyfriend hasn't called in two 
weeks. So what, there are other 
fish in the sea. We all know that 
this little factor does get us all 
down at some point in our lives, but 
we must go on, remember we are 
women now! Move on to another 
boy (or should I say man?) and get 
on with your own life. Here is 
another possible depressing 
situation: you have a paper due 
tomorrow and you have not begun it. 

-Well ladies, don't get depressed or 
take your anxiety out on others, 
after all, it is your own fault. Do 
the paper, get it over with and try 
not to do that to yourself again. 
You see, life is too short to let these

small instances get you down in the 
dumps. I am sure that we have all 
had our share of problems with our

various friends. Well, you take the 
first step to work things out even if 
you know deep down in your heart 
you shouldn't. Here at Salem, we 
form very special friendships and 
relationships that need not be 
taken for granted. As an alumna 
once said , "It is chance that makes 
us sisters at Salem, but hearts that 
make us friends." What I'm tr)nng 
to say is that we should not take 
advantage of our friends.

Also, always remember that 
things could be worse. We are all 
alive and kicking; we have roofs 
over our heads; we have enough 
food for ourselves to feed an army; 
we have friends; we have been 
given the chance to receive a 
college education; we have clothes
to keep us warm, and we have the 
chance to do anything we put our 
minds to. Many people are not as 
fortunate as we are, and we must not 
take advantage of these luxuries 
that have been given to us.

We all need to learn to 
appreciate the lives that we lead 
and to not take advantage of them. 
If you stop and think about it 
(Girls, this is sort of morbid) you 
may not know when you won't be 
around to live your life the way you 
want it to be. We are all brought 
into this crazy world to enjoy the 
life that we have. Things may get 
out of control and hectic at times, 
but always remember that life is 
too short to let it pass us by and 
regret the way we lived it. Always 
remember what you have and not 
what you could've had.
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Horoscopes
by Jupiter's Junk

SCORPIO

You've been partyingioo, too much. 
The bus nuxer really did you in. 
Salem is a fun place to party if you 
do it wisely. I think I need to 
remind you to be a Salem lady at 
ALL times.

TAURUS

You need to sit down had have a 
heart to heart with your roommate. 
She has something important to 
discuss with you, but is hesitant. 
Talk to her before its too late.

UBRA

Your love life is great. Keep up the 
good work. Your mate loves the 
attention you're giving him, he'll 
return the favors.

SAGITTARIUS

Budget your money carefully. You 
can't keep affording all those 
expensive weekends. Mom and Dad 
won't understand where the money 
really goes!

AQUARIUS

Take Mom and Dad to the cleaners 
this weekend. You need a good 
meal and they'll be here to pay for 
it. Afterall, what is Parents 
Weekend really about?

LEO

You're a little worried about 
mid-terms. You need to study more 
for finals. That is a stressful time 
and we want you back next 
semester.

VIRGO

It is time to quit smoking. The 
habit is really expensive and bad 
for you. Try exercising and eating 
better - even if that means dinine 
out!.

GEMINI

Avoid that Sagittarius in your life. 
That could be trouble. They're 
about to cheat on you, so get out 
while you can. But have no fear, I 
see a Pisces in your future.

CANCER

Don't worry about all those tests 
you've had. You did just fine. Take 
time and relax and focus on that 
social life. It's about to pick up.

CAPRICORN

Bet you never thought you'd be 
seeing an older man. Well, he 
thinks your great! Just put your 
energy into your studies and he'll 
come knocking on your door.

PISCES

Don't fret about a long distance 
relationship. Fall Break was 
definitely a plus. He's really more 
interested than you think. It may 
be several months before you see 
him, but think about that reunion.

ARIES

Senior Aries - you need to start 
looking for a job! Underclassmen - 
you need to do an internship. Those 
jobs are hard to find.
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Don't let the sting of a radar gun get you down. 
Call Clarke Dummitt, he is the best attorney in town.

E. Clarke Dummit
Attorney at Law 
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