
Milk Sanation Report Given
Dr. Mary B. H. Michal, local

Health Director, has juat re¬
ceived a report on a survey on
the milk sanitation program in
the Alleghany-Ashe-Wataua Dis¬
trict, which was made during
the month of Hay 1063 by Dis¬
trict Milk Sanitarian, Carson C.
Foard of the North Carolina
State Board of ReaRli. Ratings
were aa follows:
(No retail raw milk is sold

in this district).
USPHS rating on raw milk

aold to plants.02.9.
USPHS rating of pasturiza-

tion plants.02.4.
USPHS rating of pasturized

milk.02.7.
USPHS rating of enforcement

methods.00.2.
There are eighty grade "A'

raw-to-plant dairies in the dis¬
trict which supply grade "A"
milk for pasturization plants in
Wilkes and Catawba counties.
The local health department
supervises these dairies through
a reciprocal agreement under
which the milk is shipped for
processing.
The comment received in this

report from Mr. John Andrews,
Chief of the Sanitation Section
of the State Board of Health is
as follows:
"The milk sanitation program

Letter To Editor
THE PLEA OF A GREAT

ORATOR
Mr. Editor:

I would appreciate your pub¬
lishing the following remarks
by Henry M. Grady, made in
Atlanta, Ga., in 1887.

JAKE WINEBARGER
Rt. 2, Boone, N. C.

(Enclosure)
My friends, hesitate before

you vote liquor back . . . now
that it is shut out. Don't trust
it. It is powerful, aggressive,
and universal in its attack. To¬
night it enters an humble home
to strike the roses from a wo¬
man's cheek, and tomorrow it
challenges this Republic in the
halls of Congress.
Today it strikes a crust from

the lips of a starving child, and
tomorrow levies tribute from
the Government itself. There is
no cottage humble enough to
escape it. no place strong
enough to shut it out. It is flexi¬
ble to cajole, bat mercilew in
victory. It is the mortal MMiny
of peace and order. The despoil-
er of men; the terror of wo¬

men; the cloud that shadows
the face of children; the demon
that has .dug more graves and
sent more souls unsaved to
judgment than all the pestilenc¬
es, that have wasted life since
God sent the plagues to Egypt
and all the wars that have been
fought since Joshua stood be¬
yond Jericho.
Oh, my countrymen, loving

God and humanity, do not bring
this grand old city again under
the dominion of that power; It
can profit no man by its return.
It can uplift no industry, revive
no interest, remedy no wrong.
You know that it cannot. It
comes to destroy, and it shall
profit mainly by the ruin of
your sons or mine. It comes

to mislead human souls and to
crush human hearts under its
rumbling wheels. It comes to
convert the wife's love into de¬
spair, and her pride into shame.
It comes to still the laughter
on the lips of little children. It
comes to stifle all the music of
the home and fill it with silence
and desolation. It comes to ruin
your body and mind, to wreck
your home, and it knows that it
must measure its prosperity by
the swiftness and certainty
with which it wreaks this work.
Now will you vote it back?

POPE'S DEATH AND RUSSIA
The death of Pope John

XXIII may have a profound im¬
pact on the future development
of relations between the Soviet
Union and the Western powers.
The Pontiff in recent months

had been engaged in a delicate
and subtle effort to open up a

seaking acquaintance between
the Kremlin and the Vatican.
Whether this effort is con¬

tinued will depend on his suc¬
cessor.
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in Alleghany ¦ Ashe - Watauga
Counties la being carried on In
a satisfactory manner under the
direction of Dr. llichal by Mr.
Jack Cobb, Mr. Bower Camp¬
bell, and Mr. Andrew Yagin-
sae."

Red Cross Meet
Is Scheduled

Mr. S. M. Ayerj, Chairman
of the Watauga County Chapter
oif the American Red Ctom an¬
nounces, "that the annual meet¬
ing of the chapter will be held
at the Daniel Boone Inn, Hon-

day, June 24th at 7 p. m. for th«
transaction of business for the
year ending 1862-83, and for
diacunion of new project* to be
carried out in the year 1983-64.
He aaki all members of the

board to be present, and in¬
vites all Interested persons of
Watauga County, especially the
volunteer members of the
Bloodmobile Program.

Barter Theatre Group Is Formed
¦

Robert Porterfield, managing
director and founder of the
Barter Theatre, announced to¬
day the formation of a steering
committee for the "Frienda of
the Barter" in Boone. The com¬
mittee, headed by Cieone Hod¬
ges, chairman, and Jackie By-

[nam, co-chairman, will oversee
the Ml* of season ticket books
in the Boone area, as well as
serving aa a liaison between the
Barter Theatre and the com¬
munity. The committee will alao
be responsible for aaslsting the
Barter in maintaining up-to-

date nulling lists for their area.

Anyone interested in becom¬
ing a "Friend of the Barter".
the requirement is an interest
in Barter Theatre and its tu¬
tor*.is urged to wlprt one
of the members of the com

mittee.

The Boom committee of the
"Friends of the Barter" will

aio patron membership book*
for Barter Theatre. These
books, which serve as season
tickets, and represent a 20%
saving over the box office price
of seats. Call AM 44223 if in¬
terested. . WMM

Fallout doubled by atom tnti
of 1802.


