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New Courses
This Spring

What do a busy college
president and a
mathematician have in
common? This spring, at
College of The Albemarle,
each scholar will be
teaching a course not
usually found in the quar-
terly class schedule.

COA President Dr. J.
Parker Chesson. Jr., who
came to the college 18 years
ago to teach biology, will
return to the classroom at 7
P.M. each Monday to teach
“Topics in Biology'*. The
three credit-hour course
begins on March 8.

Dr. Chesson. who is
chairman of the N. C.
Coastal Resources Com-
mission, will discuss a
number of environmental
and ecological concerns.
They include coastal
ecology, the geology and
ecology of the Dismal
Swamp, and environment
and politics Other topics
will observe the role of
science in society, as well as
a close look at the ethics
involved with DNA ex-
periments in the bio-
engineering field.

Julian Aydlett, algebra,
trigonometry, and calculus
instructor at COA. willturn
to stargazing each Tuesday
and Thursday night this
spring. What began as a
hobby some years ago. for
the mathematician has
emerged as a four credit-
hour course, Introductory
Astronomy. He will in-
doctrinate students to the
celestial bodies, their
magnitudes, motion and
constitution.

Registration for evening
students will remain open
untO March 12. according to
Jimmy Anderson, evening
programs director. Persons
interested in enrolling
should visit the Admissions
Office in Room A-122 at the
COA campus. Monday-
through Thursday from 8
A.M. untO 10 P.M.. and on
Friday from 8 A.M. untO
3:30 P.M. said Anderson.

Reagananomics

“Most of the signs of
Reaganomics are easy to
spot--the long-term
unemployed whose com-
pensation ends, the student
whose father died in Viet-
nam learning that he won't
get educational funds-but
some effects are more
subtle, if equaUy severe.”

This was the comment
today by N. C. Democratic
Party Chairman Russell
Walker of Randolph County.
He said: “A good example
of such indirect penalties is
the fact that people who pay-
hospital bills-either through
insurance or out of their own
pocket-are seeing those
bills rise sharply because of
Administration cuts in
Medicare and Medicaid"

Sen. Walker cited the
statement of Thomas A.
Rose, president of Blue
Cross and Blue Shield in
North Carolina, who told a
civic club that “as of
January 20, twenty-two
North Carolina hospitals
had implemented rate in-
creases amounting to sl6-
million additional gross
revenue because of federal
Medicaid reductions.”

Because North Carolina
hospitals get up to 27 per
cent fewer dollars from
government-insured pa-
tients than from private
patients, the Blue Cross
president said, people with
private health -care {dans in
effect paid $124-million to
subsidize Medicare and
Medicaid in North Carolina
during 1981. He said the
trend willincrease in 1982 as
the Administration's cuts
continue.

Sen. Walker said: 'This is
one place that Reaganomics
hits the middle income
group, that tries to keep its
billspaid, right in the family
budget. This will lead to
higher direct costs for
people using hospital and
medical services and to
higher hospital insurance
cost whether or not they
enjoy good health"
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