
Postal Service
Is Now Operating
Under Big Deficit

Postmaster Joe E. Ray of Mur¬

phy recently stated that the Postal
Service, which serves faithfully
every city, hamlet and rural-side
community in the United States,

is operating under the biggest def¬
icit in the history of this govern¬
ment agency. This condition is

, due first, to the high costs of op¬

eration. and secondly, to the fact

that the postal rates and fees have

not been increased sufficiently
comparable to the co6ts of opera¬
tions.

There will be a deficit in the

Postal Operations as long as pos¬

tage rates and fees are inadequate
to meet the costs of operation.
Congress alone can determine
whether the Post Office shall sup¬

port itself as any other business

by authorizing increases in pres¬
ent postage rates to meet the op¬

erating costs, or the Congress may
elect to keep the Postal System a

Service Institution that partially
supports itself under existing laws,
and then annually appropriate ad¬

ditional sums from the General
Fund to offset deficits

Since 1945 the fixed operating
costs have increased at a rate of
nearly 1.5 billion dollars on an an¬

nual basis, while additions to the
revenue by increases in postage
rates and fees have been incrased
only at the rate of §390 million a

year, a difference of over a billion
dollars in expenses above the an¬

nual additional revenues Even
with the new increase in postage
rates, it is estimated that there
will be about 669 million dollars
deficit in 1953. And inasmuch as

the deficit must be paid out of the
general taxation. Postmaster Gen¬
eral M. Donaldson is greatly con-

cerned. and has called attention to
the great increase in the cost of
salaries and transportation in the
current fiscal year over 1945.
The Post Office Department

cannot set its financial policies,
and does not. Department policies
are set by direction of the Con¬
gress. the Interstate Commerce
Commission and the Civil Aero¬
nautics Board, as well as other
regulatory agencies of the Fed¬
eral Government. I
The total obligations of the Post

Office Department for the fiscal
year. 1951. amounted to $2,458,-
000.000. 95.6 percent of that
amount was for salaries, transpor¬
tation. travel and rents.
The obligations estimated for

1952 amounted to S2.738.105.261,
while the estimate for 1953 shows
an increase of 3.2 percent over

the 1952 estimate.

ATHLETES FOOT GERM
HOW TO KILL IT.
IN ONE HOUR.

If not pleased, your 40c back. This
STRONG, fungicide SLOUGHS
OFF the outer skin to expose
buried fungi Kills it on contact.
Get Greaseless. instant-drying T-
4-L at any drug store. Today at
Mauney Drug Company.

Charles A. Faber
Taken By Death

Charle* Anthony Faber, 73, died
at 5 45 p. m Friday at the home of
a daughter, Mrs. Lawrence Neal.
Route 1, Franklin, after a linger¬
ing illness.
He was a native of New York

State, a baker by trade. He came

to this section in 1918 and operat¬
ed bakeries in Murphy and Frank¬
lin till about 1937 when he retired.

Funeral services were conducted
at 2 p. m. Sunday in Mount Hope
Baptist Church. The Rev. Arvil
Stafford and the Rev. Bill Shields
officiated. Burial was in Mt. Zion
Cemetery with Ivie Funeral Home
in charge. Pallbearers were Jess

Shop. Harry Stoudemire. Harley
Pendergrass, Bun Riser, J. H.
Brookshire and Fred Thomas.

Surviving are the widow, the
former Miss Ellen Hughes of Ma¬
con County; iwo daughters. Mrs
Mae Xeal and Mrs. Maggie Thom¬
as. Rout? 1. Franklin; one sister.
Mrs. May Walters of Chula Vista.
Calif., three grandchildren and a

number of nieces and nephews.

New Law Gives
Benefits To
Korean Veterans

Education and training benefits
comparable to those for World
War II veterans in the original
GI Bill are provided for veterans
who have served in the armed for¬
ces anywhere since June 27, 1950,
under terms of the new GI Bill for
Korean veterans which became
law with the President's signature
on July 16.
The new law took effect on that

date, but no training allowance
may be paid for any period prior
to August 20.
A veteran is allowed one and

one-half days of training for each
day he had in service after the
outbreak of the Korean fighting.
regardless of where the sen-ice
was performed.up to a maximum
of 36 months.
However, veterans who have

previously trained under earlier
veterans' training laws.the World
War II Gi Bill or Public Law 16
or R94 for the disabled.may get
up to 43 months, minus whatever
time they have already spent in
training under those earlier pro¬
grams.
A veteran may train in school

or college, on-the-job or on-the-
farm. so long as the school or

(raining establishment has been
approved by an appropriate State
Approving Agency and meets oth¬
er qualifications of the law. Only
one change of course program is
allowed, except under certain con¬
ditions determined by the VA.
Veterans in GI Bill training will

receive an education and training
allowance each month from the
Government, to meet part of the
expenses of their training and liv¬
ing costs. Tuition, books, supplies
and equipment will not be paid by
the Government. Instead, they
will have to be paid out of the
monthly allowance.

Rates for veterans in full-time

Lmst & Lrnst
And

Dahlberg & Co.
Certified Public Accountants

Announce
the consolidation of their practices

under the name of

ERNST & ERNST
with offices at 813 Burwell Building
Knoxville, Tennessee
The combined practices will be

under the direction of

Orville C. DeView, Manager
B. I. Dahlberg And D. R. Roark

Associate Managers

We Invite You In
To See And Compare
Our Complete Line Of

Home Furnishings
We Have A Few Good
Used Livingroom Pieces

Murphy Furniture Co*
"Everything For Your Home"

Tennessee Street J. V. Hoyle, Mgr.

Farmers To Visit
Burlev Test Farm

Burley growers and other Inter¬
ested persona In the mountain area

are Invited to attend the Annual
Field Day to be held at the burley
test farm near Waynesviile. There
will be a tour of the experimental
work and demonstrations beginn¬
ing at 0 a. m on Tuesday. August

,19
Those attending the field day

will have a chance to see the dif¬
ferent experiments that are being
conducted on the farm such as:

Management tests, fertilizer work,
spacing, topping, curing, organic
vs. mineral fertilizer, varieties,
¦etc., as well as hearing a discus¬
sion on results of previous experi¬
ments on this and other test farms
in the area. Research and Exten¬
sion people will be present to an¬

swer growers' questions.
G. H Farley, county agent, says.

"The Stat ion Superintendents
have many details to look after
ir. carrying out the various treat¬
ments. keeping records, and keep¬
ing experimental tobacco separate
at harvest time. For this reason,

interested farmers and other
croups are urged to visit the sta-
tion on the above day".
Warehousemen, fertilizer deal¬

ers. and business people are invit¬
ed to attend the field day and par¬
ticipate in the program with the
growers.

Mrs. M. Franks
Dies At Age 90

Funeral services for Mrs. Mar¬
tha Ellen Franks, 90. who died
July 9 at Blue Ridge. Ga.. were

held Sunday. July 13. at Rogers
Chapel Church at 10 a. m

The Rev. Fred Stiles, the Rev.
Carl Loudermilk and the Rev. Jeff
Chastain officiated, and burial was

in the old Martins Creek Ceme¬
tery.
Grandsons were pallbearers and

granddaughters were flower girls.
Surviving are three daughters.

Mrs. Octa I.oudemilk. Mrs hum
McCluro and Mrs. Jess Ledford
and two sons. Worth Franks of
Epworth, Shelby Frank of Mur¬
phy. and 26 grandchildren and 29
great grandchildren.
Bruer and Pack Funeral Home

of Copperhill was in charge

Seminary....
(Continued from page 1>

of Andrews is director of the Mur¬
phy center.

Dr. Duke K. McCall. president
ol the Southern Baptist Theologi¬
cal Seminary, says. "Southern
Baptist Theological Seminary grew
out of an address bv Dr James P.
Boyce in which he advocated an

institution which would minister
to the needs of all men called of
Clod regardless of their previous
academic preparation Participa-
tion of the Seminary Extension
.Department is a logical develop¬
ment of tnis idea. While the aca-j
demic standards of the Southern
Seminary have been raised to
challenge the best prepared coll¬
ege graduate, we have never lost:
sight of the many men who are'
unable to attend college much
more a seminary."

Dr. E. D. Head, president of
Southwestern Baptist Theological
Seminary, says. "Southwestern
Seminary is glad to contribute its
facilities to this joint project of
Southern Baptist Seminaries. As

training in schools and colleges
range from $110 to $160 per
month, depending on the number
of dependents. Those in training
less than full time will receive
lower monthly rates. For on-the-
job trainees the top monthly rates
vary from $70 to $105. For institu¬
tional on-farm trainees the rates
range from $85 to $130. The law
requires that on-job and on-farm
rates be reduced, at four-month
intervals, as the training progress¬
es and the veteran's own earnings
increase. It also specifies that vet¬
erans taking instltutitional on-
farm training must devote full
time to their program.

Wayne R. Lunsford
Given Promotion

With X Corp* in Korea.Wayne
R. Lunsford, son of Mr and Mrs.
Neil Lunsford, Andrews, N. C.. re-

cently received a promotion to

corporal while serving in Korea
with the 73rd Engineer Combat
Battalion.
The North Carolina soldier, a

demolition specialist in Company
A of the 73d, has been in Korea

1 since early this year. Before com¬

ing overseas in January, he was

stationed at Camp Stewart, Ga.
Corporal Lunsford entered the
Army in April 1951.

Participates In
4ir Exercises
Fort Wadsworth, N T..Pfc.

Paul E Brendle, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Lee H. Brendle, Murphy. N.
C. is participating in "Operation
Signpost," the exercise geared to
put the air defenses of the U. S. on

an operational basis.
He is a member of the Army's

52nd Anti-Aircraft Artillery Bri¬
gade which guards the New York-
New Jersey areas.

The brigade is working with the
ci* ilian Ground Observer Corps;
GOC' and with Canadian air de¬
fense forces during the July 19-
28 exercises..

Brendle. who entered the Army
in August 1949. graduated from
Murphy High School.

Cpl. Jack Jones
Finishes Course
Munich. Germany.Cpl. Jack

Jones, of Andrews, N. C., recently
graduated from the Seventh Ar¬
my's Non-Commissioned Officers
Academy at Munich, Germany.
The six-week course emphasized

the use of weapons. Army admin¬
istration. laetics. supply, physical
fitness and organization. Students
were carefully selected by their
organization commanders before
attending the school.

Jones, a small arms repairman
with th' 547th Engineer Combat
Battalion, entered the Army in
January 1951.

HOMECOMING
Tiipro will be a homecoming at

Snow Hill Church Sunday. August
10. I.unch will be served. Every¬
one in invited.

Most elm species.particularly
the American and winged elms
crowing in the East, Midwest, and
the South.are plagued with two
diseases known as Dutch elm di¬
sease and elm phloem necrosis.
Both are spread by insects

in all other phases of our work
these schrols stand shoulder to
shoulder to make available to you.
who at present find it impossible
to become resident students, the
opportunity to improve your use-

fullness in Kingdom service."
Dr. Roland Q Leavell, president

of New Orleans Baptist Theologi¬
cal Seminary, says, "In the Exten¬
sion Department the seminaries
reach out a friendly hand to all
who desire seminary' studies, but
cannot attend a seminary. This
department will inspire, instruct
and better equip many thousands
of ministers and christian work¬
ers."

Costs for the students are held
at the lowest price possible to
maintain a center. Each person
will pay $6 per course besides the
purchase of his books. Books for
all three courses will be approxi¬
mately $10. Thus the total cost
for any one student who takes
three courses will be $28 for
eighteen weeks. Some of the books
used last year will be used this
semester with new ones added.
Arrangements may be made

with Registrar Fred B. Lunsford
in case a student does not have
sufficient funds to avail himself
of this school.
Anybody can take these courses,

says Mr. Brooks The courses are

especially designed for preachers,
Sunday School teachers and other
christian workers.

WANTED TO BUY
Any Number of Clean, Late Morsel

Automobiles.
Bring Your Title and Ge*

the Cash.

BURCH MOTORS
"Ton Friendly Ford Dealer"

Phone95 Murphy, N. C.
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WANTED TO BUY For cadi high
tread repairable and alick re- j
cappable carcasses. Any amount,
any ilze. Graves Tires Co. Phone j
300, Murphy. 47-tft

LOST: One Lord Elgin man's
watch at Cane Creek. Bring to
Henn Theatre and receive liber-
al reward. 2-3tc

MILK FOR SALE: When You suf¬
fer from the heat cut down on

your starches. Drink more milk.
You will be more comfortable
in warm weather. Coble Dairy
Products, Inc. 2-tfe j

FOR RENT: House. Close in town.

Newly reworked and decorated.
Phone 44-W or 48. 2-3tc

PIANO TUNERS: Wilson Brothers j
Piano Tuners will be in Murphy i
this week. Call Mrs Margaret
Akin or Mrs. C W. Savage. Also
second hand pianos can be seen

at Mrs Akins Phone 354-X-J.
3-ltc

FOR SALE: Five-room block house
with block partitions but not as

yet plastered with overhead
sealed. 25 acres with some tim¬
ber. good well 12 miles out on

highway 64 between Murphy and
Coppcrhill, $3000 Also nice 6-
room house with screened in
back porch and 6 acres two miles
out from City limits on paved
road $3,250. Both for quick sale.
D. M. Reese, Real Estate. Phone
214 or see Fred Johnson or John
O'Dell. 51-tfc.

FOR SALE: Four lots suitable for
homes. Also 5-room house and
ga-age outbuilding. Call 239-J
mornings or see Mrs. Ralph
Ramsey. . 4.3lp

I HA\ E 2 ton International Truck,
good tires and ne-v overhauled
¦ngine, that I will trade to a re¬

liable man to cut and haul into
railroad 100 Cords of Chestnut
wood I will furnish the wood,
roads built into wood, about 20
miles haul. W. S. Dickey. 4-1 tc

FOR SALE: Good used Harley j
Davidson motorcycle, model 45,
530 Walnut Street. Tel. 202-J,
Andrews. N. C. 4-ltc

CAR OWNER: Responsible party
with 5 hours week spare time to
service route of new type vend¬
ing machines for a percentage
of the collections. No Selling or

' Soliciting. Income up to $300.00
monthly depending on number
of units party selected can ser¬

vice, with very good possibili¬
ties of eventually operating full
t:me. income increasing accord¬
ingly. As income is based on

profit-sharing plan, only respon¬
sible party with references and
$480.00 working cash capital for
inventory will be considered.
Job Hoppers need not apply.
For prompt interview include
phone in application. Box "N'\
Murphy, N C. 4-J-S-ltp

FURNISHED APARTMENT for'
rent in September. Steam heat.!
Addle Mae Cooke. Phone 20 or

97-W.

FOR SALE: House 'a Valleytown.
Large lot. good condition, /"ur-!
nished or unfurnished. See or'
write Joe ftlingensmltb, owner, I
Andrews, N. C. j. s- 3tc j

WELL DRILLING: Have your,
wells drilled by modern machin¬
ery. 6" and 8" domestic and'

| commercial wells. Macon Pump'
and Well Company. Write F. Br'
Rogers, Route 1. Franklin, N. C. j

51-9tp

FOR SALE: One 5-room house.
Good garden. Wired for stove.
Has hot and cold water. Inside
city limits. Will sell at a bar¬
gain for cash. Call 362-W for
information or see Frank Rob¬
inson 2-3tp

FOR SALE. Country cured hams.
Farmers Federation, Muiyhy, N.

C 52-3tc

FOR SALE: Used Stoker and long,
saw mill type boiler with prac¬
tically new flues. Addie Mae
Cooke, Murphy. 3_tf

FOR SALE: Five-room house lo¬
cated in HayesviUe. Stream flows
through property. An acre or

more of land available Phone
191-W Murphy. N. C. Box 351.
W. A. Sampson. 3-3tp

OUR Reoresentative will be ii.
Murphy Tuesday of every week
for new and used sewing mach¬
ines end repairs. Write Singer
Sewing Machine Co., ^ BoxJ
"N". Murphy, N. C. 49-9tp

tOIt SALE: Used furniture appro¬
ved by State Health Dept. Mur¬
phy Furniture Salvage just be¬
low Cherokee Hotel, Murphy, N.
C. Phone 298-J. 3-3tc

FOR RENT: Apartment. Wired for
electric stove. Private bath
Close in town Tom- Evans.
Phone 48 or 44-W. 3_3tc

.ANTED TO BUY: Corn in
shuck. Farmers Federation,
phone G2. Murphy, N. C. 4-tfc

FOR SALE: One Shirley kitchen
sink with double drain, one elec¬
tric gasoline pump and tank,
sale or lease. See at J. P. Trull's

Store, Marble. 4-3tp

SEWING, dressmaking and alter¬
ing done at home. Mrs. George I
Portwood. 420 Valley River Ave¬
nue. Phone 396-J. 4.3nc

FOR SALE: Seven and one-half
horse power General Electric
Motor and pulley in good con¬

dition. 6-inch rubber belt prac-
tically new, one pair floor scales
in good condition. Priced at J
$175. Would sell separately.
Moss Mill, Marble, N. C. 4-3tp

FOR SALE.Used Cars: 1951
Plymouth, 1950 Ford Club
coupe, 1949 Ford Club coupe.
1947 Ford Club coupe, 1952
Chevrolet Fieetline, 1941 Chev¬
rolet 4-door, 1940 Ford coupe
1950 Ford ton pickup. 1949
Dodge 2 ton trucks. If you're
looking for a bargain in used
cars see these at Chastain Motor

°°. 4-1tc

WANTED. Waitress or grill wo¬
man or man. Smoky Mountain
Trailways depot. Murphy, N. C.

\ 4-3tc

Don't Depend on
the Other Guy...
Here's a motorist who depended
on thy OTHER guy's Insurance,
and colMded with a bozo who had
none! If you arent covered, see us

today!
Let US. Take the Klsk!

Peacock Insurance
Agency

487 Murphy, n. a

FOB RENT.floor .Muling Ma¬
chine and polisher by hour or

1 day. Phone 100. Gibbs Hardware
and Auto Supply. 47-tfc

rOR SALE.Cinder Blocks, any
size. any amount Delivered
Palmer Bros., Pbone 202 Mur¬
phy, N. C. 4"^tfc

ANTIQUE BED for sale, three-
quarter size. Springs available
with it. Addie Mae Cooke, Mur¬

phy. 3-tf

FOR SALE: Country cured hams
Farmers Federation, Murphy, N
C. Phone 62. 4-tfc

FOR RENT: Four large rooms,
large front porch, separate en¬

trance. Hot water heater. Phone
100, Murphy. N. C 4-3tc

FOR SALE: Hot Point Refrigera¬
tor Good condition. Reasonable.
Mrs. G. W. Barton near H. E.
Stiles' sjore, Marble. 2-3tp

NATIONAL ORGANIZATION has
opening for two men in Chero¬
kee. Macon, Clay and Graham
Counties. No canvassing. No col¬
lecting. Excellent opportunity
for advancement Men selected
will earn $125-5225 per week.

We train you completely and
furnish qualified leads. If you
are dissatisfied with your pres¬
ent po ition a*sd earnings you
will find this well worth your
time to investiea.e. See Mr. Joe
Myers. 108 Hiawassee Street.
Murphy, N. C. or write General
Supervisor. Box 2726, Asheville,

N. C. 2-tfc

P.M. A.
ORDERS
FILLED ON'

0-14-14
2-12-12
0-9-27

20% Phosphate
60% Potash
Austrian

Winter Peats
Vetch

Crimaon Clover
Ladino Clover
Orchard.1 Grass

Fescue

FARMERS
FEDERATION
DON RAMSEY, MfT.

Phone 62 Murphy, N. C.

NO WASTED SPACE
IN THE NEW '51

Admiral

9j,cb-hT]
onir a

The** new Admiral* are the moat com¬
pact refrigerator* ever built.7M Cu. ft.
in the floor apace of the amaOeac pre-war
"kitchenette" models; 9.J cm. ft. id the
space of the old-style 11.) cu. ft.
la the space of an old Kyle

GIBBS HARDWARE And
AUTO SUPPLY

Phone 100 Murphy, N. C.


