
Fee real 3»
bedroom trailer. SlJS par
awatk plus deposit. Call
S21-W6 after 6 p.a

LEGAL NOTICE

j < -*.-

TQi Weadal C. Chwi
Take Nedce that a pleading

seeking relief against you has
been filed in the above- styled
special proceeding. That the
nature of the relief sought is
as follows: To secure an
iQsoiuie divorce mini you on

the grounds of one year's
separation.
You are required to make

defense to such pleading not
later than April 20, 1982, and
upon your failure to do so, the
juuty seeking service against
you will apply to the Court for
the relief sought.

This the 4th day of March,
1982.

LOCKLKAK, BROOKS
A JACOBS "

AI>TIIeeaiI?,,,T
P.O. Bex 999

fimkiihi.NC 28372
Tillgli¦ [919]521-3413

fa ha | illiii I March 11, 18
ami 25, 1982.

LEGALNOTICE
tetorflMhCnlM

Notion to CradHm and
Pilim «f

The underilgned, having
qualified aa Executor of the
estate of Elizabeth Oxendine
Maynor, deceased, late of
Eobeson County, this is to
notifv ill omoiit firms ind
corporations having claims
against said estate to exhibit
them to the undersigned on or
before the 11th day of Sep¬
tember, 1982, or be barred
from their recovery.
AH persons indebted to said

estate are asked to please
make immediste payment to
.the undersigned.

This the 11th day of March,
1982.

Theedsm Mayaer
P.O. Bast 12S

Pi sill ill, NC 28372

Te be pubRahsd March 11,18,
28 and April 1, 1982.

VOLUNTEERS NEEDED
The Kobeson County

Recreation and Park Commis¬
sion is looking for volunteers
to coach Senior Tar Heel
Baseball for boys 15-17 years
oid. Coaches are needed at
Magnolia High School. Little-
field High School, Maxton
High School, Fairmont High
School, South Robeson High
and Orrum High. If you are
interested in coaching one of
these teams please call the
Robeson County Recreation
and Park Commission at'
738-9061 or 738-9595.

INSTRUCTORS NEEDED
The Robeson County Re¬

creation and Park Commissi¬
on needs instructors in the

> following programs: tennis for
beginners and advanced; ae¬

robic dancing; ballet; baton;
cake decorating; floral arran¬

ging; children's arts and
crafts; clogging; square dan¬
cing; interior decorating; art
for beginners and advanced;
macrame; crochet; horticul¬
ture; children's drama;
weight watchers; belly dan¬
cing; slimnasties; modern
dance.

If interested with past
experience or capable of
inatmantinn time* nmoramc
UI-JUHVUUg Mivaw f Wg..

contact Mitchell at 738- 9061
or 738-9595 between the
hours of 8 a.m. and 5 p.m.
Monday through Friday.

ATTENTION
LUaOUS LOCKLEAKh now

¦¦Mrtfit with Mlas Kitty's
MaUe Home Sales on High¬
way 72, near Converse and
invites all of his friends to
come see him. Best prices
around.

NORTH CAROLINA
ROBESON COUNTY
IN THE GENERAL COURT

OF JUSTICE
DISTRICT COURT DIVISION

81CVD766
, SHIRLEY J. FLORES,

pW-RII,
.w

DELORES H. FLORES,
Defendant

NOTICE OF SERVICE OF
PROCESS BY PUBI1CATION

TO: Deloiea H. Fiona
Address Unknown

TAKE NOTICE that a

pleading seeking relief again¬
st vou has been filed in the
above-styled action. The
relief being sought is an order
garnishing your disposable
earnings for the support of
your minor child(ren), to¬

gether with attorney fees and
the costs of this action.
YOU ABE REQUIRED to

make defense to such plead¬
ing on or before April 27, 1982
and upon your failure to do so

plaintiff seeking service
against you will apply to the
Court for the relief being
sought. k

I THIS the 12th day of
March,. 1982

LOCKLEAR BROOKS
A JACOBS

BYt DEXTER BROOKS
Vaace Street
P.O.Box 999

Pembroke, North Carolina
28372

[919] S21-3413

TO BE PUBLISHED! March
18, 2S< ApHI 1, and 8th 1982.

NORTH CAROLINA
ROBESON COUNT*

IN THE GENERAL COURT
OF JUSTICE

SUPERIOR COURT
DIVISION

IN THE MATTER OF
THE ADOPTION OF

TERENA ST. PIERRE BY
DUEL GRANT SHEPPARD
AND HOPE LOCKLEAR

SHEPPARD

NOTICE

TOiPbillip Frank St.
Pierre.

TAKE NOTICE that a

petition has been filed in the
above entitled proceeding.
The nature of the relief

being sought is as follows:
"A proceeding has been

filed in the Office of the Clerk
of Superior Court of Robeson
County seeking a judicial
determination as to the aban¬
donment of Terena St. Pierre
by you, the legal father, in
that you abandoned said child
for more than six months next

preceding the institution of
I this action and for legal
adoption of said child."
You are required to make

defense to such pleading no
later than April 23, 1982, and
upon your failure to do so, the
parties seeking relief against
you will apply to the Court for
the relief sought.

This the 11th day of March,
1982.

DONALD W. BULLARD
ATTORNEY FOR
PETITIONERS

' Vance Street
P.O.Box 1182

Pembroke, NC 28372
[919)521-3556

TO BE PUBLISHED! MARCH
11, 18, ad 25, 1982

POSITION AVAILABLE
Dillon County Commissi¬

on on Alcohol and Drug
Abuse, 105 N. Railroad Ave.,
Dillon, SC has a counseling
position available immediate¬
ly. College degree in counsel¬
ing or social sciences is a

prerequisite to employment.
We are an equal opportunity
employer. Call 803- 774-6591
for appointment. Must live in
Dillon County or be willing to
relocate here.
iBBDBHBBBBBHOe

MALE OR FEMALE
ENJOYABLE full or part-time
work for someone with pleas¬
ing personality who speaks
correctly and dresses neatly.
Exp. in teaching, church work
or working with youth groups
helpful. FOR THE TYPE
PERSON WHO DOES NOT
USUALLY ANSWER ADS.
Must be available for training
immed. Write Box 30579.
Raleigh. NC 27633.

jBQBBBUUuonnrirH

. New tint should be greased and put in a moderate oven
for fifteen minutes to help prevent burned cake bottoms.

NORTH CAROLINA
BOMBON COUNTY
IN THE GENEBAL COURT
OF JUSTICE SUPERIOR
COURT DIVISION

EN THE MATTER OF THE '
ADOPTION OF ,

JOHN GEORGE LOCKLEAR
BY JOHN WESLEY
OXENDINE AND LUCY
JANE OXENDINE

NOTICE
To: The Either of John

George Locklear

Take Notice that a petition
has been filed in the above
entitled proceeding. The
nature of the relief being
sought is as follows: The
legal adoption of John George
Locklear, born of Dawn Lock-
iear.
You are required to make

response to such petition no
later than April 23, 1982, and
upon your failure to do so, the
parties seeking relief will
apply to the Court for the
relief sought.

This the 11th day of March,
1982.

DONALD W. BULLAKD
Attorney foe PettMtoneim

Vance Street
P.O.Bex 1182

Pembroke, N.C. 28372
[919] 521-3554

TO BE PUBIiSHEDtMmcb
11, 18 md 25, 1982.
I8BBBBBB88MBB

LEGAL NOTICE

North Carolina
Robeeon County
Mary McGirt Owens, Plaintiff

-ve-
Kennetb C. Owens,

notice at Service of
Process by Pabllcatlon

TO: KENNETH C. OWENS
Tate Notice that a peading

seeking relief against you
has been filed in the above
entitled action in the office of
the Cl^-k of Superior Court of
Robeson County. The nature
of the relief sought is as
follows:
To secure an absolute di¬

vorce from you and to obtain
custody of the minor child,
Rodney D. Owens.
You are required to make

defense to such pleading not
later than May 7, 1982, and
upon your failure to do so,
that the party seeking service
against you will apply to the
Court for the relief sought.

This the 24th day of March,
1982.

LOCKLEAR, BROOKS
ftJACOBS

by Arnold Loddear,
Attorney for Plaintiff

Vance Street
P.O. Box 999

Pembroke, NC 28372
Telephone. [919] 521-3413

' To be published. March 25,
April 1 and 8, 1982.

DAVTOMEET
The Disabled American

Veterans Chapter 7 will hold
their monthly meeting on:

'Tuesday, April 6, 1982. The
meeting will begin at 8 p.m.
in the Robeson County Public
Library. All veterans are
invited to attend.

"Some folks art too polita
to be up to any pood."

Kin Hubbard

I EVANGELIST AT
PROSPECT CHURCH

REVIVAL
The Rev. Dr. Israel Ruc-

ker will he the evangelist for
the. prospect United Metho¬
dist Giurch Revival. March
29-4-2. at 7:30 p.tp. nightly.
Each night an inspirational
ministry of music will be
teatuieu under the direction
of Mr. Harold Jacobs. The
nursery will also be opes
nightly.

Dr. Rucker is Director of
The Commission on Mission
and Ethnic Minority Concerns
for the Council on Ministries
of the Southeastern Jurisdic¬
tion of the United Methodist
Church at Atlanta, Georgia.
He was educated in the public
school of his home state of
Mississippi, at Rust College
where he later received an

Honorary Doctorate 'at Gam¬
mon Theological Seminary.
B.D.. and at Interdenomi¬
national Theological Center.
M. Div. The Rev. Rucker is a

veteran, has taught in public
school, has pastorcd numer¬

ous churches, has been a

District Superintendent and
has served on the SEJ Council
of Ministries staff at Atlanta'
for nine years.

Dr. Rucker has numerous

writings such as. "The 'How
To' of Hunger Action and
Community Economic Deve¬
lopment." He has had num¬

erous positions in government
and community, such as Dir¬
ector of Greenwood Leflore
County Mississippi Food
Stamp Program *66-'68. He
has received many citations of
recognition anu appreciation
for distinguished service in
the church and in the ci\ and
educational arena.
On behalf of Prospect Unit¬

ed Methodikt Church, the
pastor, the Rev. Robert Man-
gum extends a warm and
enthusiastic invitation to the
public to attend Revival Ser¬
vices March 29-April 2 at 7:30
p.m. each night.

I DID YOUKNOW?

There are 2222 persons of voting age (41%)
living in the greater PEMBROKE PRECINCT who

are not registered? 1696 (46%) unregistered in Maxton?

661 (29%) in Smiths?

REGISTERNOW- SO THAT YOUCAN

VOTE IN THESPRING ELECTION.

Revival Set at Sandy Plains
Methodist Church

Revival services will be¬
gin Sunday, March 28, and
continue through Friday,
April 2. Service on Sunday
evening will begin at 7 p.m.
and services throughout the
week at 7:30 p.m. Each night
will feature special music
under the direction of Mr.
Bruce Jacobs, Mrs. Panthia
Locklear and Miss Gina May-
nor. The nursery will also be
made available.
The guest evangelist speak¬

ers are the Rev. Harold
Woods and the Rev. Samuel
Wynn. Both of the speakers
are natives of Robeson Coun¬
ty-
The Rev. Woods is a

graduate of PSU, B.S. degree,
T

certificate to teach in public
schools, science, Bible and
history. He was elected to
Who's Who Among the Stu¬
dents in American Colleges
and Universities. "He is a
graduate of Asbury Theologi¬
cal Seminary, Wilmore, K.1
receiving a B.D. degree. He
has served the following
pastorates in Robeson Coun¬
ty: Cherokee Chapel, New
Bethel and Hopewell Holiness
methodist Churches. He was
elected presiding bishop of
the 1981 Lumber River Holi¬
ness Methodist Annual Con¬
ference. He is married to
Mrs. Rosa D. Bullard and has
two daughters and one son.
The Rev. Samuel Wynn is a

graduate of PSU with a B.S.
degree and Asbury Theologi¬
cal Seminary with a B.D.
degree. He has been accepted
at St. Paul School of Theology
in Kansas City, Missouri, in
the Doctoral of Ministry Pro¬
gram. He has served the
following appointments:
Summer Intern 1977 on the|
Chippewa Indian Reservation
in Upper Pennisula of
Michigan, intern Pastor at

Prospect United Methodist
Church 1978, Ordained Dea¬
con in the N.C. United
Methodist Conference, Speci¬
al appointment on the Navajo
Reservation. Shiprock, NM,
1979-80. He is presented
serving as the Pastor of the
Pleasant Grove and Fairview
United ethodist Churches.
He is married to Louella
Chase and they have one

daughter. Mrs. Wynn is an

native of New Mexico.
The congregation and then-

pastor, the Rev. Simeon F.
Cummings, extends a cordial
invitation to the public to
attend and worship with
them.

r

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
REVIVAL

Pembroke First Baptist
Church will be conducting
revival services beginning
Sunday night, March 28, and
continuing through Thursday,
April 1.

Conducting Jre revival will
be Rev. John D. Bryant,
pastor of First Baptist; Rev.
Larry Locklear, pastor of
Galilee Baptist Church; and
f\cv. Lttwicntc nuujr, puivi
of Berea Baptist Church.

Rev. John D. Bryant, the
church pastor, encourages
everyone to attend the nightly
services. Special music will be
presented by various quartets
and church choirs.

THE REAL
ESTATE CENTER
110 west Ninth Street
Lumberton, North Carolina
Bus. (919) 738-8151
PEMBROKE: A Robeson
County dream come true" in
this 3 or 4 bedroom, 3 bath,
brick veneer home located in
the country with 5.7 acre lot.
This country home features
den with fireplace, double
garage, large screened-in
porch to relax in on those hot
summer days and nights, and
a lot more. Owner financing
available and priced at
$69,500. Call Helen Locklear
today for details.

JANE SMITH..739-5577
Pat Critchett, G.R.I..738-1309
Shirley BeB...738-1517
Helen Loddear. 738-6100
Norma Uppaid..738-3633
Martha Averttt.738-4995
Jim Anderson...738-1060
Mary Lob Odom.739-9841

J*^9Po»dea»ly Owned and

EDITOR'S NOTEi Dm to Rev. Reck- REVIVAL
er'a wife udeigefag emergency surgery SERVICES
the above Revival has been reachextoleH RESCHEDULED!
JVIarch 29-April 2, 1982.

mm

Town of Pembroke-Three bed
room, one bath home on

fenced in lot. Owner financing
at a low interest rate. Price
132,500.
Pembroke-One and one half
miles from Pembroke beauti¬
ful country home on four and
one half acres of land. Three
bedrooms, two baths and
much more.

Lumberton-Four bedrooms,
bath, large fenced in yard.
Only $22000.
Baaioeaa for sole on highway '

74. For more information call
Adeline Maynor. A & A
Realty. Pembroke, home 738-
2094, office 521-3629.

A & A INSURANCE
& REALTY

Post Office Box 1498,3rd St.
Pembroke, N.C.

Office Ph. 521-3629
Home Ph. 738-2094

^

Deep
Branch

Pre-School
Clinic

DEEP BRANCH PEE
SCHOOL CLINIC PLANNED

The Pre-School Clinic for
Deep Branch Kindergarten
will be Thursday, April 1,
1982 from 9 a.m. until 12
noon. If your child will be five
years ok) by October 16, 1982,
please bring the following
items to register your child
birth certificate; shot record;
physical examination. Please
do not bring your child.

>.* WWWWWWW!

T^needincome 5
* tax help? £jf .Over 25 Years Experience.J We keep abreast of Tax Law -jf

Changes to save you more
on Your Tax Dollar. -ft

J HOURS: 4 pm-10pm Mon.-Fri. <k
8am-6 pmSat. *

* THE TAXSHELTER £
)f College Plaza . Pembroke, NC J* Phone 521-8384 X

f ¦¦ . .. 1 .. .. ¦¦.. 11 ..

WE WORK FOR YOU!
H

:' "We Have The Insurance to fit
, Your Particular Need "

.,
If You Nood Inturaoco of Any Kind, Sn...

, > PEMBROKE* Acme *om Nmbielw FCX I

DIAL INSURANCE A6ENCYI
*

WE HAVE A VEBY NICE SURPRISE FO* YOU!

in pafrlleb n .r "I.'nlrrV. L*^ t-t ~~m .-* J
yM . vifjr alee earprtee. It wll b« iiHilthg that ]
wfl *.( weigh aa aick aa geld, bat K wl be as X
vitubk as geld. Yea caa beep It, ase It, er give H x

away aad It *¦ brlag yea hspplaees.
Heia Is aB yea det SUp a Ml ef aay denoadaatton

address aa It, aad and It. By retara anfl, wa wll |
V saad year sarprlse. Yep wfl be able te add ta It aad I

make H erve aare velaable. Al IimH . wfl be I

iXl'telllbtblT^iHZ* 0
X the werid. Aba, yea wfl get baa a eidasKe V
§ II Iilbigaapfcl < copy W the beak.

Sbp a hflaracheck tatpaa eavabgaaa« mm* Mas

0 be richer whaa yaa lacefre It. Pray far aa, far ear
0 beak ta be paMhbsi, Mr Ito aifcdstey.

WITNESS FOB CHIRST PCND
P.O. Bai 14, I

f;*e»bwM,HC 28371 i

URGENT
PEMBROKE NEEDS 2,000 VOTERS

REGISTERED IN THIS PRECINCTBEFORE
THE PRIMARY ELECTION. REGISTER ON
SATURDAY, MARCH 27, 1982 IN THE
PARKING LOT OF THE PIQQLY WIQQLY.
IN CASE OF INCLEMENT WEATHER,
REGISTRATION WILL BE HELD IN THE
PEMBROKE COURT HOUSE.

THIS REGISTRATION DRIVE IS BE¬
ING SPONSORED BY THE PEMBROKE
PRECINCT OF THE ROBESON COUNTY
INDIAN CAUCUS.

t


