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N. Y. Herald Tribune To Conduct "Progress Of 
Freedom" in The U. S. A. At Hunter College

\

cooperatives and labor unions, 
and Philip G. Ha'mmer, former 
executive director of tlie Com­
mittee for the South, who vwll 
deal with the economic aapects. 
C. A. M cknight, director of tlA 
Southern Education Report 
ing Service will speak on “La' 
tent Leadership in  the South.”

Case studies and reports on 
some community solutions wljl 
be reported on by such speak' 
ers as Dr. Herman Long, direc­
tor of Race Relations of the A- 
merican Mission Association ot 
the Board of Home Missions of 
the Congregational Cljristian, 
Churches; Harvey E. Stahl, su­
perintendent of schools of Clay- 
mont, Del.; Mrs. Pavdine Dyson, 
a teacher a t Claymont’s all- 
Negro elementary school; Jean 
Rogers, education w riter for the 
“Washington Post apd Times 
Herald”; Margaret Butcher, a 
member of the District of Co­
lumbia Board of Education and 
a teacher at Howard Univer­
sity; and Mrs. Henry A. Bart­
lett, president of the Federation 
of Citizens Association of Wash­
ington, D. C.

Segregation in the New York 
City schools w ill be considered 
by Dr. Kenneth B. Clark, as- 
iiociate psychology professor at 
City College, who has charged 
that there is such segregation 
and A rthur Levitt, president of 
the Board of Education, whq 
has ordered an impartial inves­
tigation of Dr. C lark’s allega­
tions by the Public Education 
Association, a lay civic group.

Dr. Charles Johnson, presi­
dent of Fisk University, will be 
the concluding speaker a t the) 
first session, which will include 
a musical interlude by the In- 
terracial-Fellowship Chorus di­
rected by Harold Aks.

"The Progress of Freedom in 
the U.S.A.” will be the over-ail 
theme of the twenty-third an­
nual New York Herald Tribune 
Forum to be heid on Monday 
and Tuesday evenings, Oct. 18 
and 19.

The first session, to open at 
8 p.m. on Oct. 18 at the H untw  
College auditorium, 69th St. be­
tween Park and Lexington 
Aves., will be devoted to dis­
cussions of progress toward in­
tegration in tiie schools since 
the May 17 Supreme Court de­
cision directing the end of ra­
cial segregation in education. 
Key figures in the controversy 
over segregation and education­
al and civic leaders directly 
concerned with the problem 
will participate in the discus­
sion which will include a con­
sideration of segregation in New 
York City schools.

The second session, to begin 
at 8 p.m. the following even- 
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dorf-Astoria, will be concerned 
with national progress under 
the first Republican adminis­
tration in twenty years. Five 
Cabinet members will be pre­
sent and will be questioned by 
experts from various fields. The 
Democratic and Republican 
candidates for governor of New 
York and Senator from New 
Jersey will also be on the  pro­
gram.

The first session, on progress 
in integration, will be concern­
ed with such issues as the mean­
ing of the Supreme Court de­
cision for the South and a con­
sideration of the South’s re ­
sources for meeting the chal­
lenge presented by the decision 
and the leadership available for 
exploiting these resources. First 
hand reports will be presented 
from Delaware and Washington

as well.
The program will open with 

a dramatization of the fight 
against segregation that led to 
the Supreme Court decision, 
presented by two of the cen­
tral figures. The decision itself 
and its meaning for the South 
will be discussed by Harry S 
Ashmore, executive editor of 
the “Little Bock, Ark., Gazette’ 
and author of the recently pub­
lished study, “The Negro and 
the Schools,” sponsored by the 
Ford Foundation for the Ad 
vencement of Education.

The South’s resources for 
meeting the challenge posed by 
the Supreme Court opinion will 
be discussed by George Mit 
chell, director of the South 
ern Regional Council, who will 
consider such community or-; 
ganizations as churches, farm
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Attorney Carl D. Coleman of! 
Washington, attended the fune- 
ral rites of his grandfather, 
Charles Brown, lasts Sunday.

Misses Lucille Graves andi 
Mary Jane Bullock spent the 
weekend in Baltimore visiting 
relatives and friends.

Charles H. Baines has joined^ 
the staff of the McClary Haul­
ing Co.

Kenneth*Stroud," son ̂ f"M i5. 
Odessa Sb-oud, of Cleveland; 
Sttreet has joined the United 
States Navy. Kenneth is a for­
mer scout leader.

Miss Jacqueline Barnes, a 
1954 graduate of N. C. College, 
has been named assistant stage 
manager at Greenwich New. 
Theatre in . New York. She has 
a twelve month contract. Ber­
nard Shaw’s “Major Barbara” 
is the theatre’s current produc-i 
tlon. Miss Bames is the niece 
of O. G. Garland, proprietor 
of the  Gay Street grocery. In 
the course of her w ork a t N.C. 
College, Miss Barnes gol a wide 
range of theatrical experience 
from Greek tragedy to modem 
molodrama.

Club Sepia
Club Sepia on High Street Is 

now under the directorship of 
Charles Brooks. The club has 
been renovated and is catering 
to individuals over 18 years of 
age. The new manager has lined

up several good fall attractions 
and will still cater to. parties, 
luncheons, suppers.

Mrs. Brooks appealed to {he 
public this week as to the pro­
per behavior to be observed in 
and around the club.

Funeral rites for 1 ' Charles 
Brown of Doe Street were held 
on Sunday, Oct.' 10, from the 
St. Paul AME church with the 
pastor. Rev D. W. Williams, 
officiating. Out of town rela ­
tives attending the funeral were 
Mrs. Anna Chaney and Mias 
Brown of the Bronx; Atty. 
Carl D. Coleman of Washing­
ton; Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Lee. 
Mr. Hurley Williamson, Mrs. 
Hatchett and Albert Brown of 
Yanceyville; Mrs. Burlie Web­
ster and M rs.'Izola Francis of 
Brooklyn, Robert and Alfred 
Mitchell of Jamica, N. Y., and 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Wilson of 
the Bronx, Mrs, Dora Farris, 
and Floyd King of Reidsville.

A ll persons desiring that 
certain courses a t the night 
school be given a t Langston 
should make known their in­
tentions by registering.

had been led to collect data on 
a series of 30 patients sutfM ng 
from the more serious forms of 
cardiovascular disease who had 
safely flown considerable dis­
tances. One such patient, he 
said, was a man of 58 with ex­
treme high : blood pressure 
whose a ir travel insurance busi­
ness required him to fly many 
thousands of miles each year. 
Another was a m an of 68 who 
had suffered a heart attack but 
safely flew 100,000 miles during 
World W ar II, entertaining 
troops. Another patient de­
scribed by Dr. Bourne was a 
woman with extensive rheuma­
tic heart disease who has flown 
more than 13,000 n^iles in re­
cent years.

The chief stresses to which 
people may be subjected 
through flying are  oxen lack, 
excitement and a ir sickness, 
said Dr. Bourne. Pressurized 
cabins in modern planes com­
pensate for possible ox^g^n 
difficiency, said Dr. Bourrte, 
adding that "the other factors of 
air sickness and nervousness 
are readily preventable by pro­
per remedies.”
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Executor’s Notice 
HAVING QUALIFIED as Exe­

cutor of the  estate of John B.
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BEEF AND FRESH VEGETABLE STEW 
  TODAY'S BEST FOOD BUY

to promote beef stew. In the first 
campaign of its kind, these great 
industries are helping the con­
sumer in two ways. They are 
helping us take advantage of 
nutritious and economical food 
buys, and are attempting to avoid

A rich, brown beef stew  ̂full 
of fresh vegetables is every­
body’s favorite one-dlsh meal. 
I t’s nutritious, too. The carrots, 
onions and potatoes provide the 
vitamins, minerals and energy 
we need. The beef gives us 
TieHllh-gTvlng protein.

'Xhis fall the country’s beef 
and fresh vegetable industries, 
together with the U. S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture, have en­
tered into a co-operative drive

mean more tax dollars.
Take advantage of this oppor­

tunity and serve beef stew often. 
Your family and your budget 
will both benefit.
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Doctors wUl tell you that good blood is essential to 

good health. When your bkx>d is starved for iron, 
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OK Plane Trips 
For Heart Ailers

WASHINGTON 
Plane trips offer no more 

than “a very moderate risk” to 
people w ith heart disease, es­
pecially in modern pressurized 
aircraft, a British physician 
told the Second World Congress 
of Cardiology and the 27th 
Scientific Sessions of the A- 
merican Heart Association here 
today. Because he had consider­
ed prevailing views on air 
travel for heart patients exces­
sively conservative, said Dr. 
Geoffrey Bourne of London, he
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It’s An Easy Matter To Call 
Your Doctor, But Will You 
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If You Arc Not Securc, Write 
Or Sec One Of Our Agents 
Immediately About Our Hos- 
j)italization Plan, And Health 

And Accident Insuirance.

SOUTHERN FIDELITY MUTUAL 
INSURANCE COMPANY

Agents: THOMAS NICHOLS *  BICHARD B. WALEEB

Jones, deceased, late of Dur­
ham County, North Carolina, 
this is. to notify all persons hav- 
mg claims against said estate to 
exhibit them to the undersigned 
a t Bahama, North Carolina, on 
or before the 10th day of Sept. 
1999, or this notice will be 
plead in bar of their recovery. 
All persons indebted to said es­
tate will please m ake immedi­
ate payment.

This 8th day of September, 
1954.
Joim Maynard Jones,
Executor Of The Estate Of 
John B. Jones, Deceased 
M. Hugh Thompson, Attorney

NORTH CAROLINA 
DURHAM COUNTY

EXECUTOR’S NOTICE 
HAVING QUALIFIED Exe­

cutor of the Estate of Airs. S. V. 
Norfleet, deceased, late of Dur­
ham County, North Carolina, 
this Is to notify all persons hav­
ing claims againsts said estate 
to exhibit them to the under­
signed on or before the 15th 
day of September, 1959, or this 
notice wUl be pleaded in b an  of 
their recovery. All persons In­
debted to said estate will please 
make immediate payment.

Dated this 14 day of Septem­
ber, 1954.
Mechanics and Farmers Bank, 
Executor Of Estate O f Mrs. S. 
V. Noi^leet, Deceased.
M. Hugh liiompson. Attorney 
Sept. 18, 25, Oct. 2, 9, 16, 23.
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