
Highlands Highlights
MRS. H. G. STORY

BAPTIST CHURCH
Ra». H. M. Allay, Pastor

10:00 a.m. Sunday school.
II :00 a.m. Sermon
7 p. m.B. T. U.
8 p. ioA-Sermon. '

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH
Rav. H. T. BrMfTun, Ministai
>0:00 a.m..Sunday school and

Bible classes.
11 a. m. worship service and

sermon.
i 7 p. na..Christian Young Peo¬
ples League.

METHODIST CHURCH
Ra». J. S. Higfin*. Pastor

10 a. m. Sunday School.
11 a. m..Sermon.
2:30 p. m. Preaching, Glenville.

EPISCOPAL CHURCH
OF THE INCARNATION

Ra*. A. Rwfu* Morgan, Ractor
10 a. m..Sunday School.
11 a. m..Morning prayer and

sermon. v

ANNE ANDERSON
GIVES MASQUERADE PARTY
Twenty.five memhiers of .the jun¬

ior set enjoyed the masquerade
party giwn by Anne Ajiderson
Tuesday evening from seven to
nine o'clock at the home of her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles J.
Anderson, in celebration ot her

b thirteenth birthday anniversary.
Invitations to the party bore the
character each guest was to rep¬
resent.

_

With her brunette coloring, the
young hostess was a picture 04
colonial loveliness in a Scarlet
O'Hara costume of whit* net witn
full skirt and many ruffles. Her
older sister, Angela, was dressed
as a Hawaiian girl, and her two

younger sisters, Mary Deas and
Jane, as a country doctor and
little farmer. Stewart Bndgnon
represented a farmer's wife. Kath¬
arine Smith wore the cos*""1*
a baby ; Albert Bridgman that ot
a tramp, and David Bridgman
came dressed as a negro.
Eleanor Bridgman. as OKve Oil ;
Marna Cobb, flenry; Sarah HaJV
Maggie; Betty Potts, Blondie,
Johny Crunkleton, the Lone Ran-
ger ; Juanita Alley, Mrs. Kaitsen-
jammer, and Eplhraim Pnnce,f Grandfather.
Peggy Potts was dressed as a

pirate; Isabel Hall, a fainr: M»n;Bascom Cook, an old fashioned
lady; Baddy Hall, a soldier; Didc
Schiffli, a colonial gentleman; John
Schiffli, an Indian; Richard
Thompson, a baiby^Potts, a clown ; Mattie p<**?old fashioned princess, and Eliza¬
beth Newton, an old fashioned
lady.
Soon after their arrival, Anne

took her guests on a short parade
of the downtown streets before
serving them refreshments at High¬
lands drug store. During the even¬

ing. nuts and mints were wsrved
from Silver bowls on the dining
table which held a: centerpiece ot
white and yellow flowers.

, The box of candy given as a
"*?»rize in the living: room hunt, and

Mattie Potts, Jaraes Potts and
Buddy Potts wes* prize winners
in "he guessing (games.
MISS DOROTtfY BROWN
IS BRIDE OF W. C BEATY
A marriage announcai^t of in¬

terest here is tha» of Miss Dorothy
Brown of West .Union, S. C,
Highlands, to \y»lliam Chesterfield
Beaty of Senec:*.
The wedding nvas solemnized at

the home of th*. bride's
West Union on Sunday afternoon,
June 6th. Rev. R. B. DuPree was

the officiating, number and the
impressive rir*
The wedding music w«a

by Mrs. DuPree.
The bride wore a skyland blue

dress of angel skin cvpe with
white accessories and a corsage o

pink roses. She is the daughter of
w Mm L. M. Brown whoMr. and Mrs. i-

Satulabown a summer home on satu >

mountain.

. MRS. POTTS 'ENTERTAINS
CARD CLUB
Mrs. C C. Podts entertained 16

members of the Wednesday card
club' and other friend* with a

bridge-luncheon at.the Potts House
Wednesday. Among the flower
decorations was a Jxnvl of gorge¬
ous pink radiance noses and sciz-
anthus, a gift to Mrs. Potts from
the Sloan Gardens.

In the four table game, Mrs.
£ R. Gilbert won high aaDre dub

prize and Mrs. Elliott) Caziarc the
traveling (prize. The high score

guest prize was woo by Mrs. E.
E. Branch of JJacksotiville, Fla.
who is spending 'some time at the
Potts Houes.

CARL CHASTA1N WOUNDED
AT ATTU. RECOVERING

, Mr. and Mrs. Ed Chastain haw
received notice that *h«ir «on, Car
A. Chastain, wbo wtu wounded it

action on Attu Island, is makini
. splendid rteovcry Wi a Vancou
v#rt With., kwiuL x

Bible School
For Community To Begin

Monday At Baptist
Church

A two weeks community Bible
school, representing all the High-,
lands churches, will open here on

Monday under ithe principalship of
Rev. J. S. Higgins, pastor of the
Methodist churdh. The school will
be held in the Baptist church be¬
cause of its more adequate facili¬
ties for taking care of the differ¬
ent departments.
Miss Mariie Neely and Miss Bar-

bora Zoellner will have charge of
the Beginners. The primary de¬
partment will be under the direc¬
tion of Mrs. H. T. Bridgman, who
will be assisted by Miss Angela
Anderson. Miss Eva Krewer will
have charge of the intermediates
and Mr. G. W. Dmltoon the Juniors.
Helpers in the intermediate and
junior departments wiH be the
Misses Dorothea Harbison, Rebec¬
ca Nail, Maxie Wright and Mar¬
garet Wiiey. Music will be by I
Mrs. J. S. Higgins.

Hand Work For Boys
There will he some type of

handwork for the boys under the
supervision of Rev. H. M. Alley
and Kev. H. T. Bridgman. One of
the contemplated projects for the
girls is the teaching of knitting
by Miss Nail.
School hours will be from nine

thirty to eleven thirty followed by
a ¦thirty-minute recreational period.

Mr. Higgins said a warm wel¬
come awaits those of all ages
from four years to as old as they
will come. Mr. Higgiros also ex¬

pressed the hope that s^me form
of transportation may be had for
those in outlying sections. Last
year the Bible school had an en¬

rollment of eighty-four and ithree
cars were in daily use in getting
member* to and from the school
who were too far out to walk.
This year <he people of the Gear

Creek section wish to join with
the Highlands Bible school pro¬
vided transportation arrangements
can be made.

BILLY BRYSON COLLECTS
MAGAZINES FOR PRISONERS

Billy Bryson, 12 year old son of
Mr. and Mrs. W. A Bryson, has
a very noteworthy hobby. On his
own initiative Billy gathers Life
magazines and distributes them to
the maintenance crew of convicts
working on the highway, when
they are in this section. The past
week Billy's supply ran short, but
he hopes to be better prepared
next time.

APPLEYS ANNOUNCE
BIRTH OF SON
Mr. and Mrs. Patrick Leonard

Appley hav* announced the birth
of a son, Patrick Leonard, Jr., on

June 3rd, at their home in San
Francisco, Calif.

"Pat'' Appley's parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Leonard G. Appley, and his
two sisters, the Missies Peggy and
Mary Appley, are also residents
of San Francisco for the duration.
The Appleys have beien summer
home owners here for a number
of years but due to war activities
they will not make their usual
summer visit this season, much to

<fie regret of their many Highlands
friends.
LIBRARY OPEN
TUESDAYS, SATURDAYS
Until further notice the Library

is open on Tuesday and Saturday
afternoons from four to six o'clock.
Please note the change in hours.

< t

Personal Mention
» . ».*

David Smith, U. S. Naval Re¬
serve, Washington, D. C, and Cor¬
poral G. W. Fant of Augusta, Ga.,
have returned to tSr^ir respective
posts of duty after a visit here
with Mr. and Mrs. S. C Russell.
Other weekend guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Russell were Dr. and Mrs.
M. R. Smith of Washington, and
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Smith and
family of Pendleton, S. C

Mr and Mrs. Jack M. Hall and
daughter, Joanna, of Atlanta were
weekend guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Carles J. Anderson. During their
stay here th^ey visited Mr. and
Mrs. W. R. Potts, Miss Caroline
Hall and Mr. and Mrs. Tudor Hall.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur L. Bliss
of Washington, D. C., arrived
Thursday to spend fhe season at
'Ten-Ridffe", their summer hom/
overlooking Sunrise View.

Mr. and Mrs. R. H. McCord of
Atlanta are at their summer home
at Highlands Country Club for
the season.

I Mrs. M. M. Hunter and daugh-
' ter, Miss SaHie Hunter of Pendle''
I ton, S. C., were guests of Mr. and
¦ Mri. W. S. Davis last week. Mn.

Huater, who hu been 111 for mv>

tral months, especially wished to
visit her "beloved mountains" at
this season to see the kalmia, aza¬
lea and rhododendron in bloom.

Highlands Grill, owned by W. P.
Hedden, opened Saturday under
the management of Mrs. Fred S.
Littleton, Sr. Mr. Hedden will con¬
tinue his defense work in Dameron,
Md., where he has been for the
past several months.

Mr. and Mrs. John A. Russell
and daughter, Julia Anne, of Or¬
lando, Fla., arrived Sunday to
spend the summer at their place
near Mirror Lake. With them are
Miss Elizabeth Ledbettfr and a
friend of Anderson, S. C

Mr. and Mrs. Charles du Bignon
of Miami, Fla., returned to High¬
lands Sunday. Mrs. du Bignon will
be assistant hostess at Highlands
Inn, which is being operated again
this season by Mrs. Frank B.
Cook.'

"Esteliel Lodge'' in Lindenwood
Park, belonging to Mr. and Mrs.
S. T. Marptt, has been leased for
the season by Mr. and Mrs. Johi^Bemardi and daughter of Colom¬
bia, S. c.

Mr. Samuel Stokes of Washing- |
ton, D. C, spent the weekend
here looking after improvements
that are being made at his place
recently purchased from Mrs. E.
S. Douglas.

Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Hunter of
Harwell, Ga., are spending this
w,eek at Hotel Edwards and have
with them their daughter and
granddaughter, Mrs. Jack M. Hall
and little Miss Joanna Hall of
Atlanta.

Herman Norton and Tolrver Wil¬
son of the U, S. Air Corps.
Camp Davis, are spending this
week with their parents, Mr. and
Mrs. R. E. Norton and Mr. and
Mrs. L. B Wilson

Attending the Young People's
Conference of the Asheville Pres¬
bytery in Montreat this week are
the Missies June Thompson, Angela
Anderson, Anne Anderson, Marna ,

Cobb, Katherine Smith, Sarah Hall,
Eleanor Bridgman, and Albert
Bridgman. ,

Mr. and Mrs. Kenyon B. Zahner
and son Kenyan, Jr., of Greenville,
S. C., are at their cottage on Lake
Sequoyah. Mrs. Zahner and son

are here for the season and Mr.
Zahner, whose business at times
calls him wifhm a few miles of
Highlands, expects to spend a por¬
tion of the summer here.

Prof, and Mrs. J. A Hodges,
their son and daughter, Herman
and Catherine, of Daytona Beach,
Fla., are at their cottage on Mir¬
ror Lake. Mr. Hodges is principal
of Holly Hill high school in Day¬
tona. He ill assist S. T. Marett in
his real estate office this season.

Mrs. W. C. Wardlaw of Atlanta
is spending this week at home on

Bearpen Mountain, and has as her
guest Mrs. Robert M. Calloway,
also of Atlanta.

Bobbie Weaver Hopper is visit¬
ing his aunt, Mrs. Clyde Hopper,
in Franklin. His Uncle, Clyde Hop¬
per, is in defense work in Harris-
burg, Penn.

¦ i. ¦

Mrs. Billy Nail has accepted a
position with the Delta Air Lines
in Atlanta and is taking training
for air traffic control officer. Her
husband, Lieut. Nail, is with the
air corps somewhere in India

If the 19+2 rate of shoe buying
in this country had been continued
in 19+3, sales would have exceeded
shoe production by at least 100
million pairs.

- NOTICE |
of Sarrin of

SUMMONS BY PUBLICATION

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT
Aami Twin, IMS.

North Carolina,
Mseon County.
MYRTLE HEODEN MORRISON

W. P. MORRISON

The defendant, W. P. Morrison,
will take notice that an action
entitled as above ha* been com¬

menced in" the Superior Court Df
Macon County, North Carolina, to

obtain an absolute divorce; and
the defendant wiH further take
notice that he is required to ap¬
pear at the Office of the Clerk

Iof thie Superior Court of said
County in the Court House in
Franklin, North Carolina, on the
9th day of August, 1943, and ans¬

wer, or demur to the complaint of
the plaintiff in said action, or the
plaintiff wiH apply to the Ci>urt
for the relief demanded in said
complaint.
Thi« the 14th day of June, 19*3.

A. R. HIGDCftf,
Clerk, Superior Court,
Maoon County,
North Carolina.

J17.4tc.Jly .

A combat soldier's daily food
Weighs about 5yi lbs., while a civil-

averages three pounds.

National Forest Timber
'For Sale

i
Scaled bids will be received bythe Korest Supervisor, Franklin,North Carolina, up to and not laterthan 2:00 P. M. July 19, 1943,ami opened immediately thereafter,for all live timber marked or desig¬nated for cutting and all merchant¬able dead timber located on an area

embracing about 115 acres within
the Battle Creek Unit, CullasajaRiver Watershed, Macon County,Nantahala National Forest, North
Carolina, estimated to be 70 M
feet of black walnut, yellow pop¬lar, northern red oak, white oak.While ash, black oak, chestnut oak,
scarlet oak, and buckeye sawtimher,
more or less. No bid for less than
$32.40 per M -feet for black walnut,$13.00 for yellow poplar, $10.00 for
northern red oak and white oak,$9.50 for whive ash, $6.00 for Mack
oak, $3.25 for chestnut oak and
scarlet oak, and $2.00 for buckeye
will be considered. $000.00 most ac¬
company each bid, to be applied on
the purchase -price, refunded or re¬
tained in part as liquidated dam¬
ages, according to conditions of
ttle. The right to reject any and
and all bids reserved. Before bids
are submitted fwH information con¬
cerning the timber, the conditions
of sale, and submission of bids
should be obtained from the Forest
Supervisor, Franklin North Caro¬
lina.

J17.2tc J24

National Forest Timber
For Safe

Seated bids will be received by
the Forest Supervisor, Franklin,
North Carolina, up to and not later
than 2:00 P. M. July 19, 1943, and
opened immediately thereafter, for
all the merchantable live and dead
timber designated for cutting, lo¬
cated on an area embracing about
315 acres within the Lower Piercy
Creelc Unit, Nantahala River Wa¬
tershed, Macon County, Nantahala
National Forest, North Carolina,
estimated to be 500 units (160 cubic
ieet per unit) of chestnut extract-
wood, more or less. No bid of less
than $0.75 per unit will be consid¬
ered. $250 must accompany each
b^d, to be applied on the purchase
price, refunded, or retained in part
at liquidated damages, according to

conditions of sale. The right to re¬

ject any and all, bids reserved. Be¬
fore bids are submitted full infor¬
mation concerning the timber, the
conditions of sale, and submission
of bids should be obtained from
tke Forest Supervisor, Franklin,
North Carolina.

J17.2tc J24

National Forest Timber
for Sale

The National Forest Timber de¬
scribed below will be sold by pub¬
lic auction to be held at the office
of 4he Forest Supervisor, Post Of¬
fice Building, Franklin, North Car¬
olina, beginning at 2 P. M. oo July
5, 1943. Award will bemade to the
one qualified bidder quoting the
highest price for the timber re¬

quired' to be removed. Any quota¬
tion of less than the Advertised
price will invalidate the bid. All
%e yellow .poplar sawtimber mark¬
ed for cutting and all merchanta¬
ble dead yeHow poplar sawtimber
toe*ted on areas embracing about
S5 acres within the Teilioo Creek

it, Little Tennessee River Wa¬
tershed, Macon County, Nantahala
National Forest, North Carolina,
estimated to be 91 M feet, more

cr less. No bid of less than $22.00
arc M feet will be considered. In
addition to price bid ior stumpage,
a deposit of $0.15 per M feet tor
all sawtimber cut wiH be requited
(or sale area betterment work. No
bids will be considered unless the
bidder agrees to manufacture the
timber within Macon County or

Cherokee County, North Carolina.
Each participant in the bidding will
be required to qualify by having
ih his possession certified or cash¬
ier's ohtck in the amount of $1,-
500.00 made payable to the Treas¬
urer of the United States. The suc¬

cessful bidder will be required to

deiposit with his bid $1,300.00, to be
applied on the purchase price, re¬

funded, or retained in part as liqui¬
dated damages, according to condi¬
tions of sale. The right to reject
any and all bids reserved. Prior to

date of auction full information
ooncerning the timber, the condi¬
tions of sale, and submission of
bids should be obtained from the
Forest Supervisor, Franklin, North
Carolina.

IN THE
MARINES

they say:
'OYRINK'

for Marine

"ALLI6ATOR"
for amphibious tractor

"COLLISION MATS'
for pancakct
"CAMEL*

for the favorite ciearette
with men io the Marine*

F/RST
arms satytee
The favorite cigarette with
men in the Army, Navy.
Marine*, and Comat Guard
is Camel. (Based on actual
sale* records in Pom Ex-

Came
r"

National Foreat Timber
For SaLe

Sealed bids will be received by
the Regional Forester, Glenn Build¬
ing, Atlanta, Georgia, up to and
not later 'than 2 P. id. July 5. 1943,
and opened immediately thereafter,
for all live timber marked or desig¬
nated (or cutting and aM merchant¬
able dead timber located on areas
embracing about 1,775 acres within
the Telliao Greek Unit, Little Ten¬
nessee River Watershed, Macon
County, Nantahala National Forest,
North Carolina, estimated to be
2,016 M feet, more or less, of
northern red oak, black cherry, su¬
gar maple, white aah, basswood, cu¬

cumber, white oajc, red maple, birch,
black locust, chestnut, chestnut oak,
black oak, scarlet oak, hemlock,
pitch pine, buckeye, and butternut
sawtimber, and 100 tons of tanbark
of chesiUiut oak and hemlock, more
or less. No bid oi less than $11.00
per M feet for northern red oak;
(10.00 for black cherry, sugar ma¬
ple, white "ash, basswood, and cu¬
cumber; $8.00 for white oak; $5.00
for red maple, birch, and blacklo-
cust ; $3.00 for chestnut ; $2.00 for
chestnut oak, black oak, scarlet
oak, hemlock, and pitch pine; and
$1.00 for buckeye and butternut
sawtimber ; and $1.50 per ton (2,000
lbs.) for tanbark will be considered.
In addition to prices bid for stum-
pace, a deposit of $0.15 per M feet
for all sawtimber cut 'will he re¬

quired for sale area betterment
work. $1,000 must accompany each
kid, to be applied on the purchase
price, refunded, or Detained in part
as liquidated damages according to
conditions of sale. The right to re¬

ject any and * all bids reserved. Be¬
fore bids are submitted full infor¬
mation concerning the timber, the
conditions oi sate, and submission
of bids should be obtained from the
Forest Supervisor, Franldin, North
Carolina.

J10.2»c.J34
NOTICE OF SALE

North Carolu*,
Mwa County.
IN .the superior 'court

Jbbn B. Shailds, AJminiatnkor of
Estate* <1 J. M. Dowoom and
Larixk Dowmm

?».
Nottio Enoi and Iwilmil Norman
Enu, ot al
Under and by virtue of an order

of the Superior Court of Macon
County made in the special pro¬
ceeding entitled John B. Sheilds,
administrator, against Nettie Evans
and husband Norman Evans, et al,
the undersigned commissioner will
on Monday, the 21st day of June,
KM3, at 12 o'clock noon, at the
coarthoure door in Franklin, North
Carolina offer for sale to the
highest bidder for cash the fol¬
lowing described land :

Division No. S of the J. O.
Wilkes Estate as set forth in
Book . of Orders and Decrees
No. 4, page 192, Records of the
Clerk of Superior Court of
Macon County, North Carolina,
described as follows :

BEGINNING at a stake
and pointers in the North
boundry lines of the reser¬

vation, runs S 27 E 36
poles to a stake in center of
road; then with the center of
road S 62 W IS poles and 16
links to a stake, W. C. WiJke*
corner; then N 27 W 46 poles
to a stake; tlven E 19 poles and
16 links to the BEGINNING.
Also the following tract, be¬

ing the second tract, allotted
to Lucinda Deweese, BEGIN¬
NING at a rock corner in a

hickory stump, runs S 62 poles
with the line of the reservation
to a stake, J. E. Wilkes corner;
then N 71 W with his line 7
poles to a small S. oak; then
N 33VS W with his line 16
poles to a red oak ; thenS 85
W poles to a S. oak; then
74VS W 16 poles to a post oak ;
then N &>'/i W l/i poles to a

small S. oak; then S 76 W 14
poles to a stake in Rachel Wil¬
lis' line ; then N 22 W with Ra¬
chel Willis' line 26 poles to a

stake in the center of the pub¬
lic ro»d; then with the center
of road UK poles to a. stake,
r<iind«yl«r'i corner; iheti N 42

E 12 poles with said line to a

stake; then N 54'/2 E 16 poles
with said line to a stake in line
of reservation; then East to
the BEGINNING.
This 17th day of May, 1943.

J. B. SHEJLDS,
Commissioner.

M27.4tc.J17
NOTICE OF SUMMONS

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT
North Carolina,
Macon County.
Joseph Asbear, Administrator of
Tin Estate of Nissar Asbear

»s.
Mitchell Ashear, Martha Ashaar,
Elins Ashear, Mrs. Mary Maloof
and Husband, Jo* Maloof, Mr*.
Lamyia Gorra and Husband, Sam
Gorra.
The defendents, Mitchell Ash-

ear, Martha Ashear, Elias Ashear,
Mrs. Mary Maiocf and husband
Joe Makxxf, Mrs. Lemya Gorra
and Ihusband Sam Gorra, will take
notice that an action entitled as
above has been commenced in the
Superior Court of Macon County,
North Carolina, for the purpose of
seMing the lands of petitioner's in¬
testate: in which the said defen¬
dants have an interest, and are

proper parties thereto.
It is further ordered by the

Court that the defendants above
named are required to appear at
ttie office of the Clerk of the Su¬
perior Court of Macon County,
North Carolina, ait his office in
Franldin, North Carolina, on Mon¬
day, tiha 28th day of June; 1943,
and answer or demur to the peti¬
tion of the petitioner, or the relief
demanded in said petition will be
granted;
This 27th day of May, 1943.

A. R. HJGDON,
Gerk Superior Court,
Macon County, N. C.

J3.*tc.J24
ADMINISTRATOR NOTICE
Having qualified as administrator

of N. B. L. Downs, deceased, late
of Maoon oounty, N. C, this is to
notify all persons having claims
against the estate of said deceased
to exhibit them to the undersigned
on or before the 29th day of May,
1944, or this notice will be plead in
bar of their recovery. Ail persons
indebted to said estate will pleas*
make immediate settlement.
This 29th day of May, 1943.

JESSE DOWNS,
Administrator.

J3.6tp.Jly8
ADMINISTRATOR NOTICE
Having qualified as administra¬

tor of Nis^ar Avhear, deceased,
late of Macon county _

N. C., this
is to notify all persons having
claims against the estate of said
deceased to exhibit them to the
undersigned on or before th# 8th
day of May, 1944, or this notice
will be plead in bar of recovery.
All persons indebted to said estate
will please make immediate settle¬
ment.
This 8th day of May, 1943.

JOSEPH ASHEAR,
Administrator.

M13.6tc J17
ADMINISTRATOR NOTICE

Having qualified as administrator
of O. F. Schiffli, d<-qrasc<l, late of
Macon county, N. C, this is to
notify all persons having claims
against the estate of said deceased
to exhibit them to the undersigned
Dn or before the 11th day of June,
1944, or this notice will be plead
in bar of their recovery. AB per¬
sons indebted to said estate wiM
please make immediate settlement.
This 11th day of June, 1943.

FRANK B. OOOK,
Administrator.

J17.Gtp.Jly22
ADMINISTRATRIX NOTICE
Having qualified as administratis

of Charles L. Waldroop, deceased,
late of Macon county, N. C.t this
is to notify ^11 persons having
claims against the estate of said
deceased to exhibit them to the
undersigned on or before the 6th
day of May, 1944, or this notice
will be plead in bar of their re¬

covery. All persons indebted to
said estate will please make im¬
mediate settlement.
This 6th day of May, 1943.

FRANCES WA1.DROOP,
Mil.J17 Atlminiatritri*.


