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Election, Men’s Style 
Show Are Features of 
Officers’ Wives Meeting

Beautiful decorations, election 
of officers to be installed at next 
month’s business meeting, and a 
showing of men’s clothing from 
the Style-Mart Store were fea­
tures of Wednesday’s luncheon 
and business meeting of the 
USAFAGOS Officers’ Wives Club, 
held at the Highland Pines Inn, 
with Mrs. David Van Pelt and 
Mrs. Herman Smith as hostesses.

In the clubroom a large center- 
piece of pink snapdragons was 
used and roses and ivy were 
twined around the columns. Pink 
streamers were around the col­
umns in the dining room, and in 
the center of each table was a 
large potted geranium with pink 
streamers leading to each place 
setting. Each club officer was 
presented a corsage of white car­
nations.

After the, luncheon, Mrs. James 
McNulty presented the slate of 
new officers to be voted on and 
conducted the voting procedure.

New officers are: Mrs. John 
Daunt, president; Mrs. James 
Newkirk, 1st vice president; Mrs. 
Robert Price, 2nd vice-president; 
Mrs. Ogden Fox, recording secre­
tary; Mrs. John Mims, correspond­
ing secretary; Mrs. John Loisel, 
treasurer.

Mrs. William Ryan introduced 
as guests Mrs. Roddie Massey of 
Niagara Falls, N. Y., and . Mrs. 
Kenneth Spillman of Denton, 
Tex., and presented as a new per­
manent member Mrs. Nelson P. 
Monson from San Pedro, Calif-.

Entertainment was a showing 
of fashions from the Style-Mart 
with Mrs. Tom Nicholson as nar­
rator and with Capt. David Calla­
way, Maj. Erskine Crew, Maj. Og­
den (Pete) Fox, Maj. Jess Gifford, 
and Capt. David Van Pelt model­
ing a wide selection of clothes 
ranging from casual to dinner 
wear.

JUNIOR-SENIOR BANQUET ANU PROM AT 
LOCAL COUNTRY CLUB IS GALA EVENT

The Senior Class of Southern 
Pines High School was entertain­
ed by the Junior Class Friday 
evening at the Southern Pines 
Country Club with a banquet and 
prom attended also by faculty 
and school board members aiid 
guests of the classes.

Supt. A. C. Dawson gave the 
invocation and Anike Verhoeff 
gave the welcome, to which 
James Humphrey responded for 
the guests. Claude Reams, 
George Patterson and Jacque 
Davenport prophesied glowing 
futures for members of the Senior 
Class; presentation of Senior gifts 
was by Joan Howarth, Bobby 
Parker, James Morrison, Anike 
Verhoeff and Kenneth Creech; 
and Bill Marley and Jimmy Mc­
Donald gave the Senior will.

The theme was “Club 56” and 
the colors used were pink and 
silver. The elaborate decorations 
featured pink streamers and sil­
ver stars and the program book­
lets were bound in pink with 
“Club 56” in silver on the front.

Dancing to mysic by Major 
Marshall and his orchestra was 
enjoyed. John Chappell served 
as master of ceremonies for a 
floor show which included danc­
ing and singing by Joan Howarth, 
Ginger Woodell, Mary Frances 
Lyons, Patti Hobbs, Lillian Bul­
lock and Anike Verhoeff; Roger 
Gibbs of the faculty sang, accom­
panied by Mrs. Sara Hodgkins, 
a faculty member, at the piano.

Ruth Williams and Polly.Smith 
served on the refreshment 
mittee and the committee on dec­
orations was composed of Lucy 
McDaniel, Lillian Bullock, Jean 
Haney, Lillian Clark, John Chap­

pell, Richard Mierta, Bobby 
Parker and James Morrison. 
Members of the decoration com­
mittee worked all day Friday and 
they were invited to Mrs. Hubert 
Cameron’s for a delicious lunch.

Members of the Senior Class 
are: Betty Blackmon, Betty Britt, 
Winifred Cox, Joe Diggs, Deryl 
Holliday, Robert Kennedy, Bill 
Marley, Jimmie McDonald, Pat 
Morrison, Richard Parshley, 
Julian Pleasants, John- Ray, John 
Seymour, Frances Stoots, Marga­
ret Thomas, Ann Vann, Jack 
White, Faye Ratledge, Ronny D. 
Malotte, June Bristow, Bobby 
Cline, Jacque Davenport, Barbara 
Goodwin, James Humphrey, Paul 
Kinnison, Jr., David McCallum, 
Joe McDonald, Frances Frazier, 
George Patterson, James Prim, 
Claude Reams, Mike Short, Bar­
bara Brewer, Matthew Toia, Bar­
bara Williams, John Watkins, 
Herman Smith, and Betty Bar- 
row.

Juniors are: Richard Bethea, 
Mickey Chiricos, John Chappell 
Billy Hamel, James Morrison, 
Dick Mierta, Bobby Parker, Rich­
ard Renegar, Thomas Vann. 
Roger Verhoeff, Charles Watkins 
Lillian Bullock, Jean Haney 
Joan Howarth, Lucy McDaniel 
Polly Smith, Anika Verhoeff 
Ruth Williams, Jimmy Bowden, 
Kenneth Creech, Ray Daeke 
David Hannon, Howard Morgan 
Sonny Martin, Tony Parker, 
David Riddle, Lynn Van Ben- 
schoten, Don Walter, Neil Ulsh 
Lillian Clark, Patti Hobbs, Mary 
F. Lyons, Ann Morris, Eileen 
Thwing, Betty Wilson, Ginger 
Woodell, and Cathy PoUard.

Dental Auxiliary 
Meets In Pinehurst; 
Many Activities Slated

A busy round of social and 
business activities has been plan­
ned for the sixth annual meeting 
of the North Carolina Dental 
Auxiliary which wiU meet in 
Pinehurst May 13-15 in conjunc­
tion with the North Carolina 
Dental Society. The Carolina Ho­
tel will be convention headquar­
ters.

Highlighting events will be a 
concert and lawn party Sunday 
afternoon, a tour of Clarendon 
Gardens Monday afternoon, a 
new member reception that 
night, and the appearance of bal­
lad singer, Betty Vaiden Williams 
of Raleigh, at the Tuesday lunch­
eon.

The ladies may select either 
golf or cards on Monday morning. 
The golf tournament will be fol­
lowed by a luncheon at Pine­
hurst Country Club.

The annual business meeting 
will be held Tuesday morning at 
10 o’clock with Mrs. Grady Ross, 
Charlotte, presiding.

'Tuesday night the Auxiliary 
members will be guests of their 
husbands at a banquet, ice show, 
and costume ball.

Matthews Elected 
President of Vass- 
Lakeview Alumni

Joseph A. Matthews of South­
ern Pines was elected president 
of the Vass-Lakeview High 
School Alumni Association at the 
business meeting in connection 
with the annual banquet held last 
Saturday evening in the school 
cafeteria. Elected to serve with 
him, were Edwin Causey of Lake- 
view, vice-president, and Mrs. N. 
N. McLean, secretary-treasurer.

The banquet drew a large at­
tendance and many arrived for 
an hour of visiting before time 
for dinner, which was served by 
Mrs. Bob Maurer and girls of her 
home economics department.

The tables were decorated in 
the school colors of blue and 
white, with arrangements of blue 
flowers and White candles.

Herbert Caddell, president, 
welcomed the alumni and their 
guests and H. Clifton Blue of 
Aberdeen gave the invocation. 
Principal John McCrummen, in 
behalf of the faculty and school 
board, brought greetings, to 
which Miss Pollly Gilmore re­
sponded, and H. A. Monroe, Jr. of 
the Senior Class responded to the 
president’s welcome to the sen­
iors, who ‘were special guests. 
Vick Keith of Sanford led the 
opening and closing songs and 
gave the closing prayer.

Featured speaker was the Rev. 
Angus McKay Cameron of En- 
glehard, a native of Vass and 
alumnus Of the school, who was 
introduced by Mr. Caddelll. Af­
ter a series of remarks in lighter 
vein, Mr. Cameron spoke feeling­
ly and with conviction on prob­
lems now facing the country, 
pointing out that “change” had 
taken place all along the way as 
progress had been made in the 
past.

Mrs. Marilyn Gschwind read 
minutes of last year’s meeting 
and gave the treasurer’s report 
and attendance of classes observ­
ing anniversaries this year was 
taken.

After-Prom Breakfast 
Given By Grade Mothers
For Juniors And Dates

*

The grade mothers of the 
Junior Class gave a breakfast at) 
the home of Mrs. Chester Van 
Benschoten following the Junior- 
Senior banquet and dance, with 
juniors and their dates totaling 44 
in attendance.

Ham, bacon and eggs, rolls, cin­
namon buns, doughnuts and cof­
fee were served to the young peo­
ple under the stars, as they sat 
around a bonfire.

Mrs. D. Verhoeff entertained 
the group with accordion music 
and they had a good time talking 
and singing.

Civic Garden Club 
Has Program And 
Awards Prizes

The Civic Garden Club met in 
monthly session last Thursday af­
ternoon at the Civic Club with the 
president, Mrs. Frank Hale, pre­
siding. In her opening remarks 
she spoke of the many celebra­
tions connected with “the lovely 
month of May” such as May Day, 
Maypole dances, and others popu­
lar in this and other countries.

Mrs. James Ratliff gave the gar­
den calendar, filled with timely 
hints for things to be done now. 
She urged the members to keep 
their gardens growing when the 
days become hot and long, looking 
forward to being repaid with fall 
bloom.

Mrs. Boyle, president of the 
Civic Club, was welcomed as a 
new member of the Garden Club.

Miss Helen Butler told of the 
‘Memory Garden” which has been 

started at the Alston House, the 
first planting in which was done 
by a group from this club.

Plans are being made for a 
Spring garden show, also for a

Miss Alice Covell 
Elected To Office

Miss Alice Coveil,' daughter of 
the Rev. and Mrs. Charles Covell, 
of Christchurch, Va., formerly of 
Southern Pines, has recently been 
elected treasurer of the Student 
Council at St. Margaret’s School, 
Tappahannock, Va. Miss Covell 
is a member of the class of 1957.

study group for gardeners to be 
held next fall, with new members 
welcome.

Blue ribbons for flower arrange­
ments for the year were awarded, 
as follows: 1st place, Mrs. Dean 
Dorman; 2nd, Miss Helen Butler; 
red ribbons—1st place, Mrs. Dor­
man; 2nd, Mrs. W. A. "royne.

This being the fifth anniversary 
of the club, Mrs. Virgil Page Clark 
gave a brief review of the club’s 
activities, listing the outstanding 
speakers who have appeared on 
its programs and projects that 
have been accomplished.

During the social hour cookies 
and lemonade were served in the 
clubroom, the planned garden tea 
party having been cancelled be­
cause of rain.

Gardens Don’t Have To Black-Out At 
Sunset, Says Mrs. Jane H, Struthers

Your lovingly planted gardens gardeners to run the show. Now,
don’t have to black out at sunset 
if you give them the ‘light’ touch,” 
says Jane H. Struthers, home 
service representative for the Car­
olina Power and Light Company.

Mrs. Struthers calls attention to 
the safety that outdoor lighting 
provides against both accidents 
and prowlers, and gives the fol­
lowing tips for carrying out a 
lighting plan for a garden either 
large or small:

Avoid “whitewashing” the en­
tire garden in imitation of day­
light. The result is likely to be 
flat and monotonous. The fasci­
nation of a lighted garden lies in 
contrasts of light and shadows, in 
highlights and silhouette effects.

Scatter the lighting units. Place 
them so they illuminate a flower 
bed, a well ^aped tree, a path, a 
pool, a rock garden.

Conceal the light sources. Re­
spect yoiu- neighbor’s right of pri­
vacy arid place light bulbs and 
fixtures so that light is confined 
to your own premises. In your 
own garden, the prime rule should 
be: keep the light source out of 
viewer’s eyes. Hide bulbs in 
shrubbery. Or use a shielding re­
flector.

Use white light on flowers. Col­
ored light may be used sparingly 
on white statuary, walls and trel­
lises, and is most effective in pools 
and fountains. Blue lights are 
disappointing for they are likely 
to create an eerie and unearthly 
look in the night.

A little light goes a long way, if 
directly on light-colored walls, 
and concrete and gravel patch. 
They all serve as reflectors of 
light.

Time was when a flood-lighted 
garden was foxmd only on a tre­
mendous estate with a crew of

with the growth in the number of 
home owners, with the growth of 
picture windows and an interest 
in gardening, after-dark illumina­
tion has become an every-night 
reality in modest gardens.

For not only can garden light­
ing be installed simply these days, 
without a major landscaping up­
heaval, but it also can be done 
without a major upheaval in the 
budget. There are numerous por­
table lighting fixtures available 
that can be pushed into the soil 
and connected to a portable outlet 
device.

Simple and beautiful effects can 
be achieved by the hghting of a 
well shaped tree, or a piece of 
garden statuary, or a flower bed. 
Place the light at an angle off to 
one side, or place two lights com­
ing from different angles, con­
verging on the subject. The re­
sult is another whole personality 
for your lawn or garden, when 
normally it is engulfed in black 
“nothing-ness.”

On the safety score, remember 
to experiment with placing fix­
tures only in a dry garden, for 
dew or any other moisture must 
be guarded against in handling 
electrical equipment. Install 
equipment first, then connect 
electricity.

Weatherproof cords and mois­
ture-proof connections are a 
“must” for temporary and perma­
nent installations alike. The fix­
tures themselves can be • every­
thing from commercially rhade 
“lily pads” and telescoping lights 
that poke into the ground, to 
homemade devices that are • as 
simple as an old watering can 
with a hole cut in one side, and 
another drilled in the bottom for 
the cord. They look natural by 
day, yet become a lamp at night!

Girl Scout Leaders 
Attend Workshop 
At Pinebluff Lake

Approximately 25 Girl Scout 
troop leaders'and their assistants 
attended a workshop at the Pine- 
bluff Lake Tuesday, in prepara­
tion for the Day Camp to be held 
there June 11th through the 15th. 
Miss Catherine Creasman of San­
ford, executive director of the Girl 
Scouts for this district, conducted 
the meeting which featured hand­
icraft and campcraft, and plans 
were discussed for the camporee 
next month. Mrs. Voit Gilmore 
is chairman and she will work 
with a committee of leaders, who 
will help make the camp the same 
outstanding success it was last 
year.

Among those from Southern 
Pines who attended were Mrs. 
George H. Leonard, Jr., local 
chairman of the Girl Scouts; Mrs. 
Gilmore, Mrs. Herbert Smith, Mrs. 
Marvin Wicker, Mrs. Cyrus O. 
Butler, Mrs. Margaret Weeks, Mrs. 
Jeff Gifford, Mrs. George Porter, 
Mrs. R. F. DuPre and Mrs. Louis 
Honeycutt. Other leaders came 
from Vass, Pinebluff and West 
End.

INS AND OUTS
Mrs. Mary M. Patterson return­

ed home this morning from Haines 
City, Fla., where she went last 
week to attend the wedding of her 
granddaughter. Miss Marie Ad­
ams, and Fred Harrison of the U. 
S. Navy. The wedding took place 
at 4:30 p.m. Sunday in the First 
Presbyterian Church there. The 
bride is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. L. A. Adams.

Mrs. James B. Swett, who has 
been visiting her daughter, Mrs. 
Robert Cathey, at Red Springs, is 
spending the weekend with Mrs. 
James Boyd.

TAR HEEL BASEBALL LEAGUE
Twin City at Hillcrest.....................................May 5, June 16, July 28

Fayetteville at Southern Pines
Hillcrest at Twin City...................................May 6, June 17, July 29

Southern Pines at Fayetteville
Fayetteville at Twin City..............................May 12, June 23, Aug. 4

Southern Pines at Hillcrest
Twin City at Fayetteville ................. .......... May 13, June 24, Aug. 5

Hillcrest at Southern Pines
Twin City at Southern Pines.......................May 19, June 30, Aug. 11

Fayetteville at Hillcrest
Southern Pines at Twin City........................ May 20, July 1, Aug. 12

Hillcrest at Fayetteville
Hillcrest at Twin City................................... . May"i6, July 7, Aug. 18

Southern Pines at Fayetteville
Twin City at Hillcrest................................. May 27, July 8, Aug. 19

Fayetteville .at Southern Pines
Twin City at Fayetteville ............................June 2, July 14, Aug. 25

Hillcrest at Southern Pines
Fayetteville at Twin City..............................June 3, July 15, Aug. 26

Southern Pines at Hillcrest
• /

Southern Pines at Twin City.......................... June 9, July 21, Sept. 1
Hillcrest at Fayetteville

Twin City at Southern Pines........................ June 10, July 22, Sept. 2
Fayetteville at Hillcrest

PLAY-OFFS TO BEGIN SEPTEMBER 8, BEST 2 OUT OF 3 IN 
SEMI-FINALS—BEST 3 OUT OF 5 IN FINALS

Dentists To Hold 
100th Anniversary 
Meet At Pinehurst

Members of the North Carolina 
Dental Association will celebrate 
the 100th anniversary of the 
founding of the organization at a 
four-day convention to be held at 
Pinehurst this weekend.

Dr. Bernard C. Kingsbury, 
president of the American Den­
tal Association, and Dr. Lon Mor- 
rey of Chicago, editor of the 
Journal of the American Dental 
Association, will be principal 
speakers.

One of the xmique features of 
the meeting, which will attract 
hundreds of dentists and their 
wives from the state, will be a 
costume ball Tuesday night. They 
will wear costumes that were 
fashionable in 1856.

Beginning Sunday with regis­
tration and a golf tournament, 
the convention will last through 
Wednesday noon. Various pro­
grams have been scheduled at 
which leading dentists will pre­
sent papers on advances in the 
profession.

At the centennial program 
Sunday Dr. William N. Hodgkin 
of Warrenton, Va., will be the 
principal speaker.

Portraits of the frist three pres­
idents of the N. C. Dental Society 
will be presented the State De­
partment of Archives and History 
during the convention.

The paintings will be hung in 
the Hall of History in the Educa­
tion Building in Raleigh at a 
later date.

Also meeting at Pinehurst will 
be three other groups—the N. C. 
Dental Auxiliary, the N. C. Den­
tal Hygienists Association, and 
the N. C. Dental Assistants As­
sociation.

Dr. Bernard Walker of Char-^ 
lotte is president of the Society.

Kitchin Active In 
Moore, Says Farms 
Need More Credit

A. Paul Kitchin, Wadesboro at­
torney who is seeking the Demo­
cratic nomination for Eighth Dis­
trict Congressman, is waging an 
active campaign in Moore County.

Mr. Kitchin’s campaign in 
Moore County is being directed 
by a committee of which M. B. 
Pleasants of Aberdeen is chair- 
main.

The former FBI lawyer and spe­
cial agent, who is opposing Rep. 
C. B. Deane of Rockingham for 
the nomination in the May 26 pri­
mary, has been in the county on 
several recent occasions, calling 
on Democrats over the county.

Mr. Kitchin’s most recent cam­
paign statements have dealt with 
the farm problem and textile im­
ports.

The candidate sees grave dan­
ger of another depression and says 
that it has already started on 
farms—especially small farms. He 
notes that when farm income 
drops, the profits of business and 
industry and the wages of indus­
trial workers will follow, if there 
is not a solution to the farm prob­
lem.

Mr. Kitchin has gone on record 
as favoring both parity price sup­
port and the soil bank plan, but he 
thinks that the farmer also needs 
“an extension of credit which the 
Federal government alone can in­
sure him.” The Federal Land 
Bank, he says, should adopt “a 
more realistic policy” in evaluat­
ing farm lands and Proddction 
Credit Associations “should ex­
tend farm credit up to five years, 
at reasonable interest.”

Other points the candidate has 
made on farm matters are that the 
Federal Land Bank should expand 
its intermediate loans and the 
Farmers Home Administration 
should be given adequate funds 
to help qualified farmers with lit­
tle capital.
Textile Teiriff, Quotas

The candidate has designated as 
one of the major planks in his 
platform “an effective tariff on 
textiles coupled with a strict quo­
ta on Japanese imports.”

These measures are necessary, 
he believes, to increase the per 
capita income of North Carolina- 
textile workers and rejuvenate 
the textile industry.

Farmers, also, have been harm­
ed by the drastic reduction in the 
tariff on textiles which went into 
effect last year, Mr. Kitchin said. 
He noted that, according to gov­
ernment reports, most of the cot­
ton used in these textiles is grown 
outside this country.

Mr. Kitchin opened his cam­
paign several weeks ago with the 
statement that he was “absolute­
ly and without reservation” in 
favor of the so-called manifesto, 
signed by Southern senators and 
Congressmen, that called for a re­
versal of the Supreme Court’s de­
cision against racial segregation in 
the public schools.

Twin City Grabs 
Early Lead In 
Tar Heel League

The Twin City entry in the Tar 
Heel semi-pro baseball league got 
off to an early lead in the stand­
ings by winning two games last 
.week, the first week of play.

Twin City, composed of players 
from Southern Pines, Aberdeen 
and surrounding area, defeated 
Hillcrest 19-8 Saturday, and again 
Sunday, 14-0.

A game between Fayetteville 
and Southern Pines was postpon­
ed last Saturday because of the 
game played between Southern 
Pines High School and Mt. Gilead. 
But on Sunday the Fayetteville 
entry defeated the locals 5-4.

A complete schedule of the

Cold Weather Did 
Not Hurt Crops, 
Observers Report

A low temperature reading of 
37 was recorded in Southern Pines 
Tuesday night. The reading was 
one of the lowest ever recorded 
during May at the station here.

The cold weather, which reach­
ed a low of 26 at Clingman’s Dome 
in the Great Smokies—the lowest 
in the state—let up somewhat ear­
ly Wednesday morning.

A frost that lasted about two 
hours did no appreciable harm to 
early crops, observers said, al­
though some sections of the state 
said the cold weather had set 
crops back a few weeks.

A reading of 32 at the Raleigh- 
Durham station was the lowest 
ever recorded there during May.

Southern Pines has also had 2.94 
inches of rain during May, far 
alcove the average.

Funeral Services 
For Mrs. Fuller 
To Be Held Friday

Mrs. Leo C. Fuller, a winter 
resident of Pinehurst for many 
years, died suddenly Monday af­
ternoon at her home in Pinehurst.

Funeral services will be held 
Friday at 4 p. m. at the Chapel 
of Powell Funeral Home with the 
Rev. Roscoe Prince, pastor of the 
Community Church in Pinehurst, 
officiating. Interment will be in 
the family plot in Buckfield, Me.

Mrs. Fuller’s sole survivor is 
her husband, Leo C. Fuller of 
Pinehurst, who is at present a pa­
tient in Moore County Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Fuller maintained 
a summer- residence at Water- 
ville, Maine.

CUBS ENTERTAINED
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Cassady 

entertained Cub Scout Pack 58 of 
West Southern Pines, Sunday af­
ternoon. Ernest Clark is cubmas- 
ter; Mrs. Eva McNiel and Mrs. 

league is published elsewhere in Barksdale are den mothers; and 
this issue of The Pilot. ' James Stroman is chief.

Armory Contract Postponed So That 
New, Improved Plans Can Be Used

According to information re­
ceived this week from the office 
of Major General John Manning, 
the State adjutant general, the 
date for opening bids on the 
Southern Pines armory project 
has been postponed for approx­
imately three months.

Capt. Bill Wilson, local Guard 
commander, ^id today that he 
was informed by General Man­
ning that the Armory Commission 
had decided to postpone the local 
project in order that new plans 
now on the drawing board might 
be used for the Southern Pines 
armory. The new plans do not 
change the outside appearance of 
the building appreciably, accord­
ing to Wilson, but there will be 
some changes in the interior ar­
rangements, and the overall sizg 
of the building will be increased 
by about 300 square feet.

Since construction on the origi­
nal plans was tentatively sched­
uled to start about the end of 
July, the postponement will re­
sult in an actual delay of about

one month. Plans now call for bid 
opening in the latter part of July, 
and construction to start shortiyf 
thereafter.
Site Cleared

Clearing and grading of the site 
has been accomplished locally, 
and the proposed location can be 
seen by those interested, between 
the present storage gEeage build­
ing and the old Pinehurst road. 
The lumber cleared from the site 
is being cut by local Guardsjnen, 
and the proceeds applied to pay­
ment of charges for bulldozer 
work in grading the site.
\ Further' information concern­
ing the armory construction will 
be released as soon as it is re­
ceived by the local unit. Captain 
Wilson promised, saying that the 
new plans would have to be ap­
proved by the National Guard 
Bureau in Washington before* 
they could be sent out to pros­
pective bidders.

Persons interested in bidding 
on the project are invited to in- 
qiEre'at the local uniL for infor­
mation.

Movie About CoL Hess, Former 
Teacher At USAFAGOS, Being Made

Wildlife Club Meets 
In Carthage Monday

The Moore County Wildlife 
Club will hold a dinner meeting 
at the Carthage Hotel in Carth­
age Monday night at 7:30, accord­
ing to Gen. R. B. Hill, programi' 
chairman.

Fishing in North Carolina will 
be discussed by two speakers 
from the Wildlife Resources 
Commission.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Marshall 
of Boston, Mass., and Yanceyville

Col. Dean E. Hess, a foi'mer in­
structor at the Air-Ground Oper­
ations school who became widely 
popular throughout the Sandhills, 
is the subject of a film now being 
made in Hollywood, entitled 
“Battle Hymn.”

The film, based qn Col. Hess’ 
Korean war experiences, will star 
Rock Hudson, one of Hollywood’s 
outstanding actors.

Local people will remember 
Col. Hess as one of the most pop­
ular instructors ever to be sta­
tioned at the Air-Ground School. 
While here he spoke to numerous 
civic clubs about his experiences 
in Korea whre he helped set up 
the ROK Air Force, and later an 
orphanage.

Col. Hess, an ordained minis­
ter in the Disciples of Christ, 
flew 250 missions in an F-51 dur­
ing the Korean Campaign and 
earned the nickname, the “Flying 
Parson.” Writing about him in the 
Saturday Evening Post, Harold 
H. Martin said that Col. Hess saw 
World War 2 as a “battle between 
good and evil.”

Author Martin, recounting the 
reasons that Col. Hess sought 
service in World War 2 
wrote that the Colonel had felt 
it would be .morally wrong to say 
to others, “I believe in your cause 
but you do the fighting for me.

young minister volunteered for 
training and later flew 65 mis­
sions over Europ as a lighter 
pilot. His service won him the 
Distinguished Flying Cross.

All the money that Col. Hess 
receives from the film, which the 
producers think will be a big 
moneymaker, will be used to help 
maintain an orphanage in Cheju, 
Korea, which Col. Hess set up.

At present the orphanage is 
supported primarily through do­
nations to “Hope, Inc.,” a non­
profit charitable organization 
that Col. Hess heads.

While he was in Southern 
Pines Col. Hess and his family 
lived across from the veterinary 
hospital just off Midland Road.

He lived here.-about two years.
At pfesent he is a special as­

sistant to Lt. Gen. Emmett 
O’Donnell, Air Force Deputy 
Chief of Staff in charge of per­
sonnel.

Capt. David McCampbell, USN, 
is the top living World War 2 ace. 
He downed 34 Japanese planes— 
nine in one battle. Now he is Test 
Coordinator at the Naval Air Test 
Center, Patuxent, Md.

are spneding Wednesday and My conscious won’t let me get 
Thursday nights with Mrs. James blood on my hands.” And with 
Boyd at Weymouth. that feeling, Martin said, the

Twenty-seven per cent of all 
drivers involved in fatal auto ac­
cents in the U. S. last year were 
under 25 years of age.


