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SOUTHERN PINES RECORDER'S COURT

Youth Finds Judge Means Business, 
Gets Road Term for Non-Compliance

__ ^ M .1 . _______ XI. ITvill A.mTrt/4 At* CCkA Route 3, Carthage, youth 
learned in Southern Pines Re­
corder’s Court last week that 
Judge W. Harry Fullenwider 
means what he says in the un­
usual conditions he imposes when 
suspending sentence or continu­
ing judgment in cases involving 
violation of tralfice laws.

Donnie Chavis, 19, was tried 
February 7 in the local court for 
speeding 70 miles per hour in a 
35 zone and reckless driving. He 
pleaded not guilty but was found 
guilty and jud^ent was con­
tinued on condition that he walk 
to his home (an option offered 
in lieu of a fine) and that he not 
be in any automobile, except to 
and from work or on specific er­
rands for his parents, during a 
period of 30 days.

Before the 30 days had elapsed, 
however, he was seen by an 
officer riding in a car with other 
youths in violation of the condi­
tions laid down by the judge.

In court last week he was sen­
tenced to 30 days on the roads. 
He entered an appeal to Superior
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Court. Judge Fullenwider set 
bond at $300. The appeal wiU be 
calendar^ for the next temu of 
Superior Court at Carthage.

Other cases heard in last week’s 
session were;

James Ray Peele, Route 1, 
Fayettevillp, failure to yield right 
of way, resulting in accident ahd 
property damage, found guilty of 
failure to keep a proper lookout, 
pay costs and walk a specified 
distance (in lieu of fine, by choice 
of defendant); Gary Nelson Frye, 
assault on female, nol pros with 
leave on payment of costs; Tho­
mas Stanback, assault on female, 
not guilty.

Dorothy'Warner, vile and pro­
fane language, $10 and costs; Ro- 
bie Lee Stover, public drunk, one 
month in county jail (light work 
only); George Rogers, Aberdeen, 
public drunk, one month on roads, 
suspended sentence in former 
case to be executed; James Rich­
ardson, drunk and disorderly, plea 
of guilty of public drunk accept­
ed, pay the costs; Robert Edward 
Rast, drunken driving, $100 fine 
and costs, stay in town jail until 
6 p.m. on day of trial, surrender 
driver’s license for revocation; 
Ethel M. Jensen, disregarding 
stop sign, $5 and costs; Larry 
Thomas Bennett, Carthage speed­
ing 45 in 35 zone, $10 and costs. 

James M. Jones, Pinebluff, care- 
reckless driving result-
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PINEBLUFF 
NEWS

BY MRS. EHRMAN PICKLER 
Cub Scouts

The Cub Scouts of Pack' 206, 
Pinebluff, enjoyed a trip to the 
Morehead Planetarium at Chapel 
Hill Suhday. The Planetarium had 
a special program for Scouts 
which is in connection with the 
theme for the month of March, 
“Eyes in the Sky.” Those Ipartici- 
pating in the outing were Cub 
Scouts Bunny Wallace, Frederick 
Smith, Richard Carven, Jimmy 
Carpenter, Colin Short, Marlon 
Davis, Dale Wall, Michael Geisler, 
Guerry Bryant, Charles Davis, 
David Carpenter, Douglas Mc- 
Caskill; Den Chiefs Jeff Mills 
and Mack Lathan. Helping with 
transportation and accompanying 
the Cubs were Cubmaster Hurley 
Short, Assistant Cubmaster Har­
vey Lathan, Den Mother Mrs- 
Hurley Short; Mrs. Vernon Geis­
ler, Mrs. Harvey Lathan, Libby 
Lathan, Martha Geisler and Bar­
bara Short.

\
Personals'

Miss Sylvia Thompson of Ap­
palachian College, Boone and Miss 
Gloria Church of Appalachian 
College and Fort Worth, Texas, 
are spending several days with 
Sylvia’s parents Mr. and Mrs. C. 
C. Thompson. Mr. and Mrs. 
Thompson met the girls in Char­
lotte on Thursday and will carry 
them back to Charlotte on Wed­
nesday where they wiU take

day.
Junior Kraft of Fort Jackson 

spent the weekenU with his pai- 
ents, Mr. and-Mrs. T. R. Kraft.

A-2c Jerry Troutman of Char­
leston AFB was at home several 
days last week with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Troutman 
Sr.

Mr. and Mrs. James W. Smith 
of Oak Ridge visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Winfred Smith and faimily 
Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. W. C. McHam of 
Sanford visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. O. C. Adcox Sunday.

Miss Janie Clark, 
Jackson Springs, 
Succumbs at 84

Miss Janie Clark of Jackson 
Springs, who would have been 
84 years old next Monday, died 
Sunday afternoon at Moore Me­
morial Hospital after being hos­
pitalized for two months. She was 
the daughter of the late Sarah 
Elizabeth Ray Clark and N. D. J. 
Clark and had spent her entire 
life in this community.

For many years, she was )em-
ployed as a bookkeeper for the 
M. C. McDonald Company of 
West End and prior to that was 
employed with the Holiday Com­
pany of Jackson Springs. Ten 
years ago, She broke a pelvis 
bone and since that time had been 
a semi-invalid and had made her 
home with a nephew, Carlyle 
Clark. She was a life long mem­
ber of the Jackson Springs Pres­
byterian Church and was a love­
able friend to everyone in the 
carrmunity.

She is survived by two brothers.

Malcolm A. Clark of Jackson 
Springs and J. P. Clark of HEimlet; 
three nieces, Mrs. Raymond Sea- 
well of Jackson Springs, Mrs. 
Bivens Jackson, Dunn, and Mrs. 
George Barta, Little Neck, Long 
Island, N. Y.; and three nephews, 
Carlyle Clark, Jackson Springs; 
Robert Clark, West End; and Gil­
bert Clark, Donna, Texas.

Funeral services were held on 
Tuesday afternoon at the Jstckson 
Springs Presbyterian Church with 
the Rev. W. A. Brown of, Wade 
and the Rev. Lacy McDuffie of 
Candor officiating. Burial was in 
the Jackson Springs Cemetery.

less and ---------  - _
ing in accident, leaving scene of ^
accident, judgment continued on' bus back to Boone, 
payment of costs; Robert L. O - 
Steen, Pope Air Force Base, ex­
pired license plates, $1 and costs;
Garland F. Stanback, no valid 
operator’s permit, two months on 
the roads, suspended for two 
years, not to operate a naotor ve­
hicle until license is obtained and 
presented to the chief of police,
$25 fine and costs.

Hilton Swinnie, Pinehurst, al­
lowing unlicensed person to ope­
rate motor vehicle, $10 and costs;
Thomas W. March, Route 1, West 
End, no valid operator’s permit, 
expired license plate, no liability 
insurance, possession of 20 per 
cent wine with seal broken, three 
months suspended indefinitely on 
payment of the costs, to walk 
every place he goes for 60 days, 
not to operate a motor vehicle 
until license is obtained and pre­
sented to chief of police or the 
Highway Patrol, not to allow the 
vehicle in question to be operated 
until it is propertly licensed and 
insured.

Miss Marilyn Mills of Raleigh 
and Pvt. Mac Mills of Fort Jack- 
son spent the weekend with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. H, 
Mills.

Mr. and Mrs. P. B. Watkins and 
family of Burgaw and Mrs. Lon­
nie Gray, Sr. of Atkinson were 
weekend guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
A. B. Woodcock and Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Carpenter.

Mr. and Mrs. Marian Sessoms 
and children, Marion and Michael, 
of Charlotte, spent last weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
H. L. Sessoms.

Electric Workshop 
Slated March 15

There will be a 4-H Electric 
Workshop Thursday, March 15, 
at 7 p. m. in the Home Economic 
agent’s office of the county court­
house. Don Morris of Carolina 
Power & Light Company in San­
ford will conduct the workshop

All interested 4-H Club mem­
bers, leaders and parents are in­
vited to attend. Boys and girls 
taking the 4-H Electric project 
should attend this workshop.

Mr. Morris will give a demon­
stration, followed by a work peri­
od for boys and girls after which 
he will give club members ideas 
to use for demonstration and pro­
jects. Ideas will also be given for 
exhibits and record keeping.

Only two per cent of federal 
support to science goes to agri­
culture, compared to about 40 per 
cent in 1940.

Circle 1 of Ives Memorial Bap­
tist Church met Monday morning 
at the home of Mrs. Claude Wil­
liams with 11 members and three 
visitors present. Mrs. H. L. Ses^ 
soms gave the devotional and 
presented the program on Wit­
nessing. At the close of the meet­
ing, the hostess served lunch to 
the members present. .

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
White on Sunday included Pvt. 
Harvey White Jr. of Fort Jackson, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse White and 
daughter Monya Kay and Mrs. 
Mary Ann Blackman and daugh­
ters, Carol Ann and Linda Jean, 
of Kemsville, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin McNeill and children, of 
Lakeview.

Mrs. Purvis Ferree of Winston- 
Salem spent the wekend with her 
mother, Mrs. M. F. Butner.

Pvt. Sterling Carrington of 
Fort Jackson, S. C., was at home 
for the weekend with his mother, 
Mrs. Jessie Carrington.

Mr. and Mrs. W. K. Carpenter, 
Sr. and Mrs. Ehrman Pickier at­
tended a birthday dinner at the 
home of their niece, Mrs. Leonard 
Tally and Mr. Tally, in Sanford 
Simday. The dinner was in honor 
of Mrs. E. A. Helms’ sister, of 
Mrs. Carpenter and Mrs. Pickier 
Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Tarlton and 
daughters Ann and Linda of 
Clarksville, Va. and Jack Dowless 
of Aberdeen joined them for the

THIS IS NATIONAL

4H CLUB WEEK
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ml
We wish to 
congratulate 
4-H Club
members and their 
leaders for their 
achievements 
during the past 
year.

Working together "To Make the Best Better" 
you have made our community a better place 
in which to live.

FEEDS — SEEDS — FERTIUZERS

Aberdeen Supply Co., Inc.
Phone W14-1422 Aberdeen, N. C.
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Camp Supports and 
Appliances are 

scientifically fitted here 
by registered fitters.

CULBRETH'S 
Southern Pines Pharmacy

(At Railway Station) 
Southern Pines

Tel. OX 5-5321
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Here If Is! The Year's Greatest 
Opportunity For Big Savings On Fabrics!

One Table Assorted
COTTONS & RAYONS ZOCYd.

SUITINGS
One Table 4-9c Yd.

LOOK ^ but Sp““i fiEEfiS
VALUEfi! Td,i. SAVE!

DRAPERIES
Reg. 59c Now 39c yd.
Clerks will help estimate yardage

Say “Hello 

to beauty 

in an 
Easter 

outfit 

designed 
especially 

s^for you ! ^
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Sew and Save 
for

Spring and Easter.
Select from our 

excitingly beautiful

Fabrics
in spring-fresh colors

New Arrivals Daily

Complete line of 
Sewing Accessories 
Trimmings — Buttons

Patterns
Butterick 8c McCalls in stock 

Vogue mail ordered

REGISTER
FOR NEXT

HAT MAKING 
CLASS

J

Reservations are necessary as classes 
are limited.

.RXXNG

At Rear of Store

Mill Outlet Store
650 S. W. Broad Street Southern Pines

Tel. 695-3291


