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Mrs. Jorgensen Stafford, of

Greenville, S. C, announces

the engagement of her
daughter, Miss Patricia Ann
Stafford, to Larry Franklin
Parks, son of Mr. and Mrs.

Clyde F. Parks, of Hot

Springs.
Miss Stafford and Mr. Parks

are students at Montreat-Anderso- n

College.

Anniversary
Mr. and Mrs. E. B. Sumerel

of Hot Springs celebrated
their golden wedding an-

niversary Sunday with an
open house in their home.
They were married March 27,

1921 in Ivjurens, S. C. Mr. and
Mrs. Sumerel have three
children, Mrs. Mary Lee
Ricker of Brevard, Charles
Sumerel of Hot Springs and
KLmo Sumerel of Asheville.

On Baseball
Team

James R. Ramsey, son of

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur K.
Ramsey, of Chilhowie, Va., is

third baseman for the
Chilhowie Warriors, and is a
member of the C.A.A.

He is the grandson of Mr.
and Mrs., Roosevelt Franklin,
of Route 4, Marshall and the

n of Mrs. H, E.
Wallin, Sr., of Route 3,

Marshall.

CODY MOTOR

Week Beginning April 5

Monday: Seawitch on school
baked bun, whole baked
potato, cabbage carrot slaw,
raisin peanut butter cookies
and milk.

Tuesday: Meat loaf, fluffy
mashed potatoes, green peas,
school baked rolls, butter
pineapple upside down cak
and milk.

Wednesday: Pinto beans,
mixed greens, Harvard beets,
sliced onions, cornbread,
butter, cherry cobbler and
milk.

Thursday: Sliced cold baked
ham, potato salad, green
beans, school baked rolls,
Easter cake and milk.

Friday: Beefburger on
school made buns, lettuce and
tomatoes, onions, pickles,
potato chips, apple raisin
crisp and milk.

West Virginia is the largest
coal producing state in the
nation.

f DGEHOOD
Restaurant

143S Merrimon Ave.
Asheville, N. C.

Breakfast Dinner
Supper

Regular Meals
Short Orders

Sandwiches
Homemade Pies

Open 6 a.m. - 10 p.m.

AIR CONDITIONED

Phone

MAKSIIALL, V C

See Kermit before you trade.
We're loaded with 64-6- 6 models.

Must sell to make room for new
additions to lot.

lwrence B. Burwell, MPH,
Madison County Health
Director, has announced the
Health Department Clinic
schedule for April, 1971.
Clinics listed are held at the
Health Department unless
otherwise specified.

Thursday, April 1, General
Immunization Clinic, Mars
Hill Town Hall, -4 p.m.

Friday, April 2, General
Immunization Clinic, 8:30-1- 2

Noon, p.m.
Monday, April 5, General

Immunization Clinic, Hot
Springs Town Hall, p.m.

Tuesday, April 6, Eye
Clinic, By Appointment Only

Wednesday, April 7, Child
Health Supervisory Clinic, By
Appointment Only

Thursday, April 8, General
Immunization Clinic, Mars
Hill Town Hall, -4 p.m.

Friday, April 9, General
Immunization Clinic, 8:30-1- 2

noon, -4 p.m.
Monday, April 12, Holiday,

Easter Monday
Tuesday, April 13, Mater-

nity Clinic, 11 a.m.
Thursday, April 15, Genera'

Immunization Clinic, Mars
Hill Town Hall, -4 p.m.

Friday, April 16, General
Immunization Clinic, 8:30-1- 2

noon, -4 p.m.
Monday, April 19, Mental

Health Clinic, By Ap-

pointment Only
General Immunization

Clinic, Hot Springs Town Hall,
p.m.

Thursday, April 22, General
Immunization Clinic, Mars
Hill Town Hall, -4 p.m.

Friday, April 23, General
Immunization Clinic, 8:30-1- 2

noon, p.m.
Monday, April 26. General

Immunization Clinic, Hot
Springs Town Hall, p.m

Tuesday, April 27, Family
Planning Clinic, By Ap

ointment Only
nmrsday, April 29, General

Immunization (Time, Mars
Hill Town Hall. p m

April .'ill. General
Immunization Clinic. 8 2

noon t p in
Nurse Screening (Time, !

Apimintmenl )nl

At all Genera! Im-

munization (Tunes, protection
is available against
diphtheria, poliomyelitis,
whooping cough, tetanus
lockjaw i, measles, rubella,

.ind smallpox. Blood testing

.ind tuberculin skin testing are
also available at the General
Inununization (Times.

ATTEND CONFERENCE

All seven extension agents
in Madison County returned
last Thursday night from
Winston-Sale- where they
attended the annual Extension
Conference.

IF IT'S NEWS...
TEll US ABOUT IT

WE CARE

JOHM

UUI.NOS AIRIS (Cl'l)
There are 0 spin is stadiums
in Buenos Aues lot nunc
than lull a million spectators.
Some stadiums in the city
and its subuibs have

capacities railing lioin 40.0XK
to 00.000 spectatois.

Texas's lobbery rate per
100.000 population increased
124 pei cent during the
I'H.Os.

SALES, INC
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Mrs. Phil Waldrop of
Asheville, the former Brenda
Reed, was honored with a
stork shower on Friday night,
March 19, in the Free Will

Baptist Ladies' Aid House.
The hostesses were: Miss Rita
Blackwell, Mrs. Barbara
Shelton and Mrs. Kathern
Reed.

Mrs. Guy Ramsey, Mrs.
Charlie Leake, Mrs. Raymond
Stines, Mrs. Richard Wilson,
Mrs. Pat Waldrop, and Mrs.
Roseanna Waldrop were
contest winners.

Those attending in addition
to the honoree were: Dorothy
Reed, Mrs. Raymond Stines,
Mrs. Charlie Leake, Mrs.
Richard Wilson, Mrs. Guy
Ramsey, Mrs. Pat Waldrop,
Mrs. Roseanna Waldrop, Mrs.
David Blackwell, Mrs. Cecil
Blackwell, Mrs. Gordon
Treadway, Mrs. Queen
Plemmons, Miss Janie
Plemmons, Mrs. Mary
Craine, Mrs. Coleman
Ramsey, Mrs. Susie Davis,
Mrs. Mae Roberts, Mrs.
Althea Lawrence, Marie
Waldrop, Diane Waldrop,
Dottie and Darlene Reed, Rita
Blackwell, Barbara Shelton,
Kathern Reed and Lynn
Metcalf.

Mrs. Lloyd Chandler is a
patient in a Black Mountain
Hospital where she is
receiving treatment.

Mrs. Doris Wyatt, Mrs.
Tommy Blackwell, Mrs.
Othella Brigman and Miss
Ruth Guthrie left on Thursday
for Charlotte where they will
attend the NCAE Convention
for three days.

Staff Sergeant and Mrs.
Bruce Rigsby and their four
children left on Friday for
their home near San Fran-
cisco, Calif. The family has
lived in Walnut for 16 months
and will be greatly missed in

the Church, the school and
other activities of the com-

munity Their many friends
and relatives hope that they
will be very happy in their new
home

Mr arid Mrs Morgan Moss
Jr. from Durham spent the
weekend with Mr Moss uncle
,uul aunt, the Hev and Mrs
George Moore and (den
daughters

Mr and Mrs Shepherd from
Burnsville attt uled the
morning worship service ai
the Presbyterian Church on

Sunday

INCOME TAX

RETURNS
PREPARED

Contact
REGGY ANDERS
Rector's Corner
Marshall, N. C.

Phone 649-487- 3

After 4 p.m.
Jan. 7, 14,21,28 chg.

it

69 MUSTANG, Auto.,
302. V8

2195.00

67 FORD Gal. 500, 2

dr. H.T., V8 S.D.
1395.00

67 FORD Gal. 500, 1

dr., Auto
1395.00
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66 COMET Caliente, 2
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speed
1095.00

TO COMPLIMENT
YOUR NEW OUTFIT

Lei us style your hair in or.e of the soft

new looks for spring, custom cut espe-

cially to flatter you, and right in time

for the Easter Parade . . . Hair cut,

shampoo and set are included in one

low price,

Beautytime
Beauty Shop

M ain St. M arshall, NX.

Marshal! Thrift Store

Anniversary discount

Don
it


