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FRIDAY,

^fcis is theiecpnd year that
Bion H. Butler has be$n serving
as publicity agent of the State
Fffir. The management of the
fair is greatly pleased with the
quality of the service he is .giv¬
ing and undoubtedly a big hit
was made when the services of
Mr. Butler were engaged in this
connection.
No man is the State has a

greater or more unselfish pride
ia the commonwealth than Mr.
Butler. Althoughanadopted son
he is as vigorous and earnest in
his labors and work for the good
erf the State as any of hemative
born.

. Nobody in the State has a bet¬
ter line on the resources of the
State than Bion Butler. His ar¬

ticles every Sunday in the News
& Observer show a wealth of in¬
formation about ther State to

geiher with similar information
about other States needed to give
the proper perspective and em
phasts to the North Carolina data.
The management of the Fair

made a htt when it hired Butlei
its publicityman. He isenthusi-
astic for the State and he sees in
the State Fair an agency for the
economic development of the
State of North Carolina. His
work is a labor of love as one

suited especially to his order of

abilit^jpJ>Every State Fair is of course

can be chalked down tfaat jjhe
October show is going to be
narked fay more than ordinary*
gain..News & Observer.
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Tolal Average t«E30 $229.40


