
Headstart 
Meetings Held 
In County

By: Shirley Anne McAUis'-er 
Meetings to plan for the 

Headstart Program for 1966- 
67 have been held at all 
schools in the county during 
the past two weeks. School 
committees were set up at 
each meeting, also two w-men 
to serve on the County-wide 
Heads'art Committee.

A County-wide meeting was 
held .at the Oak Crest School 
Building on December 12. 
There was a verv good turn­
out and the following will 
serve on the Yancey County 
Headstart Committee:

Officers are: Mary Sue 
Pallev, Chairman: CnTt>l
Weeks, Vice-Chairman; Fthel 
F'gajns, Secretary: Mary 
Parter. As.sts'-ant Secretary.

Other committee members 
are: Lula Miller, Ruth Ad­
kins. Cartle Pa*e. KHa Jean 
Geouee, Nell Huskins. Sally 
Thomas. Marilyn Neuhauser, 
Please Whihaon, Emma Lee 
Hensley and Dolly Hens’ey.

Yancev Cnun*v will hava 
two renresentatlves. Mary 
Sue Pailey and Ne’l Faskins, 
on the Ponr-County Mead- 
st-Tt Committee.

The main lob of the eom- 
mif‘ee will he to aid recruit­
ment, volunteer sendees, set 
un rules for and reeommend 
hiring, and heln p’an and 
review next year’s proposal.

Bazaar At 
Spruce Pine

A Christmas Crafts Bazaar, 
similar to the one held in 
Burnsvire last week, will be 
held at Harris Elementary 
School gym In Spruce Pine 
Decfinber 16 and 17 from 
9:r0-5:00 p. m.
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Items for sale will include 
Woodwork, quilts, novelty 
items, aprons, handmade 
Christmas decorations, etc.

This Is a W.A.M.Y. encour. 
aged project.

THURSDAY, DEC. ii i!i«6

Burnsville

Sale Success

The W.A.M.Y. Crafts Co- 
Ordinators report a very suc­
cessful sale which was held 
In Burnsville Friday and Sat­
urday. Many items were sold 
and the people who made 
these Items of wood, iron, 
clc'h, bamboo, etc., are grate­
ful to those who Came out on 
the rainy days.

If a neighbor or relative 
ha-ncns to have a doll that 
looks like a little old man 
wi'h a beard and is usually 
called "Psw”. most likely he 
came to the Bazaar.

ADMINISTRATRIX NOTIC* 
NORTH CAROLINA 
YANCEY COUNT?

Having qualified as Admin­
istratrix of the Estate of 
Seigle Davis, deceased, late 
of Yancey County, this Is to 
notify all persons having 
claims against the Decedent 
to exhibit the same to the un­
dersigned Administratrix at 
her home at Rt. 5, Box SS„ 
Burnsvll’e, N. C., on or before 
the 15th day of June, 1967, or 
this notice will be pleaded In 
bar of their recovery.

All persons owing the Es­
tate will please make immed­
iate payment.

This 15th day of Dee. 1966.
Cora Davis, AdmlnlstraWx 

of the Estate of Seigle pavlst 
Deceased.
Dee. 15, 22, 29, Jan. i

4
%

per annum
rate

For tho Iasi quatitr of 1986
(October 1st to December 31st peried.)

EARN MORE ON YOUR 
SAVINGS

NOW
0 Save by mail if you find it 

more convenient

First FEDEEAlSaviiit)
ASSETS OVER $10,000,000 

310 Gay Ste Erwin, Tann.

( ) Floost aond tavo by malt kit.

( ) Opan an insured lavinfi Account. Cheek enclosed.

NAME .............. ...............................................................................

ADOKE&S ..................................................................................................

tl||88tlo&S

FOR MOTHER 
FOR DAUGHTER

SWEATERS 
SKIRTS
COATS
BLOUSES

DRESSES
PANTIES
GOWNS
SLIPS

COSTUME JEWELRY

FOR FATHER 
FOR SON

PANTS SHIRTS
SWEATERS 

CAR COATS'

JIAN CASni 
Color-Coordinates

In HOLIDAY HEATHER
Blue, Pink, Green

HOLIDAY PASmS
Yellow, Blue, Peach, Mint Green,& White 

ALL GIFTS WRAPPED FREE
An Easy Store To Shop In 

J. F. ROBINSON, Gen. Mdse.


