
Southport 'Street Person' Sent To Prison After Guiltv PleaA man listed on court dockets as a
"street person" in Southport was
sent to prison for two years after
pleading guilty in Brunswick
County District Court last week to a
charge of second degree trespassing.After Robert Lee Edge, 32, plead¬ed guilty to the charge Wednesday(Sept. 29). Judge Jerry Jolly activat¬
ed a two-year sentence that had been
suspended last May after Edgepleaded guilty to charges of assault¬
ing and resisting a police officer and
first-degree trespass.

Edge was given an additional 30-
day sentence on last week's convic¬
tion, to run at the same time as the
two-year sentence.

Judge David Wall presided over
district court last Monday and
Tuesday. Judge Jolly heard cases
Wednesday. Assistant District
Attorney Rick Green offered the
state's evidence Monday and Tues¬
day, while ADA Lillian Salcines
prosecuted Wednesday's cases.
Marie Jordan served as courtroom
clerk.

Other defendants who appeared in
district court last week, with their
charges, pleas and sentences in¬
clude:

Charles Barnes, assault by point¬
ing a gun, resisting/obstructing pub¬lic officer, discharging shot gun in
city limits, all voluntarily dismissed.

Alvin D. Bartholomew, driving li¬
cense suspendcd/revoked-not per¬
manent, driving left of center, con¬
solidated judgment, N.C. Depart¬
ment of Corrections two years, sus¬
pended sentence three years, super¬vised probation three years, $300
and costs, not operate motor vehicle
until valid license, Brunswick
County Jail eight days to begin im¬
mediately.

Joyce Bell Holland, unsafe move¬
ment, voluntarily dismissed; owning
and operating vehicle with no insur¬
ance, Brunswick County Jail 60
days, supervised probation two
years, $25 and costs, reimburse
plaintiff any monies not covered by
insurance, $75 attorney fees.

Marcus E. Bowles, speeding 47 in
a 35 zone, voluntarily dismissed at
request of plaintiff.

Kenneth L. Chambers, shoplift¬
ing/concealment of goods, Bruns¬
wick County Jail 30 days, suspend¬
ed sentence two years, $50 and
costs, not go back about Wilsons
without their permission, 24 hours
of community service within 60
days, pay fee.

Sidney Lee Doty, driving while li¬
cense suspended/revoked-not per¬
manent, voluntarily dismissed.

Beverly C. Evans, second degree
trespassing, voluntarily dismissed.

Norgeto Gonzalez, no drivers li¬
cense, Brunswick County Jail six
months, suspended sentence two
years, $140 and costs, not operate
motor vehicle until valid license; ex¬

ceeding posted speed, voluntarily
dismissed.

Jeremy I. Harris, simple assault,
Brunswick County Jail 30 days, sus¬

pended sentence three years, super¬
vised probation three years, $50 and
costs, $100 attorney fees, not go
back about the person of plaintiff or

any member of his family, stay en¬
rolled in full-time school, Bruns¬
wick County Jail six days 5 p.m.-8
p.m. 10-1 to 10-3 next two weeks,
testify truthfully against co-defen¬
dant.

Jeffrey Wade House, injury to
personal property, simple possession
Schedule VI Controlled Substance,
possessing drug paraphernalia, con¬
solidated judgment, Brunswick
County Jail six months.

Patrick Edward Jones, assault
with a deadly weapon, prayer for
judgment continued and costs, not
assault, harass or threaten any of the
plaintiffs, surrender license for 60
days-hold in clerk's office.

Robert Justice, larceny, voluntari¬
ly dismissed, no plaintiff.

John Richard King, speeding 44
in a 35 zone, $40 and no costs; fail¬
ure to exhibit license, voluntarily
dismissed.

Francis Allen Ladd, owning and
operating vehicle with no insurance,
voluntarily dismissed, wrong person
charged; driving while license re-

voked-permanent, vehicle not regis¬
tered/titled, fictitious information to
officer, failure to wear seat belt/dri¬
ver, all voluntarily dismissed.

Denise Marie Lambert, shoplift¬
ing/concealment of goods, voluntari¬
ly dismissed at request of plaintiff.
Randy W. Lewis, simple worth¬

less check to Pizza Hut for $31.38
and $20.56, worthless check/closed
account for $60.42 to Roberta Pain¬
ter, consolidated judgment, Bruns¬
wick County Jail 90 days.

Deonna F. McCormick, second
degree trespassing, voluntarily dis¬
missed.
Thomasenia McKoy, operating

domiciliary home without license,
Brunswick County Jail six months,
suspended sentence five years, $50
and costs, not operate any such
domiciliary facility unless properly
licensed to do so, cooperate fully
with Department of Social Service
for five years or any state, within 90
days perform 72 hours of communi¬
ty service. .

Jerry D. Milligan, misdemeanor

breaking and entering, Brunswick
County Jail six months, suspended
sentence two years, supervised pro¬
bation two years, $50 and costs, not
go back about premises of plaintiff
for two years, assessment for alco¬
hol & substance abuse, Brunswick
County Jail 48 hours to begin 5 p.m.
on 9-28-93, $156.57 to Lee's Buy-
Rite in Leland; injury to real proper¬
ty, voluntarily dismissed.

Randolph Parish, assault on a fe¬
male, assault with a deadly weapon,
consolidated judgment, N.C. De¬
partment of Corrections two years,
suspended sentence five years, $100
and costs, not go back about the per¬
son or premises of plaintiffs except
in compliance with visitation order,
stayed enrolled Coastal Horizon and
complete program.

Malinda C. Prince, speeding 64 in
a 55 zone, $40 and costs.

Louis Ronald Ramsey Jr., disor¬
derly conduct, second degree tres¬
passing, both voluntarily dismissed.

Floyd Douglas Roberts, simple
possession of less than 'A oz. of mar¬
ijuana. driving while license sus-

pended/revoked-not permanent, pos¬
session of drug paraphernalia, con¬
solidated judgment, Brunswick
County Jail 90 days, suspended sen¬
tence two years, $250 and costs, not
operate motor vehicle until valid li¬
cense, not use, possess or consume

any controlled substance or drug
paraphernalia unless prescribed by
licensed physician, marijuana and
papers are to be destroyed.

Robert Earl Rose Jr., simple as¬
sault, voluntarily dismissed, no

plaintiff.
Stephen L. Scheid, motion for

disposition, voluntarily dismissed.
Charlie Southerland, shoplifting

concealment of goods, possession
drug paraphernalia, consolidated
judgment, Brunswick County Jail
six months, suspended sentence two
years, $50 and costs, not go back
about Wilsons for two years, not
use, possess or consume any con¬
trolled substance or drug parapher¬
nalia, 48 hours of community ser¬
vice within 60 days-pay fee.

Collie Lee Stackhouse, driving
while license suspended/revoked-
not permanent, Brunswick County
Jail 90 days, suspended sentence
two years, $200 and costs, not oper¬
ate motor vehicle until valid license.

John Wayne Stanley, second de¬
gree trespassing, voluntarily dis¬
missed.

Cassandra D. Stogner, speeding
64 in a 55 zone, $40 and costs.

Mornin Glory Townsend, second
degree trespassing, voluntarily dis¬
missed.

Kenneth S. Tregembo, speeding
64 in a 55 zone, $40 and costs.
Andrew Duane Trump, larceny,

voluntarily dismissed, no plaintiff.
Tony Whitmer, violation of court

order, Brunswick County Jail 48
hours.

Bernard Leroy Willis, DWI, Le¬
vel 5, Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
$100 and costs, surrender license, no
blood alcohol in body while operat¬
ing a motor vehicle, 24 hours of
community service within 60 days,
assessment; driving left of center,
voluntarily dismissed.

Laura Bryant Young, speeding 55
in a 45 zone, $40 and costs.

Juliana Allen, speeding 64 in a 55
zone, $40 and costs.

Dale Warren Bellamy, speeding
70 in a 55 zone, $40 and costs; fail¬
ure to comply with restriction, vol¬
untarily dismissed.

Susan A. Buckner, speeding 70 in
a 55 zone, $40 and costs.

Glenn Joseph Conley, speeding
70 in a 55 zone, $50 and costs.

Lori Leigh Crisco, probation vio¬
lation, probation revoked, sentence
activated.

Kenneth Eugene David, driving
while license revoked-permanent,
Brunswick County Jail 30 days.

Frank Dilonardo, speeding 81 in a
55 zone, prayer for judgment contin¬
ued and costs.

Kimberly Dawn Edwards, failure
to yield left turn, $15 and costs.

Willie Carvain Ford Jr., failure to
wear seat belt/driver, $25 fine; own¬
ing and operating vehicle with no in¬
surance, improper passing, both vol¬
untarily dismissed.

Joseph Robert Hall, DWI, Level
5, Brunswick County Jail 30 days,
suspended sentence two years, $100
and costs, surrender license, assess¬

ment, not operate motor vehicle with
any blood alcohol content in his
body, 24 houis of community ser¬
vice within 60 days.

Steven Brian Hatcher, speeding
88 in a 55 zone, Brunswick County
Jail 60 days, suspended sentence
two years, $50 and costs, surrender
license.

Jerry Wayne Hewett, DWI, Level
3, Brunswick County Jail six
months, suspended sentence three
years, supervised probation three
years, $300 and costs, surrender li¬
cense, assessment, 72 hours of com¬
munity service within 20 days.

Farron D. Holden, improper
equipment, $25 and costs; no trailer
tag, voluntarily dismissed.

Cathy Lynn Johnston, speeding
70 in a 55 zone, $50 and costs.

Dennis James Langley, speeding70 in a 55 zone, $25 and costs (al¬
ready paid).
Sampson McKay Jr., speeding 70

in a 55 zone. $40 and costs.
Joseph Lee Robinson, drivingwhile license suspended/revoked-

not permanent, prayer for judgmentcontinued and costs.
Edward Semidy. driving while li¬

cense suspended/revoked-not per¬
manent, voluntarily dismissed.

Richard A. Shamblin, DWI, Level
3, Brunswick County Jail six
months, suspended sentence three
years, supervised probation three
years, $500 and costs, surrender li¬
cense, assessment waived. Bruns¬
wick County Jail 20 days.

Ronald Allan Smith, driving
while license suspended/revoked-
not permanent. Brunswick County
Jail 60 days, suspended sentence
two years, $200 and costs, not oper¬
ate motor vehicle until valid license.

John Franklin Splawn. failure to
yield from private drive, voluntarily
dismissed, insurance paid.

Robert Lee Sutter, speeding 80 in
a 55 zone, Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
$50 and costs, not operate motor ve¬
hicle in this state until privilege re¬
stored to do so.

Mary Tate, simple assault, com¬
municating threats, consolidated
judgment, prayer for judgment con¬
tinued and costs remitted, not as¬
sault, harass or threaten plaintiff in
the future.

Jo Ann Vaught, speeding 77 in a
55 zone, prayer for judgment contin¬
ued and costs.

Michelle R. Vereen, speeding 70
in a 55 zone, $40 and costs.

Clara Whitmore, unsafe move¬
ment, voluntarily dismissed.

Lisa Ruitto, speeding 74 in a 55
zone, Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
$35 and costs, not operate motor ve¬
hicle until valid license.

Douglas Ray Baines, DWI, Level
4, Brunswick County Jail 60 days,
not operate motor vehicle until valid
license.

William Stevenson, unauthorized
use of motor vehicle, driving while
license suspended/revoked-not per¬
manent, expired registration card
/tag, inspection violation, consoli¬
dated judgment, N.C. Department of
Corrections two years, suspended
sentence three years, $200 and costs
(paid within two weeks), Brunswick
County Jail eight days credit for
time served, not go back about
plaintiff without her permission, not
operate motor vehicle until valid li¬
cense.

Willie J. Williams, no drivers li¬
cense, Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
not operate motor vehicle until valid
license, court cost remitted; littering
not greater than 15 lbs., voluntarily
dismissed.
Norman D. Alloway, failure to

keep crab pot buoyed, prayer for
judgment continued and costs.

Larry Bell, resisting/obstructing
public officer, voluntarily dismissed
at request of plaintiff.

Ricky Dale Bellamy, assault with
a deadly weapon, voluntarily dis¬
missed at request of plaintiff.

Sandi Bland, four counts of mis¬
representation to obtain Employ¬
ment Security Commission benefit,
consolidated judgment, N.C. De¬
partment of Corrections two years,
supervised probation two years,
costs, restitution $499 to plaintiff,
$200 attorney fees, not violate any
laws for two years, not apply for any
unemployment benefits for two
years even if he is eligible; four
counts of misrepresentation to ob¬
tain Employment Security Commis¬
sion benefit, consolidated judgment,
N.C. Department of Corrections two
years to run consecutive with previ¬
ous sentence, supervised probation
two years, restitution $499 to plain¬
tiff, $200 attorney fees, not violate
any laws for two years, not apply for
any unemployment benefits for two
years even if he is eligible.

Kenneth Bryant, two counts of
misrepresentation to obtain Employ¬
ment Security Commission benefits,
consolidated judgment, N.C. De¬
partment of Corrections two years,
suspended sentence two years, unsu¬

pervised probation two years, costs,
restitution $313 to plaintiff, not vio¬
late any laws for two years, not ap¬
ply for any unemployment benefits
for two years even if he is eligible.

Michael Shane Causey, posses¬
sion of drug paraphernalia, Bruns¬
wick County Jail six months, sus¬

pended sentence two years, $500
and costs, substance abuse assess¬
ment, submit to warrantless search¬
es, not violate any laws for two
years.

Otto S. Chamberlain, falsified/al¬
tered identification to attain alco¬
holic beverage, possession of malt
beverage by unknown not 19/20

_

years old, consolidated judgment,
prayer for judgment continued and
costs

Leja Dawn Childers, speeding 54
in a 45 zone, costs; no drivers li¬
cense, voluntarily dismissed.

Steven Lee Clemmons, unautho¬
rized use of motor vehicle, injury to
personal property, both voluntarily

dismissed at request of plaintiff.
Jimmy Francis Collins, taking un¬

dersized red drum, costs.
Craig Thomas Fortner, unsealed

wine/liquor in passenger area, vol¬
untarily dismissed; littering not
greater than 15 lbs., costs.

Clifton Garrison, knowing ficti¬
tious/cancelled/revoked/suspended
license, voluntarily dismissed; tak¬
ing wild plants from land, Bruns¬
wick County Jail six months, sus¬
pended sentence two years, costs
and $200, not violate any laws for
two years.

Bryan T. Goodwin, four counts of
misrepresentation to obtain Em¬
ployment Security Commission
Benefits, consolidated judgment,
N.C. Department of Corrections two
years, supervised probation two
years, costs, restitution $2,191 to
plaintiff, not violate any laws, not
app!y for any unemployment bene¬
fits for two years even if he is eligi¬
ble; four counts of misrepresentation
to obtain Employment Security
Commission Benefits, consolidated
judgment, N.C. Department of Cor¬
rections two years to run consecu¬
tive with previous sentence, sus¬
pended sentence two years, super¬
vised probation two years, costs,
restitution S2. 191 to plaintiff, not vi¬
olate any laws, not apply for any un¬

employment benefits for two years
even if he is eligible.

Robert W. Gore, seven counts of
misrepresentation to obtain Employ¬
ment Security Commission Benefits,
consolidated judgment, N.C. De¬
partment of Corrections two years,
supervised probation two years
costs, restitution $1,647 to plaintiff,'
not apply for any unemployment
benefits even if he is eligible, not vi¬
olate any laws for two years. $2(X)
attorney fees; six counts of misrep¬
resentation to obtain Employment
Security Commission Benefits, con¬
solidated judgment, N.C. Depart¬
ment of Corrections two years to run
consecutive with previous sentence,
suspended sentence two years, su¬

pervised probation two years, costs
restitution $1,647 to plaintiff, not
apply for any unemployment bene¬
fits even if he is eligible, not violate
any laws for two years, $200 attor¬
ney fees.

Richard Harrelson Jr., disorderly
conduct, Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
$50 and costs, not violate any laws
for two years.
Tony Wayne Hedgecock, five

counts of injury to personal proper¬
ty, consolidated judgment, prayer for
judgment continued and costs.

Junior Thomas Hewett, commer¬

cial/fishing without vessel license,
voluntarily dismissed.

Eddie Martin Huff, DWI. Level 3
Brunswick County Jail 180 days,
suspended sentence two years, $100
and costs, not operate motor vehicle
until valid license, assessment, 72
hours of community service within
90 days, not violate any laws for two
years. Appealed. Peddle license vio¬
lation/city, voluntarily dismissed.

Arbie Humphrey, assault on a fe¬
male, N.C. Department of Correc¬
tions one year, suspended sentence
two years, costs, assessment for al¬
cohol abuse, not violate any laws for
two years.

Billy Ray Johnson, driving while
license suspended/revoked-not per¬
manent, prayer for judgment contin¬
ued and costs.
Sven Ralph Draumanis, reckless

driving/to endanger, prayer for judg¬
ment continued and costs.

Jerry A. Litchfield, two counts as¬
sault with a deadly weapon, two
counts of assault by pointing a gun,
all voluntarily dismissed, no plain¬
tiff.

Michael E. Long, injury to real
property, injury to personal property,
unauthorized use of motor vehicle,
consolidated judgment, N.C. De¬
partment of Corrections two years,
suspended sentence two years, su¬

pervised probation two years, costs,
$121 to V. Powell, $375 to S. Holt,
not violate any laws for two years.
Appealed. Defrauding innkeeper,
voluntarily dismissed, no plaintiff.

Fenwick D. Lix>mer. taking pro¬
tected alligator/unlawfully, prayer
for judgment continued and costs.

Dennis R. Lowery Jr., three
counts of misrepresentation to ob¬
tain Employment Security Commis¬
sion benefit, consolidated judgment,
Brunswick County Jail 30 days, sus¬

pended sentence two years, costs,
$322 restitution to plaintiff, not vio¬
late any laws for two years, not ap¬
ply for or receive any unemploy¬
ment benefits for two years.

Donald E. Maggard. no drivers li¬
cense. Brunswick County Jail 30
days, suspended sentence two years,
costs, $25 fine, not violate any laws
for two years.

Angela Renee McLain, DWl,
Level 5. Brunswick County Jail 60
days, suspended sentence two years,
$100 and costs, surrender license,
assessment, 30 days of non-opera-
tion in lieu of community service,
not violate any laws for two years;
driving left of center, voluntarily
dismissed.

Jerry McNeil, five counts of giv¬
ing false information to Employ¬
ment Security Commission, consoli¬
dated judgment, N.C. Department of
Corrections two years, suspended
sentence two years, supervised pro¬
bation two years, costs, $561 restitu¬
tion to plaintiff, not apply for or re¬
ceive any unemployment benefits
even if eligible, not violate any laws
for two years.

Ronald Dale McPherson, DWl,
Level 5, Brunswick County Jail 60
days, suspended sentence two years,
$100 and costs, surrender license,
assessment, Brunswick County Jail
24 hours in lieu of community ser¬
vice to begin 10-6-93 at 7 p.m.; fail¬
ure to reduce speed, voluntarily dis¬
missed.

William H. Miller Jr., four counts
of misrepresentation to obtain Em¬
ployment Security Commission ben¬
efits, consolidated judgment. N.C.
Department of Coirections two
years, supervised probation two
years, costs, restitution $682 to
plaintiff, not apply for any unem¬

ployment benefits even if eligible,
not violate any laws for two years;
four counts of misrepresentation to
obtain Employment Security Com¬
mission benefits, consolidated N.C.
Department of Corrections two
years to run consecutive with previ¬
ous sentence, suspended sentence
two years, supervised probation two
years, costs, restitution $682 to
plaintiff, not apply for any unem¬

ployment benefits even if eligible,
not violate any laws for two years.

Jerry Myers Moore, speeding 50
in a 45 zone, costs.

Rodney LLoyd Parker, speeding
70 in a 55 zone, $10 and costs.
Appealed.

Bryon Steven Prevatte, failure to
disperse, voluntarily dismissed at re¬

quest of plaintiff.
Gregory K. Prevatte, disorderly
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conduct, voluntarily dism ed at r

quest of plaintiff.
Michael I -ewis Rea, possession

drug paraphernalia. Brunswick
County Jail 60 days, suspended sen¬
tence two years, $25 and costs, con¬
tinue to go to NAA meeting, not vi¬
olate any laws for two years,

Stephen N. Reynolds, injury to re¬
al property, voluntarily dismissed,
damages paid.

Richard L. Richardson, registra¬
tion documents fictitious/cancelled
/etc., taking wild plants from land,
consolidated judgment, Brunswick
County Jail six months, suspended
sentence five years, $2(M) and costs,
not violate any laws for five year.

Daniel Lee Shearon, domestic
criminal trespassing, harassing
phone call, second degree trespass¬
ing. all voluntarily dismissed at re¬

quest of plaintiff.
Norman Simmons, second degree

trespassing, voluntarily dismissed at
request of plaintiff.

Kier M. Skipper, speeding 64 in a
55 zone, prayer for judgment contin¬
ued and costs.

Billy Joe Sparks, breaking and/or
entering, N.C. Department of Cor¬
rections two years, suspended sen¬
tence five years, costs, $50 restitu¬
tion to plaintiff, not communicate
with or go about the property of
plaintiff, not violate any laws for
five years.

Robert T. Whisnant. registration
documents fictitious/cancelled/etc,
no drivers license, both voluntarily
dismissed; reckless driving/to en¬

danger, Brunswick County Jail 60
days, suspended sentence two years,
$100 and costs. $175 attorney fees,
not violate any laws for two years.

Donald Williamson, assault on a
female, prayer for judgment contin¬
ued and costs, attend mental health
& undergo an assessment for alco¬
hol abuse; breaking and/or entering,
assault on a child under 12. both
voluntarily dismissed.
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