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CHRIS AND
TINA SHORT

Twins

Observe
Birthdays
Chris and Tina Short,

twins, celebrated their
second birthday, Aug. 1.
The children of Mr.

and Mrs. Bobby Short of
408 Gillespie St. enjoyed
abirthday party at their
home with family and
friends. Their teddy
bear-decorated cake
was cut and served with
party refreshments.
The twins are grand-

children of Mills Short
of Kings Mountain and
the late Mrs. Carrie
Short, Mrs. Bonnie
Taylor of Canton and
Carter Taylor of
Asheville.

MISTY AND
SHAWN COLVIN

Colvins
Celebrate
Birthdays
Misty and Shawn

Colvin, girl-boy twins,
celebrated their second
birthday Sat., Aug. 6,
and were two years old
Aug. 9.
Holly Hobbie and

Robby cakes were made
by the twins’ mother

and were served with
ice cream and refresh-
ments.
Children present for

the party were Misty
and Shawn's five-year-
old sister, Paige Colvin,
Robin and Jason
Goforth, Tommy and
John Brooks, Amy and
Lance McBee, Amy
Brackett, Tonya

Carrigan, Robin and
Brandi Scott and Mandi
Bridges.
Misty and Shawn are

the twins of Mr. and
Mrs. Jimmy L. Colvin of
Bessemer City.
Grandparents are Mr.
and Mrs. George E.
Nolen of Kings Moun-
tain and Mr. and Mrs.
Curtis L. Colvin of
Bessemer City.

Ceramics

Course

Is Set
The Continuing Edu-

ucation Department of
Cleveland Tech has an-
nounced a course in

ceramics to begin Tues-
day, Aug. 9, from 7 to 10
p. m. at Connie's

Ceramic Shop. Connie
Grigg will instruct.
Persons needing

additional information
may call Cleveland
Tech, 482-8351, between

thehoursof8 a. m. and 4
p. m., Monday through
Friday.
Adults 18 and older,

interested in enrolling
may do so at the first
class meeting paying
the $5 registration fee. 
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