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CHEERLEADERS AND MAJORETTES CHOSEN
Sophs M et A nd 

Elected Their 
New O fficers

Members of the sophomore class 
met during the chapel hour Sat­
urday, October 1, to elect class of­
ficers and representatives for the 
student council for this academic 
year. Students who were elected 
were as follows: President of the 
class, who will also serve as a 
member of the student council, 
Michael Haddock; vice president, 
Raymond Wilkinson; secretary- 
treasurer, Mary Elizabeth Latham. 
Council members who were chos­
en were Samuel Geek, Betsy Bow­
man and Donald Helms.

In the race for president the 
nominees were Bob Hunt, Ray­
mond Wilkinson, Mary Elizabeth 
Latham and Michael Haddock. 
Vice presidential nominees were 
J. C. Groce and Raymond Wilkin­
son. Three candidates were nom­
inated for secretary-treasurer. 
They were Bob Ratchford, Mary 
Elizabeth Latham and Sara Free 
man.'

The constitution of the student 
council provides for a representa­
tive of the day students on the 
council. Nominated for this of­
fice were Samuel Geek, James 0. 
Brooks and Bob Ratchford. Other 
student_ council nominees were 
Virginia Price, Josephine Rowe, 
Jim White, Betsy Bowman, Don 
aid Helms, Polly Mallard and Bob 
Hunt.

Freshman officers and council 
members will be chosen in the 
near future.

Dance Is Given 
For Ball Team s 

A fter P JC  Game
After Brevard’s first home foot­

ball game last Saturday night, the 
players and rooters celebrated 
with a dance in the recreation 
room of West Hall. A large num­
ber of students attended, as well 
as members of both football 
teams. The Delphian initiates en­
joyed the dance more than any­
one else, it seemed, for they were 
in civil dress again after having 
gone two days outlandishly clad. 
They added to the enjoyment by 
carrying out the orders of the old 
Delphians.

Music for the dance was provid- 
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Church C alendar I

EPISCOPAL CHURCH
Morning services at 11 a. m.

METHODIST CHURCH
Morning services at 11 a. m. 
Youth Fellowship at 6:30 p. m. 
Evening services at 7:30 p. m.

BAPTIST CHURCH
Morning services at 11 a. m̂

B. T. U. at 6:15 p. m.
Evening services at 7:30 p. m

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH
Morning services at 11 a. m.

SACRED HEART CATHOLIC
Early Mass at 8 a. m.
Regular services at 11 a. m.
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FIRE PREVENTION WEEK
OCTOPER 9TH-15TH

Initial Student Recital Is Set For 
Friday Night A t 8:30 O’Clock

37 Students A re 
Listed On Summer 

School Honor Roll

According to Mrs. Isabel D. Col- 
trane, registrar, 26 members of 
the college division here made the 
honor roll during the 1949 sum­
mer session and 11 were listed on 
the pre-college honor roll, making 
a total of 37 on the summer school 
honor roll.

Those students who were named 
in the college division are as fol­
lows; Newell Campbell Bush, 
Eloise Crawford, Charles Leroy 
Dwiggins, Robert Bucharian Dwig- 
gins, Charles Ladd Freeman, Rob­
ert Luther Gosnell, Gerald Thom­
as Grant, Joseph J. Hauser, Allen 
Henley, Beatrice Elaine Higdon, 
John Robert Hyre, Dorothy Eliza­
beth McConnell, Thomas W. Mor­
ton, Estel Earl Ogle, Henry Odell 
Purgason, James C. Robertson, Ra­
chel Priscilla Roudebush, Mary 
Josephine Rowe, Alice Augusta 
Seitz, George Edwin Smith, Sher­
man Gorrell Thompson, Charles 
Edward Teague, Raymond Lee 
Wilkinson, Mrs. Carolyn Osborne 
Wolfe, James Andrew Wood and 
Lillian Bird Zachary.

The  ̂ pre-college honor roll in­
cluded Sarah Dot . Call, Carol 
Wynn Drake, Sara Lee Ergle, Pris­
cilla Hodge Foster, Mary Eliza­
beth Holland, Betty Jo McDowell, 
Joan Ann Nicholson, Joseph S. 
Ragsdale, John Justin Randall, 
Dorothy Ann Saintsing and Nancy 
Lee Sugg.

REMEMBER 
HOMECOMING 
OCTOBER 29

Many Activities Scheduled 
By Members Of  Music 

Departm ent

Great things are to be expected 
from all phases of the music de 
partment this year. With Bruce 
A. Livengood, head of the depart­
ment, and Mrs. Louise Miller, 
Earl Holloway and Allen Lind, the 
Brevard college music groups are 
already making plans for public 
and campus performances.

The first student recital of the 
year will be on Friday night, Oc­
tober 7, at 8:30 in the auditorium 
of Dunham haU. There will be 
both instrumental and vocal solos 
presented by the students of Mr. 
Livengood, Mrs. Miller, Mr. Hollo­
way and Mr. Lind.

The program will be as follows: 
Norma King, piano, “Solfeggieto” 
by Bach; Caroline Davis, piano 
“Scotch Poem” by MacDowell; 
Charles Barkley, piano, “Nocturne 
in E Flat” by Chopin; Betty 
Lawrence, piano, Three Preludes 
by Chopin; Ann Smith, piano, 
“Waltz in A Flat, Opus 64, No. 3,” 
by Chopin; Gwendolyn Pickelsim- 
er, piano, “Tyrolean Dance” by 
Williams; Frank Roberts, voice, 
“Inquesta Tomba” by Beethoven; 
Betty Boykin, voice, “In the Si­
lence of the Night” by Rachman­
inoff; and Loise Stratton, voice, 
“Automne” by Faire.

The marching band gave its in­
itial performance Saturday night 
at the football game. Under the 
direction of Mr. Lind, the band 
has approximately 30 members for 
this semester. Four majorettes 
have been elected. Their chief is 
Polly Mallard, who held that same 
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E ffort Is Being 
M ade To Increase 

The School Spirit
Now that football season has 

rolled around once more, everyone 
has started getting ready to yell 
their lungs out for Ye Olde Bre­
vard as the ball is toted over the 
goal-line for a score. For some, 
it will mean silence the next day, 
to the extreme bliss of their fel­
low students. For the tougher 
ones, it will only mean a little 
lower voice, maybe bordering on 
bass. And when you think of yell­
ing, you naturally thing of cheer­
leaders, so here is the inside view 
of the trials and tribulations of 
a cheerleader.

At the very first of school, 
many were thinking that they 
would like to become a cheerlead­
er for the Tornadoes. Some 
dropped by the wayside as the 
practice began, but even then 
there were more trying out than 
the needed jiumber, so Miss Add 
Lea Morgan was given the job of 
choosing just the right ones for a 
hard job. After much delibera­
tion, the following were chosen: 
Jean Eaker, Billie Lowrey, Max­
ine Renshaw, Eleanor Orr, Bateye 
Taylor, Sonny Allen and Speedy 
Cranford. Three of these mem­
bers Eleanor, Maxine and Bateye 
—were on the squad last year. 
During a practice session Tuesday 
Eleanor Orr was chosen as head 
cheerleader by her fellow squad 
members.

As soon as the try-outs were 
over and these aforementioned 
seven came out victorious, they 
began their practices in dead ear­
nest. Then all racked their 
brains for new yells, and a few 
were worked up for the first 
game.

Last Friday night at the pep 
rally, the cheerleaders were en­
couraged by the response they re­
ceived. The students put forth a 
real effort to learn the yells, and 
the band members did their part 
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Dance Band Is 
Orfifanized; To 

Choose Singer

At the homecoming dance Octo­
ber 29, Brevard college students 
will get their first glimpse of this 
year’s dance band. Several mem­
bers played for a few shuffles af­
ter the P. J. C. game last Saturday 
night, and from all reports, it 
sounded “good enough.”

Leading the musicians this year 
will be Ravon Smith, a Gastonia 
boy. He is the fellow who makes 
with all that music on his trum­
pet. Other members of the crew 
will include Bill Duckworth, alto 
saxaphone; Max Robinson, bari­
tone saxaphone; Mutt Lowman, 
trombone; Archie Miller, bass; and 
Dick Kelly, drums. The piano 
and tenor sax chairs have not yet 
been filled, and vocalists will be 
chosen in the next few weeks.

According to information fur­
nished by Smith and Miller, a 
favorite from last year’s band, the 
accent this year will be chiefly on 
sweet music; coupled with some 
modern specials by Ravon and Ar­
chie.


