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Cagers sport 3-1 record
by Vicki Blanlccnship

The Fighting Christian 
Cagers had victories over 
Wingate 68-61 and Lenoir- 
Rhyne 69-64 before they fell 
to Catawba in an overtime 
match 55-57.

Lee Allison and Drew 
VanHorn were head coach 
Bill Morningstar’s standouts 
for the first three games, 
averaging 15.7 and 11.3 
points a game.

Elon regained their win­

ning game by defeating UNC- 
G 62-55. Steve Martinelli, Lee 
Allison and Drew VanHom 
combined on offense to give 
Elon their victory over UNC-

G.
The Cagers will travel to 

High Point on Saturday, Dec. 
1 and then to Mars Hill 
Monday, Dec. 3.

Golden girls win
by Yield Blankenship

The Golden Girls’ basket­
ball team has come on strong 
in the beginning of their 
season, winning their firsts 
three ’ games of the year.

Elon students and staff 10% off on 

all merchandise with Elon IJ).

ALAMANCE SPORTING 
GOODS

226-9308 Mon.-Sat. 10-S:30
251 East Front St., Burlington

Coach Mary Jackson is high­
ly pleased with her team’s 
performance.

The first victory was over 
Wingate 85-43. Elon came on 
smoking the nets and never 
weakened. Freshman Nuggie 
Dixon scored 32 points as a 
standout.

Elon hosted the H&R 
Block Women’s Thanksgiv­
ing Tripleheader on Nov. 23 
and 24. Missouri Western, 
East Tennessee State, N.C. 
State, Pfeiffer, A & T 
University and Elon were the 
teams in the event.

The Golden Girls won their 
two games, making their 
overall record 3-0. The two 
victories in the tripleheader 
were over Missouri Western 
96-65 and East Tennessee 
State 63-62.

Tonight the Golden Girls 
will host Wake Forest at 7, 
and Dec. 1 they will travel to 
High Point to play the na­
tionally known Panthers.

Lee AlHaoB goes ap for a shot betweca two Wlagate defeaden
to add two points to his total of 18 points to lielp lead Elon in 
their first game victory. Photo by John Hnrd.

5 football players
Five Elon College football 

players were selected for the 
District 26 team. Tailback 
Bobby Hedrick; offensive 
guard Donovan Brown; de­

fensive tackle Jerry Cook; 
linebacker James Riddle and 
safety Bryan Burney were all 
selected for the district team.

COLLEGE PHARMACY
Mon.-Fri. 9  a.m. - 9  p.m.

W. Haggai^ Ave.j — Elon College 

Beside Winn-Dixie Phone: 584-5883

Good from Nov. 24 to Dec. 5

Sat. 9  aan. - 6 pan.

16 oz. disposable 

Mountain Dew 
Pepsi 

Pepsi Light

suggested retail

35 ‘ each

nt^w 4/$1.00
Decorative 

20 - page

Photo Album

now

$1.99

Schweppes
28-oz. 

Ginger Ale 

Tonic Water 
Club Soda 

suggested retail
53*

Tide
extra action 

laundry detergent. 

7 oz.

regularly

39® each

now 4/$1.00

Campbells
ready-to-serve soup 

easy open 

7 1/4 oz. 

Chicken Noodle 
Tomato

Vegetable and Beef

4/$1.00

Eraser-Mate 
TW 200  

Refillable

suggested retail

* 7.50

now $4.49

Nestle’s 
Souptime

Instant 

Beef Noodle 

Alphabet 

Regularly 2/$1.00

now
4/$1.00

Panty Hose
all nude 

sheer to waist

suggested retail

$ 1.59

now 99

Cigfirettes

everyday discount 

prices 

reg. & kings $3.50 

lOO’s 93.60 carton

All brands 

2-litre botdes:

Coke, Pepsi, Mello 

Yellow, Sunkist, 

and other

9 9 ® everyday 

Discount Price


