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Just a few ques­
tions—what ever happen­
ed to the brand new track 
which was to be completed 
by this fall? What happen­
ed to the senior clock in the 
refectory? What happened 
to painting the interior of 
the refectory? At one time 
wasn’t there a lawn 
mower which cut the grass 
on Babbock Beach? What 
happened to the patio fur­
niture Interdorm was go­
ing to buy for the patio 
behind Clewell? What hap­
pened to the patio? Accor­
ding to the poll taken last 
spring, wasn’t there to be 
an extension of visitation?

Was it really necessary to 
remove the sidewalk bet­
ween Babcock and 
Clewell? Does- anyone 
remember when all 
students could leave their 
dorm rooms unlocked? 
Whatever happened to 
plans for a snack bar? Is 
there really ‘’student life" 
in the student life and 
fitness center? Why do 
these things never 
materialize? Is it the fault 
of the administration? Are 
there covert efforts to 
keep the students unin­
formed? Do the trustees 
have anything to do with 
it? Any answers?_____

Program Waits For 
Approval
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Since early last spring, 
Salem’s Academic Cur­
riculum Committee and 
Academic Council have 
been examining the 
breadth of study and basic 
distribution requirements 
utilized by the college. 
Emphasis has been placed 
on special benefits and op­
portunities for students by 
the committee and coun­
cil.

Members of the 
Academic Curriculum 
Committee include Chair­
man, Dr. Edwards; Julia 
Holford, senior represen­
tative; Carla Littaker, 
junior representative; and 
Lisa Farrier, sophomore 
representative. The

Familiar Faces At 
Pappagallo

The Shop for Pap­
pagallo, a friendly little 
place like home, where 
you can relax, have some 
coffee or tea, enjoy good 
company and find 
marvelous fashions, is 
located at Brookstown 
Mill.

“We want our customers 
to feel at home,” said 
Susan Everette, manager 
of the store. And that is 
most certainly how one 
feels when greeted at the 
door of the colorful shop 
with a friendly smile. You 
might even find one of 
your very own classmates 
working the day you stop 
in. Monica Jordan and

Kim Rowland are both 
employed at Pappagallo.

The shop is like an infor­
mal living room decorated 
in exceedingly good taste, 
with comfortable sofas 
and chairs. It’s filled with 
one-of-a-kind pieces you’d 
expect to find in the home 
of an incurable collector.

Pappagallo is a name 
that has symbolized well- 
mannered fashion excite­
ment for almost two 
decades. Pappagallo shoes 
and fashions are distinc­
tive, up to the minute; yet 
classic. The soft feminine 
shoes, imaginative ap­
parel and colorful ac­
cessories all reflect the

Passing Time At Salem

Academic Council consists 
of Chairman, Dean 
Sullivan; Paula Corbette, 
senior representative; 
Angie Bostrom, junior 
representative; and 
Rachel Pichas, sophomore 
representative.

As a result of the work­
ings of these two commit­
tees new courses in Nutri­
tion, Environmental 
Design, History, and Com­
munications will be of­
fered at Salem.

In a recent interview. 
Academic Dean Patricia 
Sullivan commented that 
both committees were 
working together 
smoothly and experienc­
ing only “healthy

essence of good taste. 
They are made to appeal 
to the active, youthful 
customer—the customer 
who really lives in her 
clothes.

The Shop for Pappagallo 
is an exclusive shop. Most 
of the shops are owned and 
operated by local people 
who have been granted the 
right to the name and 
basic concept of the shop 
and to sell the Pappagallo 
merchandise.

Pappagallo is a shop to 
be found in, and to find 
wonderful things in! Go in 
and browse and have some 
coffee or tea. Don’t 
hesitate, you’re an ex­
pected guest.
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This year’s Fall Fest 

schedule is as follows:

Early Morning: Seniors 
wake underclassmen.

8:45 - Breakfast
10:30 - Entrance in FAC 

parking lot
Noon - Lunch in Salem 

Square
1:45 p.m. - Games on ar­

chery field and in old
gym
6:00 p.m. - Dinner in 

refectory
7:30 p.m. - Class skits in 

Hanes Auditorium.

Hopefully at the party

after the skits, there will 
not be the problem that 
marred the day when 
drunken rivalry took the 
place of the good-natured 
class rivalry. This should
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disagreement.”
Another point emphasiz­

ed by Dean Sullivan was 
the new link established 
between Salem College

and the Old Salem com­
munity. The Academic 
Curriculum Committee 
has proposed a major ar­
cheological dig in Old

Salem. If approved, the 
program will include 
students in both beginning 
and advanced archeology 
and anthropology courses. 
This new program will 
provide interesting oppor­
tunities for Salem students 
who have never had the oc­
casion to participate in an 
Old Salem excavation.

Aromib Square
Sept. 29 “Summer Coliseum)
Wages” (West End Opera
House) Oct. 12 “Iron Maiden”

The Fabulous (Greensboro Coliseum)
Knobs’’ (Baity’s Oct. 13 N.C. Dance
Backstreet) Theater (Stevens Center)
Sept. 30 “The Fabulous 
Knobs’’ (Baity’s
Backstreet)

Oct. 2 W-S Symphony 
Concert (Stevens Center)

Oct. 4 W-S Symphony 
Concert (Stevens Center)

Oct. 7 Rick James 
(Greensboro Coliseum)

Oct. 8 NCSA Orchestra 
(Stevens Center)

Oct. 11 Greensboro 
Symphony (Greensboro

Oct. 14 A1 Jarreau 
(Greensboro Coliseum)

North Carolina 
Dance Theater (Stevens 
Center)

NCSA, Stage 
Drama II (Stevens 
Center)

“Evita ” 
(Greensboro Coliseum)
Oct. 15 “Evita’’ 
(Greensboro Coliseum)

N.C. Dance 
Theater (Stevens Center) 

NCSA, Stage 
Drama II (Stevens 
Center)

be a time of unity, so when 
the party starts, 
remember who your 
friends are. Above all, 
please don’t drive if you 
have been drinking!
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