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Or. Rogpr Fonts speaks to participants in the Carolinas 
I’sycholofty Conference held at Meredith April 14 and 15. Keeping 
(he audience entertained with amusing anecdotes. Dr. Fonts 
spoke of his work in the field of animai communications. The 
<-onference which included a variety of films as well as many 
undergraduate paper presentations, was highly successful.

Faculty feuds
hv .lac(|ue Lawrence

On Thursday, April 13, 
1978. at 8:00 p.m. Phi Alpha 
Theta presented a Faculty 
h'eud. Six members of the 
faculty matched wits com­
petitively Team A (Tom 
Parramore. Robert Hehvig, 
Allen Page) defeated Team R 
(Frank Grubbs, Evelyn 
Simmons. .John Holt) with a 
score of 170-12.5.

Most of the questions in 
rounds one and two were on 
history. Since the teams were 
allowed to confer on answers, 
the expertise of the history 
professors helped keep the 
scores tied. It was not until 
late in the second round that 
the tie was broken.

In the third round the 
faculty wagered points on a 
three part question con­
cerning the columns in front of 
.Johnson Hall. Interestingly 
enough, neither team an­
swered correctly. (Did you 
know that the six columns in 
front of .Johnson Hall are 
Corinthian and the carved 
figures are owls?)

The knowledge of the 
faculty was impressive. They 
seemed to have little difficulty 
with fpiestions designed 
('specially to catch them 
unaware. The audience was 
amazed at not only their quick 
wit hut at their sharp crit- 
ticisms as well.

4lumua ivius award
Miss Nancy Martin/i .June 

graduate of Meredith and a 
history majopwon the Lillian 
Park('r Wallace Award for 
(•('search by the Wake County 
Phi Rota Kappa Society. 
Nancy w rote her paper on the 
P('arsall Plan, a controversial 
plan adopted by the General 
Assemtdy in 195(i following the 
t'S Supreme Court's 
(l('S('greg.(tion (U'cision.

Nanev is the fifth

M('redith history major to win 
this award in the last seven 
vears. The award is based on 
original research and good 
writing. North Carolina Slate 
l'niv('rsily history majors 
have won two of the awards.

All of the Meredith papers 
which have won were (lone in 
the junior history research 
course required of all history 
,\nd (wlitical science majors.

Two English instructors
receive Danforth honors

by Vicki .layne
Mrs. Retty Rrewer, of the 

English department has been 
awarded a Danforth post­
baccalaureate scholarship. 
She is the first Meredith 
professor to receive this 
honor, Mrs. Rrewer was one of 
100 scholars awarded this 
fellowship in the country. 
Approximately 2745 scholars 
applied for this fellowship.

Danforth fellowships are 
awarded to applicants who 
display “evidence of 
academic accomplishment 
and intellectual ability," 
“evidence of personal 
character which is likely to

.Sillly 1*21 ^4'
Dr. Sally Page has 

recently been appointed to the 
National Advisory Council of 
the associates program for the 
Danforth Foundation. Ap­
pointed by Gene Schwilck. 
president of the Danforth 
.Associates, Dr. Page will 
seiw'ea three-year term on thc- 
council.

The major work that will 
concern Dr. Page and her 
fellow council members will 
be the choosing of new people 
who will become Danforth

contribute to effective 
teaching and to constructive 
relationships with students 
and future professional 
collegues," and “evidence of 
concern for the relation of 
ethical and moral value to 
subject matter discipline, the 
educational processes, and to 
the institutes of society." The 
purpose of the fellowship is to 
develop college professors.

Mrs; Rrewer was notified 
in .January 1978 that she was 
one of 562 finalists. One 
hundred fellowships are given 
per year; this year 44 were 
award('d post-baccalaureate, 
56 baccalaureate.

The application. ac­
cording to Mrs. Rrewer. t(M»k 
about 80 hours to complete. 
Among the requirements, she 
was asked to submit ('ssays on 
her personal life and her 
teaching methods. .She feels 
that one ('ssay. entitled. 
“What has niade you the kind 
of person you are today,” was 
“difficult but interesting” and 
helped her to assess “where 
she is in her life" and “what is 
valuable in life to her."

The Danforth scholarship 
covers institutional ('xperrses 
and provides (\ stipend on tlu' 
basis of need.

Associates. Matters of policy 
and perhaps some respon 
sibility for the Associates 
conference held every two 
years are other matters that 
the council deals with. The 
other members of the council 
come from such institutions as 
the I'niversity of California 
Atlanta I'niversity. and the 
San .Jose State University.

Dr. Page has been a 
member of the Danforth 
Associates program since 
about 1970. The purpose of the 
program is to “recognize and

support college teachers who 
are concerned about per­
sonalizing or humanizing Iht' 
('(Ideation proc('ss." In 1977 
Dr Pag(' ehair('d the 
Carolina's Associates con 
ference s])onsored ev('ry Iwe 
years by (he Danforth 
Foundation,

other Danforth 
Associates on the Meredith 
campus are Dr Rernard 
Cochran. Dr Hog('r Crook 
Mrs Phyllis Garriss and Dr 
.Allen P.age.

Meredith hosts music festival
hv Mary Creech 

“How can I keep from 
singing” certainly descrilx's 
the feeling of the four 
women's choruses that par­
ticipated in the special choral 
festival called Coniinentaries 
held Sunday afternoon on 
Meredith's campus. And it is 
no wonder that they could not 
keep from singing when their 
director for the festival was 
the eminent American 
composer and conductor Alice 
Parker. With her musical 
genius. Miss Parker com 
posed Comnu'ntaries at 
Meredith's request. Com- 
in('ntari('s is in the form of a

musical passion which 
requires two separate 
choruses. Chorus .A, sung by 
the Meredith Chorale, consists 
of five dissonant melodies 
with poems by Emily 
Dickinson as text. Chorus 1’. 
sung by the Meredith 
Renaissance Singers. Rrenan 
College Women's Concert 
Choir. and Mississippi 
University for Women Con­
cert Choir. contains
traditional American tunes 
with text responding In 
Dickinson's poems. As Miss 
Parker intended that an or­
chestra accompany her 
choruses. Meredith was

('specially honored to have Hk' 
North Carolina Little Sym 
phony provide brilliant ac 
companiment. As an added 
highlight to the festival, the 
symphony preceded Miss 
Parker's passion by per 
forming musical work-- 
written by women.

The response to the 
p('rformance was full (<f 
feeling; the appreciation and 
admiration of the audience 
was gladly display('d by en 
dless applause, f’erforming 
soloists were Charlene 
Holland and Lynda Hallman 
Coordinator of the festival 
was Mrs, .lane W .Sullivan

Faculty, students represent 
Meredith to Monroe churches

l>\ Nancy N('wton 
Thirteen students and 10 

members of the Meredith 
faculty and administration 
represented Meredith at 
Raplist churches in Monroe. 
N.C. on April 2. Students at­
tending were. Linda Allgood. 
.Ann Duke, Diane Flowers. 
Ginger Gay. Wanda Hen 
derson. Kathy Hill, Amy 
Mendenhall, .Julia Nipper. 
.Janice Odom, Kathy Pittman, 
Tammy Summers. Carmen 
Warren, and Alix Wilcox. 
They were accompanied by 
President .John Weems, Dr. 
Alan Rurris. Mr. Eugene

Somner, Mr. .John Holt. Dr 
Royster Hedgepeth. Mr. 
Larry Williains. Mr. Craig 
Gr(H'ne. Mr. Rill Tatum. Mrs. 
.liuie Sparks Tatum, and Mrs. 
Alice Goode.

The w('ek('iid visitation 
look place April 1-2. While 
there, the Meredith group 
visited with churches of the 
A.ssociation sharing interests 
and concerns of the college.

Kathy Pittman, a junior, 
said of the weekend. “It was 
great! We shared with each 
other and with the churches 
w hat Meredith meant In us,"

S('uinr .Alix Wilcox ('xpressed 
similar \ i('ws saying “K was 
a good ('xpcrience to spi'ak 
Ix'lore the church('S but more 
than that to cryslalize m\ 
fo('lings .(bout Mer('dilh so 
that I could ('xpress them "

Each year, M('r('dilh ends 
student, faculty, (uid staff 
representatives (o different 
.Associations and ;(r('as w ithin 
(he state as a tiK'ans of 
outrt'aeh for the l•oll('ge. It 
provides Raplist chance to 
k((ow about Mer('dilh fir 
sthand


