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At Seen in TKe Mirror's

SPORTS
MIRROR
MORSELS

^ 1 * Coarse kindness is, at least,
W r off Athlofot better than coarse anger; and in

1 ■■■■ .1 all private quarrels the duller
• ^ BVOnit nature is triumphant by reason

North Carolina’s proud Tar 
Heels and the New Bern High 
school Bears had something in 
common last weekend, ^th 
were leveled by air attacks.
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Each Club came back in the 
second half, but it wasn’t 
enough.

Tulane’s victory over UNC 
has to be classified as an upset, 
but certainly no fluke. 
Jacksonville’s win against the 
Bruins was less startling.

North Carolina, without Ike 
Oglesby available, is like a boat 
dragging anchor. Its distress 
signal, largely ignored at the 
time, was hoisted the previous 
Saturday, when cramps bench­
ed Ike in the second half 
against spunky N. C. State.

What the Green Wave did to 
the Tar Heels, Notre Dame will 
no doubt attempt tomorrow. 
Unless North Carolina can 
mount an effective pass rush.
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Distinctive styling 
—unusual, rich­

looking fabrics— 
both are featured 

In Levi’s new 
Scarborough 

Flares. Styling 
details include large 

belt loops, flapped 
back pockets, full 

flared leg. Fine 
fabrics In 

great patterns 
and colors.
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Coarse kindness is, at least, 
better than coarse anger; and In 
all private quarrels the duller 
nature is triumphant by reason 
of its dullness.—George Eliot.

Take care to be an economist 
in prosperity; there is no fear of 
your being one in adversity.— 
Zinunerman.

A good man’s prayers will 
from the deepest dungeon climb 
heaven’s height, and bring a 
blessing down.—Joanna BaiUie.

Temptation rarely comes in 
working hours. It is in their 
leisure time that men are made 
or marred.—W. M. Taylor.

missing agauist Tulane, the 
Fighting Irish should win by 
plenty.

Happiest member of the 
Clemson Tigers, deprived of 
victory until Duke was blanked 
3-0 in Norfolk’s Oyster Bowl, 
had to be New Bern’s Jeff 
Stocks. Only a sophomore, the 
starting defensive end was 
ignored by Duke and other Big 
Four schools when grants in aid 
were handed out.

Down in Clemson’s Death 
Valiey, they sensed that Stocks 
was a good blue-chip buy. He 
isn’t the biggest guy in the 
world, but his indomitable 
spirit, they figured rightly, 
would count more than pound­
age.

N. C. State, undoubtedly a 
better team than its showing in 
earlier games indicated, may 
have been taken too lightly by 
the Demon Deacons of Wake 
Forest. Hiere rauld be further 
giant killing by the aroused 
Wolf pack.

No one should ever be 
astounded when upsets occur in 
the Atlantic Coast Conference. 
Within the Big Four family, 
history verifies that won and 
lost records are meaningless 
when emotion produces 
moments of greatness.

Sports writers, groping for 
colorful phrases, like to speak of 
inspired play. In the Big Four, if 
nowhere else, inspiration is a 
many splendored thing.
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The difference between 
failure and success is doing a 
thing nearly right and doing it 
exactly right.—Edward C. 
Sinunons.

MUG SHOT . . . This ii a 
doseup view of Apollo 15 lu­
nar sample No. 15415 at the 
Manned Spacecraft Center. 
This sample Is the white anor- 
thosltic rock (“Genesis rock”) 
collected by Astronauts David 
R. Scott and James Iriwln on 
the mission’s second extrave­
hicular activity.

If a man has a right to be 
proud of anything, it is of a good 
action done as it ought to be, 
without any base interest 
lurking at the bottom of it.— 
Sterne.

Great opportunities come to 
all, but many do not know they 
have met them. The only 
preparation to take advantage 
of them is simple fidelity to 
what each day brings.

A reserved man is in con­
tinual conflict with the social 
part of his nature, and even 
grimes himself the laugh into 
which he is sometimesi 
betrayed.—Shenstone.

Everything which I have 
created as a poet has had its 
origin in a frame of mind and a 
situation in life; I never wrote 
because I had, as they say, 
found a good subject.—Henrik 
Ibsen.

They who disbelieve in virtue 
because man has never been 
found perfect, might as 
reasonably deny the sun 
because it is not always noon.— 
Hare.

More hearts pine away in 
secret anguish for unkinchiess 
from those who should be their 
comforters, than for any other 
calamity in life.—Young.

Leland Mason

LIFE INSURANCE 
SPECIALIST

1614 Trent Blvd. 
New Bern 

Telephone 637-2223

Eubanks
Refrigeration

Service
•

413 Tryon Palace Drive 
DIAL ME 7-2571

M Ceramic Tile 
i Quarry Porches 
R Marble Fireplaces 
» Rubber & Asphalt 

Tile

G. H. BRYAN
Til* Contractor 

ME 7-5418

Butteric & Simplicity 
Patterns and .ail 

types of notions and 
Dress & Suit 

<iAaterial.

THRIFTY 
FABRIC SHOP

Kinston Highway 
Dial 637-6565

PIANOS
TRY BEFORE YOU BUY

$10.00 a Month Rents 
a New Wurlltzer Piano.

Ront Appiloa to Purchaso 
If You Buy.

FULLER’S
MUSIC HOUSE
2I6V3 Middle Street 

Now Bern, N. C.

FRY BONDED BUILT-UP

ROOFING
-Call For Free Estimates—

R. E. BENGEL
1311 N. Craven S. Dial ME 7-3404

When You're Pleasure Bent, 
On the Neuse and Trent,

A BOAT YOU BUY AT

KIMBRELL’S
WILL BE MONEY WELL SPENT


