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Devotional Thoughts
Divine Partnership

Jobe 5:17—My Father worketh 
hitherto, and I work.

Jesus knew a relationship with 
God that was personal and power­
ful. His life was joined with the 
purposes of His Father in a Di­
vine Partnership. And He in­
vites us to share in that Partner­
ship.

For His part in this Divine Part­
nership God has given us material 
resources that are limitless in ex­
tent and value, amazing mental 
powers to make use of these re­
sources, and a spiritual nature de­
signed to keep us aware of and in 
touch with the Eternal Source of 
all.

For our part in this Partnership 
God desires two responses. In 
the first place. He expects us to 
be something. That is. He wants 
our lives to reflect something of 
the “image of God” with which He 
has endowed us. He has a right 
to expect us “to do justly, to love 
mercy, and to walk humbly with 
our God.”

And He expects us to do some­
thing. We are given hands and 
minds and will to be used to make 
a productive contribution to the 
welfare of mankind. The nature 
of the job itself is not so important 
—our attitude towards it makes a 
significant difference. God would 
have each of us feel we are work­
ing with Him as we engage in 
whatever location we have chosen.

Divine Partnership! “My Fath­
er worketh hitherto, and I work.”

Rev. Robert W. Bradshaw, 
Pastor, First Methodist 
Church, Wilson, N. C.

births
Mr. and Mrs. James A. Starling 

(Finishing) announce the birth of 
an eight pound daughter, Lynda 
Ruth, born July 6, 1950

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Langley 
(Wilson Division) announce the 
birth of an eight pound daughter, 
Deborah Jane, born July 8, 1950. 
Mrs. Langley was Miss Dorothy 
Whitley of Rocky Mount.

Weddings
Miss Catherine Moore, daugh­

ter of Mrs. Wiley Moore and the 
late Mr. Moore of Norfolk, Vir­
ginia, and Romeo Cooper, son of 
Mrs. E. E. Cooper and the late 
Mr. Cooper of Rocky Mount, were 
united in marriage July 5, 1950 
in Nashville, N. C., by the Rever­
end C. A. Francis at the First Bap­
tist parsonage.

The couple are residing at 116 
Atlantic Avenue.

personals
We are sorry to report that Ed­

die Wright Denton broke his arm 
in a fall from the bed recently and 
was confined at the hospital.

Ray Bass, who has been out sick 
for several weeks is now well and 
back at work.

Mrs. Roberta Brunson Hata- 
way (Office) is sporting a new 
Ford.

Mrs. Mildred Poston’s (Wilson 
Division) husband, LeRoy, has 
been removed to his home after 
an illness at the hospital.

Sam Langley is quite elated over 
the birth of his daughter. Mrs. 
Dickerson said as she was walking 
down the street the other day she 
ran into Sam. He was singing at 
the top of his voice and with all 
his might, “Hark! T’is the voice of 
joyful sound. I got a girl and she 
weighs 8 pounds!!

PATRICK HENRY said, in 1755: 
“Is life so dear, or peace so sweet 
as to be purchased at the price of 
chains and slavery — as for me, 
give me liberty or give me death! ”

THOMAS JEFFERSON said, in 
1801: “Agriculture, manufactur­
ers, commerce and navigation, the 
four pillars of our prosperity, are 
the most thriving when left most 
free to individual enterprise.”

Warping Dept
Vacations

Herman Ezzelle spent a few days 
at Ocean View. ,

Mrs. Nellie Baker and her hus­
band, Julian (Finishing) visited 
the Lost Colony at Manteo, and 
later went to White Lake.

Mrs. Mandy Coats spent some 
time in the Smoky Mountains.

Mr. and Mrs. Will Young, and 
grandson. Berry, spent a few days 
at Ocean View.

Mrs. Kathleen Baxley, her 
daughter, Jackie, and some friends 
went to Savannah, Ga., and Flori­
da.

Mrs. Deanie Stancil visited 
friends and relatives in Scotland 
Neck.

Luther Cuddington went fishing 
at Minnisott Beach while his son, 
Charles stayed with his aunt m 
Reidsville, West Virginia.

Aubrey Frye and his family 
stayed at home and rested.

Herman Allen spent a quiet va­
cation at home.

Mrs. Janie Alexander, her hus­
band, Leslie, (Weaving) and their 
children, Pat and Betsy Jane, 
spent a week at Pamlico Beach, 
fishing and swimming.

Ira Thompson visited in Fay­
etteville.

Shipping News
Vacations

Mrs. Josephine Best visited her 
mother in Whitakers for a few 
days.

Miss Ruth Leavitt spent some 
time at Ocean View and Virginia 
Beach.

Miss Jane Coley stayed at home 
to enjoy a good rest.

Mrs. Jean Hodges visited her 
brother, Charles, who is a Life 
Guard at Nags Head.

Mrs. June Shearin spent a week 
in the mountains of North Caro­
lina, and a week at home enter­
taining her young son, Hugh 
Gaither Shearin, Jr.

Julian Whitehurst took his wife 
and daughter, Peggy, on a two 
week’s motor trip to New York 
City. While there they visited the

Pictured above is Brenda Gail 
Rowe, the nine months old 
daughter of Flyod Rowe 
(Mending) and Mrs. Dora 
Rowe, former employee.

Little Miss Judy K. Hamm, 
nineteen months old daughter 
of James Hamm (Wilson Divi­
sion) was photographed among 
the seagrass at Carolina Beach 
while they were there on vaca­
tion.

One Park Avenue Office and en­
joyed meeting a number of peo­
ple. They also attended several 
Broadway shows.

Mrs. Audrey Sowers vacation­
ed at Nags Head for a week.

Morris Williams took his family 
on a trip along the Skyline Drive 
by way of Richmond and points 
north for a few days.

Oliver Parker spent a couple of 
days fishing; but he did not have 
very good luck.

Charlie Warren and his family 
traveled around visiting their rela­
tives.

Cleveland Walker took his fami­
ly on a trip to the mountains in 
western North Carolina, and came 
back to spend ^ few days at the 
beach.


