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S£ ADVENTUROUS—Try two or more recipes of
giving. Bake one in the turkey body cavity and one in theVVopening.
Another could be done in a casserole for a wide choice.

The Herald Kitchen
By MILDRED HUSKINS
Every traditional Thanks-

giving dinner features cer-
tain foods turkey, stuff-
ing, mashed potatoes, gravy
and cranberries. *

What you add depends
(<n where you. live.

We, here in the South,
swear by our own yams,
while Yankees turned to
mashed rutabaga or cream-
ed onions. Pumpkin or
mince pie are preferred by

¦•Northerners, while cousins
in warmer climes rally to
ambrosia.

Even the stuffing tradi-
tionally served depends
largely on whether mother
grew up with the corn
bread and Sausage variety,
Pennsylvania Dutch potato
filling, or old fashioned
herb seasoned bread cube
dressing.

This year, be adventur-
ous! Serve your family
the stuffing to which they
are accustomed arid a sec-
ond variety baked along.
It’s easy when you start
with packaged mixes. Herb
seasoned dressing may be
baked in the body cavity
of your turkey. For a
change in color and tex-
ture, tuck corn bread
stuffing into the neck
opening. Place emphasis
on color and try the more
colorful cranberry -pecan-

mushroom kind. You nev-
er know. It may be next
year’s favorite!

Holiday Stuffing
1 pkg. cube stuffing.
1 cup chopped onions.
1 cup sliced mushrooms,

cup chopped pecans.
Ml cup buttdr.
1 cup cranberries, cut in

half.
3 tablespoons sugar.
Me cup chopped parsley.
Prepare stuffing accord-

ing to package directions.
Meanwhile saute onions,
mushrooms and pecans in
butter five minutes. Com-
bine cranberries and sugar.
Add all ingredients to
stuffing, stirring only to

blend. Place in a one and
one-half quart casserole
and bake, covered last 30
minutes of roasting time.
Makes six servings.

If you make your dress-
ing or stuffing from scratch
try this moist Apple Bread
Stuffing in casserole. The
flavor is delightful.

Apple Bread Stuffing
0 cups toasted bread

cubes.
2 cups sliced apples.
Vi cup onion flakes.
'U cup celery flakes.
Va cup butter, melted.
2 teaspoons poultry sea-

soning.
1% teaspoons salt.

-

1 teaspoon parsley flakes.

% to 1 cup stock or
water.

1 tablespoon butter.
Combine bread cubes and

apples in large mixing
bowl. Mix onion and cel-
ery flakes with \ cup wa-
ter; let stand five minutea.
Saute in pne-fourth cup
melted butter five min-
utes. Add to bread apple
mixture with remaining in-
gredients. Mix well. Place
in buttered two-quart bak-
ing dish. Dot with butter.
Bake covered in 375-degree
oven for 30 minutea.

This Baked Yarn Pud-
ding would be a great ad-
dition to the holiday fes-
tive board.

Baked Yana Pudding
2 cups raw yams.
2/3 cup maple syrup.
2 eggs, beaten.
2 tablespoons butter or

margarine.
teaspoons ground

ginger.
lMt teaspoons baking

powder.
1 teaspoon grated lemon

peel.
Vi teaspoon ground nut-

meg.
Va teaspoon skit.
Combine all ingredients

and mix well. Turn into
buttered one-quart casser-
ole. Bake in 350-degree
oven for 50 minutes or un-
til firm in center and
browned on top. Serve hot
or cold, topped with whip-
ped cream, if desired.!
Serves six.

The accompaniment should
be as attractive as the tur-
key. Pumpkin, spice and
everything nice to go into
these sweet potato bells to
be served with a beauti-
fully browned bird.

3 medium-sized sweet po-
tatoes, cooked and peeled.

1 cup pumpkin.
% teaspoon salt
Vt teaspoon cinnamon.
Va teaspoon nutmeg.
H teaspoon ginger.
Va cup milk.
Chopped nuts.
Cut sweet potatoes tn

quarters. Piece in mixing
bowl Add pumpkin, spices
and milk. Blend thorough-
ly until thick, smooth con-
sistency. Using one-half

tu£, P 'shape into round
bells. Roll in nuts
to cost evenly. Piece on
taking sheet beet in Mg-

Sound Advice

Mn 4
Never killa fly with

[/ *j\ gun, and never use drags '

left ever from a Sbrious
illness for self-treatment ofa similar ailment In
die first case, you’ll blow your kitchen ceiling to

smithereens along with the fly. In the second case
—you get the point You see, modern drags are
highly potent—that’s why we dispense them only

seif with leftovers, you may do serious damegs.

It’s a good idea to pour the remains of old pre.
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Center
t In Area
counselling.

The Alcoholic Center is
advised by a board of di-
rectors appointed by the
board of county commis-
sioners in the participating
counties. Chowan mem-
bers are Ernest Kehayw
and Raye Adams and they
are particularly to be com-
mended for the interest
they have shown and their

"attendance at meetings.
The staff of the center

is composed of lire. Pugh,
director; R. E. Rhodes, as-
sociate director, and Mrs.
Helen J. McPherson, secre-
tary.

As of October 1, we
were extremely fortunate
in securing the pert time
services of a family Ufa
consultant, Mrs. Letitia
Evans. Mrs. Evans will
work in family counselling
and community education
in Chowan County on
Thursdays and also may he
leached by calling the
Health Department in
Edenton, 483-2911.

Mrs. Pugh and Rhodes
visit Chowan County every
Wednesday morning end
may be reached by celling
the Health Department in
Edenton or by calling the
center office in Elizabeth
City, 335-1663.

Please feel free to call at
the center office or your
Health Department, 48J-
-2511, for any additional
Information or how we
may best serve you.

Alcoholism
Functioning

9f mat l won
July 1, IM7, marked the

opening of the Alcoholism
Center for Information and
Service in our community.
The headquarters are in
the Medical Building in
Elizabeth City but in Cho-
wan County the Health
Department in Edenton
acts as a . telephone and re*.-
ferral station and keeps a
supply of literature.

Some of the aims of the
center are (!) provide ef-
fective alcohol education
for young people (through
workshops, schools, speak-
ers’ bureau, stc.) One
ministers* workshop has
already bean held which
included a specihl invita-
tion to Chowan ministers.
(2) Up to date information
for all: literature, films,
talks, etc., in order to in-
crease the public’s under-
standing of alcoholism, its
nature and treatment and
promotion of the principle
that alcoholics can be help-
ed. The center staff are
available as speakers
whenever tmuTcmn be ar-
ranged. (S)To give ser-
vice to the alcoholic-tie in
with physician, AA, hospi-
tals, clergy, group therapy
and rehabilitation along
with the individual coun-
selling. (4) To give ser-
vice to the aleoholic’a fam-
ily through referral to ap-
propriate agency, indivi-
dual counselling and group

Mcrifts’ Program Topic
The Garden of Eden

Club had its monthly meet-
ing at the home of Mrs.
Gertrude Rosevear. Five
new members were wel-
comed at this time; Mrs.
Pay Bindeman, Mrs. Deb-
orah Cameron, Mrs. Deanna
Dameil, Mrs. Betsy Tysor
and Mrs. Letitia Evans.

Mrs. Jane Weikel pre-
sented Mrs. Emily Harrell,
and Mrs. John Lane of
Hertford, who presented a
delightful program on
handicrafts.

President Snooky Bond
reported on the district
garden club meeting in
Elizabeth City. The Gar-
den of Eden Club won
third place on Club Book
design. Club members
were pleased, as the club is
so new and were compet-
ing with 33 other clubs.

Mrs. Frances Inglls, chair-
men of Christmas decora-
tions for the Cupola House,
announced that workshops
have begun for authentic
l*th Century Christmas
decorations for the Cupola
House, Club members have
been researching and plan-
ning for this exciting event.

The Cupola House Asso-
ciation and the Garden of
Eden Club are jointly
working together to make
the authentic Christmas

decorations a real asset to
our historic heritage during
the holiday season.

Going hunting? Wear
lightweight but wjarnt

clothing, the North Caro-
lina Heart Association says.

Mast people can hunt
even if they have a heart
condition, the North Caro-
lina Heart Association
says, but see your dbetor
first and be sure.
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Herald Society News
Mr. and Mrs. Bert

Hughes will spend the
Thanksgiving holidays in
West Virginia visiting her
family.

e
Mr. and Mrs. Preston

Rogeroen visited Mrs. Olive
C. Goodwin, who is g pa-
tient W Mnrfoik General
Hospital, Sunday

i> Mr. and Mrs. Lyn Bond,
Jr, es Charlotte will spend
the Thanksgiving holidays
With Mrs. Lya-Rend.

.¦ —1
Joe Conger, HI, a stu-

dent at UNO, will spend
the Thanksgiving holidays
With hie parents, Mr. and
Mm. Joe Conger, Jr.

Rob Oglesby from Dallas,
willbe visiting his

brother. Jimmy Oglesby,
for Thanksgiving through
We ¦ - - —a. . . na
ffQfWHWM t

Mr. and Mrs. Jackie
Ot«ro of Florid* are spend-
ing several dayes with his
sister and brother-in-law,
Mr. and Mrs. Heah Good-
win.

Mr. and Mrs. Calvin
Hotter of Elizabeth City
spent Sunday with Mr, end
Mr*. Junes Hughes.

Mr. and Mrs. Calvin
Harrell spent the weekend
kt Columbia visiting his
parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Luther Harrell.

Rr. and W M. R.
Weyden of Sarasota, F)a,
are apendlng several days
with Mr. and Mrs. David
Goodwin and Mrs. Henry
C. Ooodwin.

Martin Zimmerman of
Roeky Mount spent the
weekend as guest of his
mother, Mrs. J. Edwin
Bufflap and Mr. Buffiap.

Mr. and Mrs. Marion L.
Mocely and family are
spending the Thanksgiving
holidays in Charleston,
& C, with Mr. and Mrs.
William E. Mosely, Sr., and
in Moneks Comer, S. C,
with Mm. Idell Canady.

Larry J- Williams has
returned from e three-day
Goodyear conference in
Richmond, Va.

*
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Hatch and Michael are
spending Thanksgiving with
Mrs. John Jinnette and Mr.
and Mrs. John Hatch in
Goldsboro.

Jimmy Dell of Raleigh
spent the weekend with his
parents, Mr. pnd Mrs. Per-
cy Dail, Sr.

Mr. and Mrs. Hector
Lupin, Jr, and son Risky
and daughter Patty of Ra-
leigh arrived Wtdneedy to
spend tRe ThapksgHdng
holidays wUk Ms parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Master Imp-
ton, Sr,

_

Mrs. Irma ARahrook is •
spending this mask hi
Richmond as gusst el her
mother.

•MMw^Rumeswy

Mrs. Rdwtrd Zimmerman
and daughter, Jeanne, es
l.onden, Ragland, arrived
Wed nee day te spend mw
time wttk Mr. end Meg. J
Edwin Bufflap.

Mr. and* Mis. Julian
Jethro end family es Parts-
mouth, Va, span! luaiey
with his parents, Mr, and
Mrs. Dallas Jethro, flr. .

Mrs. fTtt EUiett and ’
Mrs Milton Tynsh appnt
Pi-May night at Virginia
Beach, Va, visiting Mr.
and Mrs. James Rpentas.

Mr., and Mrs. Prank Pu-
lusnho had as their guests

over the weekend his uar«
ents from Alexander, Va,

Dr. W. I. Kart returned
from Coral Gablet, Fla, on
Friday.

Mr aml Mrs. O. L. Jeth-
ro, Jr, and family Spent
Sunday in Clayton.

Vets Comer
Q. I have just received

my dividend check on my
National Service life In-
surance policy. This sur-
prised me because t have
not paid premiums on this
policy for the pest nine
months because a waiver
of premiums has been in
force. This waiver was
granted because I am con-
sidered to be totally dis-
abled and unemployable.
Has a mistake been made?
Will I have to refund the
dividend?

A. No. The payment of
this dividend to you is
proper. Dividends on par--;
ticipating government life
insurance policies are pay*
able even though the pol-
icy is on a waiver of pre-
miums.

Mr. and Mrs. Dewey
Mills and family are
spending several days with
Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Mills
in Wilmington and with
Nr. and Mrs. Obbie Long
in Ash, N. C.

Guests for Thanksgiving
in the home of Mr. and
Mm. Alfred Guay are Mr.
and Mm. John Guay and
Lydia of Austin, Texas and
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Shan-
osky of West Roxbury,
Mass.

Saturday guests in the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Leo
LaVoie and Mrs. -W. H.
White were Mr. and Mrs.
David Scott from Alexan-
dria, Va, and Mrs. David
Hughes of Elizabeth City.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry J.
Williams and family are
spending Thanksgiving
with Mr. and Mrs. W.
Shirley Williams in Chesa-
peake, Va.

Mr. and Mrs. David
White and Mrs. Judy Wey-
mer of Norfolk and Mrs.
D. L. Stewart, Mark and
Paul of Cherry Point were
Sunday guests in the home
of Mm. W. H. White and
Mr. and Mrs. Leo LaVoie.

Mr. and Mrs. Herman
Layden, Steve, Scott and
Stanley of Virginia Beach
are visiting with Mr. and
Mm. Albert Gray.

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford

Overman and children of
Roanoke, Va., will spend
the Thanksgiving holidays
with their parents, Mr. and

Mm. R. F. Elliott and Mr.
and Mrs. C. W. Overman.

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. P.

Earnhardt, Jr, will spend
Thanksgiving in Wilming-
ton visiting her parents.

Scott Harrell, Earl Brit-
ton, Bill Boyce, Bob
Brooks and Oscar White

attended the Baltimore
Colts-Detroit Lions football
game in Baltimore, Md., on

Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry

Holmes and daughter vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Zackie
Harrell in Windsor on

*

Ward of Rich Square vis-
ited their daughter and
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs.

Jack Parker, on Sunday.

The Betty Shoppe
AFTER

VhBiIiSSMIN
REDUCTIONS
Begins Fri. At9 A.M.
Reductions on SPECIAL Groups of

EARLY Fall Merchandise
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w Suits
Hat*

¦ *Coats & Dresses
? Sweeten To Match

Fur Trihuned Coats Values to $99.00

NOW ONLY $79.00

spot tAMLrrot war uutcnosst
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The Betty Shoppe
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