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Lunch Room Menus At Local Schools
Menus at Chowan Coun-

ty school lunch roams for
December 9-13 will be as
follows:

John A. Hofanes High

Monday Tuna salad,

French fries, ketchup,
green peas, orange juice,
com bread, butter, pine-
apple upside down cake,
milk.

Tuesday—Meat loaf with
gravy, creamed potatoes,
green beans, rolls, butter,
jello, milk.

Wednesday Sandwich
.meat, sliced cheese, mus-
tard and mayonnaise, po-
tato chips, turnip greens,

bread, pineapple cake,
milk.

Thursday Country
style steak with gravy,
buttered potato, com, rolls,
butter, apricots, milk.

Friday Beef-vegetable
soup, hot dog, peanut but-
ter and jelly sandwich, or-
ange juice, bread, choco-
late cake, milk.

Ernest A. Swain
DamwUary School

Monday—Fish sticks, cole
slaw, French fries, catsup,
macaroni and cheese, com
bread, butter, peadh pie,
milk.

Tuesday— Meat loaf,
gravy, steamed rice, tur-
nip greens, biscuits, butter,
apple sauce, milk.

Wednesday Weiners,
carrot and cabbage salad,
baked beans, school baked
rolls, butter, chocolate pud.
ding, milk.

Thursday Beef vege-
table soup, crackers, toast-
ed cheese sandwiches, pine-
apple upside down cake,
milk.

Friday Turkey salad,
garden peas, potato chips,
school baked rolls, butter,
grapefruit sections, milk.

D. F. Walker High School

Monday—Weiners, cheese
cube, slaw, green limas,
roll and butter, fruit cups,
cookie, milk.

Tuesday—Fried chicken,

mashed potatoes, green
peas, rolls and butter, or-
ange half, milk.

Wednesday—Hamburger
on bun, mixed vegetables,
steamed cabbage, peach
cups, cake square, milk.

Thursday Ham salad,
sweet potata puff, cut
beans, roll and butter, milk.

Friday Fish, turnip

greens, Mexican com, ap-
ple cobbler, com bread
square, milk.

Chowan High School

Monday—Franks, pimen-
to cheese, beef and vege-

table soup, strawberry
shortcake, bread and crack,
ers, milk.

Tuesday— Pizza with
hamburger and cheese,
tossed salad, potato chips,
tomato wedges, fruit cup,

crackers and butter, milk.
Wednesday—Baked ham,

potato salad, turnip greens,

beet pickles, block cake,
rolls and butter, milk.

Thursday Chicken pan

Misunderstanding

On S. S. Reports
Although most employ-

ers know how to report
wages for social security,

some are still not sure of
the special rules that ap-

ply to domestic workers.
A worker must show his

social security card to his
employer when he or she
starts to work. The em-
ployer reports the name,
the number and wages to
Internal Revenue Service
at the end of the calendar
quarter in which the
wages are paid. He also
sends a check covering the
tax contribution along with
his report. The reports
and contributions are due
for all household workers
who are paid SSO or more
in cash by one employer
during the calendar quar-
ter.

There is some misun-
derstanding also about re-
porting wages of farm
workers. The wages of an
agricultural worker must
be reported if he is paid
as much as $l5O in cash
or is employed 20 days or
more in the year on a
time basis. This report is
made to Internal Revenue
each year when the farm
employer files his tax re-
turn.

Employers of household
or agricultural workers
who have questions about
this are urged to contact
the Elizabeth City office at
401 South Dyer Street,
Elizabeth City, N. C.
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pie, green peas, candied
yams, cranberry sauce, jel-
lo with fruit, rolls and but.
ter, milk.

Friday—Tuna fish salad,
cole slaw, potato chips, ap-
ple sauce, crackers and
rolls and butter, ice cream,
milk.

White Oak Elementary

Monday—Spaghetti with
meat sauce, green beans,
com, orange juice, com
bread, milk, jello.

Tuesday—Beef vegetable
soup, Northern beans,
crackers, milk, peadh up-
side down cake.

Wednesday—Chicken pot
pie, mixed greens, candied
yams, rolls, cookies, milk.

Thursday—Smoked saus-
age, black eye peas, potato
salad, beets, rolls, cake and
ice cream, milk.

Friday Ocean perch,
cole slaw, French fries,
hush puppies, lemon cake,
milk.

Vets Comer
Q. I desire to change

the beneficiary on my gov-
ernment life insurance pol-
icy. Do I have to send my

policy back to VA for this?

A. No, you need not

return your policy. Merely

write your nearest VA re-
gional office or the office
to which you make your
premium payments. Your
letter will be accepted as
a change and you will be
sent the appropriate forms
to list your designated
beneficiaries in a more of-
ficial manner.

George Lewis
Is Key Banker

To coordinate the agri-

cultural activities of the
N. C. Bankers Association
in this area, George W.
Lewis has been named
County Key Banker for
Chowan County.

NCBA President J. Paul
Ford of Belmont has an-
nounced that Lewis will
serve as County Key
Banker during the next 12
months. He is executive
vice president of Peoples
Bank & Trust Company in
Edenton.

For 23 years the NCBA
has received national rec-
ognition for its far-reaching
program of service to ag-
riculture in North Caro-
lina. President Ford, not-
ing the work of bankers in
behalf of agriculture,
thanked the 100 County
Key Bankers for their role
in this record.

Ford called attention to
the projects that are spon-
sored by the association
such as the annual Farm
Credit Conference which
.will again be held in Ra-
leigh February 10-11, 1969,
the two-week school at
N. C. State University for
young farmers who are
provided scholarships giv-
en by their home commun-
ity banks, and the co-
sponsorship of the land
judging meet in the inter-
est of soil conservation.
He also reported that the
banks of North Carolina
continue to lend more
money to farmers than any
other institutional group of
lenders, last year provid-
ing sl6l million in loans.

The 1969 Spotted Win-
ter Type Conference will
be held at the Pitt County
Fairgrounds in Greenville.
The two-day event, Febru-
ary 17 and 18, willfeature
an educational program of
interest to anyone in the
swine industry.

The spotted breed has
made rapid advances in
improvement during the
past year as noted by an
increase of 6$ per cent in
pacesetter litters and rec-
ord cutouts for the breed

Swine Program Being Planned
at its 1968 Summer Type
Conference and 1968 Na-
tional Barrow Show.

The program will place
major emphasis on produc-
tion and certification traits.
Included in the activities
wiU be on-foot and carcass
barrow classes, certification
pairs, type discussion, judg-
ing contest, a banquet,
featuring Dr. M. D. Wlhite-
ker of the University of
Kentucky as speaker, and
a show and sale of bred
gilts, fall boars and gilts.

Truck Registration Up

WASHINGTON Truck
registrations totaled 15,-
358,952 in 1967. An addi-
tional 834,666 trucks were
owned by federal, state and
local governments, exclud-
ing military vehicles.
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CHRISTMAS EVE
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