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GOVERNOR JIM HUNT ,

OVERWHELMS BOB SCOTT IN
ROBESON & ELSEWHERE

GOVERNOR JIM HUNT
OVERWHELMS BOB SCOTT IN
ROBESON A ELSEWHER

LUMBERTON-Governor Jim Hunt
easily turned back the challenge ol
former governor Bob Scott Tuesday ir
county and state-wide balloting.

Rumors swept Robeson County on the
eve of the Primary that many of those
professing to support Scott had defected
at the last moment.

Hunt swept Robeson County wyth
12,263 votes to Scott's total of 4,612-
State-wide he won 2^5,141 to 216,710.

Harry Welch, the other candidate,
polled 12.678 votes.

In the Republican Primary Sen. I.
Beverly Lake polled 81% to win easily
over little know C.J. "Charlie" Cars-
ten} for the GOP nomination.

STERLING JONES9 ENERGY MACHINE

Sterling Jones is «n inventor. If his
latest invention works it will revolutio¬
nize the world. He calls his latest
invention an Energy Machine.

He has invented en Energy -

Machine, an energy producing machine
which, when perfected, will return
Arabs back to the desert and make CP &
L, Lumbee River Electric Membership
Corporation and similar utilities essen¬

tially obsolete as we know then now. He
swears that the machine works; a lot of

who have examined the device.

Jones has always liked to tinker. A
few years ago he invented an ingenious
rat trap that culminated in a watery
death for the rodents. He is still
perfecting the merchandizing aspects of
what he calls the Watergate Rat Trap,

fr

named appropriately enough in honor
(tie) of the watergat* political scandal
which was in the newt when the rat trap
was invented. Jones has also worked on
a unique irrigation system, among
other ideas.

Now Jones believes he has
invented the ultimate invention, a
machine which will produce electricity
for use.

The invention entails a weight driven
rotary power generating apparatus that
is designed to efficiently provide energy
that can be harnassed and effectively

a.

Everyone today appreciates the prob¬
lems of enery faced by America and the
world at large. Jones believes his
invention will make America less
dependent on foreign oil, therby
allowing the many billion dollars spent
yearly forenergyto be used to alleviate
the many social problems

facing the poor people of America,
especially the American Indian. Jones
says, "My invention will help my
people in the long run....l know it will
because it will lower all of our light
bills."

Most of the efforts toward solving the
Energy Crisis have been in the area of
conservation and trade. In the area of
energy conservation and development
one area that has been overlooked is the
invention and production of machinery
designed to deliver energy. Jone's
machine, when fully developed, will
loor'gtfifenrtty tike a'rtmftflMitinn Mat.
air pmift with gauge* dictating the
usuage of the energy being produced by
the Energy Machine.

Jones believes, indeed, that his
machine will deliver the energy needed
to make America, and, possibly the
world, independent from the Arab and
other oil producting countries.

He leaves soon for a trip to Washing¬
ton to confer with officials from the
energy department.

' »

Other companies like General Electric,
Westinghouse are also expected to
examine Jones' machine.

Jones says, "1 know this machine
will work: I can see it working to save us
millions of dollars in lower electric
bills."

The patent for Jones' Energy Device
is pending awaiting the final approval in
Washington.
When perfected Jones' Eiiergy Device

could, most of all, make high electric
bills a thing of the past.

Said an official with one of the local
utilities. "Anything that can lower a

utility bill rather than raise it. has got to
be the greatest invention since Thomas
Edison invented the light bulb."

jr

Rev. E.B. Torter. the erudite black
City Councilman from Lumberton'a
fabled Precinct JR had publicly endors¬
ed Gov. Scott but <his endorsement
seemed to capjr little weight. Scott
polled 21b votei there but Hunt polled
529.

Another effort for Scott was made in
Pembroke although Hunt prevailed
handily there also. Scott did receive 315
votes in Pembroke but Hunt carried the
mostly Indian Precinct with 884.

Hunt swept nil 39 Precincts. Scott
made his best shewing in Lumberton's
01 Precinct with 351 and 315 in
Pembroke.

carter TOPS balloting in
presidential primary

President J ill.g Carter swept Robe¬
son County asd North Carolina In
balloting Tuesday. Hr garnered 11,419
votes to 4,076 fctfSenator Ed Kennedy
in Robeson County.

run OFFBlTlU BE JUNE 3

For those calling for ran offs the date
set for contesting then is June 3 with
Mlty U». etlwwfc asnets partietpat-
ing.

STEWARTCONCURS TO LT.
GOVERffOK JIMMY GREEN

Carl Stewart finally conceded to the
eventual winner, Lt. Governor Jimmy
Green, late Wednesday afternoon, lt
was a closely contested race throughout
North Carolina but it was not close in
Robeson County. Green won handily in
Robeson County 10,918 to Stewarts
5,307.

other statewide races...

Breece Comes lip Sheet Again
Against Thad Ewe

George Breece. the young Cumberland
County native, came up short again in

his second bid against Thad Eure, the
incumbent secretary of the state. Eure
polled almost 60% of the vole total, still
holding claim to the title of "the oldest
Rat in the Democratic Barn." Eure will
be challenged by Republican David
Flaherty in the fall.

But Breece out polled Eure in Robeson
County by a 8.500 to 6,787 vote total.
For instance, Breece out-distanced Eure
705 to 395 in the Pembroke Prednct.

John Ingram Wins Handily
John Ingram continued his winning

ways with the people with his win in the
Insurance Commissioner's race. Ingram
won a majority of the vote, avoiding a
run off against three challengers, ail
three of whom can claim the distinction
of having worked for Ingram in the
Insurance Commissioner's Office.

In Kobeson Ingram polled a resound¬
ing 10,164 against his three challenge

See Page Tea.
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HOBACE LOCKLEAM

J.w. HUNT

JACK MORGAN

CHANCELLOR INSTALlATl6T7sCHEDULED
FOR MAY 10
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JAMES E. CHAVIS
MEMORIAL SALUTE PLANNED

Carnell Locklear hat undertaken
the great challenge of beginning
something new among Indian people.
Said Locklear. "if other races can

recogni/e their own. so can we." He is
referring to a monument to Mr. James
E. (Jim) Chavis. late of Robeson
County, the monument will be in the
form of a state historical marfter bearing
his name, date of birth and a few of his
accomplishments. The marker will be
erected beside a state highway and will
be a lasting reminder of the struggle of
one "old warrior" who has now gone
home.

Chavis was instrumental in the Indian
struggle during the 1930s. He helped to
establish the identity of the original 22
Indians of Robeson County who have
gained Federal Recognition. It was

He was dedicated to the Indian cause.

Because of his efforts. Indians are now
adowedAn mmm as jurors. This waa eel
always so.

-i*
Said Locklear. "It would take us too

much space for me to try and
innumerate the many contributions of
Mr. Jim."

To accomplish his goal of erecting the
Historical marker, Locklear and other
friends of the late Mr. Jim. will host a

Jim Chavis Memorial Salute on Tuesday
night. May 13. at Pembroke Senior
High School. The cost for attendance
be S3.00 per person. There will be all
types of entertainment and refresh¬
ments. The infamous Carnell "Boss"
Strong promises to dance, sing and get
serious about the Chavis contributions.
Tickets are on sale at LRDA's Main

Office and Annex. at In The Pines Cafe.
The Carolina Indian Voice office,
members of the Prospect Jaycees. and
members of Preston Gospel Chapel may
purchase from Paul. Brooks.

WEEKEND REVIVAL PLANNED

A weekend revival is scheduled for
May 15. 16, 17 at Green Pine Free Will
Baptist Church on Route I, Pembroke.
Rev. Alber L. Fortason from Philadel¬
phia. Penn will be speaking. Service will
begin at 7:30 p.m. The congregation
and the pastor. Rev. Bobby D. Locklear.
invite the public to come and warship
with them.

PROSPECT FIRE DEPARTMENT
LADIES AUX1LARY PLAN SALE

The Prospect Fire Department Ladies
Auailiary are planning a chicken and
fish plate sale on Saturday, May 17,
l%0 at the fire department. The sale
will begin at 11:00 a.m. and plates will
be sold for $3.00, The public is
encouraged to attend and support the
worthwhile projects of the Ladies
Auxiliary.

NO HITTEl TOPPLES
PEMBROKE WARRIORS

The Pembroke Warriors fell before
the onslaught of a no hitter thrown at
them by Whitevllle's Tommy Griffin in
Three Rivers action. The Warriors
managed to score a run without a hit,
Compliments of two waks, a feilders
choice and an error.

WUTIVIIAI WOLFFACK
WON *1

Pembroke returns to action Friday
night to play their final regular season
game The Warriors aril host WestIrenes lak at 7:30 p.«. en the P»U
field
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REVIVAL PLANNED

A revival will be held at the Rock of
Bethlehem Church beginning May II.
Rev. Harvey Brewlpigton will be the
guest speaker, aa wall at Rev. Monford
Locklear. Service will begin at 7:30
nightly. The pastor of the r<$t of
Bethlehem Baptist Qiurch, Rev. f.r.
Swett and the coqmpgation extend a
cordial invitation to tB*public to attend.

golf tournament
Riverside County Clvb and Lowry's

Chain Saw will sponsor a 4 man Snow
Ball GolfTournament on Saturday. May
10. tee off time is 0 a.m. Sign np timgh)
at 6 p.m. Friday. May f. nit
Tournament is open to the public. Fee is
$7.00 for members and $12.00 for non-
memberv Individual trophies and gifts
will be awarded to first and second
place teams.

robeson historical DRAMA,
inc. awarded S6.0N GRANT

producRg organization of the OutMiN
drama. "Strike at the Wl3F. has b^oa
awarded a $6,000 grant by the North
Carolina Theatre Arts, according to
Sara Hodgkioa. Secretary of the De¬
partment of Cultural Resources.

The funds will be utilized as salary
assistance for the following positions:
Artistic Director, Technical Director/
Lighting Designer, and Costumer,

Junior Miss

and Little Miss

Deep Branch

Selected

"A Dream Come True" was the theme .

for the Little Miss Deep Breach end
Junior Miss Deep Breach Beeuty
Pageant held Friday night. May 2.

Eyrtle Ransom, teacher at Deep
Branch School, was the master of
ceremonies. Serving as judges were
Allan W; Critchett. public 'relations
officer of Southern National Bank,
Lumberton; Teresa Osendine Williams,
a former Miss Pembroke State-
University and Miss Robeson County;
Catherine Vaughan, retired from HEW
in Washington, DC. now Director of
Maiton Youth Development Organisa¬
tion, Inc; Betty CotviUe of Rowland,
Title I Reading Teacher at Rowland
High School; and Harold Dean Jacobs,
Director of Music Education at Prospect
United Methodist Church,

John N. Sampson, Principal of DeepBranch gave the welcome and introduc¬
ed the master of ceremonies.

There were 12 gtris vying tar the two
titles. Winner of the Me LRUs Mm
Deep Branch was Coretta Chnvts. Pint
runner up was Rabases Laura MaMan.
Second runner up was Lucindy Lsafc-
lear Thu new Jnnior Mlas Dunp Iran*


