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Medicine Club; President of
the Canterbury Club; a mem-
ber of the Men's Senate;'
YMCA: Biology Club; Film &

Forum; Host and Hostess; a
member of Pi Gamma Mu Na-

tional Honor Social Science
Fraternity, and was a nomi-
nee for Who's Who Among
Students In American Univer-

sities aitf Colleges. He also

awed o\ the Medical Com-

mittee and the Comittee for

Freshmen Orientation.
After graduation from

Florida A&M University, he

joined Armour-Dial, Inc. In
New York City, as a sales re-

presentative, and was cited by
the Eastern Region's Manager
of Armour, as being an out-

standing and aggressive sales re-

presentative, as well as being
the first in the placement of
18 Armour products on the

Island of Manhattan through a

wholesale grocery chain -an

accomplishment his predeces-
sors had never achieved. While

with Armour, he pursued a

Masters Degree in Business
Administration at New York
University. After leaving Ar-
mour, he played with the New

York Giants football farm
team before a khee injury
ended his career.

Arthur us a sales analyst In

the Marketing/Sales Depart-

ment for the Xerox Corpora- j

tk>n.

With these aceompltah-

ments he Is now joining the

ranks of Rev. Jessee L. Jack-
son, Gale Sayers, John D.
Rockefeller, and the late John

F. Kennedy, to name few of
those who have been re-

cipient* of this award.
When asked by the Amster-

dam News, the largest Black
Newspaper, his response to

the selection, he said, "some
individuals tend to grasp high
honors of this nature and

scrutinize the advantages of
this situation for selfish rea-
sons. My outlook is different
and twofold: I think of the

combined efforts of indlrl-
duals and situations that

placed me at this point, and
realize that this is just a no-
vel experience in my drive for

8 goal that will bring about

the inevitable for the Black
People. With the wisdom of
the Old and the Energy of the
young, this goal will be reach-;

ed.

Those among us who have

achieved some degree of suc-
cess should lend a helping
hand to those who haven't
had the opportunity.

As I reminise the past,

stand in the present and con-
template the future, I think

the wise ones of yesterday,
my peers of today and the
little ones of tomorrow will

continue to strive toward the

inevitable and move on -

Right On!"
Boyd is the son of Mrs.

Manie C. Boyd of 206 Clem-
raons Ave.

-Ali
(Continud from front page)

white draft board rejected his

claim on the ground that Ali's
Black Muslim beliefs were
"political and racial" and thus
did not qualify him for the

statutory exemption. When
the Court of Appeals affirmed
the and upheld Ali's
conviction it emphasized the

allegedly anti-white, anti-

christian, and segregationist
philosophy of the Mtislims.

The Supreme Court agreed
to consider Ali's appeal in

light of its own recent deci-
sion that makes it clear that
conscientious objector treat-
ment cannot be denied be-
cause it is not based upon tra-
tional religious beliefs. Thus,
the court will decide whether
the Selective Service System
must treat Black Muslims who
are conscientiously opposed
to war on the same basis as
registrants who beiong to
other faiths.

The decision may have sig-
nificance for the treatment:

generally of Black Muslims in

the eyes of the law, as well as
for the many who have re-
fused military service because
of their beliefs.
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According to LDF As-
sociate Council, James M. Na-
brit. 111, a written argument
will be filed with the Supreme
Cour. in about 45 days and an
orai argument will probably
take place in late April or
e»riy May of 1971.

-Emmanuel
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1887, a deed of Conveyance
from R. B. Fitzgerald and
wife to the Trustees in Trust
for the African Methodise
Episcopal Church, conveying
the property on Kent Street
known at that time as Chapel
Hill Road, Noting there in
that it was to be used by the
Conference, subject to the
rules and regulations of the

A.M.E. discipline to expound
"God's Holy Word" and with

the further provision that if

the African Methodist Church
failed to use it for the pur-

poses set forth, it would re-
vert to the heirs at law.

Yarborough and Fitzgerald
further stated, that at the

time of conveying the deed,
they and other members of

their family were not even
born. And that as active and
paying members of Emmanuel
A'.M.E. Church, have been for

many years, along with other
loyal members who have given
generously of earnings and

physical toil to preserve and

improve the structure in order

that it might be enjoyed by
it's members. It is also sad to

think that no one in the Con-
ference thought it was neces-
sary to notify the family that

the church was to be aban-

doned and action was taken
without consulting any mem-

bers of the family as to what

was transacted. "It is hard to
understand," Fitzgerald
quoted, as to how a church
has stood for some 83 years

under the .leadership of some
forty Pastors and six Bishops
and they all understood this
clause in the de«d, and only
now has the church been
abandoned to say the Fitz-

gerald's owned the church. Al-
so we do not condemn mem-
bers who wish to relocate.

Let it be known, that we,
as the heirs of R. B. and

Sarah Fitzgerald, widh that the
gift of their grandfather and

grandmother hope that the
doors of Emmanuel shall al-
ways remain open to the

members and others who wish

to expound God's word in it's
Holy Sanctuary, and also it is

the wishes of the family, if
this property is reverted to
them, that it will be used 3s
a worthwhile charity.

-Mahalia
(Continud from front page)

approximately 1200 diplo-
mats businessmen and their

wives.
"Happy Birthday" was

sung by Miss June Norton of
Washington, D. C., a TV and

radio personality, who has ap-

peared with Harry Belafonte
and Duke Ellington to name
just two. She is also a grad-
uate of Howard University,
the alma mater of the Ameri-
can Ambassador. She also

sang "The Impossible Dream"
and "My Way," which seem
to sum up the fact that al-

though President Tubman is
celebrating his 75th birthday,
he has been President for 26
years.

He was ; then presented
with two gifts, one by Charles
Sherman. The first was a map

of Africa printed in the

1600's. A reproduction paint-
ing of the Hoffman River in
1900 displaying «alonial
settlements as far back as
1825, such as Port Hill And

Fort Norris, with both forts
flying the American flag with
only 25 stars. In May of
1825 is MfcuooMa,

Liberia was born by mutual
consent of America and
Africa. The other gift was
presented by Mrs. C. L. St.
Clair, wife of the chairman of
the Chamber of Commerce.
It was a huge desk set.

Then came the pinnacle of
the evening. The "Queen of
Gospel," "The World's
Greatest Gospel Singer," was
introduced to the public. Miss
Jackson, resplerident in a long
ankle-length green gown with
sequiued. bodice and per-
manent pleats and semi-ruf-
fled bottom, took the stage.

the better part of 90 minutes,

with exceptions of hand-clap-
ping after each aong, Her
Majesty had the audience
spellbound, and she was at her

regal best.

-Savings
(Continud from front page)

account in a savings and loan
association. More and more

people came to realize this,
and that is another reason

why funds are once more

flowing into your institution.

In the recent years of
"tight money" many fami-
lies were obliged to defer

plans to buy or build homes,

in 1971, and especially if

present savings trends con-

tinue, there should be more

mortgage money available for
our community needs.

-Brimmer
(Continud from front page)

cernber 28.
NBA Executive Committee

members participating in the

press conference were:
William Hudgins, President,

NBA, and President, Freedom
National Bank, Harlem, New
York City:
Dr. Edward D. Irons, Execu-
tive Director, NBA;

L Owen Funderburg, Ist Vice
President, NBA, and Execu-
tive Vice President, Gateway
National Bank, St. Louis:
Donald Sneed, Jr., 2nd Vice
President, NBA: President,
Unity Bank & Trust Co., Rox-

bury, Mass.:
Walter Tucker, Mechanics &

Farmers Bank, Charlotte:
Sharnia Buford, Douglass
State Bank, Kansas City, Kan-

sas:
Dr. Carl M. Carrol, Riverside

National, Houston:
Samuel L. Foggie, United
Community National Bank,
Washington, D. C.

Consistory 218 To
Hold Installation
Services Mt. Calvary

Durham Consistory 218
will have public installation

service at Mt. Calvary Chris-
tial Church on Athens Street,
Sunday, January 17, at 3 p.m.

A sermonette will be
preached by Rev. J. C.
Cheek, pastor. Music will be

by the Mount Calvary
Echoes.

Illustrious Peer Otto R.

Morgan 33 Past Commander

In Chief of The Edward
Evans Consistory 196 of

Fayetteville will be the in-
stalling officer. He will be

accompanied by Edward
Evans Consistory.

The general public is in-
vited.

Fellowship hour will be en-
joyed Lby the

installation.

A polymeric coating that
insulates electrical wiring
against temperatures as high
as 700°f without degradation
or danger of fire has been developed by Hughes Aircraft
Company for the Air Force
Materials Laboratory. The ma
terial also can seal wire
against the effects of moisture
and air.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Mrs. Margaret H. Malone has

qualified as Executrix of the
Estate of Virginia Hunter Haw-
kins, late of Durham County,
North Carolina. This notice Is
to notify all persons having
claims against said estate to
exhibit them to the Executrix
through the estate's Attorney,

Mr. C. C. Malone, Jr., at 112
West Parrish Street, Durham,
North Carolina, on or before
July 10, 1971, or this notice
will be pleaded in bar of their
recovery. All persons indebted
to said estate will please make
immediate payment.

TWa 17t)h day of December,.
1970.

Pearson, Malone, Johnscm
and DeJarnMm
C. C. Malone, Jr.,
Attorney for the Estale «f
Virginia Hunter Haiwkte

Dec. 28; Jan. 2, ?, 10

SOUTH CAROLINA
iDVKHAII COUNTY

ADMINISTRATRIX NOTE®
Having qualified l as adminL

stfatrix of the estate of John
Anderson Leathers, Jr., de-
ceased, this is to notify all
persons having claims against
said estate to exhibit them to
the undersigned at 1009 Ard-
mo re Drive, Durham, North
Carolina, on or before July
4th, 1971, or this notice will
be pleaded in bar of their re-
covery. All persons indebted to
said estate will please make
immediate payment.

This 26th day of December,
1970.

Winnie Leathers,
Administratrix of the
Estate of John Anderson
Leathers, Jr.

Dr. Likoff
Keynoter

At Meharry
NASHVILLE, Tenn.

Meharry Medical College will
host one of America's most
distinguished men of medicine
January 20. Dr. William Lik-
off, acclaimed world wide for

his skills and knowledge in the

field of cardiology, will be the
keynote speaker for a Pro-
gram of Continuing Education
in Cardiology.

DR. LIKOFF received his
B.A. from Dartmouth College
and his M.D from Hahne-
mann Medical College, Phil-
adelphia, Pennsylvania. After
receiving his M.D., Dr. Likoff
was an intern, a pathology

res'dent, a medical resident,
and a chief resident at Mt.
Sinai Hospital, Philadelphia.
After leaving Mt. Sinai he was
a cardiac fellow at Peter Bent.
Brigham Hospital in Boston.'
He is currentlv a C'inical Pro-
fessor of Medicine at Hahne-
mann Medical College and
Hospital.

Dr. Likoff is currently a
member of the Executive
Committee of the American
College of Cardiology, the
chairman of the National Com-
mittee of Continuing Educa-
tion of the American College
of Cardiology, the vice-chair- j
man of the Inter-Society Com-
mission for Heart Disease Re-
sources. and chairman of the
Third National Conference on

elude faculty, students, visit-
ing and raembai*
of the local prtaa. Physician*
attending the program may
receive seven prescribed cred- 1

it hours from the Aanericarf
Acadehyr of General practice.

During the fiscal year from
July 1970 through June 1971
the United States will buy few-
er military aircraft than in
any year since 1946, the first
year after World War 11.

Your professional hairdresser
knows the answer...

Is braiding your unatural"
theonly way to make it
look better?

Do you have to braid your hair every night or everytime
you wash it? Going through this process makes it easier to comb,
keeps down split ends and helps give your 'fro more body.
However, it sometimes takes several days of braiding to achieve
these results.

The best and quickest way to keep a nice shaped 'natural'
is to go to your professional hairdresser for the Kindness System
from Clairol. It's the new way of styling and making a flimsy
'fro a fuller 'fro. The Kindness® Instant Hairsetter & Kindness®
Heat-Activated conditioner are the instant problem solvers for
tangles, breakage and damaged ends. It's great for all kinds of
hair styles and wigs too!

After washing and towel drying your hair, the professional
hairdresser applies the Kindness Heat-Activated Conditioner.
It's formulated to give hair deep-down body and a healthy glow.
Then, the Kindness Instant Hairsetter, with its warm-hearted
rollers, is used to help penetrate the conditioner gently into your
hair. This gives yoyr hair more beauty and hold power for a
style that lasts and lasts. Then, of course, the expert does the
styling.

Why not talk to your hairdresser about using the Kindness
System. From wash to set . . . including shaping ... it takes
less than an hour. Your professional hairdresser knows that the
Kindness System is far better than tiresome braiding.

Askfor a free consultation.

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION OF

MKHANICS & FARMERS BANK
of Durham in the State of North Carolina and Domestic Subsidiaries

at the close of business on December 31,1970.

ASSETS

Cash and due from banks.. $ 1,475,186.67
U.S. Treasury securities 3,288,199.23
Securities of other U.S. Government

agencies and corporations *. 4,176,464.07
Obligations of States and political subdivisions ... 2,443,042.01
Other securities 2,792.82
Federal Funds sold and securities purchased t

under agreements to resell 2,200,000.00
Other 10an5........... 9,347,357.14
Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other

assets representing bank premises 846,905.16
Real estate owned other than premises 11,157.00
Other assets

. 247,307.62

TOTAL ASSETS $24,038,411.72

LIABILITIES

Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships,
and corporations $ 7,734,333.08

Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships,
and corporations 10,306,805.75

Deposits of United States Government 1,462,670.05
Deposits of States and political subdivisions 1,789,350.78
Certified and officers' checks, etc 339 033 95
TOTAL DEPOSITS $21,632,193.61

Total demand deposits 10,570,387.86
1b) Total time and savings deposits 11,061,805.75

Mortgage indebtedness 248 06318
Other liabilities 298!681!46
TOTAL LIABILITIES. $22,178,938.25
MINORITY INTEREST IN CONSOLIDATED

SUBSIDIARIES -. ..$ 19,346.63

RESERVES ON LOANS AND SECURITIES

Reserve for bad debts losses on loans (set up pursuant to
Internal Revenue Service rulings) $ 155,602 40Reserves on securities^." 1,500^00

TOTAL RESERVES ON LOANS AND SECURITIES H 157,102.40

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS

Capital notes and debentures 4.95% due December 1990 $ 200 000.00Equity capital, total 1,483,024.44
Common stock total par value 565 435.00

(No. shares authorized 200,000) ?

(No. shares outstanding 113,087)

J/ *"

*iu 803,127.00
Undivided profits 114,462.44
TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS $ 1,683,024.44
TOTAL LIABILITIES, RESERVES, AND

1

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS $24,038,411.72

MEMORANDA

Average of total deposits for 15 calendar days
ending with call date S2O 834 164 17Average of total loans for 15 calendar days

' ending with call date. 9,325,785,18
"ARR| SON, Cashier, of the above-named bank, do solemnly

belfef ePOrt °f cond,tion is true and correc t. to the best my knowl-

D L HARRISONTotal deposit to the credit of the State of North Carolinaor ahy official thereof $ 811,378.83
*

..
_ it _

Correct? Attest:State of North Carolina, County of Durham, ss:
Sworn to and subscribed before me this 12th

day of January, 1971, end I hereby certify that lam CLYDE DONNELL
not an officer or director of this bank. j h WHEELER

JOSEPHINE S. STRAYHORNE, Notary Public J - s - STEWART
My commission expires December 10,1974. Directors

Coronary Care Units (Ameri-

can College of Cardiology and

American Heart Association)

June, 1871.

THE PROGRAM will in-
elude tours of cardiovascular
wards and facilities, lectures
by noted speakers and a lun-
cheon. Chairman for the lun-
cheon will be Mrs. E. (Chip-
pey) Grier, Medical Technolo-
gist in Cardiology. Persons at-
tending the symposium will in-

8A


