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Kiwanis Tuesday t 

The Tryon Kiwanis Club will 
meet on Tuesday at 1 p. m. at Ho- 
tel Tryon. 

Flood Notes 

By Ralph C. Erskine, Jr. 
If you think it has been raining 

in Tryon just read the following 
extracts from an interesting let- 
ter Ralph C. Erskine. Jr. wrote 
home from Hartford, Conn, where 
he is with the Hartford Electric 
Company: 

“Thursday the water from the 
park river came across its banks 
and started to flood the streets in 
the section around our building. 
A motorboat which had been built 
in the cellar of the Ramp Garage 
floated up out of the gangway and 
was moored to a fire hydrant in 
the center of the business district. 
Two fire trucks were used togeth- 
er with about 4 portable pumps 
in a losing fight to keep the water 

|from flooding our Pearl St. sub- 
rstation which feeds the midtown.. 

The river rose to 38 feet, 6 feet 
higher than the 1927 flood. From 
the top of a department store I 
could see water stretching for 
miles across the Connecticut River 
valley, farms, woods, and towns 
apparently floating. Huge Shell 
gasoline tanks rose from their 
bases and floated majestically 
down the turbulent river along 
with sheds, barns, roofs and other 
wreckage sweeping steel high ten- 
sion towers down like trees in a 

gale—South Meadow station shut 
down when the water could no 
longer be kept out, leaving the 
stricken city to grope in darkness 
-Continued on Buck Pap*_- 

Holy Week Services 

By Rev. C. P. Burnett 
This is Holy Week. There will 

be services every day at the 
Church of the Holy Cross. Each 
afternoon, with the exception of 
Wednesday, there will be Evening 
prayer and address at 5 o’clock. 
On Thursday morning Holy Com- 
munion at 10 and on Good Friday 
morning prayer and sermon at 11 
o’clock. 

On Wednesday afternoon at 3:- 
30 there will be mission study 
class conducted by Bishop Touret 
in the Parish Hall. 

The rector and congregation ex- 

tend a most cordial invitation to 
members of other churches to join 
in the services, feeling that they 
will be a helpful preparation for 
the Easter services to be held in 
the various churches next Sunday. 

Mills-Henderson 

Mr. and Mrs. N. T. Mills of Co- 
lumbus, N. C. have announced the 
engagement and approaching mar- 

riage of their daughter, Miss Wil- 
lie Odessa Mills to Mr. James C. 
Henderson of Ware Shoals and 
Simpsonville, S. C. 

The marriage will take place on 

April 25 at home in Columbus. 
The Rev. Charles B. Trammel, 
pastor of bride-elect will officiate. 

Storm in Georgia 
Announcers over the radio this 

morning stated that a cyclone had 
struck Gainesville, Ga. did a lot of 
damage between there and Ander- 
son, S. C. Several hundred people 
reported killed. 


