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Golf News
Tryon golfers are interested in

the post-season tournament to be
held at Beaver Lake golf course

ion Thursday by the Piedmont Golf
Between 60 and 75

golfers are expected to compete.
The association is composed of

Lake Lure, Forest City, Tryon,
Shelby, Morganton, and Spartan-
burg. The Spartanburg team won
the association cup for compiling
the best season record, and the
trophy will be presented to the
victorious aggregation following
the close of Thursday’s competi-
tion.

Professionals from each of the
member clubs will vie for a cash
prize, while the amateurs —and all
who participated in the season
matches are invited—will engage

. in a handicap affair for trophies
and medals.

Spartanburg won eight and lost
two matches during the regular
reason; Morganton had a 7-3 win-

. lose record; Lake Lure broke even

as t 5-5; Forest City dropped four
winning six, and Tryon and

Shelby tied for bottom place with
three victories against seven set-
backs.

Assault Case Nol Prossed
The case in which Archie Bur-

rell, Tryon policeman was charg-

ed with assault'and battery on the
person of Mielvin Hines, son of
Sheriff W. D. Hines, was nol pross-

ed on Monday afternoon in the
Polk County Superior court.
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War Relief Canning

Now that the members of the
younger set are joining the regu-
lar staff, canning days in Landrum
take on an almost festive quality.
Last week, several of the younger
men made their first appearance,
Rufus Zogbaum, Jr., home for a
brief stay before taking up his
aviation duties at Pensacola, was
one of the newcomers assigned
the job of labeling the cans. His
younger brother, David, was an-
other who did his efficient hit.
Jimmie Marshall, Jr., is a zeal-
ous worker whose services are con-
tributed on Tuesday and Friday
mornings. Last Friday he arrived
at an unusually early hou r with
two bushels of figs donated by his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. James Wal-
ler Marshall, from their place,
Mountain Acres. Others who made
their initial appearance on Friday
were Miss Sue Still, Miss Marga-
ret Beach, Miss Alice Millard,
Mjiss Fay Trowbridge, Miss Fran-
ces Hudson, Mrs. B. G. Henry,
Mrs. James Wilson, Mrs. Marcus
Nash, Mrs. Lespie Barnett, Mrs.
W. Y. Wilkins, Mrs. C. A. Mar-
tin, Mrs. E. J. Jacobs, and Mrs.
J. W. Taylor.

On Tuesday last, 327 cans of
string beans, tomatoes, peaches
and apples were packed and on
Friday 143 cans of figs, string
beans, apples and tomatoes, bring-
ing the total to 3389 cans. These
were donated by the Walter Hills,
Mrs. Hester Daley, Mr. W. A.
Ballew and Mrs. J. W. Marshall.
In addition to this, 50 pounds of
honey were contributed by Mrs.
E. G. Vollmer.
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