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CURB UKPOimw
C. J. Lynch and the Curb Re-

porter attended the banquet of
Steapship & Tourist Agents Assn,
at Asheville on Wednesday night,
the purpose of the visit was to
sell the idea of directing travelers
to Tryon, and to assure the
Tourist Agents that Tryon hotels
and inns would cooperate with
them 100 per cent. This announce-
ment was made to the 300 agents
assembled at the George Vander-
bilt. Mr. Lynch did a good sell-
ing jom for Tryon. They express-
ed appreciation of the hospitality
of Tryon people and their admira-
tion for the scenery of the com-
munity. Each one of the agents
will be sent copies of the Tryon
Chamber of Commerce folder and
a list of the hotels cooperating
to bring guests to Tryon. In this
connection it would be well to note
that somebody has to go to extra
expense for trips of this kind.
There is gasoline to buy, automo-
biles to use and personal time
taken up,—time that you would
like to use for something else.
When yen pay your dues to the
Chamber of Commerce or contri-
bute to the special entertainment
expenses you do a lot, and it helps
the fellow who gives BOTH time
and money. It is only by every
business person, innkeeper and
professional man doing his part
that the community population is
kept up to a minimum, to assure
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Observation Posts on Job

Chairman Julian B. Hester and
Wayne Creasman have

jbrganized airplane observation
Pposts over the county to report

on the movements of airplanes
in this section during maneuver
week. Two big bombers flew over
Tryon this morning. The observ-
ers are as follows:

Columbus: Robert S. McFarland,
Captain; Billy Burgess, Bob Gib-
son, J. C. Gibson, J. Alvin Wil-
son, Jr.

Coxe: Sam Dobson, Captain;
Horace Scoggins, Pearson Gray
(colored), Mrs. James L. Houser,
James L. Houser, James L. Hous-
er, Jr., A. C. Roddy, Albert Rod-
dy, Lee Twitty (colored), Fletcher
Twitty (colored).

Saluda: Edwin Leland, Captain;
Roy Baisoen, Dennys Cary-Elwes,
William G. Egerton, Roy Johnson,
Robert Michael, Daniel Pace, Hugh
Seay, Roy Ward.
\ Tryon: M. B. Caldwell, Cap-
tain; Spurgeon Arledge, Richard
Arthur, James Baker, Harrison
Bridgeman, Jr., Billy Dick, Robert
Dick, Jimmy Edney, Marvin Ed-
wards, Jr., Marion Edwards, John
Paul Jones, Ellis Kuykendall,

Lock McGeaohy, Tom Melton,
Morgan Phillip Morris, Charlie
Owens.

Hot Grease Burns Baby

- Caroline Jones, 18-months-old
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Walter
Jones of Valhalla is in St. Luke’s
hospital for treatment of burns
received on Tuesday afternoon
when a pan of hot grease turned
over on her and burned her body
and face severely.


