
GENERAL 
Refrigerators, Ranges, Freezers, Washers, Water Heaters 

Andrews Furniture & Appliance Company 

ELECTRIC 

SPEED AT COLUMBUSS 

Capt. C. A. Speed of the State 

Highway Patrol. Asheville, will be 
the guest speaker at the Stearns 

Parent-Teacher meeting in Colum- 
bus Thursday night at 7:30. 

There will be a joint coronation 
and recognition service for G. A.’s 
and R. A.’s at the Columbus Bap- 
tist Church tonight (Wednesday), 
at 7:30. Sunbeans will also par- 
ticipate. Anna Pack will be crown- 
ed queen. Virginia Splawn, Ruth 
Connor and Patricia Edwards are 
expected to be princesses. Several 
others ladies-in-waiting and maid- 
ens. Kermit Cantrell will become 
a knight. Other boys will become 
pages. Elenda Pack will be Anna 
Pack’s flower girl and Alvin Pack 
her pillow-bearer. Anna will go 
to Campbell College Friday to 

attend Queen’s Court. 

FOR SALE: Canna, Chrysan- 
themums, Amaryllis and other 

plants. Also ladies shovels for 

gardening at Arledge Hardware 
in Tryon.—Adv. p. 

FOR SALE: Small Electric Re- 

frigerator. Good condition. $40.00. 
Tel. 317-W.—Adv. 25, 27p. 

Bargain opportunity: Table Top 
Crosley Deep Freeze, designed as 

modern kitchen unit, 4 cu. ft. 

capacity. Used only a few months; 
like new. $100. Mrs. James W. 
Baxter, Phone 2112.—Ad 24, 25, 26c 

Walter A. Knoop 

Real Estate Sales 
Res. Phone 311-M 

AT LAST ON THE SCREEN ! ! 

BIGGEST SPECTACLE OF OUR 
TIME ! ! 

MGM Presents Sir Walter Scott’s Famed Novel 

(In Technicolor)—No Advance In Price 

Wednesday, Thursday and Friday 
March 25,26, and 27 
Matinee Thursday at 3 P. M. 

TRYON THEATRE Tryon, N. C. 


