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Weather Monday: High 91, low 
60, Rel. Hum. 52 . . . Next trouble 
expected in Indochina where Reds 
are trying to get a stronger foot- 
hold . . . American businessmen 
seem! confident of the future, that 
signing of the armistice will not 
slow up production . . . Spartan- 
burg county shipped 700 carloads 
of peaches last we^k . . . Congra- 
tulations to Miss Faith Burwell, 
daughter of Ernest Burwell of 

Tryon. Sunday’s Spartanburg 
Herald had an interesting write 
up about her rapid rise since 

graduating from Northwestern 
University School of Dramatics. 
She has already been accepted as 
a professional in the cast of “New 
Faces” at the Great Northern 
Theatre. She will enter the Yale 
School of Drama this fall for 

graduate study .... The Spartan- 
burg Herald reports that Jessie 
Dav of Tryon is a patient at Gen- 
eral Hospital ... If you train vour 
children at home to put trash in 

receptacles it wiU • help keep 
streets cleaner. However, many 
adults throw cigar wrappers and 
cigarette cartons on the streets. 
Folks just not thinking. If you 
don’t throw stuff in front of some- 
body else’s place it will influence 
them not to throw stuff in front of 
your place. If vou love your com- 
munitv you will help keep it clean. 
-Continued on Back Pape_ 

BRIDGE RESULTS 

Results of the special winners 
game at the Duplicate Bridge club 
at Oak .Hall hotel Fx-iday, were 
as follows: 

North-South: 1st, Mr. and Mrs. 
John W. Norwood Jr.; 2tid, James 
W. Crawley and James P. Earle; 
3rd, L. C. Dodge and T. H. Hart- 
ley ; 4th, Mrs. A. D. White and 
Mrs. S. C. Page; 5th, Mrs. Baxter 
Haynes and Jules Feder, 

East-West: 1st, Mrs. W. D. 
Johnston and Chester D. Ward Jr.; 
2nd, Mrs. G. H. Pinckney and Miss 
Elise Pinckney; 3rd, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Kerby; 4th, Phil Harris and 
C. E. Harris; 5th, Mrs. A. B. Vogel 
and Mrs. W. M. Bomar. 

Twenty pairs participated. Win- 
ners of North-South and East- 
West received silver prizes. 
The next special winners game 

will be played in September. A 
regular game will be played at 
the Oak Hall hotel next Friday, 
August 1. 

CORN FUNERAL. 3 P. M. 
Funeral services for Orval Corn 

who passed away Sunday will be 
held this afternoon at 3 at the 

Tryon Second Baptist Church. The 
body will be taken, to the church 
at 2 p. m. to await the hour of 
service. 

MAGIC FOR DOCTORS 
The Dbho Chemical Corporation 

is presenting a program of magic 
at Saluda Wednesday night at 
8:15 for the benefit of the expan- 
sion fund for the Southern Pedia- 
tric Seminar at Saluda, according 
to Mayor John T. Coates. 
“Ber-Kee” the famous magician 

will put on the program. 


