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Precinct meetings will be held. 
The times vary from precinct to 
precinct. Delegates will be 
elected to the county convention 
on March 29th at 10 a.m. at the 
Polk County Courthouse in 
Columbus.

COMMUNICATION
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a space. It could be executed by a 
North Carolina artist and would 
add immeasurably to the 
library-art center complex.

I would propose that a fund be 
established for this purpose, to be 
called the Samual and Jane 
Abernethy Fund The late Mr. 
Abernethy and his wife, a present 
resident, were some of the first 
horse lovers to move there from 
the north. He was a highly 
respected and beloved citizen, as 
is his wife, who has been an 
outstanding horsewoman and is a 
person of great dignity and 
courage. If this suggestion meets 
with any approval, notify The 
Bulletin, and I will be happy to 
deposit a small nucleus at NCNB 
for this purpose.

Thank you for your Southern 
hospitality.

Elva Michael
Oregon State University
Department of Anthropology
Corvallis, OR 97331

Attended Course
Sandra Covil of Paint ‘n Paper, 

Etc., Landrum, recently attend­
ed a 1% day Floor Fashion Center 
Color Coordination and Design 
Course in Charlotte, North 
Carolina, conducted by Arm­
strong Cork Company’s Interior 
Design Center.

The course is offered to firms 
who have recently become 
authorized Armstrong Floor 
Fashion Center retailers. Over 
3,000 persons from across the 
nation have attended to date.

Floor Fashion Center retailers 
offer the public a complete 
resilient floor covering center 
designed to provide professional 
advice and assistance.

Current fashion trends, popular 
architectural styles and the latest 
floor covering decorating techni­
ques were discussed. The 
information obtained will allow 
Floor Fashion Center retailers to 
offer assistance to customers 
that have decorating questions.

Senior Citizens’ 
Meeting Changed

The Polk County Senior 
Citizens’ Club has postponed its 
March meeting date from the 
24th to Monday, March 31st, at 
5:30 p.m. at the Meeting Place in 
Tryon. A covered dish supper will 
be served at 5:30, and the 
meeting will follow at six. The 
speaker will be Ace Rickenback­
er of Radio Station WTYN.

Bulletin Readers
Out of town subscriptions have 

been entered for the following: 
James J. Kenney, P. 0. Box 523, 
Naperville, Ill.; Mrs. V. W. 
Colley, Box 757, Oglethorpe, Ga.; 
Allen Brown, 820 Theirist Ave., 10 
F, Bronx, N. ¥.; Mrs. Gertrude 
Burns, 1719 S. Seminole Drive, 
Apt. B, Chattanooga, Tenn.; L. 
W. Thompson, Jr. 1523 Los 
Robles Blvd. Apt. 11, Sacramen­
to, Calif.; Richard A. Vander- 
hoef, 1747 Marquette Ave., 
Cincinati, Ohio; William Kessler, 
314 Abbotsford Rd., Kenilworth 
Ill.; Mrs. Daryl Dennis, Rt. 5, 
Box 36, Owatomma, Minn.; Mrs. 
Larura Henderson, Walter H. 
Lehner, Lewis C. Hawkins, Jr., 
all Rt. 1, Tryon; Donald G. 
Wright, Rt. 2, Tryon; Bill 
McCraw, Lynn; Mrs. Sallie Jane 
Wilson, Rt. 1, Mill Spring; Arthur 
A. Atkins, Gene Owens, Supt. 
David A. Cromer, Columbus; 
Kyle Benkert, Mrs. J. C. 
Williams, Ray Skipper, Miss 
Lucy M. Phelps, Rt. 1, Columbus; 
Mrs. Arthur Westa, in care of 
Tillman, Box 308, Campobello, S. 
C.; J. B. Mayby, Rt. 1, 
Campobello; Fo-Fo-Th-Bo, 330 
Main St., Hendersonville; Mrs. 
Elsie Brown, Edward R. Inman, 
Rt. 1, Saluda; Mrs. R. H. 
Littlefield, Rt. 1, Box 414-A, 
Inman, S. C.; Mrs. Nell Fagan, 
Miss Nellie Belue, Mrs. Terry 
Hines, Rt. 1, Landrum; Thomas 
Harris, Wm. H. McClure, Rt. 2, 
Landrum.

Changes of address have been 
made for the following: Kenneth 
Smith from Sarasota, Fla. to 
Tryon; Miss Margaret Bullitt 
from Lake Lure to 306 Gypsy 
Lane, Wynnewood, Pa.; David G. 
Weber to 82 East Main St., 
Inman, S. C.; Mrs. Ernst Mahler 
from Delray Beach, Fla. to Rt. 2, 
Tryon; Valerie M. Thompson 
from Alexandria, Va. to Tryon; 
Don Fowlie to R.R. 3, Perth 
Ontario, Canada K7H; Miss 
Emily Edwards to Rt. 2, 213 
Hunter’s Trail, Greenville, S. C. 
29615.

Expanding
The Bureaucracy

While Congressmen talk of 
stopping inflation by reducing 
federal spending, a new bill in the 
House of Representatives pro­
poses to expand the federal 
payroll to an enormous degree.

This bill would encourage 
federal agencies to go in business 
for themselves whenever they 
felt they could produce the goods 
and services they use better than 
private business does.

Why would any agency head 
want to do that? It’s simple. The 
more people an agency head has 
working for him, the higher 
salary he gets.

Just two weeks ago the U. S. 
Small Business Administration 
completed a six-months study 
showing it costs taxpayers 50 
percent more for government 
agencies to produce the goods 
and services they use instead of 
buying them from small, private 
businesses.

So, we believe this new bill is a 
bad bill. It would increase the 
cost of goods and services that 
must be paid for with taxpayers’ 
money, and worse, it could 
destroy several thousand small 
buisnesses, putting their activi­
ties into the hands of politicans. 
— WRAL-TV Editorial

If Michigan’s rivers flowed in 
one continuous line, the stream 
would course 36,000 miles, 
National Geographic says.

LOST: Between Tryon P.O. 
and Arts Center, Friday night, a 
ladies white gold round wrist 
watch with a black leather band. 
Call 894-8608 or leave at Bulletin 
Office, adv. 18,c.
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WA-RITE
The Weight Control Program with a 

Common-Sense Approach
BEGINS MONDAY EVENING, MARCH 24,

7:30-9:00
Each Monday thereafter through June 9 

in the Tryon Seventh-day Adventist Church
Registration Fee, $20, Call 894-8212
DO IT NO W! SPACE IS LIMITED!

Baby-sitting service will be provided

Democratic Rally 
Friday, March 21st
On Friday, March 21st at 7:30 

p.m. the Democratic Women of 
Polk County will sponsor another 
Democratic Rally at the Polk 
County Courthouse. Oliver 
Greene, Chairman of the Polk 
County Democratic Executive 
Committee will be in charge of 
the program.

Bob Jones, who has served a 
number of terms as a member of 
the N. C. House of Representa­
tives will be the speaker. Mr. 
Jones is seeking election from the 
40th District which consists of 
Polk, Rutherford and Cleveland 
counties.

This will be the second 
Democratic Rally, the Democra­
tic Women of Polk County have 
sponsored for candidates who 
expressed a desire to meet here. 
George W. Breece, candidate for 
Secretary of State was the 
speaker at a recent rally. All 
local candidates and Democratic 
voters are invited. Refreshments 
will be served by the Democratic 
Women of Polk County.______
CHEESE! CHEESE! CHEESE!
New shipment of 2 yr. old New 
York Cheddar, yellow and white 
has just arrived. Also, a limited 
amount of Gruyere, Emmentaler 
and 4 different types of cheese 
balls. Mr. A’s Deli, 526 S. Trade 
St., Tryon, 859-9439. adv. 18, 20, 
21,c.

HOUSE PAINTING
Inside or Out

PAUL HYDER, 457-3512
“Free Estimates”


