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Weather Friday: high 63, low 
38. hum. 78%, precipitation 21; 
Saturday: high 76, low 44. hum. 
78%, precipitation .05: Sunday: 
high 83.low 49, hum 60% 
Monday was another summer- 
like day. The calendar says that 
it is still winter, but the 
temperature says differently

The Lithuanian parliament 
voted Sunday to break away from 
the Soviet Union and restore the 
independence the Baltic republic 
lost when it was forcibly annexed 
by the Kremlin 50 years ago

Georgia Tech defeated Virginia 
70 to 61 Sunday to win the ACC 
basketball tournament in 
Charlotte.

The Justice Department has 
begun a formal investigation of 
The Citadel Military College in 
Charleston to determine whether 
its policy of admitting only men 
violates’ the Constitution and 
laws against discrimination

Pam McKaig. daughter of Bill 
and Dot McKaig of Tryon is a 
patient at Duke University 
Medical Center and would love to 
hear from her friends Her 
address is Duke University 
Medical Center. N43 Nurses 
Station. Room 4315, Durham. 
N.C.27710.

The auditions for “When We 
Continued On Back Page

Phoenix Cable
To Wire Green Creek

Phoenix Cable will soon begin 
wiring the Sunny View area of 
Polk County, and has decided to 
extend its service down Rt. 9 to 
Green Creek and Sandy Plains. 
Phoenix assistant vice president 
Chuck Himelrick told The 
Bulletin Monday.

The company, which was 
approved by the county to 
operate in the Sunny View area 
last fall, operates Mountains 
Cablevision in Lake Lure.

Himelrick said his company 
has finished gelling permits to 
use the power poles in the Sunny 
View area from Duke Power and 
Rutherford Electric Association.

''We're just waiting for a 
(wiring) crew and some 
hardware." before Sunny View 
residents can begin getting cable 
service. Himelrick said

As for the Sandy Plains and 
Green Creek areas. Himelrick 
said he spent last Friday driving 
the area and has asked his staff to 
begin mapping the area for cable 
service.

The Green Creek Ruritan Club 
can largely take the credit The 
club members have been passing 
petitions asking Phoenix to 
extend its service. Petitions are 
out at Meg's Diner. Sandy Green 
Supermarket and at area 
churches.

"The big thing with a lot of 
people is sports, ESPN," said the
Rev. Chuck Rinehart, president 
of the Green Creek Ruri tans

Himelrick said when his staff
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Columbus Democrats
Columbus Democrat Precinct 7 

will meet March 15 at 8 p.m. at 
the Democrat Headquarters in 
Columbus All Democrats in 
Precinct 7 are invited.

Equestrian 
Field Day On 15th

An educational event being co­
sponsored by the Polk County 
Agricultural Extension Service 
and Foothills Equestrian Nature 
Center is planned for March 15. 9 
a.m. to3p.m. It will be held at the 
Foothills Equestrian Nature 
Center in the same area the 
Horse Management Seminar was 
held A wide variety of topics will 
be discussed. The information 
will be FREE and the day will 
provide an opportunity for you to 
plan a picnic!

The following topics are being 
planned: "Basic Hoof Care and 
Maintenance" by Hulen Howard; 
"Recognizing And Treating 
Founder and Laminitis" by Bob 
Drinnen; "Equine Pediatrics by 
Dr Jerry Dorsam. DVM; "Tack 
Care" by Nancy Lehner, and 
"Maintenance of Horse Fitness 
by Lydia Juenger. Of course, we 
will provide a break consisting of 
sticky buns, coffee and iced tea.

In order to ensure enough 
space and enough refreshments, 
you need to call the Extension 
Office If you want more specific 
information, or need to register, 
call Allyn Walker at 894-8218. 
Monday-Friday, 8:30-noon and 1- 
5p.m. — Reporter

Cherokee Eliminates
Polk County 102-92

The Cherokee Braves 
outscored the Polk County 
Wolverines 102 to 92 Saturday 
niglit in the 1-A Western Basket- 
ball Sectionals at Tuscola High 
School The Braves who are 20-6 
advance to the Western 
Regionalsat Hickory.

The Braves were hot as a 
firecracker as they scored 31 
points in the first quarter to lead 
31-22. The Wolverines spent the 
rest of the night trying to catch 
up. The Braves had five players 
and the Wolverines had four 
players in double figures. The 
Wolverines ended their season 
with a 21-6 record

The scoring was as follows: 
BOYS 1-A SECTIONAL FINALS

POLK COUNTY <92) — Dwight 
Canady 21, Kerry Miller 3, Travis 
Callahan 12, B.G. Edwards 12, 
Chauncey Barber. Carlo Wilkins 
19. Bob Gregory. Kyle Cunning 
ham 15, Sean Suber 5. Brian 
Taylor, Kevin Wood 5.

CHEROKEE (102) - T. Smith 
8. Buford Smith 21. Cooper, Sean 
Ross 21. Raines 4. Jody Davis 12. 
Jeremial Littlejohn 12. Jonah 
Wolfe 24.

Halftime; 49-38. Cherokee.

Duplicate Bridge
Results of the Tryon Duplicate 

Bridge played Thursday at the 
Meeting Place were as follows:

1st Tim and Louise Horne. 2nd 
Ed Delehanty and Andrew Leslie, 
3rd. Jeanette White and Pat Fiol. 
4th. Tracy Morris and Betty 
Czetwertynski.


