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The executive committee of the 
Southern Baptist Convention, 
meeting behind closed doors and 
protected by five armed guards, 
Tuesday voted to fire the two top 
editors of Baptist Press, the 
denomination’s news service. 
The dismissals are expected to 
inflame Baptist moderates and 
widen the split that has developed 
in the nation’s largest Protestant 
denomination.

Two strong aftershocks struck 
central Luzon Island in the 
Phillipines early Tuesday and 
more bodies were found two days 
after a devastating earthquake. 
The death toll topped 300.

Bo Jackson of the Kansas City 
Royals hit three homers and 
drove in seven runs but had to 
leave Tuesday night’s game in 
the sixth inning after injuring his 
left shoulder while diving for a fly 
ball.

James M. Meredith, a civil 
rights pioneer who now works for 
Sen. Jesse Helms, contended 
Tuesday that a cadre of white 
men control American blacks 
and their leaders. Meredith made 
the allegation when asked about a 
charge he made Monday that 
many of the delegates to last 
week’s NAACP convention are
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Hole-In-One
Roger Hardin of Landrum 

made his first hole-in-one 
Sunday, June 24th at the Link’s o' 
Tryon, Gowensville. He used a 7- 
iron to ace the 12th hole. He was 
playing with Lewis Jones, Tom 
Jones and Jerry Burns in the 
Jimmy Crain - J. L. Shields 
Memorial Golf Tournament.

Buys Lot
Buddy Moore has purchased a 

lot in Land O’ Lakes, Mill Spring 
from Nettie Black.

Mr. Moore works at Jimmy’s 
Boat & Storage as a boat 
mechanic. His hobbies include 
fishing, racing and football.

Myjna Viehman of First 
Real Estate was listing and 
selling agent.

Steeple Goes On
Wednesday morning the 

steeple went on the new building 
for Southside Baptist Church on 
Sunset Road in Landrum. The 
pastor of Southside Baptist is the 
Rev. Aaron Pruitt.

Honored
The Pisgah Legal Services 

newsletter for Summer 1990 has a 
picture of Phillip Feagan of 
Columbus. Mr. Feagan was one 
of six attorneys who were 
nominated for the 1990 Pro Bono 
Services Award of the N.C. Bar 
Association for their special 
volunteer efforts for the poor.

THURSDAY, JULY 19,1990

Young Citizen

Shown above is Ansley, she is 2 
years old and the daughter of 
Greg and Cheryl Lynn of Tryon.

Ground Breaking 
For Day’s Inn

There will be a ground 
breaking for Day's Inn Motel 
Thursday at 10 a.m. at the 
intersection of 1-26 and Hwy. 108 
in Columbus.

Genealogical Research
The W.N.C. Society for 

Genealogical Research will meet 
Saturday, July 28th at 9:45 a.m. 
in the Henderson County Library 
Auditorium. Norm Morrison, 
Latter Day Saints Church 
volunteer librarian, will use as 
his topic “Bridging Gaps." He 
will deal with connecting one 
generation to another 
genealogically. All interested 
persons are invited.

20C Per Cops

“Kevin Can Wait”
Sunday, July 22 at After 

Church-in-the-Park in the Tryon 
High Open Air Gym, the film, 
“Kevin Can Wait" will be shown 
at 9 p.m.

Jim Peterson had big plans 
about what he could accomplish 
for God; as a Christian TV talk- 
show host, or as the pastor of a 
large thriving church, or even as 
a pioneer missionary!

But in the middle of Jim’s big 
dreams, he neglected people 
around him — especially Kevin, a 
teenager who always seems to be 
left out of Jim’s “in” church 
youth group. “What’s so 
important about these people,” 
he wonders. Jim Peterson is 
about to find out. “Kevin Can 
Wait” will make you laugh and 
cry. It’s a film every Christian 
should see, because each of us 
can benefit from this prignant, 
humorous presentation of a key 
principle in the Christian life.

All teens and young people in 
the area are invited to attend this 
film. — Reporter

Mrs. Iona Fox, William Fox, 
Hattie Berry and Katherine 
Cannady have returned to their 
homes in Tryon alter attending 
the Berry-Bryant family runion 
in Charlotte. The reunion was 
attended by 5 generations from 7 
states including New York, New 
Jersey, Massachusetts, 
Tennessee, Alabama, North 
Carolina and South Carolina and 
was concluded in Tryon with 
gatherings at the homes of Mr. 
and Mrs. Prince Cannady, Mrs. 
Fox and Mrs. Berry.


