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The weather Tuesday: hieh 87. 
low 64, hum. 73 percent. As of 7 
a.m. Wed., .06 inches of rain had 
fallen.

Volunteers are being sought to 
spend a few hours cleaning up the 
inlets and shorelines of Lake 
Adger.

If you've ever had the pleasure 
of fishing the lake — one of 
Western North Carolina’s best 
kept secrets — you've probably 
been struck by the contrast 
between the beautiful scenery of 
this mountain lake and the 
ugliness of the litter along its 
shore.

Bays arc nearly filled up with 
styrofoam, old drums, and 
careless visitors' trash. Shoreline 
campgrounds bear the remains 
of parties — beer cans, bottles 
and trash.

Thankfully, there are hundreds 
of people who just want to clean 
all this up and put it right again.

In cooperation with The Big 
Sweep '90, a clean-up has been 
organized for Saturday, Sept 22. 
If you’d like to join in the fun and 
volunteer to restore Lake Adger’s 
beauty, meet at the Red Barn 
Boat Launch at 10 a.m. to recieve 
instructions and trash bags. Boat 
launching will be free.

Tickets are on sale for the
Continued On Back Page

County Sports
Contests scheduled today are:
The Polk County Varsity 

volleyball team meets East 
Rutherford at East Rutherford at 
4 p.m.

The Polk County Junior High 
School football team will play- 
East Rutherford at home at 5 
p.m.

The Polk County junior varsity 
football team meets Chesnee at 
home at 7 p.m.

The Polk County cross country 
team will compete at A.C. 
Reynolds in Asheville at 5 p.m.

The Polk County women’s 
varsity tennis team will compete 
at East Rutherford at 4 p.m.

Youth Services

Habitat Annual 
Meeting Sept, 19

The annual meeting of Thermal 
Belt Habitat for Humanity will be 
held Sept. 19 at 3 p.m. at the 
Tryon office of NCNB, it was 
announced by Woody Woodham, 
Thermal Belt Habitat president. 
The board of directors meeting 
will immediately follow. The 
public is invited to attend.

ACT Meeting
The Association of County 

Taxpayers of Polk County will 
meet Wednesday, Sept. 19th, at 
7:30 p.m. at Isothermal 
Community College - Polk 
Campus.

Candidates running for County 
Commissioners have been invited 
to speak on subjects of crucial 
|importance to Polk County.

Scott and Lisa Cooper of Forest 
City, will be conducting services 
on September 14, 15 and 16 at the 
Landrum Pentecostal Holiness 
Church on S. Randolph Street in 
Landrum. Appearing with Scott 
and Lisa will be Johnny, the full- 
time friend of this team. This 
ministry uses a combination of 
ventriloquism, singing and 
testimony to share the gospel of 
Jesus Christ. Services will begin 
at 7 p m. on Friday and Saturday 
and Sunday at 11 a.m. and 6:30 
p.m. Everyone welcome. For 
more information call Pastor 
Randall Yon, 457-4325. - 
Reporter__ ____

Red Fox Women’s Bridge
Results of the Red Fox 

Women's Bridge Tuesday, Sept. 
11th were as follows: 1st. Brenda 
Merkel, 2nd. Margaret Vance, 
3rd. Barbara Keffer.

New Arrival
Glen and Robin Plumley of 

Landrum are parents of a 
daughter, Erin Elizabeth, born 
Sept. 3 at Spartanburg Regional 
Medical Center. She weighed 10 
lbs. 9ozs. and is 22' । inches long.

Paternal grandparents, are 
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Plumley of 
Landrum

Maternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Bradshaw of 
Landrum. Great grandmother is 
Mrs. Lorena Wilson of Landrum.

Meeting Place Bridge
The results of the Tuesday 

Afternoon Meeting Place Bridge 
are as follows: 1st Babs Van 
Cleave, 2nd. Ethel Pfeiffer, 3rd 
Audrey Collins, 4th Gretchen 
Duryeti.


