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The weather Tuesday, high 
68, low 52, hum. 55 percent, 
and as of 7 a.m. Wednesday .80 
inches of rain had fallen. Two 
niches of rain fell over just the 
last few days. It was needed.

When people talk about signs, 
sometimes the argument gets 
around to one of supporting 
local business.

That's an issue that shouldn't 
have to be raised at all. We all 
need to be shopping at home 
first.

If your looking for anything, 
look in the Thermal Belt area. 
Local merchants count on local 
support first and foremost. If 
they don't get it, business suf­
fers, downtowns suffer and 
everyone suffers.

Support your local merchants.
What's happening:
The Columbus Town Council 

meets tonight at 7:30 at the 
Town Hall.

The Tryon Little Theater will 
present the courtroom 
drama/comedy "First Monday 
in October" about the Supreme 
Court tonight through Sunday.

The annual 4-H Awards 
program will be held tonight at 
6:30 at the 4-H & Youth Cen­
ter.

The third annual tour of 
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Lanford Running For 
Crippled Children

As one of North Carolina's 
top high school cross country 
athletes, Wolverine runner 
Cliad Lanford has been selected 
to participate in the Shrine 
Bowl Game Ball Run.

The run, a relay of the official 
Shrine Bowl football, will be 
held on Dec. 13, the day before 
the annual North Carolina/ 
South Carolina all-star football 
game. It will begin at the 
Greensboro Oriental Shrine 
Club and will conclude at 
Charlotte Memorial Stadium. 
Each of the 33 runners will run 
a 2-3 mile leg of the relay.

As a Shrine Bowl Game Ball 
runner, Lanford will be saluted 
at the Shrine Bowl Awards 
Banquet and will receive a spe­
cial warm-up jacket. He will 
also be a guest at the football 
game and may ride on the run- 
ers float in the pre-game par­
ade.
—Community Reporter

Communication
Dear Jeff:

The Smith-Kennedy trial 
reminds us of the famous case 
in the 20's when the state of 
Florida reversed its laws twice 
in one year. In the Florida case 
the legislature allowed him to 
take over his wife's estate and 
she was committed to an insti­
tution.
John Haney

THURSDAY, DEC. 5,1991

Jane L. Poller

Joins Mental
Health Staff

Jane Leone Poller has recently 
joined the staff of the Polk 
Mental Health Center. Poller 
will be working with children, 
adolescents and families as a 
clinical therapist and an in- 
home service specialist.

Poller received an M.A. in 
Counseling Psychology from 
the University of San Francisco 
and an M.S.W. from Syracuse 
University. She completed her 
doctoral coursework at Colum­
bia University where she was an 
Exxon and Sara Sturtevant fel­
lowship recipient.

Prior to her move to western 
North Carolina, Poller was a 
family therapist at Family Ser­
vices Associates in Syracuse. 
Earlier, she was Dean of Stu­
dent Affairs at Kirkland- 
Hamilton College, director of 
the Counseling Center Mary- 
mount College and Assistant
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New Arrival
Andrew and Lori Blackwell 

Lynch of Lyman, S.C. are par­
ents of a daughter, Kristen 
Nicole Lynch, bom Dec. 3rd at 
Spartanburg Regional. She 
weighed 2 lbs. 1 oz. She has 
two brothers, Mark and Scott 
Lynch.

Maternal grandparents arc 
Mrs. Brenda Parker of Colum­
bus and Jerry Blackwell of 
Tryon.

Paternal grandparents are Rev. 
and Mrs. George Washington 
Lynch of Mill Spring.
—Community Reporter

New Arrival
Rodney and Teresa Loman of 

Landrum arc parents of a 
daughter. Heather Rcnea, 6 lbs., 
11 oz. bom Nov. 29, 1991 at 
6:32 p.m. in a Tennessee hospi­
tal.

Maternal grandparents are 
Doris Levi, of Landrum and 
Franklin Levi of Spartanburg, 
S.C.

Paternal grandparents are 
Raymond and Shirley Maynard 
of Crossville, Tennessee and the 
late Ronald Loman of Battle 
Creek, Mich.
—Community Reporter

PTA Bingo
Green Creek Elementary PTO 

will sponsor Bingo Night Fri., 
Dec. 6 at 6 p.m. until in the 
school cafeteria.

Community Reporter


