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'ond Giants
Billy Dickey, the hottest

>itcher in the Winston-Salem
>emi-Pro League tossed a
our-hitter Sunday for his fifth
victory as the Pond Giants
opped the Indians 3-2 at
irnie Shore Field.
The ace righthander got all

he support he needed in the
irst inning as the Giants got
ill three of their runs on RBI
tingles by Ken Valentine and
lohn Spease.
The same two teams _will_
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( Edge By I
meet again this Sunday night
at 8 back at Ernie Shore Field.
Dickey is again scheduled to
pitch for the Giants. He will be
looking for his sixth win
without a loss. Mike Smith will
probably be the Indians
starter.

A home-run contest will
precede the game featuring
Ed Greene, John Spease, Ken
Valentine and Mars Shaw of"
the Giants and, Curtis

the I
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V-S Indians

Roseboro, James "Pookie"
Bailey, Charles Rice and Ted
Petree of the Indians.

***

In WSBL action last week
the Greensboro All-Stars
remained undefeated but were
tied by Stokesdale 7-7. The
All-Stars whipped Mount
Airy 8-1 in their other league
game.

The Pond Giants strengthenedtheir hold on second
place by beating the Braves
8-7, while the third place
knights split two games
nipping the Indians 2-1 and
losing to Stokesdale 2-1.

In other games, the fourth
place Indians shut out winless
Oak Ridge 6-0. The Braves
topped the Pirates 6-1 and
squeaked by Oak Ridge 6-5,
while Mount Airy beat the
Pirates 6-2.

State gets *

HEWGrant
The State has received a

$1,680,514 federal grant from
the Department of Housing
and Urban Development
(HUD) for fiscal year 1976-77
to assist all levels of planning
in the state. Governor Jim
Holshouser announced recently.
Under HUD's ComprehensivePlanning Program, the

funds will be shared hv
regional planning agencies,
large cities, counties, and
small communities throughout
the state.
Three large cities which

have chosen to receive grant
assistance through the state
are: Raleigh, $45,000; High
Point, $35,000; and Fayetteville,$22,000.

Fourteen of the 17 regional
planning agencies in the state
will be given a total of
$581,521 of the grant.
The N.C. Department of

Natural and Economic Resourceswill receive $540,000
which it will allocate to small
cities and counties. The
remaining $457,093 will fund
statewide planning activities
based in the Department of
Administration.
"Although funds under this

-program have been cut by
one-quarter nationally, North
Carolina fPrr't u<Jil >Ivr I
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percent less than it received
for the previous fiscal year.
Our state's activities in land
policy development, the Coasoverall

quality of planning
throughout the state account
for HUD's awarding North

- Carolina a grant at a rate
above the national average,"
said Governor Holshpuser.


