
Shaw Names 

Dr. Fields 

President 
At its meeting on Tuesday, 

July 13, the Executive Com- 
mittee of the Shaw University 
Board of Trustees designated 
Dr. Richard L. Fields as Act- 
ing President of the Universi- 
ty. Dr. Fields has been charg- 
ed with full responsibility for 
the overall management of the 
University. 

Dr. Fields, who joined the 
Shaw staff recently as Execu- 
tive Vice President, was for- 
merly Director of University 
Planning, Management and 
Evaluation at North Carolina 
A&T State University, Greens- 
boro. North Carolina. He has 
held previous administrative 
positions at Bennett College, 
as Director of Teacher Educa- 
tion and at Fayetteville State 
University, as Dean of the 
University. 

He has had extensive expe- 
rience as a teacher on the 
secondary and college level, 
and as consultant and lecturer 
at workshops and conference 
for several colleges and uni- 
versities, including Tuskegee 
Institute and the University of 
North Carolina at Chapel Hill. 

Dr. Fields is married to the 
former Gladys Westray and 
they have three children 
Richard Alan, Mark Lewis, 
and Tracy Antoinette. 

Pizza Huts 

Selects Foote, 

Cone, Belding 
Foote. Cone & Belding of 

Chicago has been selected as 
the national advertising agen- 
cy for Pizza Hut, Inc. and its 
nationwide franchise restau- 
rant system. 

The agency will be responsi- 
ble for the more than $6 
million national account effec- 
tive September 1, 1976. The 
Pizza Hut Advertising Com- 

_ mittee, comprised of two com- 

pany and two franchise repre- 
sentatives, was responsible 
for managing the agency 
screening and selection pro- 

-SS. 

More than 60 national amh- 
regional agencies were ini- 
tially evaluated by Pizza Hut 
after the seven-year associa- 
tion with Noble-Dury and As- 
sociates was terminated in 
April. Six agencies were inter- 
viewed before the list was 

pared to three in late June. J. 
Walter Thompson (Chicago) 
and Tracy-Locke (Dallas) 
joined FCB as the final three 
under consideration. The 
three made presentations the 
week of July 5 based upon 
specific assignments from the 
Pizza Hut Ad Committee. 

FCB, including the Chicago 
office, consists of 21 wholly- 
owned advertising agencies in 
13 countries. Its 1975 billings 
amount was $385 million. The 
1975 Chicago office accounted 
for $107 million. 

In making the announce- 

ment, Pizza Hut's Sam Mey- 
ers, Vice President of Adver- 
tising and Market Planning 
and International Pizza Hut 
Franchise Holders Associa- 
tion President, Dan Heese, 
said, "All three finalists did an 
excellent job of handling the 
Ad Committee's assignments 
with originality and insight. 

There are 2,381 Pizza Hut 
restaurants in 47 stc'»s and II 
foreign markets. 

CONTINENTAL τ railway 

RETIREE ELMIRA COLEMAN LAW- 
■ RENCE, 3rd from left, front row, smiles as 

she poses with co-workers and boss, D.T. 
Blackwelder, 2nd from left, front row, on last 

day of work for Continential Trailways at 8th 
and Smith Streets last Friday. Photo by 
Peeler 

With Continental 1 raUways 

Mrs. Elmira C. Lawrence 

Ends 25 Years Of Services 
Mrs. Elmira Ccjeman Law- 

rence, 60, of Tanktown Road, 
Matthews, N.C. worked her 
last day as a member of the 
Cleaning Department of Con- 
tinental Trailways last Fri- 
day. 

The mother of 5 children, 
grandmother of 9, and widow 
of the late Robert "Dutch" 
Lawrence says she would 
have worked for Continental 
Trailways, "off and on" for 25 
years this coming September" 
and she hates to leave. 

"I'm going to miss the girls, 
they are all very nice they all 
call me "Ma" or "Granny", 
says Mrs. Lawrence who 
worked with "8 girls and 4 
men" in the cleaning depart- 
ment headed by Foreman D. 
T. Blackwelder who she says 

"is the best bossman in Char- 
lotte." 

Mrs. Lawrence says failing 
health, "back trouble, sugar, 
and Jiigh blood pressure" 
caused her to leave and she 
now wants to work with child- 
ren in a hospital and do 
missionary work. 

She says she plans to spend 
more time in her yard working 
with her flowers. "I love all 
flowers but I like azeleas 
most", she said. 

She says she doesn't plan to 
do much traveling, adding, 
"I've been to New York 5 to 6 
times and to Johnston, Pa. 3 or 

5 times- on my bus pass", 
which allows her to travel 
free. 

Retiree Lawrence came to 
Continential Trailways in 1953 

at a salary of "50 or 75 cents 
an hour": when she left last 
Friday she was earning (3.37 
per hour. 

Mrs. Lawrence's children 
are: Lola Lawrence, 42, of 
Matthews: Lula Mae Brown, 
40, of Charlotte; Robert Lewis 
Lawrence, 38, of Charlotte; 
Leroy Lawrence, 35, of John- 
ston, Pa.; and Melvin Douglas 
Lawrence, 25, of Charlotte. 

She is a member of Mt. 
Moriah Baptist Church of Mat- 
thews, pastored by Rev. J.C. 
Robinson, where she has been 
a member for 46 years and has 
served as President of the 
Missionary Circle for 10 years, 
Beginners Sunday School 
Teacher for 22 years, Vice 
President of the Missionary 
Circle for 5 years, and sung on 
the choir for 4 years. 

Keid r amily Gathers Here For Reunion 
The Keid family reunion 

'was held recently at Metropo- 
litan Church with approxi- 
mately 200 members and 
friends in attendance. 

The affair began with out of 
town members arriving from 
as far away as Michigan. 
Everyone was excited and 
thrilled at the opportunity of 
seeing family and friends a- 

gain. 
Thomas Wolfe said, "you 

can never go home again; that 
the baby bird can never return 
to the nest of his fathers; that 
when you leave you may as 
well take all your memories 
and all your fantasies with 
you." 

The Reids proved him 
wrong with the success of 
their reunion. 

Born to the marital union of 
the late Jane and Charlie Keid 
were 14 children. Those at- 
tending the reunion were Her- 
man, Charlie, Cora Reid Ca- 
routhers, Mattie Reid Kearns, 
and Viola Reid Grier with 
their children and grandchild- 
ren. 

Mrs. Helen Price, Mrs. Lula 
Watson, and Mr. Olin Carou- 
thers were the coordinators of 
the reunion. 

The grandchildren were re- 

sponsible and participated in 
(he program which consisted 

initially of a welcome to fami- 
ly and friends by Kevin Carou- 
thers, who was the emcee. 

Family and friends sang 
"Come Thou Almighty King". 
The scripture was chosen and 
read by Bertram Hogue 
Genisis. 17:10-18. Prayer was 
lead by Rev. H O. Graham, 
the minister of Metropolitan 
Presbyterian Church. 

"Lift Every Voice and Sing" 
was in tribute to the family 
sung by Beverly Hogue Sim- 
mons, Karen Massey, Brigette 
Carouthers, Sabrinia Grier, 
Kevin Carouthers, Eric Wat- 
son, Perry Carouthers, John 
ΕϋβΒΒΜϋηΐιΐΜ- ■ 

Price Jr., and Tony Watson. 
Bertram Hogue and Zebria 

Neal sung "The Impossible 
Dream" after which a history 
of the Reid family was given 
by Jennie Mae Thompson. 
Dinner was served imme- 
diately following grace by 
Çlimmie Watson, Jr. 

The reunion next year will 
be hosted by the Grier family. 
™"Keep^OU^^niHoPTown^ 
friends informed on what's 
happening in Charlotte by 
sending them"«à i;upy of the 
Charlotte Post each week. The 
cost is only $8.00, plus tax per 
year. 
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O'Herron Wants Adequate Method 

Of Evaluating State Τeachers 
North Carolina must take 

any steps necessary to provide 
a fair and adequate method of 
evaluating teachers to deter- 
mine their qualifications to 
teach in the public schools, Ed 
O'Herron, Democratic candi- 
date for Governor, said. 

He was commenting on 

news stories reporting that the 
State has asked a federal 
court to reverse its 1975 ruling 
that the requirement of a 

minimum score on the Na- 
tional Teacher examination 
for teachers certification was 

unconstitutional. The 1975 rul- 
ing was that the State's use of 
the ΝΤΕ discriminated 
against blacks and other mi- 
norities because more blacks 
than whites failed to make the 
minimum score, 950 out of a 

possible 1,800. The N.C. Attorn 
ney General's office now con- 
tends that a recent Supreme 
Court ruling contradicted the 
action in the North Carolina 
ΝΤΕ case. 

"Perhaps the ΝΤΕ isn't the 
best way to measure a teach- 
er's qualifications", O'Herron 
said, "though I wonder if 
educators wouldn't by nature 
be better judges of that than 
courts. As long as one court 
has ruled against the ΝΤΕ, it 
is imperative that the State 
take steps to provide a test 
that meets constitutional as 

well as educational standards. 
"I am sure that the educa- 

tors of North Carolina, in the 
colleges as well as in the 
public schools, can come up 
with a proper evaluation. Un- 
til this is done, we have no way 
of gauging a teacher's compe- 
tence, other than in college 
transcripts and in interviews. 
The real worth of the tran- 

script could well vary from 
campus to campus, and the 
skill of the interviewing offi- 
cial could vary from school 
system to school system. The 
result could be disastrous for 
children who might be in 
classrooms with inferior 
teachers, while better qualifi- 
ed teachers were still looking 
for jobs." 

O'Herron pointed out that 
the State Board of Education 
worked out a system of teach- 
er certification some years 

ago, but that the General 
Assembly had then reinstated 
the ΝΤΕ cutoff score. 

"I realize that development 
of a valid and fair evaluation 
could take several years." 
O'Herron said. "But we can 
begin the task now, and I will 
ask the 1977 General Assem- 
bly to come up with one to be 
used until detailed studies can 

Sacred Heart's 

Fund Raising 
Tops $300,000 

Fund raising at Sacred 
Heart College topped the $300. 
000 mark for the 1975-76 fiscal 
year. This figure is 35 percent 
higher than last year and 252 
percent greater than fiscal 
year 1973-74. 

The increase in external 
support was noted in all areas 

including contributions from 
alumni, Trustees and Visitors, 
corporations, foundations, and 
other friends. The monies 
were primarily designated for 
building renovation, scholar- 
ships for needy students, the 
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and unrestricted uses. 

According to John Heiber- 
ger, vice president for Institu- 
tional Relations, the college is 
ahead of schedule in reaching 
the October goal of its half- 
million dollar "Commitment 
Campaign" being chaired by 
Hugh McColl, president. of 
NCNB. Among the gifts to the 
College is a $170,000 challenge 
grant from the DeRance foun- 
dation which must be matched 
in the next six months. 

"We want everyone to know 
of our success in receiving 
external support", said Sister 
Michel, president of Sacred 
Heart, "because it is a tribute 
to the worth of the College, its 
programs, and the many peo- 
ple who have worked so hard; 
but, and I emphasize but, we 

cannot let up now. We must 
double our efforts if we are to 
reach our goal in terms of 
dollars and, most importantly, 
in terms of the programs they 
make possible." 

be completed." 
O'Herron pointed out that 

the Board of Governors of the 
University of North Carolina 
is planning a year long study 
of teacher training in all the 
State's institutions of higher 
education, including the pri- 

I 

vate campuses. This study, he 
said, "will give us a better 
idea of what training is now 

being given, what changes 

should be made in this field, 
and what methods of evaliiâ- 
ting prospective teachers 
would be best." 
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Vauable Coupon 

FREE 

Foot Long 
Hot dog 

With Every Roll Of Wallpaper 
In Stock Paper And All Book 

W Orders ! 

I Coupon Good For 
3 Months 

0 Expires October 15 th ! 

Mouse Of Wallpaper 
Λ 3158 Freedom Dr. 394-0911 " 

Open uoily 10-9, Sun. 1 6 

PEELER'S PORTRA/ ' STUDIO υ 

fi 
FIRST.. 
For Fine 

Photography 
2224 Brnttiftt 

Ford Rd. 
Charlotte, IN. C. 

392-2028 
or 

392-0945 

★ Wedding* 
In Natural (.«lor 

★ <4ψ & Gown 
Photo* 

*Nrw« Photography 

★ Group Function* 

★ Restoration 

★ Portrait* 

★ Copies 

A-l & KEY SERVICE INC. 

Bonded Locksmith ν 

Keys Fitted To Locks House 61 Car Keys 
CAROLINA MALI. 

CONCORD, N. C 2·02Β 
7θβ·βθ13 

TRYON MALL 

CHARLOTTE. N. C 28213 

307 0012 

Book Sellers to America since 178a 

Çxrkesbury 
Serving United Methodic. United Church of 
Christ, United Presbyterian and other deno- 
minations with the best in church ?»nd church 
school supplies. 

S409 South Boulevjrri 
C hjrlotte North Cjrolinj 28210 

704 52S-4543 
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YOU CAN BE TI1EWOMAN YOU WANT TO BE 

30 MINUTES IN AIR 
CONDITIONED COMFORT 

IS ALL IT TAKES FOR 
SHAMPOOING SET 

SCALP CONDITION 
FOR UNRULY HAIR 

CALL 333-6331 TODAY 
FOR AN APPOINTMENT 

TALFORD BEAUTY 
WORLD 

1120 BEATTIES FORD ROAD 

SEE Mr. "T"or Mrs. Talford 

CHARLOTTE'S FINEST 
TRY OUR CREAM RELAXER 

Open fron^^Twëekdays From 8 7Saturday 
Closed on Monday 

4 I MU» f 

** ELDER'S SUPER MARKET * * 
THREE CONVENIENT LOCATIONS 

Store no. 1 
Store no. 2 Store no. 3 -1 

2606 W. Boulevard 2115 Beatties Ford Road 100 Park Avenue 
WE ACCEPT USD A FOOD STAMPS, WIC MID 

Heavy Western Beef 

Chuck Roast 

63° u,. 

Freeh Lean 

Ground Beef 

59' k- 

·.·>) 

Grade A Whole 

Fryers 
43° »>■ 

Fun Buddy 
12°®· ι#-* :: 

Franks v*&· 1 t 
64 oz. Pepsi, Mu Dew, Tru-Aid 69° 

Aset flavors 

3 46οι. Cane 

Hi-C 
With flO QQc 
purchase 

Cri"p wt ) 
Lettuce 
29° Head 

Shurfresh Frozen 

Orange Juice 
2 For 39C 

Golden DeL 

Apples 
23e 

We 

Redeem 

Food Stamps 
J "J J 

California 

Potatoes 

12 lb. 

1 

ό id. nag 

Shurfine 
"ι 

Sugar 

Giant Size 

OR Tide 99° With $10.00} 
■» * 

Groc, Order ~\ 


