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| Sapphire-Whitewater Given 
Honorable Mention Saturday 
Brevard Rotarians To Have 
Yule Party At Glen Cannon 

Brevard Rotarians will en- 

tertain their Rotary Annes at 
♦v«ir annual Christmas party 
.text Monday night, Dec. 14th, at 
the Glen Cannon Country club. 

The banquet meeting will be- 
gin promptly at 7:00 o’clock, 
and all Rotarians are urged to 
bring their wives to this gala 
event. 

Dr. Wilburn Davis will be in 
charge of arrangements. 

At the regular weekly meet- 
ing of the club on Monday in 
Gaither’s Rhododendron room. 
Dr. Davis told of plans for the 
big Asheville-Kemper Golf clas- 
sic at Etowah Valley next June. 

He said that many Rotarians 
were already assisting with 
plans and he emphasized that 
the event would be a big attrac- 
tion for Brevard and Transyl- 
vania county. 

Walter Holland, the im- 
mediate past president, pre- 
sided over Monday’s meeting. 

Penrose P-TA 
Meets Monday 
The Penrose P-TA will meet 

Monday evening, December 
14th, at 7:30 o’clock in the 
school cafeteria. 

The program, “What Christ- 
mas Means”, will be presented 
by Miss Joan Mills and Mrs. 
Jean Dees. Students from all 
classes will participate. 

All parents and interested 
persons are urged to attend. 

COMFORTING — Swirl’* 
“Wear-Now” coatshirt from 
the Spectator collection is in 
tones of gold and brown on 
polyester and cotton. 

Adults between the ages of 21 
and 35 litter three times as 

much as people over fifty and 
twice as much as those in the 
35-49 age bracket, says Keep 
America Beautiful. 

When you think of pretcrip 
tions, think of VARNER’S, adv. 

By Hester Hasten 

SAPPHIRE WHITEWAT- 
ER — Sapphire Whitewater 
Community won an honorable 
mention at the Awards Lunch- 
eon in Asheville on Saturday, 
Dec. 5. Attending the lunch- 
eon from Sapphire were Mrs. 
Dorothy McNeely and daugh- 
ter, Jean and Gail, Mr. and 
Mrs. Erik D. Hansen, Miss 
Cindi Rock, Mrs. Hester Han- 
sen, and Mr. and Mrs. Oakley 
Farver. 

It is not too late to enroll in 
the upholstery class that is be- 
ing held each Tuesday and Fri- 
day evening at the Sapphire- 
Whitewater Community center. 
This is proving an interesting 
project for husband-and-wife 
teams. The classes are from 
7:00 to 10:30 p.m. 

We express our appreci- 
ation to the Highway Depart- 
ment for repairing road 
shoulders and installing guard 
rails at the top of Toxaway 
Falls. This will make a much 
safer bridge crossing come 

tourist season. 

Ken and Laura Wilson have 
leased the sandwich shop at Mt. 
Toxaway Lodge and will have it 
opened officially the latter part 
of this week even though they 
are already serving, along with 
redecorating. 

They will serve breakfast and 
lunch during the week and per- 
haps will serve dinners on week- 
ends if there is sufficient de- 
mand during the skiing season. 

This is a much needed accom- 
modation in our community and 
we thank the Wilsons for bring- 
ing it to us. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to express our heart- 

felt gratitude to our many 
friends and neighbors for the 
beautiful flowers, food and 
many other acts of kindnesses 
at the death of our son and 
brother Danny Tinsley. May 
God bless each and everyone of 
you. 

Mr. Joe and Louise Tinsley 
and family 

BREVARD HARDWARE 
Christmas Check List 

FOR MOM: 
Club Aluminum 
Waring Blenders 

Farbarware 
Corning Ware 

G.E. or 

Sunbeam 
Appliances 
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SPECIAL 
Your Choice 

Toasters 
Irons 

Scissors 
Electric Socks 

$088 

FOR DAD: 
Sportsman Blanket Gun Rack 

Black & Decker Tools S K Wayne Tools 
Tool Boxes 

FOR TEENS: 
Study Lamps 

Pop Corn Poppers 
Electric Curlers 

Make-Up Mirrors 
Bulletin Boards 

CHILDREN: 
Table Tennis 

Wagon 
Tricycles 

Radios 

KNOW YOUR 

PIPES 
PIPE DREAM 

4- PLASTIC PH 
LIGHTWEIGHT, 
EASILY MSTAUJD. 
USB) MOSTLY 
outdoors. 
RESISTS COLO 
BUT NOT MAT. 

/ Lvs? 
THREADED, 
GALVANIZED PIPE 
NOT EXPENSIVE, 
BUT SCALE AND 
CORROSION CAN 
BUHDUP. 

RIGID COPPER 
P*E-EXCELLENT 
FOR HOT A COLD 
WATER LINES. 
JOINTS ARE 

BENDS WITH- 
OUT RHINOS. 
ALLOWS 
EAST 
PLOW. _ 

Menus For Lunchrooms Next 

Week Are Announced Today 
Menus for Transylvania Coun- 

ty Schools for the week be- 
ginning Thursday, December 
10th through Thursday, Decem- 
ber 17th. 

Thursday — Beef/vegetable 
soup, saltines, peanut butter 
sandwich, fresh or chilled fruit, 
yellow cake w/chocolate icing, 
milk, butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Beef/vegetable soup-saltines or 
meat loaf w/rice and gravy, 
frozen baby limas, french bread 
toast fresh or chilled fruit, 
yellow cake w/chocolate icing 
or jello w/topping 

Friday—Frankfurter w/chili, 
mustard, onions, pickle slices, 
baked potato, basic cole slaw, 
finger rolls, chocolate pudding, 
milk and butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Frankfurter /chili or oven fried 
liver, hot rolls, chocolate pud- 
ding or chilled apricots 

Monday — Spaghetti, french 
bread, tossed salad, peach crisp, 
milk, butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Spaghetti french bread or hot 
submarine sandwich w/french 
fries, peach crisp or chocolate 
rolled wheat cake 

Tuesday — Dried beans, on- 

ions, relish or pickle slices, con- 
fetti slaw, peach or pear half, 
crispy cornbread, banana pud- 
ding, milk, butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Dried beans or ham-lettuce sand- 
wich w/french fries, banana 
pudding or two-color jello 

Wednesday — Sloppy Joe 
w/bun, french fries, catsup, 
green beans, fruit salad w/cot- 
tage cheese, prune or other 
cake, milk, butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Sloppy Joe w/bun or tuna 
roodle casserole, hot rolls, 
prune or other cake or choco- 
late brownie 

Thursday — Southern fried 
chicken, rice, gravy, buttered 
green peas, jellied citrus fruits, 
Huffy biscuits, brown sugar 
cookie, milk, butter 

Jr. and Sr. High Schools — 

Southern fried chicken w/rice 
and gravy or barbecue w/bun, 
brown sugar cookie or apple 
crisp 

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of George Liverett 

wish to thank the friends and 
neighbors for their kindness 
shown during our recent be- 
reavement. 

The Liverett Family 

_ 

BOOK REVIEW 
PROM THE 

FRANSYLVaNIA COUNTY LIBRA! 

FOR FRIENDS OF THE LIBRARY 

CALK by Sylvia Wilkenson 

Sylvia Wilkenson, one of 
North Carolina’s major living 
authors, has had her third novel 
published recently. 

CALE, the title of the book 
and the name of the herov is a 
much longer book than the 
earlier KILLING FROST and 
MOSS ON THE NORTH SIDE. 
It is both easier to understand 
and less interesting than the 
earlier works. The setting is a 
farm in middle North Carolina 
from 1940 to 1958, from the 
birth of Cale Jenkins until his 
senior year in high school. The 
incidents in the book ring true 
to every North Carolinian who 
has lived in the country. The 
dialogue is real and the atti- 
tudes of the characters, both 
white and black, are exactly and 
skillfully depicted. 

Falissa, Gale’s mother, mar- 
ries Jerome Jenkins, a some- 
what rough red-neck fanner 
whom her dainty mother and 
gentle father feel is not quite 
up to their station in life. She 

is a hard working, sober, in- 
tense woman, never deviating 
from her duty as wife, mother 
and house-keeper. Cain’s sister, 
Pearlie Mae, is touched by the 
sympathy for the Negro libera- 
tion just being felt in the rural 
South. 

Cale himself is pulling away 
from tobacco farming. Endowed 
with keen intelligence and a 
love of building houses be 
knows college is completely out 

of the question for him and n 
rebelliously waiting out U 
school year until graduation. j 

There is little drama in the 
book, although some of the fact 
dents are frightening and somg 
comic. The land, the everyday 
life of the Jenkins family and 
their blade tenants are the staff 
all rural Southerners are made 
of, and as such are part of the 
South, America, and its joys end 
problems. 

Action Group Approved To 

Operate Emergency Food 
And Medical Operations 

Western Carolina Community 
Action, Inc., has been approved 
by the Division of Human Re- 
sources, Department of Local 
Affairs, Raleigh, North Caro- 
lina to operate an Emergency 
Food and Medical Services Pro- 

Lutherans To Light Christmas 
Tree At Service On December 20 
Plans are being completed 

for the annual lighting of the 
Christmas Tree at Good Shep- 
herd Lutheran church, corner 
of North Broad street and Fish- 
er road, according to announce- 

ments released by Mrs. 0. A. 
Hofmann, president of the Luth- 
eran Church Women. 

The service will begin at 5:00 
o’clock on Sunday afternoon, 
December 20th, and a special 
invitation is being given to 
members of all church groups 
in the community to attend this 
beautiful and impressive Cris- 
mon Service. 

Instead of making use of the 
usual lights and ornaments, the 
tree will be decorated with spe- 

dal ornaments which the 
women of the church have 
made and will be placed on the 
tree during the service. 

The word Chrismon is a 
combination of the first parts 
of two words, Christ and mono- 
gram. Thus the tree, when 
completely decorated, becomes 
a visible witness of the Lord, 
telling what He is like, what He 
has done. Many of the designs 
which will be used are centuries 
old, some as old as the Bible 
itself and are thus the heritage 
of all Christians. 

Following this service, there 
will be a period of fellowship 
to which an worshippers are 
cordially invited. 

cram in Henderson end Tran* 
sylvania Counties. This program 
is funded to operate from Do* 
cember 1. 1970 to May 31,1973. 

The Emergency Food an4 
Medical Services Program will 
issue vouchers to persons need* 
ing food on an emergency basis. 
Medical vouchers will also be 
issued for illnesses that are 
food related upon referral froni 
a doctor or the Health Deport- 
ment. 

Persons needing emergency 
food services should contain 
Western Carolina Community 
Action, Inc., in Brevard or Hen* 
dersonville. The Brevard phons 
number is 883-6151. In Henden 
sonville, the number is 692- 
5295. 

For Rubber Stamps* 
The SB? 

Transylvania Times: 

883-4250 4 
---* 

Brevard Carpet Shop 
100 S. Broad St. 883-3850 Brevard, N. C. 

Featuring Brand Names Like 

WonaJ, & M*. OtL» 
VISIT AND SEE OUR NEW LINE OF 

ath Room & Car Carpets 
FIVE COLORS IN STOCK 


