
SOUTHERN PINES 
By Jerry V. Healy 

Shields Cameron and Herbert 

Cameron, flying the colors of the 

Cameron clan, are in Fayette- 
ville for a few days to participate 
in the ceremonies commemorat- 

ing the 200th anniversary of the 
Scottish settlement of the Cape 
Fear Country. Together with 

many other members of the Clan 

Cameron they will march in the 

parade of the Highland Scotch 
clans. 

A number of musically minded 

people from Southern Pines and 

vicinity will journey to Raleigh 
tonight to listen to the John 

Charles Thomas recital at the 

auditorium. Attending with Mrs. 

L. D. McDonald, will be Mrs. 

Charles Picquet, Mrs. J. D. Sit- 

terson, Mrs. P. P. Pelton, Miss 
Iris Tate and Miss Blanche Sher- 
man. 

The Civic Club announces a 

full and varied program- for this 
week. Tonight Chief Blackbird, 
Chippewa brave from Wisconsin, 
will present authentic interpre- 
tations of American Indian 
songs, stories and dances. His 

*fsong and dance” will start at 
8:00 o’clock at the Civic Club. 

Friday morning at 9:30 the la- 
dies of the Club will hold a food 
sale, proceeds of which will go 
toward the building fund. The 
sale will be conducted by Mrs. 
Ernest Morell, Mrs. Wade Ste- 

vick, Mrs. William E. McCord and 
Mrs. L. D. McDonald. A benefit 

bridge will follow in the after- 
noon at 2:30. Mrs. James J. 

Spring and Mrs. Edward Horne 
will be in charge. 

Mrs. John G. Erhardt is antic- 

ipating the arrival of Mr. and 
Mrs. N. P. Davis of Washington, 
D. C. Mr. and Mrs. Davis will 

spend several days with Mrs. 
Erhardt at her home on Wey- 
mouth Heights. 

Committee Chairman B. C. 

Doyle stated today that much 

progress has been made by the 
Welfare Committee of the Junior 
Chamber of Commerce toward 

furnishing needed families in 
and around Southern Pines with 

clothes, fuel and other necessi- 
ties of life. However, the sur- 

face has only been scratched and 
there is much work to be done. 

Together with Boy Scout Troop 
No. 4, which is ably assisting 
them, they ask for your hearty 
support. 

WANTED 

Male, Instruction. Would like to 
hear from reliable men we can 

train to overhaul, install and ser- 

vice Air Conditioning and Re- 

frigerating Equipment. Must 
be mechanically inclined. No in- 
terference with present occupa- 
tion, For interview write at 
once, giving name, address, age. 
Utilities Inst., XI Pinehurst Out- 
look, Box 591. 

McLEAN’S 

Sportswear, Street Dresses, Evening 
Gowns, Lingerie and Accessories 

Children’s and Infant’s Wear 
SOUTH STREET ABERDEEN, N. C. 

’s How We Operate 
'STANDARD' ^ 

Esso 
DEALER 

Before applying a grease gun to your 
§ 

car, the official chart for your make and 
year is consulted, then followed accu- 

rately in lubricating every point. No 
guess-work with our Verified Lubrication 

Blount’s Esso Station 
On Highway No. 1 Aberdeen 
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Up yonder the road a piece 

i/s rather a unique tourist home. 

To many of us living here in the 

Sandhills it is, and has always 
been known as “Skyline.” As a 

habitation for tourists traveling 
the broad highway ‘tween points 
north and south of here there 

are few comparisons. In addi- 
tion to its beautiful location and 
the congenial hospitality shown 
the tired and wearied traveler, 
Skyline houses within its four 
walls a varied and unique collec- 

tion of rare antiques, assembled 
from many countries. Conduct- 

ed by Mr. and Mrs. Arch Cole- 

man, Skyline bids you welcome. 

As something offside and dif- 

ferent, but costing not a wee 

penny, John Ormsby, manager of 
the Southern Pines Bowling Al- 

leys, will allow two free games 
of bowling to. the two parties 
whose names are mentioned from 

time to time in this column. Out 

of the grab basket we have — 

Miss Katherine Buchan and Miss 

Iris Tate. 
Mrs. Arthur Woodbury and 

her niece, Barbara Arbour, en- 

route from Baltimore to New 

Orleans stopped over to see Mr. 

and Mrs. Frank Viall. 

Southern Pines Building & 

Loan officials attended a District 

meeting of North Carolina Build- 
ing and Loan associations yes- 

terday at Fayetteville. Attend- 

ing the afternoon discussion and 

informal evening dinner meeting 
were President A. S. Ruggles, 
secretary-treasurer Ralph Chan- 

dler and directors, Howard 
Burns, J. D. Arey and Frank Wil- 
son. 

Mrs. G. J. Hardwick and Miss 

Betty Hardwick of Augusta, Ga., 
and Mrs. L. L. Willet of Port 

Washington, N. ^Y., were guests 
at the Woodworth for a few 

days. Mr. and Mrs. George M. 
Schettler of Detroit, Mich., were 

recent arrivals. 

The Junior Chamber of! Com- 
merce met at the Southern Pines 

Country Club on Monday even- 

ing, the. occasion of their month- 

ly dinner meeting. An attend- 
ance of 25 enjoyed the entertain- 
ment provided by Chief Black- 
bird following the dinner. 

Yesterday at the Club the Will- 

ing Workers of the Baptist 
Church entertained at a Silver 
Tea for 30 guests. Mrs. F. M. 
Gardner and Mrs. Louis Schiep- 
ers pouredv 

Mr. and Mrs. H. G. McElroy, 
announce the birth of a son, at 

Moore County Hospital, Sunday. 
The child weighed nine pounds, 
nine ounces, and has been named 

H. G. Jr. 

Advertise in The Outlook 

Crystal Lassies Show Is 
Just A Broken Mirror 

FORUM SPEAKER HAS 
PERSONALITY CHARM 
THAT WINS AUDIENCES 
John Temple Graves ll is Noted 

As Writer and Economist; 
Newspaperman Has Written 
Books, Primarily on South 

John Temple Graves II, who 

will inaugurate the Pinehurst 
Forum series with a lecture on 

a topic to be chosen, is a bril- 

liant, entertaining and thorough- 
ly authoritative lecturer. Mr. 

Graves was heard here last year 
as the guest speaker for the 
Southern Rotarians convention. 

Mr. Graves, at present associ- 

ate-editor of the Birmingham 
Age-Herald, was educated at 

Princeton University and George 
Washington University, and is 

the holder of many honorary de- 

grees from other well-known in- 

stitutions. A Georgian by birth, 
Mr. Graves* ability as a newspa- 
per man and economist have led 

him far afield. As early as 1919 

he was sent to the Peace Com- 

mission in Paris as assistant to 
Edward N. Hurley. He was 

named as one of the outstanding 
economists on the .Federal Trade 

Commission in Washington, 
where he served from 1919 to 

1925. 

Starting on the editorial stall 
of the old New York Journal, Mr. 
Graves was later editor of the 

Palm Beach Times and the Jack- 
sonville Journal. Sandwiched in 

between these activities, Mr. 

Graves has found time to write 

several, books, primarily about 
the South, and win a Middle At- 

lantic States Tennis champion- 
ship to boot. 

As newspaper man, economist, 
and author he has long been well 
established, but it is by dint of 
his wit and dynamic personality 
that he has endeared himself to 
his Southern audiences. This will 

be, insofar as we know, his first 
address to the ex-patriate North- 
erners wintering in Pinehurst. 

Mr*. Graves will speak Thurs- 
day evening, December 7 at the 

Country Club immediately fol- 

lowing the Club’s regular Thurs-J 
day night buffet supper. 

At this point we can’t help 
telling about the reaction of one 

young lady in Pinehurst when 
she heard he was coming. Al- 

though any type of lecture doubt- 
less still held for her all the ter- 
rors of a college classroom, she 

unhesitatingly exclaimed, “Dd 
listen to that man, even if he 

spoke on alfalfa-growing.” Al- 

though'as yet we don’t know ex- 

actly what his subject will be, we 

feel fairly safe in announcing 
that it will not be alfalfa-grow- 
ing. 

Ted Turner Arrives 
At Pine Needles 

Ted Turner, Pine Needles golf 
professional, arrived at Knoll- 
wood yesterday ready for his sea- 

son’s duties. Ted, who is pro- 
fessional at the Pine Valley 
Country Club, New Jersey, dur- 

ing the summer months, makes 
a strong addition to the profes- 
sional golfing talent located in 
the Sandhills. 

Turner had a good tournament 

season, having finished second in 
the Philadelphia open and sec- 

ond in the Pine Valley Invitation- 
al tournament held early this 
month. He led the Philadelphia 
qualifying round for the nation- 
al open at .Overbrook with a card 
of 141. 

Ted is on his game at present 
and plans to go to Miami for 
the Miami-Biltrflore $10,000 
open, first event on the winter 
tournament schedule. This event 
is scheduled for December. 

) 
Ted will assume his duties as 

head professional at The Pine 
Needles Golf Club today. He is 
assisted by Johnny Capello. 

Exotic Show Designed by Bel 
Geddes Cut from New York 
World's Fair Along with other 
Exhibits; John K. Weeks is 

Stockholder t 

The effort of John K. Weeks 
of Southern Pines and Norman 

Bel Geddes, to elevate the World 
of Tomorrow through their ex- 

hibit Crystal Lassies, at the New 
York World’s Fair, has been 

terminated by Fair officials. 
The exotic show was designed 

by Mr. Bel Geddes. Mr. Weeks 
is a stockholder in the corpora- 
tion. 

Mr. Weeks has been advised 
that the amusement area of the 
Fair will be shortened next year 
so that all of the exhibits in the 

lower end will be cut off. * The 

new line will be designated 'just 
South of the Sun Valley exhibit. 

The Crystal Lassies show, the 

popular parachute drop, the Cu- 

ban Village and about 25 per 
cent of the 1939 amusements will 

be out, according to the an- 

nouncement from Fair officials. 
No reason was given. 

The Crystal Lassies produc- 
tion was an original creation by 
Mr. Bel Geddes. Patrons en- 

tered a darkened and mysteri- 
ous hall. The blackout was com- 

plete. Suddenly the lights came 

on and the spectators beheld a 

beautiful maiden,/ whose form 
divine was multiplied a thous- 
and times, by hundreds of clev- 

erly placed mirrors. It was diffi- 
cult to pick out the original from 
the duplicates. 

Mr. Weeks estimated that when 

the exhibit is torn down there 
will be enough mirrors for each 
stockholder to '^redecorate his 

home, but the beautiful reflection 
will begone. 

— For Sale or Rent — 

UPRIGHT FISHER PIANO 

Good Condition 

I Reasonable 

l Phone 7902 So. Pines 

I 

ABERDEEN 
By Mrs. William Carter, Jr. Tel Aberdeen 995^ 

Mrs. B. G. Peterson and daugh- 
ter, Miss Alma Du Meer, spent 
Monday in Hamlet visiting Mrs. 

Peterson’s son, Mr. Du Meer and 
his family. 

Mrs. Reid A. Page entertained 
her Southern Pines Bridge Club 
at her home here on Monday af- 

ternoon. There were three ta- 

bles in play, and after the game 
the hostess served a delicious 
salad course. 

Miss Nettie Allen and Miss 
Alice Wilder attended the Duke- 
Carolina game at Durham Sat- 

urday in company with Mr. 

George Allen and Miss Ernestine 
Bethea of Latta, S. C. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Swaringen 
and children were guests Sunday 
of Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Pleasants. 

Among those Junior Book 

Club members attending the ban- 

quet given by the Hamlet Jun- 

ior Book Club honoring the state 

president, Mrs. Charles Pierce, 
Jr., on Monday night in Hamlet, 
were Miss Alice Wilder, Mrs. O. 
Leon Seymour, Mrs. Knox Mat- 

thews, Mrs.. D. L. Easterling, 
Mrs. J. B. Edwards, Mrs. Jack 

Taylor and Miss Grace Queen. 
Attending the football game 

between Duke and Carolina Sat- 

urday were Messrs. J. C. Rob- 

bins, Dan -Farrell, Jack Taylor, 
Forrest Lackey and L. J. Mur- 

phy. 
Mr. and Mrs. Purvis Ferree of 

Pinehurst, formerly of Aberdeen, 
attended the Duke-Carolina game 
with Mr. and Mrs. Henry Butner 

of Elkin. 

Miss Ruby Batael entertain*, her sister and her sister’s 
^ 

of Thomasville this weekend^11 
the Aberdeen Hotel. at 

Little Miss Patsy Blue, daugh 
ter of Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Bln 
who has been quite ill, is Some 
what improved. 

The following games have beeil 
posted as scheduled for the Ab 
erdeen High School’s Basketball 
season: 

(All dates as of 1940) 
Hoffman, Jan. 12, at Hoffmail 
Carthage, Jan. 16 at Carthage 
Cameron Jan. 19 at Cameron 
Vass Jan. 23 at Aberdeen 
Raeford (ind.) Jan. 23 at Ab. 

erdeen 

Pinehurst Jan. 30 at Pinehurst 
Southern Pines Feb. 2 at Ab- 

erdeen 

Carthage Feb. 6 at Aberdeen 
Hoffman Feb. 9 at Aberdeen 
West End Feb. 13 at Aberdeen 
Cameron Feb. 16 at Aberdeen 
Vass Feb. 20 at Aberdeen 
Southern Pines Feb. 21 at So. 

Pines 

Pinehurst Feb. 23 at Aberdeen 

Both teams show up well in 
practice and expect to offer real 
competition to all the excellent 
teams listed above. Come out 

and support them, you owe it to 
the schools and you owe it to 

yourself to keep posted on all the 
activities of our young people. 
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Sunshine A verages 9 Days out of 70 
' Ai11 WINTER RECREATIONS 
south's WfaGoif Without Steep Hi7/s 
BEST 18-HOLE jfe AND HORSEBACK 
GOLF COURSE RIDING BOTH FREE 
At Hotel Door XT0 WEEKLY GUESTS 

SPECIAL RATES I MONTH OR LONGER- 

FOREST HILLS HOTEL 
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e c t i n/' e Clientele FIREPROOF 
NOW OPEN 

TURKEYS 

SQUAB 
DUCKS 
CHICKENS 
CAPONS 
SANDHILLS HAMS 
FINEST WESTERN 

MEATS 

ARTICHOKES 
BROCOLLI 
ENDIVES 
CHIVES 
CRANBERRIES 
YAMS 
NEW CROP PAPER 

v SHELL PECANS 

Stop 
Your 

Here For 
Di inner I 

PLUM PUDDING 
MINCE MEAT 
MAPLE SYRUP 
PRESERVES 
FINEST FRUITS 

DATES, NUTS 
FIGS, CANDIES 

You’ll enjoy these big sav- 

ings just as much as the 
delicious foods we sell! All 
the traditional Thanksgiving 
delicacies offered at prices to 

make your dinner a bit hit. 
Make up your list and stop 
in ! 

Try Our Imported Cheeses With Watercress 

DORN’S 
SOUTHERN PINES 

All Pinehurst orders before 8:45 a. m. delivered same morning otherwise 3 p. m. delivery 


