
Zebulon Society Happenings 
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Cash of 

Oxford were the Monday guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Vic Tart and 

children. 
* 

The father of Mrs. Sidney Ed- j 
dins, Dr. J. R. Hester of Wendell, 
underwent an emergency appen- 

dectomy late Monday afternoon in 
Rex Hospital. He is reportedly 
resting comfortably. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Vassar Eddins of 

Augusta, Ga., spent the Easter 

holidays with Mr. and Mrs. Sidney 
Eddins and other relatives in 
Wendell. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bunn 

were in Winston-Salem part of 

the Easter holidays visiting Mr. 

and Mrs. Howard Bunn Jr. They 
also visited Mrs. Bunn’s relatives 
in Elizabethtown during the holi- 
days. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bunn 

spent part of last week in Youngs- 
ville with their grandchildren 
while their son-in-law and daugh- 
ter, Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Moss, at- 
tended the National Young Farm- 
ers Convention in Tulsa, Okla. 
Mr. Moss was named one of four 

outstanding young farmers of the 
nation at the convention. 

• 

Mrs. Ann Harris of Greenville 
and Mr. and Mrs. Leary Davis of 
Winston-Salem were the holiday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ferd Davis. 

Mrs. Eddie Carnevale of Flint, 
Michigan, was the weekend guest 
of her brother, Johnsey Arnold, 
and Mrs. Arnold. While here she 
attended her graduation class re- 
union at Bunn High School. She 

is a 1943 graduate of the high 
school. 

* 

Mrs. Charles Flowers was the 

guest of Dr. and Mrs. Charles 
Flowers Jr. and children of Chapel 
Hill during Easter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sidney Holmes 
and sons spent the weekend in 

Columbia, S. C., visiting Mrs. 

Holmes’ parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
W. Carroll. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. 'J. M. Hobbs of 

Melbourne, Fla., are visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. L. W. Perry. Mrs. Hobbs 
and Mrs. Perry are sisters. 

* 

Steve McDevitt, a freshman at 
Pfeiffer College and a member of 
the college choir, will sing in Men- 

* 

delssohn’s Oratorio “Elijah” on 

April 30. This is a major program 
event in the college’s 1903 Arts 
Festival. He is the grandson of 
Mrs. Urtrice Carter and the son 
of Major and Mrs. H. K. McDevitt 

| of Ernest Harmon Air Force Base, 
Stephenville, Canada. 

* 

S/Sgt. and Mrs. A. P. Moore and 
children, Donna, Doug and Lori 
Anne, arrived last week in the 

States after a three-year stay in 

England. They are expected here 
for a visit with Mrs. Moore’s moth- 

er, Mrs. Ollie W. Pearce, and her 
brother and his family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Pearce, this week. Sgt. 
Moore is with the Air Force. 

* 

C. M. Watson spent the holiday 
weekend with his daughter and 
son-in-law, Mr. pnd Mrs. Homer 
Blanton of Richmond, Va. 

* 

The grandson of C. M. Watson, 
Michael Watson, recently under- 
went a medical checkup at Duke 

Hospital and was told that he is 

very much improved. Mike suffers 
a heart defect, an opening between 
the two valves in his heart. Duke 
medical officials told him he may 
not have to undergo an operation 
for several years if his condition 

continues to improve. The hand- 

some 13-year-old is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. K. Watson of New 
Bern. 

Mrs. Luke Kitahata and daugh- 
ters are houseguests of Dr. and 
Mrs. L. M. Massey. Dr. Kitahata 
and his wife and children arrived 
here last week from New York. 

He, however, had to return to his 
work, leaving this weekend. 

Carolyn, Amy and Mari will be 
here for this week. 

* 

Stevie Quick, son of the Rev. 
and Mrs. Bill Quick, underwent a 
tonsillectomy at Wendell-Zebulon 

Hospital Friday. He is recuper- 
ating very well. 

• 

Isaas Medlin, father of Mrs. Pat 
Farmer, underwent major surgery 
Tuesday at Wendell-Zebulon Hos- 
pital. 
. * 

Dr. and Mrs. B. D. Thomas and 
children vacationed at Atlant’c 
Beach during the Easter weekend. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Rhudy and 
children of Raleigh were the Sun- 
day night supper guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Alvin Beck. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Lowery and 
daughter motored to Virginia dur- 
ing the holidays. They visited 
their son, Cadet Ted Lowery, who 
is a student at Fork Union Military 
Academy. 

* 

Mrs. J. T. Ellett and Mrs. C. 
G. Weathersby spent the Easter 
weekend holiday with their sister, 
Miss Martha Williams of Clover, 
Va. 

* 

Mr. and Mrs. Will Upchurch, Jr. 
were Easter weekend guests of 
their daughter and son-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Liles of Enfield. 

* 

Easter holidays for Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Beck and daughter were 
spent in Spartanburg, S. C. They 
were the guests of Mrs. Beck’s 
sister and her husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. D. Higgins. 

NEWS of WENDELL 
Mrs. Leslie Alligood had as visi- 

tors last week her two daughters, 
Mrs. J. C. Brothers, their children, 
Debbie, Diane and Jim, o£ Virginia 
Beach, Va.; Mrs. George C. Seay 
and daughter, Missie, of Winston- 
Salem. Mrs. Alligood and two 

daughters spent last Friday in 

Washington, N. C., with the Alli- 

good relatives. 
Elmer Rhodes is seriously ill at 

Wake Memorial Hospital. 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Henderson 

and daughter of Winston-Salem 
and Mrs. Graham Dean and Mrs. 
Fred Bass spent Easter holidays 
in Sarasota, Fla., with Mr. Hen- 
derson’s mother. 
The Rev. Roy McCormick will 

be in Richmond, Va., for a radio 
reading program of continuing 
education called the Tower Room 

Program. Doster Brock will fill 
the pulpit on April 21 at the Pres- 
byterian Church during the pas- 
tor’s absence. 

Mrs. Lena Mae Head of Raleigh 
spent the holidays with her broth- 
er and sister-in-law, the Plato 
Monks. 
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Reidsville spent Saturday with sis- 
ters, Mrs. R. B. Critcher and Mrs. 
Hettie Mae Wilkins. Mrs. Wilkins 
and Critcher left here Tuesday for 
a trip through the state and on to 
Richmond, Va. Mrs. Wilkins is 
from Douglas, Ga. 

Mr. and Mrs. Linville Roach and 
children of Greensboro spent the 
holidays with their parents, the 
Rev. and Mrs. Joe Roach and Mrs. 

Harry Gerald. 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Brantley 

attended the funeral of Mrs. 
Brantley’s aunt, Mrs. George Rob- 
ertson, in Blackstone, Va., last 
Sunday. 

Mrs. G. P. Conoley’s two grand- 
sons, Neil and Tim, of Wilson spent 
the weekend with the Conoleys. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Conoley spent 
Sunday with their parents. 
Lesa and Sherry Harding of 

Hyattsville, Md., spent the week- 
end with grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. W. B. Bruch. 
Mr. and Mrs. Dwane Bruch and 

children of Arlington, Va., visited 

their parents, Mrs. Pearl Wall and 
Mr. and Mrs. W. B. Bruch, the past 
weekend. 

Mrs. Inez Fortune continues ill 
at Wake Memorial Hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Avery 
Scarboro of Durham spent the hol- 
idays in Wendell with parents. 

Miss Hazel Taylor spent the 
weekend in Wilmington with 
friends. 

Mrs. Betty Taylor of Tarboro 
visited the past weekend with her 
friend, Mrs. Wilbur Marshbum. 

Mrs. Gladys Heroy Griffin of 
Smithfield spent the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Griffin. 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmo Bunn and 

family of Garner were Sunday 
guests of his mother, Mrs. Mozelle 
Bunn. 

Mrs. Nan Herndon and Alma 
Lee of Greenville were weekend 
guests of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Mattox. 
Mr. and Mrs. Doster Brock and 

two children spent the holidays 
with Mrs. Brock’s parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. S. C. Smart, at Lenoir. 

Mes Amis Bridge 
Club Is Feted 

Mrs. Ben Thomas was hostess to 
the Mes Aipis Bridge Club last 
week at her home on Church 
Street. An Easter motif was used 
in decorations. 
Club members present were 

Mrs. Fred Smith, Mrs. Howard 
Beck, Mrs. Philip Olive, Mrs. Lois 
Wall, Mrs. Helen Gregory and Miss 
Mary L. Palmer. Guests were Mrs. 
L. E. Long and Mrs. Thurman 
Murray. 
Taking home high score prize 

was Miss Palmer, with second high 
going to Mrs. Olive. Mrs. Murray 
was the recipient of guest high 
score prize, with second high going 
to Mrs. Long. 

After the three progressions the 
hostess served Easter ice cream 
molds, nuts, almonds, macaroons, 
and coffee. During play lime ice 
and candies were served. 

Miss Mary Todd Satterfield, 
daughter of Mrs. Bimey Clark Sat- 
terfield of Wendell and the late 
Mr. Satterfield, is engaged to 
Henry Graham Tyson, Jr., son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Tyson of Wilson. 
Her mother announces the en- 

gagement. A June 15 wedding is 
planned. 

Dixie News 
Miss Daisy Narron 

Mr. and 'Mrs. Johnny Whitley 
and family of Clayton and Mr. and 
Mrs. Vernon Hawley of Kenly and 
Mr. and Mrs. Lester Hinton and 
sons, Randy and Dennis, of Zeb- 
ulon and Mr. and Mrs. Billy Hin- 
ton and children of Zebulon were 
the guests during the weekend of 
Mrs. Christine Hinton and Carol, 
Douglas and Marion Hinton. 

Mrs. Mamie Stancil of Selma 
was the weekend guest of her 
brother and sister-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Hocutt, and children. 
Mr. and Mrs. Franklin Narron 

and children, Renate and Frank, 
Jr., of Raleigh and Mr. and Mrs. 
Hester Narron and children, Cyn- 
thia and Delbridge, of Candor, 
and Jerry Narron of Aberdeen, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Narron, 
Jr., and sons, Lloyd and Dennis, 

GOLDEN WEDDING . . . Mr. and Mrs. Marion Butler Perry of 
Wendell were honored on Sunday, March 31, with a reception at their 
home given by their children. The gala occasion marked the Perrys’ 
50th wedding anniversary. 

f Micro were the guests during 
the weekend of Mr. and Mrs. Alvin 
Narron. 

Mr. and Mrs. Avery Batten and 
children were the Sunday guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. H. P. Braswell of 
Selma who are Mrs. Batten’s par- 
ents. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Boykin were 
the guests during the weekend of 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Holland and 
children of High Point. 

Miss Rebecca Narron of Win- 
ston-Salem spent the weekend 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Sam Narron, and brother, Richard. 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Hawley 

and children of Micro were the 

guests during the weekend of their 
son and daughter-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jackie Hawley. 
Person Boykin of Raleigh was 

the guest during the weekend of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Henry Boykin, and children. 
Mr. and Mrs. P. L. Perry of 

Zebulon and Mr. and Mrs. Guy 
Holland of Kenly and Mr. and 
Mrs. John D. Bunn of Bailey were 
the guests during the weekend of 
Mrs. Onnie Bailey and son, Randy 
Bailey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Raeford Johnson 
and children of Newport News, 
Va., and Mr. and Mrs. Rex Ren- 
frow of Raleigh, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Creech and children and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Renfrow and 
daughter, Tammie, were the guests 
last Sunday of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Renfrow, Gail and Cecil. 

Mr. and Mrs. Randel Narron and 
children of Newport News, Va., 
and Elton Narron of Selma were 
the guests during the weekend of 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Narron and 

daughter, Kaye. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Davis and 

son, Mark, of Fayetteville, were 
the guests during the weekend of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wade 
Davis. 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Gray Bat- 

ten and daughter, Carol, of Fu- 

quay Springs, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Poe O’Neal and daughter, Towan- 
na, of Fayetteville, and Mr. and 
Mrs. James Sullivan and son, Don, 
of Greenville, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Woodrow O’Neal and children ol 
Crozet, Va., and Mr. and Mrs. Sa- 
pero O’Neal and children of Ply- 
mouth, and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Ihrie III and children of Zebulon 
were the guests during the week- 
end of Mrs. Rebecca O’Neal and 
Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Parrish and 
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Mr. and Mrs. Fred Johnson ol 

Raleigh and Mrs. Mary Lee Wil- 
liams and son, Dail, of Raleigh, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Godwin 
and daughter, Rose, of Goldsboro, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bill O’Neal and 
boys of Clayton were the guest! 
during the weekend of Mrs. Ome- 
ga O’Neal. 
Mr. and Mrs. Nelson Narron and 

son, Neal, of Zebulon and Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Narron of Pine Level 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ishmael Narron 
and boys, Worth, Danny, and Ken- 
neth, of Knightdale, and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Curtis and children, 
Judy and Johnny of Knightdale, 
and Mrs. Mamie Stancil of Selma 
were the Sunday guests of Mrs. 
Hettie Narron and daughter, Joyce. 
Mr. and Mrs. William Edwin 

Narron and girls, Wanda and Car- 
olyn, visited Mr. and Mrs. Virgil 
Brown and children of Bethany 
community during the weekend. 

Miss Carol Hinton spent this 
weekend with Miss Jean Johnson 
of near Wendell. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Satterwhite 

and children of Raleigh and Mr. 
and Mrs. Hugh Wilder and chil- 
dren of Knightdale and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Pegmean and children 
of Raleigh and Mr. and Mrs. Earl 

Holland and children of High 
Point were the guests during the 
weekend of Mr. and Mrs. Onnie 
Narron. 

Mrs. Bill Gay is at Woodard- 

Herring Hospital but is improved. 
Mrs. Mary Nancy Johnson is 

staying with her daughters while 
she is taking an operation on her 
eyes at Rex Hospital. 

g.. 

(Wakefield News! 
| Mrs. Vera B. Rhodes | 
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Our Sunrise Service at the Zeb- 
ulon Cemetery was well attended. 
Some over 300 is my guess. 
And I guessed the number of 

seed in a large pumpkin once at 
the State Fair and did not miss it 
one. I won two tons of Smith- 

Douglas fertilizer for the prize. 
That was before I lost my left hind 
foot of a Grave Yard rabbit. Ha ha. 
Back to our Easter service. It 

was very impressive. I think all 
enjoyed it. We had four pastors of 
the combined churches participat- 
ing with the Rev. Robert Ward of 
Union Chapel bringing an appro- 
priate and impressive sermon. 
The Wakelon High School Band 

added much to the service with 
several selections. We thank Mr. 

Burns and the members of the 
band for coming. 
We served hot coffee and bhoco- 

late in the Church Annex, and it 
was good after standing out for 

the service so early in the morn- 
ing. 
The sunrise, the birds singing, 

the flowers, the dew on the grass, 
the cool breeze, and the lovely 
trees all showed the great handi- 
work of God. 
Our attendance picked up at 

church and Sunday School and we 
had lots of visitors on Easter. 
Arrangement of white flowers 

were put in the church by the W. 
H. Winstead family in memory of 
Mr. Winstead. Mrs. Winstead and 
son Charles of Chapel Hill at- 
tended. 

Among those present were Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Pippin, Mr. and 
Mrs. Craven Brown, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Stroud. Mrs. Stroud is the 
former Rochelle Pippin. 

Mrs. Jeanie Hamm’s mother 
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Tennessee to visit the Rev. Horace 
Hamms for a few days. 

Mrs. Fannie Bolton had some of 
her children home for Easter. 

Mrs. Maggie Perry is a patient 
at the hospital; also Mt. Cracker 
Bunn and Mr. Berlie May. All 
were improving. 

Mrs. Jack Palmer and Peggy and 
Patsy and two other friends are 
spending the week with the W. L. 
Simpsons and Mrs. Teny. The 
Palmers are from Baltimore. 

Mrs. Jerry Garritt, daughter of 
Mrs. Callie Powell, is Spending 
some time here. Her father is in 
Rex Hospital. 
Mr. and Mrs. P. P. Pace were 

here for the holidays with the 
Harold Pippins. 

Mrs. Alice Hood is about the 
same. Our Wakefield - Zebulon 
Chapter, Order of the Eastern Star, 
took her for our shut-in of the 
month. 
Mr. and Mrs. D. A. Gay and 

Don and Alice were here last Sun- 
day from Kinston to see Mrs. 
Hood. 

Mrs. Munk Jones is very ill at 
Rex Hospital. 

- Your diamonds will sparkle with 
new life if you give them a bath 
with lukewarm water and am- 
monia, scrub with old toothbrush. 


