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-VesperConcertCarolina No Longer Light
Of Liberalism For South

Excessive Faculty Restrictions in Regard to Student Privileges
and Activities Have Raised Warranted Protests

From Open-Minde- d University Men.
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NEW-YOR- FUND

PLANS STUDY OF

NEGROQUESTION

3&odesian Student Will. Be Sent
Here to Investigate Race

Problems.

New York, May 16.-- The ap-
pointment of Roger D. H. Jones,
.a graduate of Cambridge univer-
sity, to study astronomy at the
University of Virginia, and of
George Stark, attached to the
Native Development Department
of Southern Rhodesia, South
Africa, to study problems of
Negro education at the Univer-
sity of North Carolina, was an-
nounced today by the Common-
wealth Fund, of New York, of
which Edward S. Harkness is
president.

These British visitors, with
thirty-fou- r others enrolled at
other universities, will come to
the United States next Septem-
ber for a two-ye- ar period as
Commonwealth Fund fellows.
The fellowships were established
an 1925 to further the develop-
ment of understanding and
good-wi- ll between Great Brit-si-n

and the United States. Un-
der this plan, 147 men and
--women from British, Scottish,
.and Welsh universities, from the
dominions apd colonies, and
from the government services
overseas have already come to
American universities for grad-
uate and special study.

Interested in America
According to a report written

by a fellow just returned to
England, "Every young Eng-
lishman today is curious about
and interested in the United
States of America. In England
no other country in the world
arouses more discussion, more
difference of opinion or reveals
more knowledge and ignorance
than your country. If one were

(Continued on page three)

dent to receive credit for a
course he must have attended
that class at least seventy-fiv- e

percent of"thetime they have
ruled.

These regulations Were not
to be put into effect until the beT
ginning of the fall quarter, the
attendance problem of this
quarter being placed under the
heads of the several depart-
ments. Acting with this as
their backing, the dean of the
liberal arts school and the dean
of the commerce school have
practically "outlawed" cutting
classes in these two divisions
arbitrarily and mechanically
putting men on probation and
under threat of suspension with
little human feeling.

Acting also under this same
faculty ruling, the psychology
department placed even more
rigid restrictions upon students.
It was first announced that all
persons missing a psychology
class must make up this absence
and be fined fifty cents, and that
"announced" quizes missed
would have to be punished by a
fine of one dollar unless the in-

structor decided to fail the stu-

dent on that quiz. A committee
of students was chosen to confer
with the department head in an
attempt .to reduce make-u-p

charges. The fifty cents unex-cuse- d

class make-u-p fee was re-

duced to twenty five cents, and
likewise the laboratory fee, but
the other charges remained the
same.

Yellow Journal Suppressed
In the spring of 1929 mem-

bers of Sigma Upsilori, a na

As his final presentation of
the year, Professor Nelson O.
Kennedy will give his sixth ves-
per concert of the year in the
music auditorium this after-
noon at 4:45.

In addition to the five concerts
by Professor Kennedy, a series
of three guest organists has tak-
en place since the dedication of
the organ by Edward Eigen-schenc- k

in November.
The program scheduled for

today includes: Rogers, Andan-
te Quasi Fantasia; Alexander
Russell, The Bell of St. Anne de
Beaupre; Wolstenholme, Alle-
gretto; Kinder, Jubilate Amen;
Rachmaninoff, Prelude in C
sharp minor; George B. Nevin,
In Memoria; and Widor, Finale
(Second Symphonie).

EXTENSION MEN
AT CONFERENCE

M. F. Vining, R. M. Grum-
man, and E. R. Rankin, of the
extension department of the
University, left yesterday for
New York where they will at-

tend the sixth annual meeting
of the American Association for
Adult Education, which will oc-

cur there from Monday to Wed-nesda- y,

in the new school for
social research.

Grumman is a member of
state and national commissions
on the enrichment of adult life,
while Rankin and Vining are be-

ing sent by the University ex-

tension division. The Univer-
sity is planning to expand its
adult educational activities soon.
A sectional meeting will be de-

voted entirely to 'discussion of
University extension.

Among some of the several
notables that have been obtained
to address the association are:
President Nicholas Murray But-

ler of Columbia University ;

Newton D. Baker, former Secre-
tary of War; and Miss Dorothy
Canfield Fisher, authoress.

'John Barleycorn' Is
At North

Eighteenth Amendment Is Farce

Ml MERCHANTS

WILL EiWTAE
CAROLINA SENIOR

Local Stores Will Treat Grad-uatin- g

Class to Week of
Free Attractions.

The annual senior week acti-
vities will get underway Mon-
day and continue through Fri-
day. The various merchants of
Chapel Hill have offered to con-
tinue their annual display of
generosity by opening their
establishments to the seniors in
a regular schedule. On Monday
the Smoke Shop and Lacock's
Shoe Shop have offered free
drinks and free shoe shines, re-

spectively. Tuesday the seniors
will be treated by Suttons' to
free drinks and they wTill play
miniature golf free. After this
exercise they will be treated to
free buttermilk at the Durham
Dairy Products company. Wed-
nesday more drinks and shoe
shines at Pritchard-Loyd'- s and
the University Shoe Shop are
scheduled. At the Paragon Ice
Cream company and the Waffle
Shop the seniors may obtain ice
cream and coffee.

More Treats
If the members of the class

have survived this first assort-
ment of treats, they will have
one last splurge on Friday. The
D. and G. Cafe will serve ice
tea and cakes all day except dur-
ing the lunch hour. Harry's
Grill will give apples or cigars
to go with the free drinks of the
Carolina Coffee shop. After
having their footwear treated
for the last time through gen-

erosity, the seniors will feast at
the Friendly on coffee and cakes,
the cakes coming from the Hill
Bakery, at 10:30 p. m.
" Then with the peanuts given
by the Campus Confectionery
they will attend the free show
at the Carolina Theatre at 11 :15.

Supreme
Carolina University

Here When Students Wish to

"John Barleycorn" is king at
practically all social gatherings
among students" here. From
banquets to entertaining a
friend, from house-parti- es to
private dates, from football
games to dances, spirits are ac-

cepted as indispensable to the
general gaiety. Even the age-ol- d

feminine attitude of opposi-
tion to strong drink has broken
down, and a large percentage of
girls are not averse to drinking
in moderation themselves. Add-

ed to the natural exhiliration ob-

tained from drink, is the lure of
the forbidden fruit, of accom-
plishing the forbidden, and of
following personal convictions
in defiance of arbitrary law.

For the first time in several
years, the town authorities seem
to have taken a hand in an at-
tempt to curb drinking at the
University. This is based on
the rumor that federal agents
were to be brought to raid fra-
ternity houses and dormitories.
No real action was taken by the
police department, but the ru-

mor served to curb drinking for
a short while.

Drinking Very Apparent
At this time of the year, drink-

ing becomes more apparent, due
to the many social affairs tak-
ing place on the Hill. This is
not an indication that drinking
is increasing, but that it seems

(Continued on last pdgu)

Editor's Note : It is with no
flippant or bitter attitude that
we here present the protest of
six student leaders who, having
the interest of student activi-
ties at heart and seeing their
apathetic condition a deplorable
state, have sought a reason for
such a state and sincerely have
come to the conclusion that
there is no single student activ-
ity genuinely a student activity,
due to the unconscious and grad-
ual encroachment of faculty
members and their eventual
overshadowing of students.

The Daily Tar Heel has been
enlisted in the cause of STU-
DENT CONTROL OF STU-
DENT ACTIVITIES. We ask
a sane and open minded consid-
eration of the problem by every-
one concerned, and the same
right to speak out bravely and
sincerely that which has been
rumored and whispered for
years, as did our forefathers at
Independence hall.

Insidious in its nature and
innocuous in its effect has been
the gradual unconscious assum
ing of control of the student
extra-curricul- ar activities on
the campus here by members of
the faculty and the administra-
tion. Perhaps student genera-
tions : in..the past have looked
with approval upon this as-

sumption of student prerogative
by unofficial and unelected fac-
ulty boards, committees, and in-

dividuals. However, for four
years rumblings and discontent
have been sporadically issued.
At last and but recently the stu-

dent voice in the shape of a
newly elected group of conscien-
tious student officials has be-

come "articulate.
The University, if it were

ever truly liberal, is no longer
as one Tar Heel writer has said
"the beacon of liberalism for
the whole South."

Among movements aimed at
furthering the conservatism of
the already declining liberal
center here was the movement
on the part of the deans of the'
schools of commerce, "liberal"
arts, and applied science by
which they successfully man-
euvered the faculty into abolish-
ing optional attendance and the
cut system, limiting absence to
three and five a quarter. The
liberalism of Royster and Hib- -
bard went by the board when
the former died and latter was
able , to escape these ever nar-
rowing walls.

Hibbard's System
It was Dean Hibbard's plan

to give optional attendance to
the two upper classes, and to al-

low as many as ten cuts to
freshmen and sophomores. Dur-

ing the time that this plan was
in effect, it was found that the
number of students making the
honor roll was larger than this
year under compulsory attend-
ance despite what has been said.
Further investigation revealed
that Hibbard was of the opinion
that the members of the junior
and senior classes were perfect-
ly able to think and act for
themselves.

Faculty Meeting
At a meeting of the faculty a

few months ago attendance
rules were passed which allowed
optional attendance to no one,
permitting three to five cuts per
quarter as ea course has classes
per week. In order for a stu- -

Columbia University President
Writes On Modern Day Liberty

.. o ',' -

In the Opinion of Nicholas Murray Butler, the Modern Citizen
Is Surrounded by Both Opportunities and Limitations

John A. Lang, retiring presi-
dent of N. C. S. F., went out of
office with the meeting of the
association in Durham yester-
day, 9which was attended by stu-
dents from all over the state.

CECELIA BASON TO
STUDY IN EUROPE

Miss Cecelia Bason, of the
University faculty in the school
of education, has been appoint-
ed a member of a select group
of American teachers -- who are
to sail from New York May 21
for an educational tour of
France and Germany during the
summer months.

The tour is being sponsored
by the International Institute of
College Teachers, Columbia uni-
versity, New York City. In
Europe the tour, will be under the
educational direction" of the
ministry of education in France
and Germany, which means that
the delegates will have entree
to libraries and museums not
open to the average tourist, and
that other honors, and privileges
will be accorded them.

The delegates will visit lead-

ing colleges and universities in
both countries.

he rises superior to these limita-
tions and through sacrifice over-

comes them and turns them into
elements of strength and power
for himself, he grows in indivi-
duality and usefulness as a citi-

zen.
It is law which imposes the

limitations that are characteris-
tic 'of liberty. Law v is nothing
more or less than the system of
collection of principles and rules
of human government in their
application to property and con-

duct, to be enforced by a politi-

cal authority, which are upheld
bv the common will. Laws
themselves change, but the prin-

ciples underlying the existence
of law do not, and can not,
change, unless society and civili-

zation are to be destroyed. They
are the long and painful product
of evolution operating in the
field of human conduct and
human affairs. The really in-

telligent man regards the tried
and tested products of time with
high respect ; the revolutionist
would destroy them at one blow

for the pleasure of returning to

chaos. It is of high importance
to teach that law is not caprice,

that it is not tyranny, that there
be discrimination in itsis to no

application. It is the sovereign

people themselves who speak by

the mouthpiece of the law, and

the institution and enforcement
of law are the people's own in-

stitutions and agencies.

Obtain Any Assortment of Orange County
Thirst-Quenchin- g Beverages.

- o

tional literary fraternity, pub-

lished a scandal sheet known as
the Yellow Journal in which
faculty men as well as students
were unjustly .lampered. De-

spite the fact that such a publi-

cation was exceeding bad taste
it has been found that the stor-
ies all had sane basis of fact in

'

them. Instead of prohibiting
further publication of the sheet,
the administration saw fit to
bring tremendous pressure to
bear upon the student council
and to have "shipped" all per-

sons connected with the journal.
Student Entertainment

Nowhere is there a single
student activity in which stu-

dents have actual and final con-

trol. The students on the Stu-

dent Entertainment Committee
have only a theoretical voice in
the selection and management
of the f course. The faculty
members pay little or no atten-
tion to what students may de-

sire, and little if any responsi
bility is felt on their part, de-

spite the fact that the money
for such entertainment is con
tributed in an extra-curricul- ar

manner by the student body.
The Tar Heel asks with . full
cause why this committee can
not operate as efficiently with a
student majority expressing stu
dent desire.

Athletic Council
In some educational institu

tions students have a vote which
is heard and respected by those
administrating and controlling
student athletics. We have yet
to hear of many - incidents in
which the Athletic Association
has been guided by student
opinion rather than what they
may consider student opinion to
be. If athletics at the Univer

(Continued on last page)

Reprinted by permission of the
Columbia Spectator)

By Nicholas Murray Butler

Liberty is the freedom from
&H restraints but those which
the. lawful rights of others im-
pose. Liberty, therefore, at-
taches to man as a social and
political animal. It relates to
his conduct and opportunities as
a member of a body politic. Lib-
erty contradicts and denies lic-

ense just as completely as it con-

tradicts and denies tyranny. To
escape from restraints other
than those imposed by the law
ful rights of others, men have
made every conceivable sacrif-

ice. To be permitted to hold
opinions of one's own choosing,
to pursue the calling of one's
own preference, to move about

s inclination and opportunity
nay lead, to retain as one's own

Possession the rewards of one's
labor and skill, are inseparable
from liberty. The free man,
therefore, lives surrounded by
both opportunities and limita-
tions. The opportunities are an
invitation to the exercise of his
own capacities; the limitations
sre the just opportunities and
Privileges of others. It is one
of the paradoxes and marvels of
human nature that man grows
in power and in grace as he
lives and works with others who
have the same privileges and
opportunities as himself. As

(Editors note : This is a com
posite story by five members of
the Daily Tar Heel staff who
have made a recent investigation
into the liquor situation at the
University.)

Prohibition, as a "Noble Ex
periment," has as its laboratory
the various colleges and univer-
sities of the nation, where to-

day's youth and tomorrow's
citizenry congregate, for it is
among these future leaders and
voters that the theory will meet
its final test, not among the
more partial generation which
has been responsible for the
passage of the present enforce-
ment laws.

The state of North Carolina
has taken stringent means of
barring drink from the campus
of the University of North
Carolina. The "wet-drinkin- g,

dry-votin- g" taxpayers have not
been willing to permit any lax-

ity whatsoever of moral .
be-

havior on the campus of a state-support- ed

institution. Thus, as
is typical of most state univer-
sities, there is a condition of ex-

treme enforcement: the federal
laws ' are upheld by the local
police, and local laws are made
and enforced by the faculty and
student government.

Laws Are Farce
Yet, even in this extreme" con-

dition, the laws are a farce.


