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Be Closed Monday, July 4th.

Cares . . . About You!

By MONICA KIVEL
' The next really hot sultry
afternoon, lay down that text-
book or lab report. Close your
eyes and visualize the cool
blueness of water lapping ov-

er the edges of a swimming
pool. Imagine the splashing
chlorinated water. If you're a
boy, add girls in bathing suits.
If you're a girl, think about
those tanned lifeguards. Not
surprisingly, you may find
yourself on the way to Kess-
ing Pool.

Located behind Woolen
Gymnasium, Kessing Pool
opened June 10 to students
and personnel. Students are
admitted with I. D. cars; Un-
iversity personnel and their
families are admitted with
privilege cards. Prvilege cards
are available to staff members
for $6 for any person over
16 and $4 for those under 16.
The cards are sold at By-nu- m

Hall.
Kessing is open seven days

a week. The hours are noon
to 6 p.m. and 7:30 to 9:30
p.m. on weekdays; noon to 6
p.m. Saturday; and 2 to 5 p.m.
Sunday.

Children are not allowed in
the pool from 1 to 4 p.m. Mon-
day through Saurday and from
2 to 5 p.m. Sunday.

At least three lifeguards are
on duty at all times and dur-
ing the children's hour from
noon to 1 p.m. Monday
through Saturday, four life-
guards are on duty.

The regulations say all per

r CLIP

sons with long hair are re-

quired to wear bathing caps.
The rule applies to both sex-

es.

Psyc School

Needs Help

In Experiments
The Psychology Department

of the University is looking
for student volunteers for its
experimental programs.

To conduct experiments in

the past, the department re-

lied largely on students from
the psychology 26 classes, but
these have proved insufficient.

According to Dr. John
Schopler at least five different
studies are now being conduct-

ed, each requiring from 70 to
100 participants. "We're inter-

ested in trying to solve our
summer subject shortage by
seeing whether the general
student population would be
willing to participate," Schop-

ler said.
Typical studies involving

.college students now being
conducted by the department
include bargaining and se-

quential decision making ex-

periments. Often in the lat-

ter, a volunteer may find
himself matching wits with a
computer.

Any student interested in
participating may contact Miss

" Linda Edwards in 102 New
West, or call 933-205- 6.
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ALLGOOD BRAND SLICED

CAP'N JOHN'S FROZEN

STICKS
FRESH FROZEN, TENDER

FTO
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Legs

'Shop Ahead, A&P Will

JANE

NE ROOM
PARKER GOLDEN-POTAT- OSNACK BAR

This Week's Specials

All Day- -9 A. M. -- 11 P. M.

Regular Menu Items Reduced n

Have A Safe Holiday!"

California 29cNECTARINES Lb.

White, Seedless 39cGRAPES Lb

WESTERN

CANTALOUPES

3 for. 89c

White Potatoes

10 & 49c .

1-- LB. BOX

CONTAINING 2-8--
0Z.

- FRIDAY -
Hot Fish Sandwich 25c

- SUNDAY -
Spaghetti and Garlic Bread -5- 0c

- MONDAY -
Hot Dogs, Garnished 10c-

- TUESDAY -
Pizza Pie 50c

- WEDNESDAY --

Hamburger Steak Platter 75c

- THURSDAY -
Grilled Cheese Sandwich 20c

THE PINE ROOM

The Popular Place To Meet,

Snack or Dine

vv.
SPECIAL!

Save
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