
Food stamps,
soon to be used in Moore County, 
are like a new industry, says an 
official. See page 8, Section 2.
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Three adult
education courses are announced 
this week by the college here. 
See page 8 and page 1, Section 3.
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Library Display Shows 
Long-range Town Plan

Interested citizens may view 
several maps of a long-range, 
comprehensive development 
plan for Southern Pines, 
throughout this month, in the 
new art gallery of the town 
library, John Faulk, chairman 
of the gallery committee, re­
ports.

These planning studies are

OLD PHOTOS OF 
TOWN ON VIEW

In as.sociation with the town 
and area planning exhibit in 
the new art gallery of the 
Southern Pines Library, a dis­
play of over 100 old photos 
showing scenes of Southern 
Pines in days gone by has 
been arranged in the adjoin­
ing small gallery at the libra­
ry.

Persons loaning material for 
the exhibit include the Misses 
Virginia and Nell Huttenhau- 
er, Harry Goldsmith, Miss 
Ruth Doris Swett, Mrs. Ella 
Chatfield, Mrs. William 
Matchett and Mrs. John F. 
Faulk.

SAILOR CHARGED

Knifing Victim* 
Still Critical 
But Improving
A young Hoke County man 

is in critical condition at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital, and a Rich­
mond County sailor is charged 
with cutting him in an affray 
involving the first youth’s es­
tranged wife, at Barney’s 
Danceland (The Red Barn) on 
old US 1 north of here, Satur­
day night. - .

Michael McKenzie, 21, of 
Rockingham, a U. S. Navy 
man home on leave, made 
$3,000 bond Monday on a pro­
visional charge of felonious 
assault, pending the outcome 
of the condition of William 
Morris, 21, of Lumber Bridge, 
Route 1.

Morris, a third-shift employ­
ee of J. P. Stevens & Co. at 
Aberdeen, suffered a knife 
gash halfway round his body, 
from the front of the abdomen 
to the backbone. His intestines 
were pierced and spinal 

(Continued on Page 8)

‘Guidelines’ To 
Area Published

“Southern Pines Guide­
lines,” a local information and 
promotion booklet of interest 
and usefulness to both visitors 
and native residents, has been 
published and widely distrib­
uted in the Sandhills by John 
Owen Jones and Cay Jones, in 
cooperation with the Mer­
chants Council and the Town’s 
Resort Advertising Commit­
tee.

Mr. and Mrs. Jones were re­
tained by the committee last 
fall to do news and publicity 
work for the Town. The 
booklet replaces an informa­
tion brochure formerly issued 
by the merchants.

“Guidelines” describes the 
attractions of the area, golf 
courses and places of interest 
to visit, has a two-page map 
of the area extending as far as 
the airp*ort and the Country 
Club of North Carolina, and 
notes upcoming events of the 
Spring season.

Restaurants, hotels, motels 
and other service establish­
ments and businesses have 
advertising in the booklet. It 
is available free at these pla­
ces and at numerous other lo­
cations serving the public.

Wildlife Convention 
Scheduled At Raleigh

The annual state convention 
of the North Carolina Wildlife 
Federation with which the 
Moore County Widllife Club 
is associated, will be held at 
the Sir Walter Hotel in Ra- 
eigh, February 24-26.

Mrs. Cornelia Vann, secre­
tary of the Moore Club, asked 
The Pilot to bring the conven­
tion to the attention of club 
members, as formal notice has 
not previously been given to 
them.

It is expected that a number 
of Moore Club members will 
attend all or part of the meet­
ing, Mrs. Vann said.

being done through a contract 
with the North Carolina De­
partment of Conservation and 
Development Division of 
Community Planning, in Ra­
leigh. The Town of Southern 
Pines is appropriating fund. 
over a two-year period for the 
initial phases of the planning 
program while the federal 
government more than match­
es the town’s amount with 
planning assistance funds un­
der the new Department of 
Housing and Urban Develop­
ment.

The exhibit includes a large 
aerial photograph mosaic of 
the entire area, a base map 
showing physical features, a 
land-use map, a comprehen­
sive zoning map, a proposed 
thoroughfare plan, a subdivi­
sion topographic model, and a 
color slide show of “de;irable 
and poor tasie examples” in 
the vicinity.

According to Donald W. 
Bradley of Southern Pines, 
the community planner in 
charge of the local work, who 
also prepared the exhibit, the 
purpose 'of the show is to in­
form citizens of the planning 
program and its progress. 
“The planning process must 
have knowledgable citizen 
participation to be effective 
and democratic,” he believes.

The display will be studied 
by the Town Council, Planning 
B'oard, Zoning Board, Parkway 
Beautification Committee, in­
terested civic orrganizations, 
local public and parochial 
school classes and the Commu­
nity College and will be open 
to the public during regular 
library hours.

“It is hoped that people will 
sign the guest book and record 
their comments which will be 
considered in formulating fur­
ther design and recommenda­
tions of the plan,” Bradley 
said.

The Town will be provided 
with published reports and 
documents, including a popu­
lation and economic study, a 
land development plan, sub­
division regulations, and a new 
zoning ordinance “as guides to 
insure an orderly physical de­
velopment.”

SEN. JOE S. SINK

Sink Announces 
Candidacy For 
Slate Senator

state Senator Joe S. Sink of 
Lexington in Davidson County 
this week announced that he 
will be a candidate for relec­
tion, seeking the Democratic 
Party’s nomination in the May 
primarJ^ He is one of three 
candidates so far to announce 
in the new 19th Senatorial 
District which includes five 
counties — Davidson, Mont­
gomery, Moore, Richmond and 
Scotland. The district will have 
two senators in the 1967 Gen­
eral Assembly.

Announcing their candidac­
ies for the Democratic state 
senatorial nomination two 
weeks ago were J. F. Allen of 
Biscoe in Montgomery County 
aind Voit Gilmore of Southern 
Pines, incumbent state sena­
tor in the old 18th District. 
The new 19th District was 
created in the recent special 
session of the General Assem­
bly, for reapportionment.

(Continued on Page 8)

MEETING POSTPONED
The Moore County commis- 

sroners, who had announced 
plans for a midmonth special 
meeting Tuesday of this week, 
postponed it to Tuesday, Feb­
ruary 22, at 2 pm because of a 
conflict with a district meet­
ing at Rockingham.

First Classes Held Today 
In Collegers New Building

Students of the science 
classes of Sandhills Commun­
ity College today (Thurs­
day) moved into the spa­
cious and modern laboratories 
and classrooms of the just- 
completed Science Building 
on the college campus, off the 
Pinehurst-Airport road.

Use of the building was first 
scheduled for Wednesday, but 
last-minute preparations were 
not completed in time.

The first unit of the three- 
building complex to be open­

ed, it will be used for classes 
in biology, chemistry, elec­
tronics and physics. Faculty 
members as well as students 
are enthusiastic over the new 
and up-to-date facilities. Fa­
culty members—John New­
comer, physics, Donald W. 
Whelan, biology, John H. Car­
penter, television and radio, 
and H. L. Thornburg, chemis­
try—agree that training and 
experimentatron in their fields 
of teaching will be highly ef­
fective with the technical and

[SYSTEM TO CHANGE
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EARLY ARRIVALS — Dr. Raymond A. 
Stone, right, was on hand at the Sandhills 
Community College campus this morning to 
greet the first group of about 30 students 
arriving to attend various science classes

there. Next to the president is Miss Shirley 
Hare of Route 2, Robbins, and the three 
young men are, left to right: Bruce Monroe 
of Aberdeen, Jerry Lawrence of Sanford 
and Richard Austin of Raleigh.

(Pilot photo)

ALL-DAY EVENT SET SATURDAY

Many Entries In Hnnter Trials
Close to 100 horses and 

at least eight hunt teams had 
been entered by early this 
week in the annual Hunter 
Trials to be held Saturday at 
the Scotts Corner course, off 
Youngs Road.

An official of the sponsoring

Kirkman Joins 
Barnum Firm 
In Real Estate

John S. Ruggles, president 
of Barnum Realty & Insur­
ance Company, announced this 
week that Ira J. Kirkman has 
joined the firm as a real es­
tate broker. Mr. Kirkman is 
managing the sales office at 
Highland Trails for the Bar­
num company which assumed 
exclusive management of that 
residential sub-division on De­
cember 1.

F'ormerly employed as a 
mechanical engineer with La- 
go Oil and Transport Com­
pany, Ltd., an affiliate of 
Standard Oil Company, New 
Jersey, Mr. Kirkman was sta- 

((jontinued on Page 8)

Rescue Units In 
Cape Fear Search

Members of all four units 
of the Moore County Rescue 
Squad—Robbins, Vass, Carth­
age and the Sandhill unit with 
headquarters at Aberdeen — 
took part last week and over 
the weekend in searching op­
erations for three members of 
the Allen family presumed 
lost in a boating accident at 
Lock 3 on the Cape Fear Riv­
er, according to Col. A. M. 
Koster, M'oore County Civil 
Defense director.

Some 25 rescue units from 
around the state, using 50 
boats, took part in the search 
on Sunday, reported Sonny 
Guion, commander 'of the 
Sandhill unit.

Three bodies were recover­
ed earlier last week—those of 
Mr. Allen, a small .son and a 
friend of the family. The bod­
ies of the mother and two oth­
er children were being sought.

Camellia Exhibit At 
Library Here Set

The annual exhibition of a 
wide variety of camellia blos­
soms from the estate of Mr. 
and Mrs. T. E. Morton on 
Y'oungs Road will begin at the 
Southern Pines Library on 
Monday, to continue, with new 
flowers added regulavly, 
through March 5, Mrs. S. H. 
Lambourne, librarian, an­
nounces.

The library showing of the 
flowers began a number of 
years ago, when the estate 
was owned by the late Harry 
Vale who cultivated and de­
veloped many rare and beau­
tiful plants.

Moore County Hounds said the 
entry list is thought to be a 
record and well surpasses the 
entries of last year.

Starting time is 10 am for 
junior riders, in three classes, 
and 2 pm for the adult classes 
—First Season, Thoroughbred,

Basketball
Tournament

Scheduled
It’s basketball tournament 

time again lor the high schools 
of Moore County.

Starting at Wadesboro Mon­
day, to run through Saturday, 
will be the Central Tarheel 
Conference tournament in 
which Southern Pines, Aber­
deen, Union Pines and North 
Moore will be playing—from 
this county—along with East 
and West Montgomery sch'ools, 
Rohanen, Jordan Matthews of 
Siler City and Wadesboro.

Coach David Page of South­
ern Pines said last night that 
final seedings have not been 
made, but that it’s probable 
that Southern Pines girls will 
play their first game at 4 pm 
Monday and the boys their 
first at 5:30 pm that day. 
Wadesboro is expected to be 
seeded No. 1 in both boys’ and 
girls’ division^.

There will be four games 
Monday, three on both Tues­
day and Wednesday and two 
on Thursday, Friday and Sat­
urday.
Sandhill Conference

The Sandhill Conference 
tournament—with Pinehurst
and West End taking part as 
the Moore County members of 
the conference—will be played 

(Continued on Page 8)

Non-Thoroughbred and Open 
Hunters and Hunt Teams— 
also a new class. Amateur 
Owner-Rider, which is being 
added this year.

Climaxing the afternoon will 
be the final Championship 
Class, for the Stoneybrook 
Perpetual Trophy in which 
first and second place winners 
in other classes are eligible to 
compete. A special feature will 
be the awarding of the Field 
Hunter Challenge Trophy to a 
horse regularly hunted with 
the Moore County Hounds.

The entire Hunter Trials 
course can be seen from the 
parking spaces which may be 

(Continued on Page 8)

MERCHANTS TO 
MEET MONDAY

A general m.em'bership 
meeting of the Southern 
Pines Merchants Council 
will be held at 8 pm Mon­
day in the municipal build­
ing. Dante Montesanti, 
council chairman, has an­
nounced.

Local merchants who 
have not been attending 
council meetings: are in­
vited to be present as a 
new membership year is 
beginning.

Accomplishments of the 
council during the past 
year will be reviewed and 
work for the coming year 
planned.

W. S. Thomasson is vice 
chairman of the council; 
Garland Pierce is secretary 
and other members of the 
board are David Suther­
land, J. T. Overton, Larry 
Snyder, Mrs. Katherine 
Muddimer ^nd E. Earl 
Hubbardu

3 Officials Of 
Courts Plan To 
Ask Reelection
Three Moore County elec­

tive court officials all said 
this week they plan to run 
again in the Democratic pri­
mary this May, in the last 
elections for these particular 
posts.

When another election year 
rolls around. State court re­
form will be well under way, 
taking place in six North Ca­
rolina districts this year, in 
Moore and about 20 other 
counties in 1968. The rest of 
the State will follow in 1970.

Judge J. Vance Rowe of 
Moore Recorder’s Court at 
Carthage and W. Lament 
Brown, solicitor, both said 
they will seek reelection for 
the coming term—the last one 
of the court’s existence. With 
the coming of the new dis­
trict courts, the present lower 
courts—both county and mu­
nicipal—will terminate.

C. C. Kennedy of Carthage, 
clerk of Moore Superior Court 
since 1948, will run again for 
this office, which will not be 
voted on again. With the com­
ing of court reform, it will be 
appointive, not elective.

The courts and clerk’s office 
will become responsibilities of 
the State, no longer of the 
county (or as in the case of 
the Southern Pines and Aber­
deen courts, of the municipali­
ty).

MR. LEWIS

Fred G. Lewis 
Named To School 
Post, Pinehurst

Fred G. Lewis has been 
named superintendent of the 
Pinehurst City Schools to suc­
ceed the late Lewis S. Cannon, 
according to an announcement 
made this week by J. W. Shef­
field, chairman of the Pine­
hurst board of education.

Mr. Lewis will assume his 
duties on Monday, February 
21. He and his wife will occu­
py a home ■on Short Road. The 
post of superintendent has 
been vacant since the death 
of Mr. Cannon on December 5, 

(Continued on Page 8)

scientific equipment of the 
laboratories and study rooms.

The opening of the Science 
Building is another milestone 
in the growth and develop­
ment of the college, and comes 
exactly a year after the con­
tracts for construction of the 
buildings were awarded to six 
North Carolina firms. De­
signed by Hayes-Howell & 
Associates, Architects, of 
Southern Pines, the red brick, 
white pillared structures ad­
mirably suit the 180-acre 
wooded campus site given to 
the college by Mrs. C. Louis 
Meyer of Pinehurst.
For Nursing Training

The second floor of the Sci­
ence Building also includes 
an area which will be used by 
the Department of Nursing 
Training which will be added 
to the curriculum in the fall. 
Director of the department is 
Mrs. Regina S. Schendler who 
holds a B. S. Degree in Edu­
cation from New York Uni- 

(Continued on Page 8)

FOR E.A.S. SYSTEM

FREE CLASSES SET NEXT WEEK

Civil Defense Course To Begin
“Education for Living in the 

Nuclear Age,” a free course 
covering all aspects of Civil 
Defense—with emphasis on 
what families can do to pro­
tect themselves in case of nu­
clear war or natural disaster— 
will start Monday at East 
Southern Pines High School.

Classes will be held each 
evening, Monday through 
Friday, at 7:30 pm, to last 
about two hours, said Charles 
Scott, project chairman for the 
sponsoring Jaycees. Full co­
operation is being given by 
the State Department of Pub­
lic Instruction and local Supt. 
J. W. Jenkins, as well as by 
Col. A. M. Koster, county and 
local Civil Defense director. 
The specially trained instruc­
tor will be from the State ed­
ucation department.

Persons planning to attend

20 ENROLLED AT UNION PINES SCHOOL

Students Taking Trade Courses
Twenty students at Union Pines High 

School, between Carthage and Vass (mail 
address: Route 1, Cameron) are taking part 
in the Industrial Cooperative Training 
(ICT) vocational education program there. 
Both boys and girls are included.

After 1 pm each school day, they leave 
their classrooms and go to jobs in a variety 
of trade occupations. They work on Satur­
days, too. For the on-the-job work, they 
are paid wages comparable to those paid 
any other employees of equal skill and 
experience.

Thus, they are earning while they are 
learning; and North Carolina educator's have 
found, over the many years the program 
has been operating in industrial plants and 
businesses of this state, that it is turning out 
young people wiio nave a big headstart in 
the increasingly (femanding business of 
making a living.

To enter the ICT prograrn a student must 
be 17 years of age, must be a junior, must 
be able to furnish some type of transporta­
tion to and from work, and must be recom- 

(Continued on Page 3)

the course may register with 
any Jaycee; with Colonel Kos­
ter whose county CD office is 
in the Information Center 
building; or with Mr. Jenkins’s 
office. Persons may also regis­
ter at the first course session.

Films, slides and other vis­
ual aid material will be used, 
as well as verbal presentation 
by the instructor. The spon­
sors emphasize that the course 
presentation will be varied 
and interesting, not merely 
a series of lectures each night.

New Telephone 
Equipment Now 
Arriving Here
Joe Kimball, district man­

ager of the United Telephone 
Company of the Carolinas, 
Inc., has announced that cen­
tral office equipment has 
started arriving for the all- 
new M'oore County Extended 
Area, Service (EAS) and toll 
switching center located in 
Southern Pines.

The equipment will be in­
stalled in the new building, 
385^ West Pennsylvania Ave, 
which is now under construc­
tion. The new EAS system will 
permit toll-free calls between 
most areas of the county.

The Southern Pines instal­
lation, which will consist of 
2,500 lines of crossbar switch­
ing equipment . will be the 
largest-in- the Moore County 
EAS network. In addition to 
the equipment associated with 
local and extended area ser­
vice, a complete new set of 
toll switchboard positions will 
be placed into service.

According to Mr. Kimball, 
more than $2 million will be 
spent on updating equipment 
and providing toll-free service 
in Moore County. This expen­
diture includes a new cross­
bar central office recently in­
stalled in Robbins and another 
one planned for Carthage.

“Tentative plans now call 
for the inauguration of Moore 
County EAS on October 30, 
1966,” Mr. Kimball said.

The equipment that has ar­
rived is stored in the new 
building on Pennsylvania Ave. 
This structure—which adjoins 
the headquarters office build- 

(Continued on Page 8)

3 Escaped Prisoners Apprehended 
Here After Business Area Chases

Three young Negroes who 
escaped Monday from a Lil- 
lington prison camp road gang 
working on Pope AFB, were 
captured Tuesday night after 
a cops-and-robbers chase 
through midtown alleys here.

Spotted about 9 pm on the 
corner of Pennsylvania and 
Bennett by 'Sgt L. D. Beck in 
the police car, they disappear­
ed into the darkness behind 
the Southern Pines library, 
the post office and neighbor­
ing buildings. Beck radioed for 
help and was joined by Pa­
trolmen Robert Moore and 

j Bill McNeill, with Police Chief 
' Earl Seawell and members of 
the sheriff’s department also 
arriving in short order.

The pursued men ducked 
and dodged in a chase which 
lasted altogether about two 
hours. By 11 pm two had been 
caught, offering n'o further re­
sistance, and the third had 
gone into the lighted show­
room of the Carolina Soap & 
Candle Co. nearby, where an

CHECKING UP—Fred E. Sexton, left, of 
Whispering Pines, coordinator of the In­
dustrial Cooperative Training program at 
Union Pines High School, discusses a stud­
ent’s work with Dan Kruger, plant manager 
at Trimble Products, Inc., here. Eight of the 
20 students in the program are pictured at 
work, on another page.

(David Barnes photo)

PALSY DONATIONS
Donations through Wednes­

day in the Moore County cam­
paign for United Cerebral 
Palsy amounted to $2,141.89, it 
was reported today by Mrs. 
Vivien McKenzie of Pine­
hurst, treasurer. Contributions 
may still be sent to PO Box 
246, Pinehurst, she said.

employee, Sid Hackney, was 
working late, and asked that 
police be called so he could 
give himself up.

The three were identified 
as Freddy Taylor, 19, Levi 
Hamilton, 22, and Rufus Bail­
ey, no age given. 'They told 
officers that, after walking 
off the road gang near the 
sewage plant on the air base, 
they had spent the night in 
the woods. They admitted 
breaking into the Alvin Quick 
home on Youngs Road, taking 
only food, Tuesday afternoon.

Officials from the Lilling- 
ton camp came for them that 
night.

Moore deputies assisting lo­
cal police in the capture were 
H. H. Grimm, Ed Cockman and 
J. A. Lawrence.

THE WEATHER
Maximum a.nd minimum 

temperatures for each day of 
the past week were recorded 
as follows at the U. S. Weather 
Bureau observation station, at 
WEEB, on Midland Road.

Max. Min.
February 10 ........... 68 49
February 11 ........... 65 58
February 12 ........... 61 53
February 13 ........... 68 55
February 14 ........... 61 37
February 15 ........... 54 42
February 16 ........... 57 44


