
Hot Springs Girl Scouts Oreanizine:
New Girl Scout Troops have

been organising in Hot
Springs for the past few
wesks. Troops for Brownies
(grades one through three),
juniors (grades four through
six), and Cadattes (grades
seven and eight), have
started registering girls in-

Women

Bridge
Appalachia
Barriers
The efforts of Appalachian

women to understand their
"Appalachianness" took a
new turn last week when the
Council on Appalachian
Women held its spring
meeting in Cincinnati.
Women from the thirteen

Appalachian states were
invited "to get acquainted
with our urban sisters outside
Appalachia," explained Nina
Poage, vice president of the
Council on Appalachian
Women. Or, as Jeanne Hof¬
fman of Mars Hill, the
Council's Executive Director
put it, "If you spend all your
time contemplating your
navel, you'll never learn
anything about yourself. We
went to see what is happening
to Appalachian migrants, to
find out want Appalachian
people . rural and urban,
living inside and outside the
region . can learn from each
other."
"We came away with a new

consciousness of a kinship
network, and values so strong
that they have lasted in urban
areas even through one or two
generations," Mrs. Hoffman
said.

Engagement
Mr. and Mrs. John R.

Lackey Jr. of New Stock Road
announce the engagement of
their daughter, Julie Lynn
Lackey, to Gerald James
Ledford, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Bryson Ledford of Canton.
The bride-elect is a senior

music education major at
Mars Hill College
The future bridegroom

attended Mars Hill College
and is now studying for his
master's degree in music
education at the University of
Illinois at Champaign.
The wedding is planned for

June 16.

Engagement
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie W.

Duyck of Weaverville an¬
nounce the engagement of
their daughter, Brenda Diane
Duyck, to Greg Garrison
Cole, son of Mrs. Shelby G.
Shields and Bensil Cole, both
of Weaverville.
The bride-elect is a student

at Mara Hill College and is
employed by Buncombe
County Child Development.
The future bridegroom is a j

student at Asheville-
Buncombe Technical Institute
and is employed by Baker
Electronics Inc.
The wedding is planned for

Sept. 1.

School Menu
For Week Of

April 23
BREAKFAST

Monday, April 23: dunkin
sticks, juice and milk.
Tuesday, April 24: cereal,

banana and milk.
Wednesday, April 2S:

buttered toast, applesauce
and milk.
Thursday, April N:

doughnut, juice and milk.
Friday, April 27: manager

choice
LUNCH

Monday, April 23: meat
loaf, sweet potatoes, peas,
(ruit cup, rolls and milk.
Tuesday, April 24: pinto

beans, harvard beets, turnip
greens, school made cookies,
corn bread and milk.
Wednesday, April 2S: fish

sticks, green beans, carrots,
paar crisp, roils and milk.
Tharsdny, April M:

manager cnoice

Friday, April 27: chipped
ham on bun, sliced tomatoes,
trench fries, banana pudding
and milk

ttrtiM In Joining the fun And
excitement of Girl Scouting.' If you are interested in
joining one of these troops,but failed to attend the
meeting on April 11, you can
.till Join," Mrs. J.C. (Sdma)
Wallin, Hot Springs troop
organizer, stated.
Contact Mrs. Wallin for

information on which leader
you and your parents should
contact. Mrs. Wallin-.

telephone number is 622-7278,
or contact Jan Hager at the
Ptagah Girl Scout Council

Office in Asheville (252-4442).
Any adults interested in

working with Scouts in any

Engagement
Mr. and Mrs. Charles

Franklin Phillips of Mars Hill
announce the engagement of
their daughter, Tina
Lorraine, to Michael Howard
Murphy, son of Mr. and Mrs.
William John Murphy of

Minneola, Kla. Miss Phillips
and Mr. Murphy are students
at Mars Hill College. The
wedding will take place
August 19, in the Anderson
Amphitheatre on the Mars
Hill College campus.

capacity are encouraged to
call, also
There will be an orientation

to Girl Scouting on April 24 at
7 p.m. at the Hot Springs
School. This will be for all
adults planning to work with
Scouts, or those interested in
learning more about the
program. "Please plan to
attend," Miss Hager com¬
mented.

Mrs. Morgan Is Honored In Charlotte
Mr*. Effie Morgan who

celebrated her 82nd birthday
April 17, was honored on April
15 at Hospitality Care of
Charlotte
Mrs. Morgan's daughters,

Mrs. Robert J. Rice, assisted
by Mrs. Jack L. Peoples of
Winston Salem, entertained
approximately SO friends, and
staff members in the dining
room of the nursing home
between 4 and 6 p.m. A color
scheme of pink and green was

used throughout. Mrs.
Peoples served the punch and
butter mints, Mrs. Rice
served the cake.
Dr. Monroe T. Morgan of

Johnson City, Tenn. and Dr.
Joe L. Morgan of Marshall,
Route 2, assisted their mother
in opening gifts and cards.
Mrs. Morgan's other children
who called but were unable to
attend are: Frank W. Morgan
of Route 6, Portland Tenn,
Coy B. Morgan of Route 1,

Portland, Tenn, Mr* Jeratd
Fisher of Marshall. Route I,
and Mr*. Myrtle Paulson M
Port Lauderdale, Pla.

Wolves
While hunting, wolvef

roam far and wide They
tend to travel single file at f
tireless rate of five miles
an hour. Oftentimes, theif
routes traverse frozen water
ways, windswept ridges ang
old roads and trails.
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