
To sell three times as maay

Red Cross Christmas seats this

year as last year is the plait Of

the American Red Cross and

National Tuberculosis Associa
tion in their efforts to meet the

as anti-tuber-

tioo that these agesciesareen¬
deavoring to take.
Three million dollars is the

amount expected from the safe
ofseals lhisyeat. This requires
that every agency work tbjsiifc?

iHERIA

i Take no chance with a sore

'throat, advises the State Board
of Health. Sore throat, regard¬
less 3f how- light thesorenesa,
should arouse suspicion. Itmay
le aD<M|i> is ihe beginning

dismiss it
untilthe doctor has proved" ftii
not Especially is this import-
aat if diphtheria is pcevalent in
the community. Remember that
if it is diphtheria, every hour

toxin is delayed, the possibility
of f fata) termination is increased.
Diphtheriais about onehund¬

red per cent curable, provided
the treatment is give soon
enough. Oftentimes the begin¬
ning of iip&fiieria, which^s a

sore throat, is thought to beonly
a cold or tonsilftisaad the doctor
» ««.¦»¦««*g*»

i there is ho cure.
Sfis when^ diphth
ed> itgive antitoxin
for the diagnoiis^
fctoisduetoa l»
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