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Socials-Persdnal Items ...

MRS. SNEAD AND 
MRS. THOMAS GIVE 
INFORMAL »TEA FRIDAY

J

A pretty ii^ormal tea, honoring 
Miss Leonora Currie, was that 
given by Mrs. Crawford Thomas 
and Mrs. Younger Snead at 4:30 
on !]^iday afternoon at the home 
of Mrs. Snead.

A corsage of deep pink rose 
buds and baby’s breath was given 
to Miss Currie.

Guests were invited into the 
dining room, which looked beau­
tiful with its bridal decorations. 
Flowers used on the table were 
white snapdragon, regal lilies 
and baby’s breath, flanked by 
lighted candles in crystal holders. 
Mrs. Paul Dezeme served punch. 
Ices in the shape of bride’s roses 
were served with individual cakes 
daintily decorated. The hoste^es 
were assisted in serving by tlieir 
daughters. Misses Iris Thomas 
and Jenelle Snead. The bride- 
elects gift from the hostesses 
were crystal. Twenty-five friends 
of the honoree and her mother 
enjoyed this hospitality.

------------0------------
Those attending the graduation 

of Dr. Riley M. Jordan from Bow­
man Gray School of Medicine of 
Wake Forest college in Winston- 
Salem M^onday night were Mr. 
and Mrs, J. F. Jordan, Dr. Julius 
Jordan, Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Baker.

GARDEN CLUB MEETS 
WITH MRS. R. L. CARTER

Miss Janie Lou Veasey Married To 
Thomas F. McFadyen Saturday P. M.

. The Garden Department of the 
Raeford Woman’s Club met at the 
home of Mrs. R. L. Carter on 
Tuesday afternoon. Mrs. H. A. 
Cameron Vand Mrs. Israel were 
co-hostesses with Mrs Carter.

Mrs. W. T. Coviilgton, chairman 
presided during the business ses­
sion. "^he club voted to change 
the meeting date from the first 
Tuesday in each month to the 
second Tuesday in each month, 
and. the next meeting will be held 
in September. Mrs. H. A. Camer­
on was voted an honorary mem­
ber.

A very interesting program on 
“Nature Study” was presented by 
Mrs. William Lament and Mrs. 
j. S. Johnson. Mrs. Lament spoke 
on Trees and Mrs. Johnson on 
Birds. Mrs. Clarence Lytch won 
the prize in the contest held on 
the name of trees, and Mrs. Aga- 
nora Andrews won the door prize.

During the social hour a tempt­
ing plate of sandwiches and 
cookies was served with an iced 
drink.

------------ 0------------
Mrs. C. P. Trexler and children 

accompanied Sgt. and Mrs. Mur­
phy Hancock' of Fort Bragg to 
Greensboro Saturday to see Mrs. 
W. S. Hancock, who is Sgt. Han­
cock’s mother, and Patricia and 
Joe Hancock’s grandmother.

SENIOR BRIDGE CLUB 
JOURNEYS TO WINSTON- 
SALEM THURSDAY

Mrs. Robert McCleskey invited 
her mother’s bridge club, which 
is the senior club, to her home in 
Winston-Salem for a spend the 
day party last Thursday.

Eight club members accepted 
the invitation and went early for 
a full day. The morning was spent 
in shopping and visiting,^ After a 
appetizing luncheon at Mrs. Mc- 
Cleskey’s home, the party settled 
down for an afternoon of bridge. 
High score was made by Mrs. 
Adelyne Johnson and low score 
by Mrs. Clyde Upchurch. Both 
were given most attractive prizes.

Those going to Mrs. McCleskey’s 
were: Mrs. Clyde Upchurch, Mrs. 
Adelyne Johnson, Mrs. Julian 
Johnson, Mrs. Benton Thomas, 
Mrs. Marshall Thomas. Mrs. John 
McGoogan, Mrs. Arthur Matheson 
and Mrs. Lawrence Poole.

15-A
DRIVE-IN THEATRE

SHOW STARTS 7:30 P. M. 
DAIJiY AND SUNDAY

Tonight — June 14 
“DRUMS”

______Sabu
Friday - Saturday — June 15-16 

“WOMAN ON THE RUN” 
Dennis O’Keefe - Ann Sheridan

Sunday — June 17 
“HOLIDAY INN”

Monday - Tuesday — June 18-19 
“BACK ON THE FARM” 

Ma and Pa KettleI

Wednesday - Thursday — June 20-21 
“ROPE OF SAND”

30c - Children Under 12 FREE

ma

❖ Raeford Theatre ❖
OPEN AT 5 P. M. DAILY

THURSDAY — FRIDAY

“Half Angel”
Loretta Young - Joseph Cotton. 

Also Latest World News 
And A Good Comedy

SATURDAY

“Virginia City”
Errol Flynn Randolph Scott - Humphrey Bogart

SUNDAY ONLY

“The Hit Parade Of 1951”
John Carroll 

Also A Good Cartoon

MONDAY - TUESDAY

“Steel Helmet”
Robert Hutton

WEDNESDAY - Bargain Day

“Jungle Jim”
Johnny Weismuller 

COMING

“The Enforcer”
Humphrey' Bogart

from a double pearl coronet. She AT HMIE
BRIDE AND BRlDE-i

AMERICAN HOME 
DEPT. MEETS WITH 
MRS. KEN McNEILL

The newly organized American 
Home Department of the Raeford 
Woman’s Club held its first meet­
ing on Friday night of last week 
at the home of Mrs. Ken McNeill 
at McCain.

Th^ following officers presided 
during the meeting: Mrs. Ken 
McNeill, chairman; Mrs. Wilton 
Wood, vice-chairman; Mrs. Pres­
ton Kelly, secretary; Mrs. Harry 
Harrison, treasurer. Hostesses and 
programs were selected for the 
coming year.

The members were well repre­
sented at the meeting and several 
hew members attended.

At the end of the meeting deli­
cious refreshments were served.

------------------------0----------------— ■

BRIDE-ELECT HONORED 
WITH BRIDGE PARTY

The marriage of Miss Janie Lou 
Veasey daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. O. Veasey, and Thomas Fad- 
yen, was solemnized in a candle­
light ceremony at 8 o’clock Sat­
urday. evening at the Raeford 
Baptist Church. The Rev. Judson 
Lennon, pastor of the bride, and 
the Rev. P. O. Lee, pastor of the 
Raeford Methodist church, offi­
ciated. The double ring ceremony 
was used.

A program of nuptial music

vvas presented by Mrs. Alton War­
ren, organist, and Mason Bell, 
soloist, both of Fayetteville.

The bride, who was given in 
marriage by her father, wore a 
gown of white satin with a fitted 
bodice and full skirt -falling into 
a cathedral train. It had a mar­
quisette yoke inset etched with 
a seed pearl design. The design 
was repeated on the long sleeves, 
pointed over the hand. The fin­
gertip length veil of illusion fell

carried the traditional white tnr- 
chid on a prayer bo<fr.

Mrs. Dan Pitt of Rocky Mount, 
sister of the bride, was matron 
of honor. She wore a floor length 
gown of orchid lace and mar­
quisette. The bridesmaids t were 
Miss Ruby Dunbar and Miss Ag­
nes Rell. They wore similar 
gowns, One of aqua and one of 
pink. All three attendants car­
ried bouquets of yellow rosebuds 
and carnations. They wore small 
flower coronets, matching their 
gowns, in their hair.

Little Olivia Pitt, niece of the 
bride, was flower girl. She wore 
white organdy over yellow satin 
and carried a basket of yellow 
rosebuds.

Pfc. Donald Schubring of Ft. 
Jackson, S. C. was best man.

Groomsmen were Fred Mc­
Fadyen, brother of the groom, 
Alton Warren. Dr. Julius Jordan 
and Dan Pitt.

For the wedding Mrs. Veasey 
wore powder blue sheer with 
white accessories, and Mrs. Mc­
Fadyen wore pink with white

(accessories. Both wore corsages 
of pink camafions.

Immediately following the cere­
mony the bridal party formed a 
receiving line in the vestibule, of 
the church to receive congratula­
tions after which the couple left 
for a wedding trip. For traveling 
Mrs. McFadyen wore a suit of 
navy with white accessories and 
the orchid lifted from her prayer 
book.

The bride is a graduate of Hoke 
County High School and will com­
plete her nurse’s training at 
Highsmith hospital the latter part 
of June.

Pfc. Mc-radyen also graduated 
from Hoke County High School 
and attended Bob Jones College, 
Greenville. S. C. He is now in 
the army and stationed at Fort 
Jackso.v S. C.

On Wednesday afternoon^ Hsn, 
Clyde Upchurch and daughter,, 
Mrs. Robert McCleskey of WlnstOtt 
Salem gave a formal afternMB 
tea at the home of Mrs. Upchmr^ 
At this time they honored Mt». 
Phil Johnson, a bride of the spring; 
and Miss Leonora Currie, bride- 
elect of this month.

Mixed summer flowers in tajrtfr* 
ful arrangements were used*« 
living room and music room. In 
the dining room a motif in yellonr 
and white' was carried out in 
flower arrangements and all ap­
pointments. The table w?s t over- 
ed with a hand embroidered clofli 
of Chinese linen and design- Yel­
low candles in crystal holders and 
glads, snapdragons and roses in 
yellow with feathery sprays and 
maline bows were used on the 
table. A large silver bowl on buf­
fet held m.agnolias and magnoMa 
buds. Decorated cakes, salted nuts, 
and candies and the punch bowl, 
holding frozen orange punch, 
completed the table arrangemenls.

Assisting Mrs. Upchurch and 
Mrs. McCleskey in receiving and 
serving were: At front door. Mrs. 
Julian Johnson. In the receiving 
line were Mrs. Upchurch. Mrs. 
McCleskey, Miss Leonora Curri*, 
Mrs. Phil Johnson, Mrs. A- K- 
Currie and Mrs. Adelyne Roberts 
Johnson. At the dining room door, 
Mrs. Tom.-nie Upchurch; serving 
in the dining room were Mrs. 
Lewis Upchurch at the puncAi 
bowl; and Mrs. Clyde Unchurch, 
Jr., Miss-Agnes Mae Johnson and 
Miss Joan Johnson. Mrs. R. B. 
Lewis received in the music room 
and goodbyes were said to Mrs. 
H. A. Cameron.

About seventy friends called 
during the afternoon.

-----------0—----“

Mr.'and Mrs. Kermit Crawdey 
of Lynchburg. Virginia, -were visi­
tors in the home of Mr. Crawley’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Crawley, during the week end.

Friends of Col. and Mrs. Bob 
Conk and their daughter. Lynn, 
ree'eived announcements this 
week of commencement exercises 
of Frankfurt High School Frank­
furt, Germany. /June 8th. Lynn 

/-as a member/&f the senior class.
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On Thursday afternoon of last 
week Miss Leonora Currie was 
honored when Mrs. Israel Mann, 
Mrs. Dwight Brown and Mrs. R. 
L. Murray' entertained for her 
with bridge.

This Very pretty party ■was 
given at the home of Mrs,. Murrky, 
which was most attractively ar­
ranged, for the occasion.

On arrival the guests were ser­
ved punch on the terrace. Miss 
Maude Poole poured.

There were five tables placed 
for bridge and one for rook in 
living room and den. Miss Cur­
rie’s place was marked with a 
corsage of gardenias and gypso- 
phila.

After a number of progressions, 
Mrs. W. M. Roberts held highest 
score in bridge and Miss Mayme 
McKeithan in rook. Both were 
awarded prizes. Mrs. W. H. Hasty 
of Maxton, aunt of the bride, was 
a guest and was remembered with 
a gift. The gift to the bride-elect 
was china in her pattern. A most 
refreshing ice course was served 
after the game.

----------O-----------
COUPLES CLUB 
ENTERTAINED

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Muench en­
tertained the couples club Sat­
urday evening at their home. There 
were three tables playing with 
Mr. and Mrs. Israel Mann and 
Mrs. Doug McLeod visitors. Israel 
Mann won the visitor’s prize and 
Mrs. Neil Senter the club prize.

A dessert course was most re­
freshing, served after the game.

-----------0----:------
FUTURE HOMEMAKERS 
AT WHITE LAKE CAMP
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Shop now for Dad and get your best selection-of fine clothing from our big store ..

i

The Hoke County Chapter of 
the FHA was represented at camp 
last week by Miss Hefner and four 
girls, Harriet Hodgin, Carol Ever- 
leigh, Jean Ob'ster and Bheila 
Balfour.

The girls were enrolled in 
classes of music, art and crafts 
and 'swimming. Miss Hefner and 
each of the girls worked on the. 
State program of work for the 
following year.

The camp group was made up 
of 350 girls and their advisers 
from all parts of the state.

--------- ^—0------------
Miss . Jeannette Hughes of Shel­

by arrived in town and is at Mrs. 
John 'Walker’s. Miss Huges, who 
is a student at Wake Forest col- 
lege,, will have charge of the 
Young People’s work at the Bap­
tist church during the summer 
months.

SPORT SHIRTS 
DRESS SHIRTS 
PAJAMAS 
SOCKS
SWIM TRUNKS 
TIE JEWELRY 
COOL SUITS

NECKWEAR
SUSPENDERS
BELTS
Handkerchiefs 
SLACKS 
STRAW HATS 
SPORTS WEAR

COMPARE BELK’S QUALITY ...
COMPARE BELK’S STYLE ...

COMPARE BELK’S PRICES

$
GIFT

PACKAGES 
WRAI^’ED 

FREE jOF 

CHARGE

Belfcifensdale
■a

J

MAKE DAD’S 

FAVORITE 

STORE YOUR 

FAVORITE 

STORE”
I


