
Young Demos 
Set Convention 

More than 1 non of the party 
loyal will gather in Raleigh Sep 
tern her 2.*>. an«l 27 for th< 
twenty-ninth annual convention 
of the Young I>emo« ratio Clubs 
of North Carolina 

Registration for the statewide 
affair will begin at II Friday 
morning in the lobby of the Ho- 
tel Sir Walter anti will continue 
throughout the day. 

Friday's activities include a la- 
dies luncht'on and fashion show 
and a 3 o’clock key note address 
by gubernatorial candidate I>an 
K. Moore. 

Friday's banquet begins at 7 in 
the Southern anti Carolina rooms 
of Raleigh’s Memorial Auditor- 
ium. All important caucuses and 
committee meetings will be the 
only order of business for the re- 

mainder of I he evening. 
Saturday morning at 9 the 

election of statewide YDC offic- 
ers for the coming year will be 
gin. At present only five candi- 
dates have made known their in- 

tention to seek one of the elec- 
tive offices. 

Doran J. Berry of Cumberland 
County and Coorge Miller of 
Durham County are actively 
campaigning for the presidential 
chair now held by outgoing presi- 
dent Tom Oilmore. 

Susan Stephenson of Wake 
county and Carolyn Blue of 
Moore county inuth want to be 
national committeewoman. 

Wiley Earp from Johnston 
county is making his bid for the 
job of state YDC treasurer. 

When the smoke from the vot- 
ing clears, delegates will be giv- 
en the chance to a tend football 
games in the Raleigh Durham 
Chapel Hill area. 

Saturday afternoon at 5 a re 

ception will honor county 
YDC presidents. At 7 delegates 
will attend the main convention 
banquet. 

A dance from 10 til 1 and a' 
legislative breakfast Sunday 
morning will wind up a full 
weekend. 

A/1C CtowM 
At Show AFB 

SUMTER, S. C Airman First 
Class Robert L. Crawf ird, son of 
Mrs. Ethel L. Crawford of 9(m; 
Boyce St., Kings Mountain. N. C.. 
has arrived for duty with a Tac-I 
tieal Air Command «TACi unit 
at Shaw AFB. S. C. 

Airman Crawford, a flight 
training equipment specialist, 
previously served ath Randolp 
AFB. Tex. His new unit supports, 
the TAC mission of providing, 
firepower and other air support! 
to U. S. Army tows. 

His wife. Betty is the daughter 
of Mrs. Nettie P. Hawkins of 905 
Church St.. Kings Mountain. 

Coupe 6 4-Door LeMans Sedan 

Pontiac To Show 
New ’65 Models 
Many Features 
Of New Pontiac 
For Year *65 

Pontiac Motor Division offers 
a completely new concept in au- 

tomotive design and styling with 
the introduction of their 1965 
models. 

The Catalina, Star Chief and 
Bonneville models will present 
an appealing silhouette as they 
are longer, lower and wider on 

the exterior and contain more 

room and luxurious furnishings 
in the interior. 

The combination of styling ex- 

cellence and outstanding perfor 
mance, which has valuted Ponti- 
ac into one of the front runners 

in automobile sales, prevails a- 

gain in 1965. 
The Catalina models, t h e 

Grand Prtx spoils coupe and all 
station wagons have a 121-inch 
wheelbase while the Star Chief 
and Bonneville models measure 

124 inches (except the Bonneville 
Safari). 

The overall length of the Cata- 
lina and Grand Prix has been in- 

creased to 214.6 inches and the 
Star Chief and Bonneville mod- 
els are 221.7 inches long. All Sa- 
fari models measure 2VS.9 inches. 

Pontiac’s high selling Catalina 
senes is available in seven mod- 
els — two and four-door sedans, 
two ami four-door hardtops. six 

and nine-passenger station wa- 

gons and a convertible. 
four-dnor hardtop and a four 

The Star Chief series offers 
door sedan. 

Bonneville buyers choose he 
tween a sports coupe, a four-door 
hardtop, a six-passenger station 

wagon and a convertible. 
Pontiac’s award-winning sports 

coupe, the Grand Prix. will again 
be entered in the luxury car field. 

In announcing the new models. 
E. M. Estes, a General M >tors 
vice president and general man- 

ager of Pontiac said, “every 1965 
model is a newly-inspired Ponti- 
ac creation containing perfor 
mance. styling and luxury- fea- 
tures never before offered in the 
middle price range.” 

Tile 1965 Pontiacs go on sale 
in dealer showrooms Septetnhet 
24. 

All the body styles for 1965 are 

completely new. They all ha\ 

the obvious appearance advan- 
tages of curved glass which al- 
lows ilw upper structure to bet- 
ter integrate with the lower as 

'part of the overall car design. 
This is particularly Evident on 

tin* sports coupe with its fast- 
flowing roof line. Curved glass 
also makes possible a more effi- 
cient use of space. 

A Pontiac e.v lusive for 1965 is 
the articulated windshield wipei 
which gives a g tea ter sweep area 

than ever before. This system is 
designed to wipe at much highei 
speeds than any other system. 
Tiie articulated wiper is standard 
on ail Pontiac models except the 
Catalina which offers it as an op- 
ion. The articulated wiper has 

greater tension of the blade to 
the glass and gives bettor wiping 
in the critical corner areas of the 
windshield. 

l’ontiac windshields are Iargbt 
anti have less curvature for im 
proved vision and more effective 
c v era go by the new windshield 
wipers 

Custom detailing in many 
aieas has been introduced on the 
new models. Wheel opening 
moldings, stainless steel hotly 
guard side moldings anti sparkl- 
ing new chrome die cast front 
and rear end treatments are all 
featured in 1905. Large wrap-a 
round bumpers are scaled to| 
longer anti more dominant front 
entl sheet metal. 

Several important improve- 
ments have been made in the 
Pontiac convertibles which mean 
!let ter appearance, more comfort 
and increased safety. All conver- 
tibles have a new tempered glass 
roar window to provide the ulti- 

mate in visibility ami durability. 
This window does away entirely 
with deformation and scratching. 
Also, the window doe* not need 
to he removed and may he low- 
ered readily with the top. 

One of the most exciting mod- 
els in the 196' Pontiac lineup id 
the 2 plus 2. Available in Cata- 
lina sports coupe and converti- 
ble models, the 2 plus 2 has 
come into its own in 1963. 

The 2 plus 2 includes bucket 
seats, exclusive expanded Monro- 
kide trim in four interior colors, 
body paint stripes just below the 
fender upper peak extending the 
full length of the car, 2 plus 2 
emblems on the front, sides and 
rear anti Pontiac's high perform- 
ance 121 cubic inch engine with 
four barrel carbuthtion and a 
three speed synchromesh trans- 
mission with floor shift. 

Also included in this exclusive 
package is a dual exhaust system 
and simulated louvers on the 
front fender located to the rear 
of the front wheel opening. 

A new console Is optional on 
the 2 plus 2 which has a cast 
leather grain texture and is 
painted to compliment the instru- 
ment panel. 

G-W Classes 
Start Thimday 

Boiling Springs—Approximate 
ly 72.V730 students will converge 
on the GardnerAVebb College 
campus Sept. 13-15 for orienta- 
tion and registration in prepara- 
tion for classes Sept. 17. 

This will be the largest stu- 
dent body ever at the Baptist 
junior college with 500 of the 
number being boarding students 
and the remainder day students. 
Last year the student body num- 
bered 686 full time students. 

These figutes do not indude 
Evening College enrollment, en- 
rollment for the graduate course 
in education slated for each Sat- 
urday this year nor other stu- 
dents w’ho are classified as "spe- 
cial” in that they do not plan to 

carry a full college study load. 

Director of Development, Rob- 
ert Abrams, states that 440 of the 
boarding students are in dormi- 
tories. is are in the Hamrick 
Building off campus. 30 are in 
college owned buildings off cam- 

pus and 12 others are living in 
rooms rented in the community. 
These 12 will take meals at the 
college cafeteria. 

New students, freshmen and 
transfer students will attend a 
general Convocation at 8:30 a.m 
Sept. 15 at the E. B. Hamrick 
Auditorium and will then be split 
into four groups for purposes of 
orientation procedures and pho- 
tograph for the college yearbook. 
Orientation continues Sept. 16 
and classes begin Sept. 17. 

OfftoSchool? 
You'll want die Kings Mountain Herald — a great big. news - filled 
letter from home—to keep yon informed about your home area 

events. 

For the 

Full College 
School Term 

OMIT_ 

Anywhere 

Boy Scouts 
Win Airasii 

Kings Mountain Boy Scout* 
won advancement* and tnorit a- 
wards at Thursday* Bey Scout 
Court of Honor at Central Meth- 
odist church. 

Tap rank advancement went to 
Star Scouts Jimmy White of 
Troop 91 and Paul Dunn of 
Troop 294. 

Other rank advancements went 
to First Class Scouts Gregory 
Nolan. Steve Laney and Gary 
Nolen, all of Troop 2M, and to 
Second Class Scouts Cart Fulton 
of Troop 90. Roger Marr, Darrell 
Hawkins. Reed Strickland and 
Ronnie Staley, all of Troop 91, 
and to Tenderfoot Scouts Jack 
Hendrick of Troop 91, Ronnie 
Payne and Randy Wilson of 
Troop 92 and Reese Black of 
Troop 294. 

Merit awards went to the fol- 
lowing: 

TToop 90: Andy Noisier, first 
aid, astronomy, music; Billy Mill- 
hr, finger printing; Danny Eu- 
gene Sellers, pigeon raising; 
Stevie Gladden, finger printing. 

Troop 91: Bobby Mode, home 
repairs; Eddie White, swimming, 
life saving, personal fitness; 
Chuck Sparks, hiking; Charles 
Sparks, camping, swimming, per- 
sonal fitness; George Poole, cook- 
ing, swimming; Scott Kelly, 
swimming; Barry Jones, swim- 
ming; Jimmy Crawford, swim- 
ming; Jimmy Champion, scholar- 
ship, Tommy Bridges, public 
health and gardening; Don 
Bridges, citizenship in the nation, 
canoeing, personal fitness. 

Troop 92: Danny WUson, swim- 
ming; Vic Laughridge. fishing 
and swimming; Richard Waters, 

| fishing; and Keith Hullendcr. 
fishing. 

Troop 294: Gary Nolen, music 
and fishing; Steve Lanfry, music 
and fishing; and Gregory Nolan, 
music and fishing. 

In Michigan, a computer-con- 
trolled 80-inch hot atrip mill op- 
erates at speeds up to 3.000 feet 
per minute. It converts a 54.000- 
pound slab into coiled sheet 
steel in about one and one-hall 
minutes. 

The first coeducational college 
in the United States was Oberlin 
College, reports World Book En- 
cyclopedia. In 1835 the college 
announced. “Young ladies at- 
tend recitations wilh young gen- 
tlemen in all the departments.” 

Ellison Aboard 

USS PROVIDENCE < FIITNC) 
Charlie M. Ellison, seaman. U- 

SN. son of Mrs. James E. Ellison 
Of 206 Dll ling St.. Kings Moun- 
tain. N. C.. was on<* of 802 crew- 

men aboard the guided missile 
cruiser. UEE Providence to ar- 

rive in Long Beach, Calif., fol- 
lowing an extended tour of duty 
in the Western Pacific. 

Providen<v arrived at her new 

homaport of Long Beach on Au- 
guat 25, following a two-year, 
two-month employment in the 
Western Pacific, nerving as flag- 
ship for Commander Seventh 

Dating her employment in the 
Seventh Fleet, Providence steam- 

ed moit> than 90,000 miles, visit- 
ed 24 ports in 12 countries includ- 
ing all major ports in the West- 
ern Pacific, and hosted more 
than 190,000 visitors. 

Relieved as flagship by the 
guided missile cruiser, USS Okla- 
homa City. Providence departed 
Ydkoauka. Japan on July 5. sig- 
nifying the end of an event-fill- 
ed cruise. 

In addition to maintaining the 
high degree of readiness expect- 
edand required of Seventh Fleet 
whips. Providence participated 
fully in the People-to-People pro- 
gram in furthering the promo- 
tion of goodwill and understand 
ing between the United States 
and other nations. 

Gaston College 
To Enroll 

Applications for day school at 
Gaston College will be dosed at 
600. Approximately 390 have al 

1 ready been accepted. Any student 
; who plans to attend day classes 
at Gaston College is urged to ap- 
ply immediately. 

In order to fadlitate registra- 
tor, students in the day program 
may work out their schedules foi 
the fall semester with the regis 
trar between now and September 
S3. Those wishing to do so are 
asked to call the College office 
number 864-2581, and make an 

appointment. 
Applications for evening class- 

es will continue to be accepted, 
but are asked to enroll as soon 
as possible. Approximately 9G 
students have been accepted for 
evening classes to date. 

Hambright Clan 
To Hold Reunion 

The annual Hambright re- 
union will he held Sunday. Octo- 
ber 4. at Shiloh Prwbyteiiui 
rhurvh at Grover. N. C. at 12:.1o 
p.m. A pienie lunch will in* sen 

ed at this time. 
After lunch, a dedication of a 

monument in honor of Col. Fred 
erick Hambright will be held. All 
members of the CoL Frtfderi< U 
Hambright Chapter DAR o f 
Kings Mountain are invited to at 
tend. 

CALLING ALL 
HOME MAKERS 

By GENE TIMMS 
DON'T OVER-CROWD 

TOUR ROOMS 

Many years ago a famous 
decorator said. ••'Hie right way 
to furnish any room is with 
the least number of pieces of 

i-.i-,. n»d not with the 
most. That 
principle still 
applies today. 

Too many 
rooms in too 
homes look 
like displays in 
furniture stores 

—terribly over- 

crowded. 
Many people seem to have 

a fear of leaving any open 
floor or wall spaces in their 
rooms. But. actually there is 
nothing worse than the "clut- 
tered” look. 

Sufficient spacing is an im 

portant factor in decorating. 
It is often the difference be 
tween "decorating" and “furn- 

ishing". 
Enough space between the 

different pier-es of furniture 
and wall decoration in any 
room will allow the individual 
items to "stand on their own 

feet" and display their own 

personality. 
We are always ready to give 

you decorating advice and 
help with no obligation. Come 
on in and talk over your dec- 
orating problems with us. We 
welcome the opportunity to 
visit with you. 

We are receiving daily new 
Pall Living Room. Dining 
Room. Den, and Bod Room 
furniture. Won’t you come in 
and browse*, you're in for a 

treat you’ll enjoy. The "Mys- 
tery Tune” is up to $25.00. 
why not tune in "The Gene 
Timms" show and see if you 
can identify the record. 
WKMT every Mon., Wed. and 
Fri.. at 7:30 a.m. 

PLONK’S 

f 

QbssanC 
Sweater- 

do the most 

jfor knits... 
and you 

Bras 

with diagonal stretch panel that lifts 
and holds. Up-shaped "loving-cuffs’* 
anchor leg — allow hi-stepping move- 
ment. AH-way-stretch crotch can't cut 
or bind. White or Black. 


